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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

The Department of Agriculture has 
submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
Comments are requested regarding: 
whether the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of burden including 
the validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Comments regarding this information 
collection received by March 28, 2025 
will be considered. Written comments 
and recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted within 30 days of the 
publication of this notice on the 
following website www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain. Find this 
particular information collection by 
selecting ‘‘Currently under 30-day 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Rural Housing Service 

Title: Community Facilities Grant 
Program—7 CFR 3570–B. 

OMB Control Number: 0575–0173. 
Summary of Collection: The Rural 

Housing Service is authorized by 
Section 306(a) of the Consolidated Farm 
and Rural Development Act (7 U.S.C. 
1926), as amended, to make grants to 
public agencies, nonprofit corporations, 
and Indian tribes to develop essential 
community facilities and services for 
public use in rural areas. These facilities 
include schools, libraries, childcare, 
hospitals, clinics, assisted-living 
facilities, fire and rescuer stations, 
police stations, community centers, 
public buildings, and transportation. 
The Department of Agriculture through 
its Community Programs strives to 
ensure that facilities are available to all 
rural communities. 

Need and Use of the Information: 
Rural Development field offices will 
collect information from applicant/ 
borrowers and consultants. This 
information is used to determine 
eligibility, project feasibility, and to 
ensure borrowers operate on a sound 
basis and use loan and grant funds for 
authorized purposes. Failure to collect 
the information could result in 
improper determinations of eligibility, 
improper use of funds, and or unsound 
loans. 

Description of Respondents: Not-for- 
profit institutions. 

Number of Respondents: 1,272. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting: 

On occasion. 
Total Burden Hours: 17,263. 

Levi S. Harrell, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2025–03090 Filed 2–25–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–XV–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request; Reinstatement 

The Department of Agriculture has 
submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and reinstatement under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
Comments are requested regarding 
whether the collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the functions of the agency, including 

whether the information will have 
practical utility; the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of burden including 
the validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Comments regarding this information 
collection received by March 28, 2025 
will be considered. Written comments 
and recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted within 30 days of the 
publication of this notice on the 
following website www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain. Find this 
particular information collection by 
selecting ‘‘Currently under 30-day 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Food Safety and Inspection Service 
Title: Accredited Laboratories. 
OMB Control Number: 0583–0158. 
Summary of Collection: The Food 

Safety and Inspection Service (FSIS) has 
been delegated the authority to exercise 
the functions of the Secretary as 
provided in the Federal Meat Inspection 
Act (FMIA) (21 U.S.C. 601 et seq.), the 
Poultry Products Inspection Act (PPIA) 
(21 U.S.C. 451, et seq.), and the Egg 
Products Inspection Act (EPIA) (21 
U.S.C. 1031 et seq.). These statues 
mandate that FSIS protect the public by 
verifying that meat and poultry products 
are safe, wholesome, unadulterated, and 
properly labeled and packaged. FSIS 
will use one form to collect information 
to help assess laboratories participating 
in the Accredited Laboratory program to 
ensure they meet the required 
standards. 

Need and Use of the Information: Any 
non-federal laboratory that is applying 
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for the FSIS Accredited Laboratory 
program will need to complete an 
Application for FSIS Accredited 
Laboratory Program 10,110–2 form. 
State or private laboratories need only 
submit the application once for entry 
into the program. FSIS uses the 
information collected by the form to 
help assess the laboratory applying for 
admission to the FSIS Accredited 
Laboratory program. 

Description of Respondents: Business 
or other for-profit. 

Number of Respondents: 2. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting: 

Annually. 
Total Burden Hours: 1. 

Food Safety and Inspection Service 
Title: Records to be Kept by Official 

Establishments and Retail Stores that 
Grind Raw Beef Products. 

OMB Control Number: 0583–0165. 
Summary of Collection: The Food 

Safety and Inspection Service (FSIS) has 
been delegated the authority to exercise 
the functions of the Secretary as 
provided in the Federal Meat Inspection 
Act (FMIA) (21 U.S.C. 601 et seq.). 
These statues mandate that FSIS protect 
the public by verifying that meat and 
poultry products are safe, wholesome, 
not adulterated, and properly labeled 
and packaged. 

FSIS requires that all grinders or 
choppers of raw beef products, beef 
manufacturing trimmings, or trimmings 
fabricated at retail intended for use in 
raw ground or chopped beef products, 
including retail facilities, are persons 
required by FMIA to keep records which 
will fully and correctly disclose all 
transactions involved in their business 
subject to the Act. If not doing so 
already, these businesses must maintain 
records that disclose the identity and 
supplier of all materials used in the 
preparation of each lot of raw ground or 
chopped beef product. 

Need and Use of the Information: 
FSIS requires that all establishments 
and retail stores that grind or chop beef 
products are required to keep these 
records. These records provide critical 
information about how, when, and 
where raw ground or chopped beef 
product was prepared, shipped, 
received, stored, and handled, which 
are essential to illness outbreak 
investigations, recalls, and other agency 
public health activities conducted by 
FSIS. 

In addition, FSIS requires that 
specific information be kept in the 
required records and that retail stores 
maintain store-designed systems that 
allow them to link individual packages 
of raw ground or chopped beef products 
prepared and sold by them to the 

required records. The required records 
must include the following information: 

1. Name, point of contact (name, title, 
email, and facsimile number) telephone 
number, and establishment number of 
the Federal, State, or foreign 
establishment supplying the raw source 
material, 

2. Supplier lot numbers and 
production dates for each raw source 
material used; and, 

3. The names of the supplied 
materials. 

Description of Respondents: Business 
or other for-profit. 

Number of Respondents: 65,911. 
Frequency of Responses: 

Recordkeeping: Weekly, Annually, 
Monthly. 

Total Burden Hours: 1,658,650. 

Levi S. Harrell, 
Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2025–03088 Filed 2–25–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–DM–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Economic Development Administration 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Amend an 
Investment Award and Project Service 
Maps 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and clearance in accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995, on or after the date of publication 
of this notice. We invite the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
comment on proposed, and continuing 
information collections, which helps us 
assess the impact of our information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. Public 
comments were previously requested 
via the Federal Register on December 3, 
2024 during a 60-day comment period. 
This notice allows for an additional 30 
days for public comments. 

Agency: Economic Development 
Administration, Department of 
Commerce. 

Title: Amend an Investment Award 
and Project Service Maps. 

OMB Control Number: 0610–0102. 
Form Number(s): None. 
Type of Request: Regular submission; 

Extension of a currently approved 
collection. 

Number of Respondents: 632 (600 
requests for amendments to 
construction awards, 30 requests for 

amendments to non-construction 
awards, 2 project service maps). 

Average Hours per Response: 2 hours 
for an amendment to a construction 
award, 1 hour for an amendment to a 
non-construction award, 6 hours for a 
project service map. 

Burden Hours: 1,242 hours. 
Needs and Uses: To effectively 

administer and monitor its economic 
development assistance programs, EDA 
collects certain information from 
applicants for, and recipients of, EDA 
investment assistance. Occasionally, 
often due to a change of conditions on 
the ground, a recipient needs to submit 
a written request to EDA to amend an 
investment award. EDA needs to receive 
such information and documentation as 
EDA deems necessary to determine the 
merit of altering the terms of an award 
(see 13 CFR 302.7(a)). Additionally, 
EDA may require a recipient to submit 
a project service map and information 
from which to determine whether 
services are provided to all segments of 
the region being assisted (see 13 CFR 
302.16(c)). 

Affected Public: Current recipients of 
EDA awards, including: (1) cities or 
other political subdivisions of a state, 
including a special purpose unit of state 
or local government engaged in 
economic or infrastructure development 
activities, or a consortium of political 
subdivisions; (2) states; (3) institutions 
of higher education; (4) public or private 
non-profit organizations or associations; 
(5) District Organizations; (6) Indian 
Tribes; and (7) (for training, research, 
and technical assistance awards only) 
individuals and for-profit businesses. 

Frequency: As necessary as 
determined by recipient need. 

Respondent’s Obligation: Mandatory. 
Legal Authority: The Public Works 

and Economic Development Act of 1965 
(42 U.S.C. 3121 et seq.). 

This information collection request 
may be viewed at www.reginfo.gov. 
Follow the instructions to view the 
Department of Commerce collections 
currently under review by OMB. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted within 30 days of the 
publication of this notice on the 
following website www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain. Find this 
particular information collection by 
selecting ‘‘Currently under 30-day 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function and 
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