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Individuals who wish to be 
considered for membership on the West 
Virginia Secure Rural Schools Advisory 
Committee must submit a nomination 
with information, including a Form AD– 
755 (Advisory Committee or Research 
and Promotion Background 
Information). Nominations should be 
typed and include the following: 

If nominating an individual, a brief 
summary, no more than two pages, 
explaining the nominee’s qualifications 
to serve on the Secure Rural Schools 
Advisory Committee and addressing the 
membership composition and criteria 
described above. 

(a) A resume providing the nominee’s 
background, experience, and 
educational qualifications. 

(b) A completed Form AD–755, 
Advisory Committee or Research and 
Promotion Background Information. 
The form can be downloaded by visiting 
the following website https://
www.usda.gov/sites/default/files/ 
documents/ad755.pdf. 

(c) Letters of endorsement are 
required for certain representations. 

Persons with disabilities who require 
alternative means of communication for 
program information (for example., 
Braille, large print, audiotape, American 
Sign Language, etc.) should contact the 
responsible Agency or USDA’s TARGET 
Center at (202) 720–2600 (voice and 
TTY) or contact USDA through the 
Federal Relay Service at (800) 877–8339. 
Additionally, program information may 
be made available in languages other 
than English. 

Equal opportunity practices in 
accordance with USDA policies shall be 
followed in all appointments to the SRS 
RACs. To ensure that the 
recommendations of the SRS RACs have 
taken into account the needs of the 
diverse groups served by USDA, 
membership will, to the extent 
practicable, include individuals with 
demonstrated ability to represent all 
racial and ethnic groups, women and 
men, and persons with disabilities. 

USDA programs are prohibited from 
discriminating based on race, color, 
national origin, religion, sex, gender 
identity (including gender expression), 
sexual orientation, disability, age, 
marital status, family/parental status, 
income derived from a public assistance 
program, political beliefs, or reprisal or 
retaliation for prior civil rights activity, 
in any program or activity conducted or 
funded by USDA (not all bases apply to 
all programs). Remedies and complaint 
filing deadlines vary by program or 
incident. 

Dated: April 23, 2024. 
Cikena Reid, 
USDA Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2024–09085 Filed 4–26–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3411–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

The Department of Agriculture has 
submitted the following information 
collection requirement(s) to OMB for 
review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Comments are 
required regarding; whether the 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of burden including 
the validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Comments regarding this information 
collection received by May 29, 2024 will 
be considered. Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted within 30 days of the 
publication of this notice on the 
following website www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain. Find this 
particular information collection by 
selecting ‘‘Currently under 30-day 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function. 

An agency may not conduct or 
sponsor a collection of information 
unless the collection of information 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number and the agency informs 
potential persons who are to respond to 
the collection of information that such 
persons are not required to respond to 
the collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. 

Food Safety and Inspection Service 

Title: Salmonella Control Strategies 
Pilot Projects. 

OMB Control Number: 0583–NEW. 
Summary of Collection: Food Safety 

and Inspection Service FSIS has been 
delegated the authority to exercise the 
functions of the Secretary (7 CFR 2.18 

and 2.53), as specified in the Poultry 
Products Inspection Act (PPIA) (21 
U.S.C. 451, et seq.). This statute 
mandates that FSIS protect the public 
by verifying that poultry products are 
safe, wholesome, and properly labeled. 
This ongoing, voluntary data collection 
will provide comprehensive information 
about pathogen control and the 
measurement strategies necessary for an 
effective poultry products inspection 
program. 

Need and Use of the Information: On 
October 19, 2021, USDA announced that 
FSIS would mobilize a stronger and 
more comprehensive effort to reduce 
Salmonella illnesses associated with 
poultry products. A key component of 
this effort is identifying ways to 
incentivize the use of preharvest 
controls to reduce Salmonella 
contamination coming into the 
slaughterhouse. Under the pilot projects 
program, establishments will 
experiment with new or existing 
pathogen control and measurement 
strategies and share data with FSIS. 
Associations may also submit aggregate 
data. The data will be analyzed by FSIS 
to determine whether they support 
changes to FSIS existing Salmonella 
control strategies. 

Description of Respondents: Business- 
for-not for-profit; Farms; State, Local or 
Tribal Government. 

Number of Respondents: 40. 
Frequency of Responses: Reporting; 

Other (one-time). 
Total Burden Hours: 620. 

Rachelle Ragland-Greene, 
Acting Departmental Information Collection 
Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2024–09093 Filed 4–26–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–DM–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Census Bureau 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; 2024 American Community 
Survey (ACS) Sexual Orientation and 
Gender Identity Test 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and clearance in accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995, on or after the date of publication 
of this notice. We invite the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
comment on proposed, and continuing 
information collections, which helps us 
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