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CFR 102–3.150(b), waives the 15- 
calendar day notification requirement. 

The committee meeting is being held 
under the provisions of the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (FACA; 5 
U.S.C. 10), the Government in the 
Sunshine Act of 1976 (5 U.S.C. 552b, as 
amended), and 41 CFR 102–3.150. 

Purpose of the Meeting: The purpose 
of the meeting is to review TRADOC 
Priorities, the AEAC Charter, and to 
conduct mandatory annual ethics 
training. The Committee will also 
receive an overview of the Fiscal Year 
2024 AEAC Study which will focus on 
the modernization of the Special 
Operations School of Excellence 
(SOCoE). 

Agenda: January 24 and 25: The 
committee is chartered to provide 
independent advice and 
recommendations to the Secretary of the 
Army on the educational, doctrinal, and 
research policies and activities of U.S. 
Army educational programs. The 
committee will complete all FACA 
annual requirements, will begin 
discussions related to the modernization 
of the Special Operations School of 
Excellence (SOCoE), and discuss and 
deliberate provisional findings and 
recommendations submitted by its 
subcommittees. 

Public Accessibility to the Meeting: 
Pursuant to 5 U.S.C. 552b, as amended, 
and 41 CFR 102–3.140 through 102– 
3.165, and subject to the availability of 
space, this meeting is open to the 
public. Seating is on a first to arrive 
basis. Attendees are requested to submit 
their name, affiliation, and daytime 
phone number seven business days 
prior to the meeting to Dr. Green, via 
electronic mail, the preferred mode of 
submission, at the address listed in the 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT 
section. 

Because the meeting of the committee 
will be held in a Federal Government 
facility on a military base, security 
screening is required. A photo ID is 
required to enter base. Please note that 
security and gate guards have the right 
to inspect vehicles and persons seeking 
to enter and exit the installation. 
TRADOC Headquarters is fully 
handicap accessible. Wheelchair access 
is available in front at the main entrance 
of the building. For additional 
information about public access 
procedures, contact Dr. Green, the 
committee’s Designated Federal Officer, 
at the email address or telephone 
number listed in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section. 

Written Comments or Statements: 
Pursuant to 41 CFR 102–3.105(j) and 
102–3.140 and section 10(a)(3) of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, the 

public or interested organizations may 
submit written comments or statements 
to the committee in response to the 
stated agenda of the open meeting or in 
regard to the committee’s mission in 
general. Written comments or 
statements should be submitted to Dr. 
Green, the committee Designated 
Federal Officer, via electronic mail, the 
preferred mode of submission, at the 
address listed in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section. Each page 
of the comment or statement must 
include the author’s name, title or 
affiliation, address, and daytime phone 
number. The Designated Federal Official 
will review all submitted written 
comments or statements and provide 
them to members of the committee for 
their consideration. Written comments 
or statements being submitted in 
response to the agenda set forth in this 
notice must be received by the 
Designated Federal Official at least 
seven business days prior to the meeting 
to be considered by the committee. 
Written comments or statements 
received after this date may not be 
provided to the committee until its next 
meeting. 

Pursuant to 41 CFR 102–3.140d, the 
Committee is not obligated to allow a 
member of the public to speak or 
otherwise address the Committee during 
the meeting. Members of the public will 
be permitted to make verbal comments 
during the Committee meeting only at 
the time and in the manner described 
below. If a member of the public is 
interested in making a verbal comment 
at the open meeting, that individual 
must submit a request, with a brief 
statement of the subject matter to be 
addressed by the comment, at least 
seven business days in advance to the 
committee’s Designated Federal Official, 
via electronic mail, the preferred mode 
of submission, at the address listed in 
the FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT 
section. The Designated Federal Official 
will log each request, in the order 
received, and in consultation with the 
committee Chair, determine whether the 
subject matter of each comment is 
relevant to the committee’s mission 
and/or the topics to be addressed in this 
public meeting. A 15-minute period 
near the end of the meeting will be 
available for verbal public comments. 
Members of the public who have 
requested to make a verbal comment 
and whose comments have been 
deemed relevant under the process 
described above, will be allotted no 
more than three minutes during the 
period, and will be invited to speak in 

the order in which their requests were 
received by Designated Federal Official. 

James W. Satterwhite Jr., 
Army Federal Register Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2024–00308 Filed 1–9–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3710–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2544–000] 

Hydro Technology Systems; Notice of 
Authorization for Continued Project 
Operation 

The license for the Meyers Falls 
Hydroelectric Project No. 2544 was 
issued for a period ending December 31, 
2023. 

Section 15(a)(1) of the FPA, 16 U.S.C. 
808(a)(1), requires the Commission, at 
the expiration of a license term, to issue 
from year-to-year an annual license to 
the then licensee(s) under the terms and 
conditions of the prior license until a 
new license is issued, or the project is 
otherwise disposed of as provided in 
section 15 or any other applicable 
section of the FPA. If the project’s prior 
license waived the applicability of 
section 15 of the FPA, then, based on 
section 9(b) of the Administrative 
Procedure Act, 5 U.S.C. 558(c), and as 
set forth at 18 CFR 16.21(a), if the 
licensee of such project has filed an 
application for a subsequent license, the 
licensee may continue to operate the 
project in accordance with the terms 
and conditions of the license after the 
minor or minor part license expires, 
until the Commission acts on its 
application. If the licensee of such a 
project has not filed an application for 
a subsequent license, then it may be 
required, pursuant to 18 CFR 16.21(b), 
to continue project operations until the 
Commission issues someone else a 
license for the project or otherwise 
orders disposition of the project. 

If the project is subject to section 15 
of the FPA, notice is hereby given that 
an annual license for Project No. 2544 
is issued to Hydro Technology Systems 
for a period effective January 1, 2024, 
through December 31, 2024, or until the 
issuance of a new license for the project 
or other disposition under the FPA, 
whichever comes first. If issuance of a 
new license (or other disposition) does 
not take place on or before December 31, 
2024, notice is hereby given that, 
pursuant to 18 CFR 16.18(c), an annual 
license under section 15(a)(1) of the 
FPA is renewed automatically without 
further order or notice by the 
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1 Emailed comments from Nancy Shimeall and 10 
other individuals. 

Commission, unless the Commission 
orders otherwise. 

If the project is not subject to section 
15 of the FPA, notice is hereby given 
that Hydro Technology Systems is 
authorized to continue operation of the 
Meyers Falls Hydroelectric Project 
under the terms and conditions of the 
prior license until the issuance of a 
subsequent license for the project or 
other disposition under the FPA, 
whichever comes first. 

Dated: January 4, 2024. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Acting Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–00337 Filed 1–9–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER24–773–000] 

Escalante Solar, LLC; Supplemental 
Notice That Initial Market-Based Rate 
Filing Includes Request for Blanket 
Section 204 Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of 
Escalante Solar, LLC’s application for 
market-based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is January 24, 
2024. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at https://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 

eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
may mail similar pleadings to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. Hand delivered submissions in 
docketed proceedings should be 
delivered to Health and Human 
Services, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (https://
www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202) 502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Dated: January 4, 2024. 

Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Acting Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2024–00334 Filed 1–9–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RM98–1–000] 

Records Governing Off-the-Record 
Communications; Public Notice 

This constitutes notice, in accordance 
with 18 CFR 385.2201(b), of the receipt 
of prohibited and exempt off-the-record 
communications. 

Order No. 607 (64 FR 51222, 
September 22, 1999) requires 
Commission decisional employees, who 
make or receive a prohibited or exempt 
off-the-record communication relevant 
to the merits of a contested proceeding, 
to deliver to the Secretary of the 
Commission, a copy of the 
communication, if written, or a 
summary of the substance of any oral 
communication. 

Prohibited communications are 
included in a public, non-decisional file 
associated with, but not a part of, the 
decisional record of the proceeding. 
Unless the Commission determines that 
the prohibited communication and any 
responses thereto should become a part 
of the decisional record, the prohibited 
off-the-record communication will not 
be considered by the Commission in 
reaching its decision. Parties to a 
proceeding may seek the opportunity to 
respond to any facts or contentions 
made in a prohibited off-the-record 
communication and may request that 
the Commission place the prohibited 
communication and responses thereto 
in the decisional record. The 
Commission will grant such a request 
only when it determines that fairness so 
requires. Any person identified below as 
having made a prohibited off-the-record 
communication shall serve the 
document on all parties listed on the 
official service list for the applicable 
proceeding in accordance with Rule 
2010, 18 CFR 385.2010. 

Exempt off-the-record 
communications are included in the 
decisional record of the proceeding, 
unless the communication was with a 
cooperating agency as described by 40 
CFR 1501.6, made under 18 CFR 
385.2201(e)(1)(v). 

The following is a list of off-the- 
record communications recently 
received by the Secretary of the 
Commission. This filing may be viewed 
on the Commission’s website at http:// 
www.ferc.gov using the eLibrary link. 
Enter the docket number, excluding the 
last three digits, in the docket number 
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