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Dated: January 3, 2024. 
Alan F. Estevez, 
Under Secretary of Commerce for Industry 
and Security. 
[FR Doc. 2024–00190 Filed 1–8–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–JT–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

Civil Nuclear Trade Advisory 
Committee: Meeting of the Civil 
Nuclear Trade Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: International Trade 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice of Federal advisory 
committee meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice sets forth the 
schedule and proposed agenda for a 
meeting of the Civil Nuclear Trade 
Advisory Committee (CINTAC). 
DATES: The meeting is scheduled for 
Thursday, January 11, 2024, from 9 a.m. 
to 4 p.m. eastern standard time (EST). 
The deadline for members of the public 
to register, including requests to make 
comments during the meeting and for 
auxiliary aids, or to submit written 
comments for dissemination prior to the 
meeting, is 5 p.m. EST on Monday, 
January 8, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be in- 
person at the Department of Commerce 
Herbert C. Hoover Building (1401 
Constitution Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20230). Registered participants will be 
emailed instructions on accessing the 
designated meeting space. Requests to 
register (including to speak or for 
auxiliary aids) and any written 
comments should be submitted to Mr. 
Jonathan Chesebro, Office of Energy & 
Environmental Industries, International 
Trade Administration, (email: 
jonathan.chesebro@trade.gov). Members 
of the public should submit registration 
requests and written comments via 
email to ensure timely receipt. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mr. 
Jonathan Chesebro, Office of Energy & 
Environmental Industries, International 
Trade Administration, Room 28018, 
1401 Constitution Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20230. (Phone: 202– 
482–1297; email: jonathan.chesebro@
trade.gov.) 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background: The CINTAC was 
established under the discretionary 
authority of the Secretary of Commerce 
and in accordance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (5 U.S.C. 1001 
et seq.), in response to an identified 
need for consensus advice from U.S. 

industry to the U.S. Government 
regarding the development and 
administration of programs to expand 
U.S. exports of civil nuclear goods and 
services in accordance with applicable 
U.S. laws and regulations, including 
advice on how U.S. civil nuclear goods 
and services export policies, programs, 
and activities affect the U.S. civil 
nuclear industry’s competitiveness and 
ability to participate in the international 
market. 

Topics to be considered: The agenda 
for the Thursday, January 11, 2024, 
CINTAC meeting will include 
discussions of CINTAC priorities for its 
2022–2024 charter term and activities 
related to the U.S. Department of 
Commerce’s Civil Nuclear Trade 
Initiative. 

Members of the public wishing to 
attend the meeting must notify Mr. 
Jonathan Chesebro at the contact 
information above by 5 p.m. EST on 
Monday, January 8, 2024, in order to 
pre-register. Please specify any requests 
for reasonable accommodation at least 
five business days in advance of the 
meeting. 

A limited amount of time will be 
available for brief oral comments from 
members of the public attending the 
meeting. To accommodate as many 
speakers as possible, the time for public 
comments will be limited to two (2) 
minutes per person, with a total public 
comment period of 20 minutes. 
Individuals wishing to reserve speaking 
time during the meeting must contact 
Mr. Jonathan Chesebro and submit a 
brief statement of the general nature of 
the comments and the name and 
address of the proposed participant by 
5 p.m. EST on Monday, January 8, 2024. 
If the number of registrants requesting to 
make statements is greater than can be 
reasonably accommodated during the 
meeting, ITA may conduct a lottery to 
determine the speakers. 

Any member of the public may 
submit written comments concerning 
the CINTAC’s affairs at any time before 
and after the meeting. Comments may 
be submitted to Mr. Jonathan Chesebro 
in the International Trade 
Administration’s Office of Energy & 
Environmental Industries. For 
consideration during the meeting, and 
to ensure transmission to the Committee 
prior to the meeting, comments must be 
received no later than 5:00 p.m. EST on 
Monday, January 8, 2024. Comments 
received after that date will be 
distributed to the members but may not 
be considered at the meeting. 

Copies of CINTAC meeting minutes 
will be available within 90 days of the 
meeting. 

Dated: January 3, 2024. 
Man K. Cho, 
Deputy Director, Office of Energy and 
Environmental Industries. 
[FR Doc. 2024–00196 Filed 1–8–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DR–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

Renewable Energy and Energy 
Efficiency Advisory Committee; 
Meeting 

AGENCY: International Trade 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice of an open meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Renewable Energy and 
Energy Efficiency Advisory Committee 
(REEEAC or the Committee) will hold 
an in-person meeting, accessible to the 
public in-person and online, on 
Thursday, January 25, 2024 at the U.S. 
Department of Commerce in 
Washington, DC. Registration 
instructions for the public to attend 
either in-person or online are provided 
below. The meeting has a limited 
number of spaces for members of the 
public to attend in-person. Requests to 
attend in-person will be considered on 
a first-come first-served basis. 
DATES: Thursday, January 25, 2024, from 
approximately 10 a.m. to 3:30 p.m. 
eastern daylight time (EDT). Members of 
the public wishing to participate must 
register in advance with Cora Dickson at 
the contact information below by 5 p.m. 
EDT on Monday, January 22, 2024, 
including any requests to make 
comments during the meeting or for 
accommodations or auxiliary aids. 
ADDRESSES: To register, please contact 
Cora Dickson, Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO), Office of Energy and 
Environmental Industries (OEEI), 
Industry and Analysis, International 
Trade Administration, U.S. Department 
of Commerce at (202) 482–6083; email: 
Cora.Dickson@trade.gov. In their 
registration, members of the public 
wishing to attend in-person must 
request in-person attendance by the firm 
deadline above. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Cora 
Dickson, DFO, Office of Energy and 
Environmental Industries (OEEI), 
Industry and Analysis, International 
Trade Administration, U.S. Department 
of Commerce at (202) 482–6083; email: 
Cora.Dickson@trade.gov. Registered 
participants joining virtually will be 
emailed the login information for the 
meeting, which will be accessible as a 
livestream via WebEx Webinar. 
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Registered participants joining in- 
person will be emailed instructions on 
accessing the designated meeting space. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background: The Secretary of 
Commerce established the REEEAC 
pursuant to discretionary authority and 
in accordance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, as amended (5 
U.S.C. 1001 et seq.), on July 14, 2010. 
The REEEAC was re-chartered most 
recently on May 27, 2022. The REEEAC 
provides the Secretary of Commerce 
with advice from the private sector on 
the development and administration of 
programs and policies to expand the 
export competitiveness of U.S. 
renewable energy and energy efficiency 
products and services. More information 
about the REEEAC, including the list of 
appointed members for this charter, is 
published online at http://trade.gov/ 
reeeac. 

On January 25, 2024, the REEEAC will 
hold the sixth meeting of its current 
charter term. The Committee will 
deliberate on approval of several 
recommendations. The REEEAC will 
also be briefed on recent ITA 
accomplishments of relevance to the 
U.S. renewable energy and energy 
efficiency industries, including the 
delegation to COP28, the launch of the 
Clean Tech Top Export Markets website, 
and the establishment of the Supply 
Chain Center. The agenda will be made 
available by January 22, 2024 upon 
request to Cora Dickson, and the most 
current version of the agenda will also 
be made available on the REEEAC 
website. 

The meeting will be open to the 
public and will be accessible to people 
with disabilities. All guests are required 
to register in advance by the deadline 
identified under the DATES caption. 
Requests for auxiliary aids must be 
submitted by the registration deadline. 
Last minute requests will be accepted 
but may not be possible to fill. 

A limited amount of time before the 
close of the meeting will be available for 
oral comments from members of the 
public attending the meeting. Members 
of the public attending virtually who 
wish to speak during the public 
comment period must give the DFO 
advance notice in order to facilitate 
their access. To accommodate as many 
speakers as possible, the time for public 
comments will be limited to two to five 
minutes per person (depending on 
number of public participants). 
Individuals wishing to reserve speaking 
time during the meeting must contact 
Cora Dickson using the contact 
information above and submit a brief 
statement of the general nature of the 

comments, as well as the name and 
address of the proposed participant, by 
5 p.m. EDT on Monday, January 22, 
2024. If the number of registrants 
requesting to make statements is greater 
than can be reasonably accommodated 
during the meeting, the International 
Trade Administration may conduct a 
lottery to determine the speakers. 
Speakers are requested to submit a copy 
of their oral comments by email to Cora 
Dickson for distribution to the 
participants in advance of the meeting. 

Any member of the public may 
submit written comments concerning 
the REEEAC’s affairs at any time before 
or after the meeting. Comments may be 
submitted via email to the Renewable 
Energy and Energy Efficiency Advisory 
Committee, c/o: Cora Dickson, 
Designated Federal Officer, Office of 
Energy and Environmental Industries, 
U.S. Department of Commerce; 
Cora.Dickson@trade.gov. To be 
considered during the meeting, public 
comments must be transmitted to the 
REEEAC prior to the meeting. As such, 
written comments must be received no 
later than 5 p.m. EDT on Monday, 
January 22, 2024. Comments received 
after that date will be distributed to the 
members but may not be considered at 
the meeting. 

Copies of REEEAC meeting minutes 
will be available within 30 days 
following the meeting. 

Dated: January 3, 2024. 
Man K. Cho, 
Deputy Director, Office of Energy and 
Environmental Industries. 
[FR Doc. 2024–00194 Filed 1–8–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DR–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

[RTID 0648–XD284] 

Takes of Marine Mammals Incidental to 
Specified Activities; Taking Marine 
Mammals Incidental to the Hydaburg 
Seaplane Base Refurbishment Project 
in Hydaburg, Alaska 

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Issuance of an incidental 
harassment authorization. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
regulations implementing the Marine 
Mammal Protection Act (MMPA) as 
amended, notification is hereby given 
that NMFS has issued an incidental 
harassment authorization (IHA) to the 

Alaska Department of Transportation 
and Public Facilities (DOT&PF) to 
incidentally harass marine mammals 
during construction associated with the 
Hydaburg Seaplane Base Refurbishment 
Project in Hydaburg, Alaska. 

DATES: This authorization is effective 
from September 15, 2024 through 
September 14, 2025. 

ADDRESSES: Electronic copies of the 
application and supporting documents, 
as well as a list of the references cited 
in this document, may be obtained 
online at: https://www.fisheries.noaa.
gov/national/marine-mammal- 
protection/incidental-take- 
authorizations-construction-activities. 
In case of problems accessing these 
documents, please call the contact listed 
below. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Reny Tyson Moore, Office of Protected 
Resources, NMFS, (301) 427–8401. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

The MMPA prohibits the ‘‘take’’ of 
marine mammals, with certain 
exceptions. Sections 101(a)(5)(A) and 
(D) of the MMPA (16 U.S.C. 1361 et 
seq.) direct the Secretary of Commerce 
(as delegated to NMFS) to allow, upon 
request, the incidental, but not 
intentional, taking of small numbers of 
marine mammals by U.S. citizens who 
engage in a specified activity (other than 
commercial fishing) within a specified 
geographical region if certain findings 
are made and either regulations are 
proposed or, if the taking is limited to 
harassment, a notice of a proposed IHA 
is provided to the public for review. 

Authorization for incidental takings 
shall be granted if NMFS finds that the 
taking will have a negligible impact on 
the species or stock(s) and will not have 
an unmitigable adverse impact on the 
availability of the species or stock(s) for 
taking for subsistence uses (where 
relevant). Further, NMFS must prescribe 
the permissible methods of taking and 
other ‘‘means of effecting the least 
practicable adverse impact’’ on the 
affected species or stocks and their 
habitat, paying particular attention to 
rookeries, mating grounds, and areas of 
similar significance, and on the 
availability of the species or stocks for 
taking for certain subsistence uses 
(referred to in shorthand as 
‘‘mitigation’’); and requirements 
pertaining to the mitigation, monitoring 
and reporting of the takings are set forth. 
The definitions of all applicable MMPA 
statutory terms cited above are included 
in the relevant sections below. 
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