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for the pesticide of interest identified in 
Table 1 in Unit IV. 

For general information on the 
registration review program, contact: 
Melanie Biscoe, Pesticide Re-evaluation 
Division (7508P), Office of Pesticide 
Programs, Environmental Protection 
Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20460–0001; telephone 
number: (202) 566–0701; email address: 
biscoe.melanie@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

Does this action apply to me? 
This action is directed to the public 

in general and may be of interest to a 
wide range of stakeholders including 
environmental, human health, farm 
worker, and agricultural advocates; the 
chemical industry; pesticide users; and 
members of the public interested in the 
sale, distribution, or use of pesticides. 
Since others also may be interested, the 
Agency has not attempted to describe all 
the specific entities that may be affected 
by this action. If you have any questions 
regarding the applicability of this action 
to a particular entity, consult the 

pesticide specific contact person listed 
under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

II. Background 

Registration review is EPA’s periodic 
review of pesticide registrations to 
ensure that each pesticide continues to 
satisfy the statutory standard for 
registration, that is, the pesticide can 
perform its intended function without 
unreasonable adverse effects on human 
health or the environment. As part of 
the registration review process, the 
Agency has completed interim or final 
decisions for all pesticides listed in 
Table 1 in Unit IV. Through this 
program, EPA is ensuring that each 
pesticide’s registration is based on 
current scientific and other knowledge, 
including its effects on human health 
and the environment. 

III. Authority 

EPA is conducting its registration 
review of the chemicals listed in Table 
1 in Unit IV pursuant to section 3(g) of 
the Federal Insecticide, Fungicide, and 
Rodenticide Act (FIFRA) and the 

Procedural Regulations for Registration 
Review at 40 CFR part 155, subpart C. 
Section 3(g) of FIFRA provides, among 
other things, that the registrations of 
pesticides are to be reviewed every 15 
years. Under FIFRA, a pesticide product 
may be registered or remain registered 
only if it meets the statutory standard 
for registration given in FIFRA section 
3(c)(5) (7 U.S.C. 136a(c)(5)). When used 
in accordance with widespread and 
commonly recognized practice, the 
pesticide product must perform its 
intended function without unreasonable 
adverse effects on the environment; that 
is, without any unreasonable risk to 
man or the environment, or a human 
dietary risk from residues that result 
from the use of a pesticide in or on food. 

IV. What action is the agency taking? 

Pursuant to 40 CFR 155.58, this notice 
announces the availability of EPA’s 
interim or final registration review 
decisions for the pesticides shown in 
Table 1. The registration review 
decisions are supported by rationales 
included in the docket established for 
each chemical. 

TABLE 1—REGISTRATION REVIEW INTERIM AND FINAL DECISIONS BEING ISSUED 

Registration review case name and No. Docket ID No. Chemical review manager and contact information 

Dioctyl Sodium Sulfosuccinate; Case Number 4095 ....... EPA–HQ–OPP–2022–0550 Bob Little, little.robert@epa.gov, (202) 566–2234. 
Plant Extract 620; Case Number 6071 ............................ EPA–HQ–OPP–2013–0587 Joseph Mabon, mabon.joseph@epa.gov, (202) 566– 

1535. 
Polymeric betaine; Case Number 5116 ........................... EPA–HQ–OPP–2013–0374 Erin Dandridge, dandridge.erin@epa.gov, (202) 566– 

0635. 
Sodium Fluoroacetate; Case Number 3073 .................... EPA–HQ–OPP–2010–0753 Natalie Bray, bray.natalie@epa.gov, (202) 566–2222. 
Undecylenic Acid; Case Number 4095 ............................ EPA–HQ–OPP–2022–0549 Bob Little, little.robert@epa.gov, (202) 566–2234. 

The proposed decisions and proposed 
interim registration review decisions for 
the chemicals in the table above were 
posted to the docket and the public was 
invited to submit any comments or new 
information. EPA addressed the 
comments or information received 
during the 60-day comment period for 
the proposed interim decisions in the 
discussion for each pesticide listed in 
the table. Comments from the 60-day 
comment period that were received may 
or may not have affected the Agency’s 
interim or final decision. Pursuant to 40 
CFR 155.58(c), the registration review 
case docket for the chemicals listed in 
the Table will remain open until all 
actions required in the decision have 
been completed. 

This document also announces the 
closure of the registration review case 
for chlorpyrifos-methyl (Case Number 
8011, Docket ID Number EPA–HQ– 
OPP–2010–0119) because the last U.S. 
registrations for these pesticides have 
been canceled. 

Background on the registration review 
program is provided at: https://
www.epa.gov/pesticide-reevaluation. 

Authority: 7 U.S.C. 136 et seq. 
Dated: July 18, 2023. 

Mary Elissa Reaves, 
Director, Pesticide Re-Evaluation Division, 
Office of Pesticide Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2023–16016 Filed 7–27–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[DA 23–630; FR ID 158891] 

Disability Advisory Committee; 
Announcement of Meeting 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In this document, the 
Commission announces the second 
meeting of the fifth term of its Disability 

Advisory Committee (DAC or 
Committee). 

DATES: Thursday, September 7, 2023. 
The meeting will come to order at 9:00 
a.m. Eastern Time. 
ADDRESSES: The DAC meeting will be 
held in the Commission Meeting Room 
at FCC Headquarters, located at 45 L 
Street NE, Washington, DC 20554. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Joshua Mendelsohn, Designated Federal 
Officer, Federal Communications 
Commission, Consumer and 
Governmental Affairs Bureau, (202) 
559–7304, or email: dac@fcc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
meeting is open to members of the 
general public. The meeting will be 
webcast with sign language interpreters 
and open captioning at: www.fcc.gov/ 
live. In addition, a reserved amount of 
time will be available on the agenda for 
comments and inquiries from the 
public. Members of the public may 
comment or ask questions of presenters 
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via livequestions@fcc.gov. Requests for 
other reasonable accommodations or for 
materials in accessible formats for 
people with disabilities should be 
submitted via email to: fcc504@fcc.gov 
or by calling the Consumer and 
Governmental Affairs Bureau at (202) 
418–0530. Such requests should include 
a detailed description of the 
accommodation needed and a way for 
the FCC to contact the requester if more 
information is needed to fill the request. 
Requests should be made as early as 
possible; last minute requests will be 
accepted but may not be possible to 
accommodate. 

Proposed Agenda: At this meeting, 
the DAC is expected to discuss or 
receive updates on (i) a working group 
report and recommendation on the 
transmittal of audio description files to 
Internet Protocol programming; (ii) a 
working group report and 
recommendation on Direct Video 
Calling best practices and outreach; and 
(iii) any other topics relevant to the 
DAC’s work. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Suzanne Singleton, 
Chief, Disability Rights Office, Consumer and 
Governmental Affairs Bureau. 
[FR Doc. 2023–16070 Filed 7–27–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0813, OMB 3060–0987; FR ID 
157352] 

Information Collections Being 
Reviewed by the Federal 
Communications Commission Under 
Delegated Authority 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995, the Federal 
Communications Commission (FCC or 
the Commission) invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 

information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
The FCC may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid Office 
of Management and Budget (OMB) 
control number. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before September 26, 
2023. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Nicole Ongele, FCC, via email PRA@
fcc.gov and to nicole.ongele@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Nicole 
Ongele, (202) 418–2991. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0813. 
{PRIVATE} 

Title: Section 9.10, Enhanced 911 
Emergency Calling Systems. 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other-for- 

profit and State, local and Tribal 
governments. 

Number of Respondents and 
Responses: 675 Respondents; 567 
Responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 0.5–1 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: One-time 
third-party disclosure requirements. 

Obligation to Respond: Mandatory. 
Statutory authority for this information 
collection is contained in 47 U.S.C. 151, 
152, 154(i), 154(j), 154(o), 251(e), 303(b), 
303(g), 303(r), 316, and 403. 

Total Annual Burden: 527 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Needs and Uses: The information 

collection entailed in a Public Safety 
Answering Point (PSAP) request is 
necessary to initiate E911 service and 
serves as notice to the CMRS provider. 
The notification requirement on PSAPs 
will be used by the carriers to verify that 
wireless E911 calls are referred to 
PSAPs who have the technical 
capability to use the data to the caller’s 

benefit. If the carrier challenges the 
validity of the request, the request will 
be deemed valid if the PSAP making the 
request provides the following 
information: 

A. Cost Recovery. The PSAP must 
demonstrate that a mechanism is in 
place by which the PSAP will recover 
its costs of the facilities and equipment 
necessary to receive and utilize the E911 
data elements; 

B. Necessary Equipment. The PSAP 
must provide evidence that it has 
ordered the equipment necessary to 
receive and utilize the E911 data 
elements; and 

C. Necessary Facilities. The PSAP 
must demonstrate that it has made a 
timely request to the appropriate local 
exchange carrier for the necessary 
trunking and other facilities to enable 
E911 data to be transmitted to the PSAP. 

In the alternative, the PSAP may 
demonstrate that a funding mechanism 
is in place, that it is E911 capable using 
a Non-Call Path Associated Signaling 
technology, and that it has made a 
timely request to the appropriate LEC 
for the necessary ALI database upgrade. 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0987. 
Title: 911 Callback Capability; Non- 

initialized Handsets (47 CFR 
9.10(o)(1)(i–iii), 9.10(o)(2)(i–iii)). 

Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Businesses or other for- 

profit. 
Number of Respondents and 

Responses: 595 respondents; 225,595 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 
0.01094882 hour (range of 30 seconds 
for labeling each handset to one hour for 
each respondent’s public education 
effort). 

Frequency of Response: Third-party 
disclosure requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Mandatory. 
Statutory authority for this information 
collection is contained in 47 U.S.C. 154, 
160, 201, 251–254, 303, and 332 unless 
otherwise noted. 

Total Annual Burden: 2,470 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No Cost. 
Needs and Uses: In 2003, the 

Commission modified 47 CFR 20.18(l) 
to further improve the ability of public 
safety answering points (PSAPs) to 
respond quickly and efficiently to calls 
for emergency assistance made from 
non-service initialized wireless mobile 
handsets. In 2019, 47 CFR 20.18 was 
renumbered as 47 CFR 9.10. 
Accordingly, we have updated the 
references to section 20.18 with section 
9.10. See 84 FR 66716. Non-service- 
initialized wireless mobile handsets 
(non-initialized handsets) are not 
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