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COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the 
California Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of virtual 
business meetings. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) that the California Advisory 
Committee (Committee) to the U.S. 
Commission on Civil Rights will hold a 
series of virtual business meetings via 
ZoomGov on the following dates and 
times listed below. These meetings are 
for the purpose of reviewing and 
discussing the latest draft of their report 
on the civil rights implications of AB5. 
DATES: These meetings will take place 
on: 
• Friday, October 6, 2023, from 1:00 

p.m.–2:30 p.m. PT 
• Friday, November 3, 2023, from 1:00 

p.m.–2:30 p.m. PT 
• Friday, December 1, 2023, from 1:00 

p.m.–2:30 p.m. PT 
Zoom Link To Join: https://

www.zoomgov.com/meeting/register/ 
vJItc-Cppj4tEwuaYQD
hCjO8NPtQyYyDIZw. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brooke Peery, Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO) at bpeery@usccr.gov or by 
phone at (202) 701–1376. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Committee meetings are available to the 
public through the registration link 
above. Any interested member of the 
public may listen to the meeting. An 
open comment period will be provided 
to allow members of the public to make 
a statement as time allows. Per the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, public 
minutes of the meeting will include a 
list of persons who are present at the 
meeting. If joining via phone, callers can 
expect to incur regular charges for calls 
they initiate over wireless lines, 
according to their wireless plan. The 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
telephone number. Closed captioning 
will be available for individuals who are 
deaf, hard of hearing, or who have 
certain cognitive or learning 
impairments. To request additional 
accommodations, please email Angelica 
Trevino, Support Services Specialist at 
atrevino@usccr.gov at least 10 business 
days prior to the meeting. 

Members of the public are entitled to 
make comments during the open period 
at the end of the meeting. Members of 
the public may also submit written 
comments; the comments must be 
received in the Regional Programs Unit 
within 30 days following the meeting. 
Written comments may be emailed to 
Brooke Peery (DFO) at bpeery@
usccr.gov. 

Records and documents discussed 
during the meeting will be available for 
public viewing prior to and after the 
meeting at https://
www.facadatabase.gov/FACA/ 
FACAPublicViewCommittee
Details?id=a10t0000001gzkUAAQ. 

Please click on the ‘‘Meeting Details’’ 
and ‘‘Documents’’ links. Records 
generated from this meeting may also be 
inspected and reproduced at the 
Regional Programs Unit, as they become 
available, both before and after the 
meeting. Persons interested in the work 
of this Committee are directed to the 
Commission’s website, https://
www.usccr.gov, or may contact the 
Regional Programs Unit at (312) 353– 
8311. 

Agenda 
I. Welcome & Roll Call 
II. Committee Discussion 
III. Public Comment 
IV. Adjournment 

David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2023–15888 Filed 7–26–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the 
Nebraska Advisory Committee to the 
U.S. Commission on Civil Rights 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, that 
the Nebraska Advisory Committee 
(Committee) to the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights will host an in-person 
Community Forum in Lincoln. The 
purpose of the meeting is to gather 
testimony regarding the Covid–19 
Pandemic on education in the state, 
with a focus on digital divide and 
increasing mental health challenges. 
The Committee seeks to hear from 
students, teachers and other 
stakeholders on their experiences and in 
areas in which they still need support. 

DATES: Wednesday, August 9, 2023, 
from 1:00 p.m.–4:00 p.m. Central Time] 
ADDRESSES: Embassy Suites Lincoln, 
Room Regents B, 1040 P Street, Lincoln, 
NE 68506 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Victoria Moreno, Designated Federal 
Officer, at vmoreno@usccr.gov or by 
phone at 434–515–0204. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Members 
of the public are entitled to make 
comments during the open period 
towards the end of the Community 
Forum if you did not speak during the 
Community Forum. 

Members of the public are entitled to 
submit written comments; the 
comments must be received in the 
regional office within 30 days following 
the meeting. Written comments may be 
emailed to Victoria Moreno at 
vmoreno@usccr.gov. 

Persons who desire additional 
information may contact the Regional 
Programs Coordination Unit at 434– 
515–0204. Records generated from this 
meeting may be inspected and 
reproduced at the Regional Programs 
Coordination Unit Office, as they 
become available, both before and after 
the meeting. Records of the meetings 
will be available via 
www.facadatabase.gov under the 
Commission on Civil Rights, Nebraska 
Advisory Committee link. Persons 
interested in the work of this Committee 
are directed to the Commission’s 
website, http://www.usccr.gov, or may 
contact the Regional Programs 
Coordination Unit at vmoreno@
usccr.gov. 

Agenda 

I. Welcome & Roll Call 
II. Public Comment 
III. Next Steps 
IV. Adjournment 

Dated: July 21, 2023. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2023–15886 Filed 7–26–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the New 
York Advisory Committee to the U.S. 
Commission on Civil Rights 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Notice of virtual business 
meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
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Federal Advisory Committee Act, that 
the New York Advisory Committee 
(Committee) to the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights will hold a public meeting 
via Zoom. The purpose of the meeting 
is to discuss major themes and issues 
that have emerged from panel briefings 
I through VII on the New York child 
welfare system and its impact on Black 
children and families. 
DATES: Friday, August 18, 2023, from 
1:00 p.m.–3:00 p.m. Eastern Time. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held 
via Zoom. 

Registration Link (Audio/Visual): 
https://bit.ly/3OkM2rO. 

Join by Phone (Audio Only): 1–669– 
254–5252; Webinar ID: 160 034 0769#. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Mallory Trachtenberg, DFO, at 
mtrachtenberg@usccr.gov or 1–202– 
809–9618. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This 
Committee meeting is available to the 
public through the registration link 
above. Any interested member of the 
public may listen to the meeting. An 
open comment period will be provided 
to allow members of the public to make 
a statement as time allows. Per the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, public 
minutes of the meeting will include a 
list of persons who are present at the 
meeting. If joining via phone, callers can 
expect to incur regular charges for calls 
they initiate over wireless lines, 
according to their wireless plan. The 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Closed captioning is 
available by selecting ‘‘CC’’ in the 
meeting platform. To request additional 
accommodations, please email 
svillanueva@usccr.gov at least 10 
business days prior to the meeting. 

Members of the public are entitled to 
submit written comments; the 
comments must be received in the 
regional office within 30 days following 
the meeting. Written comments may be 
emailed to Mallory Trachtenberg at 
mtrachtenberg@usccr.gov. Persons who 
desire additional information may 
contact the Regional Programs 
Coordination Unit at 1–202–809–9618. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Regional Programs Coordination Unit 
Office, as they become available, both 
before and after the meeting. Records of 
the meetings will be available via 
www.facadatabase.gov under the 
Commission on Civil Rights, New York 
Advisory Committee link. Persons 
interested in the work of this Committee 
are directed to the Commission’s 
website, http://www.usccr.gov, or may 
contact the Regional Programs 

Coordination Unit at svillanueva@
usccr.gov. 

Agenda 

I. Welcome and Roll Call 
II. Approval of Minutes 
III. Discussion 
IV. Public Comment 
V. Next Steps 
VI. Adjournment 

Dated: July 21, 2023. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2023–15881 Filed 7–26–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the 
California Advisory Committee; Update 

AGENCY: Commission on Civil Rights. 
ACTION: Notice; update meeting date. 

SUMMARY: The Commission on Civil 
Rights published a notice in the Federal 
Register on Monday, March 20, 2023, 
concerning a meeting of the California 
Advisory Committee. The meeting date 
has since changed. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brooke Peery (DFO), bpeery@usccr.gov. 

Correction: In the Federal Register on 
Tuesday, March 20, 2023, in FR 
Document Number 2023–16586, on 
pages 16586 and 16587, third and first 
columns, change the meeting date from 
August 11, 2023, to August 18, 2023. In 
addition, the link to join will remain the 
same: https://www.zoomgov.com/ 
meeting/register/vJItdemgrTIoH3ECxG_
1nKQsiTklnVcYIUE. 

Dated: July 21, 2023. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2023–15883 Filed 7–26–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the 
California Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of virtual 
business meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) that the California Advisory 
Committee (Committee) to the U.S. 
Commission on Civil Rights will hold a 
business meeting via ZoomGov on 

Friday, September 8, 2023, from 1:00 
p.m.–2:30 p.m. Pacific time for the 
purpose of reviewing and discussing the 
latest draft of their report on the civil 
rights implications of AB5. 
DATES: Thes meeting will take place on: 

• Friday, September 8, 2023, from 
1:00 p.m.–2:30 p.m. PT. 

ZOOM LINK TO JOIN: https://
www.zoomgov.com/meeting/register/ 
vJItc-Cppj4tEwuaYQDhCj
O8NPtQyYyDIZw. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brooke Peery, Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO) at bpeery@usccr.gov or by 
phone at (202) 701–1376. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Committee meetings are available to the 
public through the registration link 
above. Any interested member of the 
public may listen to the meeting. An 
open comment period will be provided 
to allow members of the public to make 
a statement as time allows. Per the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, public 
minutes of the meeting will include a 
list of persons who are present at the 
meeting. If joining via phone, callers can 
expect to incur regular charges for calls 
they initiate over wireless lines, 
according to their wireless plan. The 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
telephone number. Closed captioning 
will be available for individuals who are 
deaf, hard of hearing, or who have 
certain cognitive or learning 
impairments. To request additional 
accommodations, please email Angelica 
Trevino, Support Services Specialist at 
atrevino@usccr.gov at least 10 business 
days prior to the meeting. 

Members of the public are entitled to 
make comments during the open period 
at the end of the meeting. Members of 
the public may also submit written 
comments; the comments must be 
received in the Regional Programs Unit 
within 30 days following the meeting. 
Written comments may be emailed to 
Brooke Peery (DFO) at bpeery@
usccr.gov. 

Records and documents discussed 
during the meeting will be available for 
public viewing prior to and after the 
meeting at https://
www.facadatabase.gov/FACA/ 
FACAPublicViewCommittee
Details?id=a10t0000001gzkUAAQ. 

Please click on the ‘‘Meeting Details’’ 
and ‘‘Documents’’ links. Records 
generated from this meeting may also be 
inspected and reproduced at the 
Regional Programs Unit, as they become 
available, both before and after the 
meeting. Persons interested in the work 
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