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commence when the determination is 
made. 

• If construction is delayed or halted 
due to the presence of a marine 
mammal, the activity may not 
commence or resume until either the 
animal has voluntarily exited and been 
visually confirmed beyond the 
shutdown zone or 15 minutes have 
passed without re-detection of the 
animal. 

• The Holder must use soft start 
techniques. Soft start requires 
contractors and equipment to slowly 
approach the work site creating a visual 
disturbance allowing animals in close 
proximity to construction activities a 
chance to leave the area prior to stone 
resetting or new stone placement. 
Contractors shall avoid walking or 
driving equipment through the seal 
haulout. A soft start must be 
implemented at the start of each day’s 
construction activity and at any time 
following cessation of activity for a 
period of 30 minutes or longer. 

• Vessels would approach the 
breakwater perpendicular to the area 
they need to be as much as is feasible 
to minimize interactions with pinnipeds 
on or near the breakwater. 

• The Holder must ensure that 
construction supervisors and crews, the 
monitoring team, and relevant ACOE 
staff are trained prior to the start of 
construction activity subject to this IHA, 
so that responsibilities, communication 
procedures, monitoring protocols, and 
operational procedures are clearly 
understood. New personnel joining 
during the project must be trained prior 
to commencing work. 

• Construction activity must be 
halted upon observation of either a 
species for which incidental take is not 
authorized or a species for which 
incidental take has been authorized but 
the authorized number of takes has been 
met, entering or within a 200 m Level 
B harassment zone. 

• Construction work will start at the 
landward end of the breakwater as 
much as feasible. 

• The ACOE must employ one 
protected species observers (PSOs) to 
monitor the shutdown and Level B 
harassment zones. 

• Monitoring will be conducted 30 
minutes before, during, and 30 minutes 
after construction activities. In addition, 
observers shall record all incidents of 
marine mammal occurrence, regardless 
of distance from activity, and shall 
document any behavioral reactions in 
concert with distance from construction 
activity. 

• The ACOE must submit a draft 
report detailing all monitoring within 90 
calendar days of the completion of 

marine mammal monitoring or 60 days 
prior to the issuance of any subsequent 
IHA for this project, whichever comes 
first. 

• The ACOE must prepare and submit 
final report within 30 days following 
resolution of comments on the draft 
report from NMFS. 

• The ACOE must submit all PSO 
datasheets and/or raw sighting data (in 
a separate file from the Final Report 
referenced immediately above). 

• The ACOE must report injured or 
dead marine mammals. 

Comments and Responses 
A notice of NMFS’ proposal to issue 

a renewal IHA to ACOE was published 
in the Federal Register on April 14, 
2023 (88 FR 23002). That notice either 
described, or referenced descriptions of, 
the ACOE’s activity, the marine 
mammal species that may be affected by 
the activity, the anticipated effects on 
marine mammals and their habitat, 
estimated amount and manner of take, 
and proposed mitigation, monitoring 
and reporting measures. NMFS received 
no public comments. 

Determinations 
The renewal request consists of a 

subset of activities analyzed through the 
initial authorization described above. In 
analyzing the effects of the activities for 
the initial IHA, NMFS determined that 
the ACOE’s activities would have a 
negligible impact on the affected species 
or stocks and that authorized take 
numbers of each species or stock were 
small relative to the relevant stocks (e.g., 
less than one-third the abundance of all 
stocks). The mitigation measures and 
monitoring and reporting requirements 
as described above are identical to the 
initial IHA. 

NMFS has concluded that there is no 
new information suggesting that our 
analysis or findings should change from 
those reached for the initial IHA. Based 
on the information and analysis 
contained here and in the referenced 
documents, NMFS has determined the 
following: (1) the required mitigation 
measures will effect the least practicable 
impact on marine mammal species or 
stocks and their habitat; (2) the 
authorized takes will have a negligible 
impact on the affected marine mammal 
species or stocks; (3) the authorized 
takes represent small numbers of marine 
mammals relative to the affected stock 
abundances; (4) ACOE’s activities will 
not have an unmitigable adverse impact 
on taking for subsistence purposes as no 
relevant subsistence uses of marine 
mammals are implicated by this action, 
and; (5) appropriate monitoring and 
reporting requirements are included. 

National Environmental Policy Act 

To comply with the National 
Environmental Policy Act of 1969 
(NEPA; 42 U.S.C. 4321 et seq.) and 
NOAA Administrative Order (NAO) 
216–6A, NMFS must review our 
proposed action (i.e., the issuance of an 
IHA renewal) with respect to potential 
impacts on the human environment. 

This action is consistent with 
categories of activities identified in 
Categorical Exclusion B4 (incidental 
take authorizations with no anticipated 
serious injury or mortality) of the 
Companion Manual for NOAA 
Administrative Order 216–6A, which do 
not individually or cumulatively have 
the potential for significant impacts on 
the quality of the human environment 
and for which we have not identified 
any extraordinary circumstances that 
would preclude this categorical 
exclusion. Accordingly, NMFS 
determined that the issuance of the 
initial IHA qualified to be categorically 
excluded from further NEPA review. 
NMFS has determined that the 
application of this categorical exclusion 
remains appropriate for this renewal 
IHA. 

Endangered Species Act (ESA) 

No incidental take of ESA-listed 
species is authorized or expected to 
result from this activity. Therefore, 
NMFS has determined that formal 
consultation under section 7 of the ESA 
is not required for this action. 

Renewal 

NMFS has issued a renewal IHA to 
ACOE for the take of marine mammals 
incidental to conducting Port San Luis 
breakwater repairs in Avila Beach, CA, 
through March 31, 2024. 

Dated: May 5, 2023. 
Kimberly Damon-Randall, 
Director, Office of Protected Resources, 
Marine Fisheries Service. 
[FR Doc. 2023–09951 Filed 5–9–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 
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ACTION: 30-Day information collection 
notice. 

SUMMARY: The DoD has submitted to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
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(OMB) for clearance the following 
proposal for collection of information 
under the provisions of the Paperwork 
Reduction Act. 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
comments received by June 9, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Angela Duncan, 571–372–7574, whs.mc- 
alex.esd.mbx.dd-dod-information- 
collections@mail.mil. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title; Associated Form; and OMB 
Number: Air Force Families Forever 
Annual Survivor Survey; OMB Control 
Number 0701–AFFF. 

Type of Request: New. 
Number of Respondents: 350. 
Responses per Respondent: 1. 
Annual Responses: 350. 
Average Burden per Response: 25 

minutes. 
Annual Burden Hours: 146. 
Needs and Uses: The Air Force 

Families Forever (AFFF) program is a 
long-term survivor program established 
to provide support to family members of 
deceased Regular Air Force and U.S. 
Space Force members and Reserve 
Component Airmen who died in an 
Active Duty, Inactive Duty for Training 
(IDT), or Annual Training (AT) status 
and whose relationship was established 
prior to the Airman or Guardian’s death. 
The program’s mission is to link 
families of fallen Airmen and Guardians 
to their Air Force and Space Force 
Family, thereby promoting Survivor 
resilience and fostering well-being and 
connectedness. The Air Force Families 
Forever Annual Survivor Survey is 
necessary to assess the impact and 
effectiveness of AFFF and make changes 
to policy, operational guidance, or 
tactical implementation of the program 
based on the results. Results may lead 
to changes to the current outreach 
conducted through AFFF, a 
reassessment of appropriate staffing 
levels, and the identification of high 
performing program elements, to name 
just a few potential outcomes. The AFFF 
survey is available to those NOK who 
are eligible for the program to obtain 
their assessment of how the program 
supports them and if any changes to the 
program are necessary to improve 
support. The survey is voluntary and 
will not collect any information specific 

to the respondent’s identity. The 
information collected will remain 
confidential and will only be used in 
aggregate. The results will be analyzed 
by headquarters staff to understand the 
impacts of the AFFF program. 

Affected Public: Individuals or 
households. 

Frequency: Annual. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
OMB Desk Officer: Ms. Jasmeet 

Seehra. 
You may also submit comments and 

recommendations, identified by Docket 
ID number and title, by the following 
method: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name, Docket 
ID number, and title for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing on the internet at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 

DOD Clearance Officer: Ms. Angela 
Duncan. 

Requests for copies of the information 
collection proposal should be sent to 
Ms. Duncan at whs.mc-alex.esd.mbx.dd- 
dod-information-collections@mail.mil. 

Dated: May 5, 2023. 
Aaron T. Siegel, 
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison 
Officer, Department of Defense. 
[FR Doc. 2023–09920 Filed 5–9–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–06–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Office of the Secretary 

[Docket ID: DoD–2023–OS–0041] 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

AGENCY: Office of the Under Secretary of 
Defense for Personnel and Readiness 
(OUSD(P&R)), Department of Defense 
(DoD). 
ACTION: 60-Day information collection 
notice. 

SUMMARY: In compliance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
OUSD(P&R) announces a proposed 
public information collection and seeks 
public comment on the provisions 
thereof. Comments are invited on: 
whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 

agency, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the agency’s estimate of 
the burden of the proposed information 
collection; ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; and ways to minimize the 
burden of the information collection on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
DATES: Consideration will be given to all 
comments received by July 10, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by docket number and title, 
by any of the following methods: 

Federal eRulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Mail: Department of Defense, Office of 
the Assistant to the Secretary of Defense 
for Privacy, Civil Liberties, and 
Transparency, 4800 Mark Center Drive, 
Mailbox #24, Suite 08D09, Alexandria, 
VA 22350–1700. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name, docket 
number and title for this Federal 
Register document. The general policy 
for comments and other submissions 
from members of the public is to make 
these submissions available for public 
viewing on the internet at http://
www.regulations.gov as they are 
received without change, including any 
personal identifiers or contact 
information. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: To 
request more information on this 
proposed information collection or to 
obtain a copy of the proposal and 
associated collection instruments, 
please write to Federal Voting 
Assistance Program ATTN: Mr. David 
Beirne, 4800 Mark Center Drive, Suite 
03J25, Alexandria, VA 22350, or call at 
(571) 372–0740. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title; Associated Form; and OMB 
Number: Overseas Citizen Population 
Survey; OMB Control Number 0704– 
0539. 

Needs and Uses: The primary 
objective of the Overseas Citizen 
Population Survey (OCPS), conducted 
on behalf of the Federal Voting 
Assistance Program (FVAP), is to refine 
FVAP’s methodology for estimating the 
number of overseas U.S. civilians who 
are eligible to vote and who have 
registered and participated in the past. 
These estimates are then used to address 
the question of whether the registration 
and voting propensity of the overseas 
civilian population differs from that of 
comparable domestic or military 
populations. Subsequent to each 
Presidential election year, FVAP must 
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