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Dated: April 7, 2023. 
Stephanie Weiner, 
Acting Chief Counsel, National 
Telecommunications and Information 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07776 Filed 4–12–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–60–P 

COMMISSION OF FINE ARTS 

Notice of Meeting 

Per 45 CFR chapter XXI 2102.3, the 
next meeting of the U.S. Commission of 
Fine Arts is scheduled for April 20, 
2023, at 9:00 a.m. and will be held via 
online videoconference. Items of 
discussion may include buildings, 
infrastructure, parks, memorials, and 
public art. 

Draft agendas, the link to register for 
the online public meeting, and 
additional information regarding the 
Commission are available on our 
website: www.cfa.gov. Inquiries 
regarding the agenda, as well as any 
public testimony, should be addressed 
to Thomas Luebke, Secretary, U.S. 
Commission of Fine Arts, at the above 
address; by emailing cfastaff@cfa.gov; or 
by calling 202–504–2200. Individuals 
requiring sign language interpretation 
for the hearing impaired should contact 
the Secretary at least 10 days before the 
meeting date. 

Dated April 3, 2023 in Washington, DC. 
Susan M. Raposa, 
Technical Information Specialist. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07833 Filed 4–12–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6330–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Air Force 

Record of Decision for the Foreign 
Military Sales Pilot Training Center at 
Ebbing Air National Guard Base, 
Arkansas, Environmental Impact 
Statement 

ACTION: Notice of Availability of Record 
of Decision. 

SUMMARY: On March 11, 2022, the 
Department of the Air Force (DAF) 
signed the Record of Decision (ROD) for 
the Record of Decision for the Foreign 
Military Sales (FMS) Pilot Training 
Center at Ebbing Air National Guard 
(ANG) Base, Arkansas, Environmental 
Impact Statement. 
ADDRESSES: Mr. David Martin, AFCEC/ 
CZN, Building 1 Bay 8 Room 8009, 3515 
S General McMullen, San Antonio TX 
78226–1710, (210) 925–4266; 
david.martin.127@us.af.mil. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The DAF 
has selected to beddown 12 Royal 
Singapore Air Force F–16 aircraft and 
24 F–35 FMS aircraft at Ebbing ANG 
Base, Arkansas. 

The DAF decision documented in the 
ROD was based on matters discussed in 
the Final Environmental Impact 
Statement, inputs from the public and 
regulatory agencies, and other relevant 
factors. The Final Environmental Impact 
Statement was made available to the 
public on February 3, 2023, through a 
Notice of Availability in the Federal 
Register (Volume 88, Number 23, Page 
7445) with a waiting period that ended 
on March 7, 2023. 

Authority: This Notice of Availability 
is published pursuant to the regulations 
(40 CFR part 1506.6) implementing the 
provisions of the National 
Environmental Policy Act (42 U.S.C. 
4321, et seq.) and the Air Force’s 
Environmental Impact Analysis Process 
(32 CFR parts 989.21(b) and 
989.24(b)(7)). 

Tommy W. Lee, 
Acting Air Force Federal Register Liaison 
Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07742 Filed 4–12–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 5001–10–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket No.: ED–2023–SCC–0023] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget for Review 
and Approval; Comment Request; 
Student Assistance General 
Provision—Subpart E—Verification 
Student Aid Application Information 

AGENCY: Federal Student Aid (FSA), 
Department of Education (ED). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 
1995, the Department is proposing an 
extension without change of a currently 
approved information collection request 
(ICR). 
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before May 15, 
2023. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for proposed 
information collection requests should 
be submitted within 30 days of 
publication of this notice. Click on this 
link www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain to access the site. Find this 
information collection request (ICR) by 
selecting ‘‘Department of Education’’ 
under ‘‘Currently Under Review,’’ then 

check the ‘‘Only Show ICR for Public 
Comment’’ checkbox. Reginfo.gov 
provides two links to view documents 
related to this information collection 
request. Information collection forms 
and instructions may be found by 
clicking on the ‘‘View Information 
Collection (IC) List’’ link. Supporting 
statements and other supporting 
documentation may be found by 
clicking on the ‘‘View Supporting 
Statement and Other Documents’’ link. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
specific questions related to collection 
activities, please contact Beth 
Grebeldinger, 202–377–4018. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: Student Assistance 
General Provision—Subpart E— 
Verification Student Aid Application 
Information. 

OMB Control Number: 1845–0041. 
Type of Review: An extension without 

change of a currently approved ICR. 
Respondents/Affected Public: Private 

Sector; Individuals and Households; 
State, Local, and Tribal Governments. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Responses: 23,855,169. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Burden Hours: 3,835,338. 

Abstract: This request is for an 
extension of the information collection 
supporting the policies and reporting 
requirements contained in subpart E of 
part 668—Verification and Updating of 
Student Aid Application Information. 
Sections 668.53, 668.54, 668.55, 668.56, 
668.57, 668.59 and 668.61 contain 
information collection requirements 
(OMB control number 1845–0041). This 
subpart governs the verification and 
updating of information provided on the 
Free Application for Federal Student 
Aid (FAFSA) which is used to calculate 
an applicant’s Expected Family 
Contribution (EFC) for purposes of 
determining an applicant’s need for 
student financial assistance under Title 
IV of Higher Education Act of 1965, as 
amended (HEA). The collection of this 
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documentation helps ensure that 
students (and parents in the case of 
PLUS loans) receive the correct amount 
of Title IV program assistance by 
providing accurate information to 
calculate an applicant’s expected family 
contribution. There has been no change 
to the regulatory language since the 
prior information collection filing. 

Dated: April 10, 2023. 
Kun Mullan, 
PRA Coordinator, Strategic Collections and 
Clearance, Governance and Strategy Division, 
Office of Chief Data Officer, Office of 
Planning, Evaluation and Policy 
Development. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07819 Filed 4–12–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Environmental Management Site- 
Specific Advisory Board, Oak Ridge 

AGENCY: Office of Environmental 
Management, Department of Energy. 
ACTION: Notice of open meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces an in- 
person/virtual hybrid meeting of the 
Environmental Management Site- 
Specific Advisory Board (EM SSAB), 
Oak Ridge. The Federal Advisory 
Committee Act requires that public 
notice of this meeting be announced in 
the Federal Register. 
DATES: Wednesday, May 10, 2023; 6 
p.m.–8 p.m. EDT. 
ADDRESSES: This hybrid meeting will be 
in-person at the Department of Energy 
(DOE) Information Center (address 
below) and virtually via Zoom. To 
provide a safe meeting environment, 
seating may be limited. To attend 
virtually or to register for in-person 
attendance, please send an email to: 
orssab@orem.doe.gov by 5 p.m. EDT on 
Wednesday, May 3, 2023. 

Board members, DOE representatives, 
agency liaisons, and Board support staff 
will participate in-person, following 
COVID–19 precautionary measures, at: 
DOE Information Center, Office of 
Science and Technical Information, 1 
Science.gov Way, Oak Ridge, Tennessee 
37831. 

Attendees should check the website 
listed below for any meeting format 
changes due to COVID–19 protocols. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Melyssa P. Noe, Deputy Designated 
Federal Officer, U.S. Department of 
Energy, Oak Ridge Office of 
Environmental Management (OREM), 
P.O. Box 2001, EM–942, Oak Ridge, TN 
37831; Phone (865) 241–3315; or E-Mail: 
Melyssa.Noe@orem.doe.gov. Or visit the 
website at www.energy.gov/orssab. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Purpose of the Board: The purpose of 

the Board is to make recommendations 
to DOE–EM and site management in the 
areas of environmental restoration, 
waste management, and related 
activities. 

Tentative Agenda: 
• Comments from the Deputy 

Designated Federal Officer 
• Comments from DOE, Tennessee 

Department of Environment and 
Conservation, and Environmental 
Protection Agency liaisons 

• Presentation 
• Public Comment Period 
• Motions/Approval of February 8, 2023 

Meeting Minutes and March 8, 2023 
Meeting Minutes 

• Status of Outstanding 
Recommendations 

• Subcommittee Reports 
Public Participation: This meeting is 

open to the public. The EM SSAB, Oak 
Ridge, welcomes the attendance of the 
public at its advisory committee 
meetings and will make every effort to 
accommodate persons with physical 
disabilities or special needs. If you 
require special accommodations due to 
a disability, please contact Melyssa P. 
Noe at least seven days in advance of 
the meeting at the phone number listed 
above. Written statements may be filed 
with the Board via email either before 
or after the meeting. Public comments 
received by no later than 5 p.m. EDT on 
Wednesday, May 3, 2023, will be read 
aloud during the meeting. 

Comments will be accepted after the 
meeting, by no later than 5 p.m. EDT on 
Monday, May 15, 2023. Please submit 
comments to orssab@orem.doe.gov. 
Please put ‘‘Public Comment’’ in the 
subject line. Individuals who wish to 
make oral statements should contact 
Melyssa P. Noe at the email address or 
telephone number listed above. 
Requests must be received five days 
prior to the meeting and reasonable 
provision will be made to include the 
presentation in the agenda. The Deputy 
Designated Federal Officer is 
empowered to conduct the meeting in a 
fashion that will facilitate the orderly 
conduct of business. Individuals 
wishing to submit written public 
comments should email them as 
directed above. Individuals wishing to 
make public comments will be provided 
a maximum of five minutes to present 
their comments. 

Minutes: Minutes will be available by 
emailing or calling Melyssa P. Noe at 
the email address and telephone 
number listed above. Minutes will also 
be available at the following website: 
https://www.energy.gov/orem/listings/ 

oak-ridge-site-specific-advisory-board- 
meetings. 

Signed in Washington, DC, on April 10, 
2023. 
LaTanya Butler, 
Deputy Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2023–07849 Filed 4–12–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings #1 

Take notice that the Commission 
received the following Complaints and 
Compliance filings in EL Dockets: 

Docket Numbers: EL23–57–001. 
Applicants: Lee County Generating 

Station, LLC v. PJM Interconnection, 
L.L.C. 

Description: Motion for Stay, or in the 
Alternative Limited Waiver or Remedial 
Relief, Request for Immediate 
Alternative Dispute Resolution, and 
Request for Waivers and Expedited 
Action of Lee County Generating 
Station, LLC. 

Filed Date: 4/5/23. 
Accession Number: 20230405–5183. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/20/23. 
Docket Numbers: EL23–59–000. 
Applicants: Lincoln Generating 

Facility, LLC v. PJM Interconnection, 
L.L.C. 

Description: Complaint of Lincoln 
Generating Facility, LLC v. PJM 
Interconnection, L.L.C. 

Filed Date: 4/6/23. 
Accession Number: 20230406–5213. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/8/23. 
Take notice that the Commission 

received the following electric rate 
filings: 

Docket Numbers: ER23–807–001. 
Applicants: Southern California 

Edison Company. 
Description: Tariff Amendment: 

Response to Deficiency, BCE Los 
Alamitos 2 First Amend GIA–DSA, 
WDT1583 to be effective 3/13/2023. 

Filed Date: 4/7/23 
Accession Number: 20230407–5038. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/28/23. 
Docket Numbers: ER23–1575–000. 
Applicants: Homer Solar Energy 

Center, LLC. 
Description: Homer Solar Energy 

Center, LLC Petitions for a Limited, 
Prospective Waiver of Section 30.4.4.5.1 
of the NYISO OATT. 

Filed Date: 4/3/23. 
Accession Number: 20230403–5359. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 4/24/23. 
Docket Numbers: ER23–1588–000. 
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