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7 See https://sam.gov/content/assistance-listings. 

marketing of grain. Grain producers in 
affected counties in Illinois, Indiana, 
Iowa, Kentucky, Minnesota, Missouri, 
North Dakota, South Dakota, Tennessee 
and any other affected counties as 
determined and announced by the 
Deputy Administrator for Farm 
Programs (DAFP) are eligible to apply. 

The producers are required to 
complete the form FSA–413 and FSA– 
413–1, Continuation Sheet for EGSFP, if 
applicable, EGSFP Application to 
determine eligibility and the need for 
the on-farm grain storage capacity, 
estimated costs to build the on-farm 
grain storage and purchase drying and 
handling equipment. FSA may request 
additional supporting documents for 
verification of information on a 
completed EGSFP Application. 

For the following estimated total 
annual burden on respondents, the 
formula used to calculate the total 
burden hour is the estimated average 
time per response multiplied by the 
estimated total annual responses. 

Estimate of Respondent Burden: 
Public reporting burden for this 
information collection is estimated to 
average 0.2368 hours per response to 
include the time for reviewing 
instructions, searching for information, 
gathering, and maintaining the data, and 
completing and reviewing the collection 
of information. 

Type of Respondents: Producers or 
farmers. 

Estimated Annual Number of 
Respondents: 750. 

Estimated Number of Responses per 
Respondent: 1.92. 

Estimated Total Annual Responses: 
1440. 

Estimated Average Time per 
Response: 0.2368 hours. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden on 
Respondents: 341 hours. 

We are requesting comments on all 
aspects of this information collection to 
help us to: 

(1) Evaluate whether the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
FSA, including whether the information 
will have practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of FSA’s 
estimate of burden including the 
validity of the methodology and 
assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those that 
are to respond, including using 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

All comments received in response to 
this document, including names and 
addresses when provided, will be a 
matter of public record. Comments will 
be summarized and included in the 
submission for Office of Management 
and Budget approval. 

Environmental Review 
The environmental impacts have been 

considered in a manner consistent with 
the provisions of the National 
Environmental Policy Act (NEPA, 42 
U.S.C. 4321–4347), the regulations of 
the Council on Environmental Quality 
(40 CFR parts 1500–1508), and the FSA 
regulations for compliance with NEPA 
(7 CFR part 799). 

The purpose of EGSFP is to establish 
assistance to help agricultural producers 
in affected counties in Illinois, Indiana, 
Iowa, Kentucky, Minnesota, Missouri, 
North Dakota, South Dakota, and 
Tennessee purchase and build on-farm 
grain storage and purchase drying and 
handling equipment necessary due to 
marketing and storage disruptions 
caused by devastating natural disaster 
events from December 1, 2021, through 
August 1, 2022. The limited 
discretionary aspects of EGSFP do not 
have the potential to impact the human 
environment as they are administrative. 
Accordingly, these discretionary aspects 
are covered by the categorical 
exclusions in 7 CFR 799.31(b)(6)(iii) that 
applies to price support programs, 
provided no extraordinary 
circumstances are found to exist. As 
such, the implementation of EGSFP and 
the participation in EGSFP do not 
constitute major Federal actions that 
would significantly affect the quality of 
the human environment, individually or 
cumulatively. Therefore, FSA will not 
prepare an environmental assessment or 
environmental impact statement for this 
action and this document serves as 
documentation of the programmatic 
environmental compliance decision for 
this federal action. 

Federal Assistance Programs 
The title and number of the Federal 

assistance programs, as found in the 
Assistance Listing,7 to which this 
document applies is 10.973, Emergency 
Grain Storage Facility Assistance 
Program. 

USDA Non-Discrimination Policy 
In accordance with Federal civil 

rights law and USDA civil rights 
regulations and policies, USDA, its 
Agencies, offices, and employees, and 
institutions participating in or 
administering USDA programs are 

prohibited from discriminating based on 
race, color, national origin, religion, sex, 
gender identity (including gender 
expression), sexual orientation, 
disability, age, marital status, family or 
parental status, income derived from a 
public assistance program, political 
beliefs, or reprisal or retaliation for prior 
civil rights activity, in any program or 
activity conducted or funded by USDA 
(not all bases apply to all programs). 
Remedies and complaint filing 
deadlines vary by program or incident. 

Individuals who require alternative 
means of communication for program 
information (for example, braille, large 
print, audiotape, American Sign 
Language, etc.) should contact the 
responsible Agency or USDA TARGET 
Center at (202) 720–2600 (voice and text 
telephone (TTY) or dial 711 for 
Telecommunications Relay Service 
(both voice and text telephone users can 
initiate this call from any telephone). 
Additionally, program information may 
be made available in languages other 
than English. 

To file a program discrimination 
complaint, complete the USDA Program 
Discrimination Complaint Form, AD– 
3027, found online at https://
www.usda.gov/oascr/how-to-file-a- 
program-discrimination-complaint and 
at any USDA office or write a letter 
addressed to USDA and provide in the 
letter all the information requested in 
the form. To request a copy of the 
complaint form, call (866) 632–9992. 
Submit your completed form or letter to 
USDA by mail to: U.S. Department of 
Agriculture, Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Civil Rights, 1400 
Independence Avenue SW, Washington, 
DC 20250–9410 or email: OAC@
usda.gov. 

USDA is an equal opportunity 
provider, employer, and lender. 

William Marlow, 
Acting Administrator, Farm Service Agency. 
[FR Doc. 2023–05331 Filed 3–10–23; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 3411–E2–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

Lolo National Forest; Revision of the 
Land Management Plan for the Lolo 
National Forest 

AGENCY: Forest Service, Agriculture 
(USDA). 
ACTION: Notice of intent to prepare an 
Assessment and Initiate Land 
Management Plan Revision for the Lolo 
National Forest. 
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SUMMARY: The Forest Service, U.S. 
Department of Agriculture, is initiating 
the Land Management Plan (Plan) 
revision process, pursuant to the 2012 
Planning Rule and as directed by the 
National Forest Management Act, for the 
Lolo National Forest located in western 
Montana. This process will result in a 
revised Land Management Plan which 
will guide all resource management 
activities on the Lolo National Forest for 
approximately 15 years. This notice 
announces the initiation of the 
assessment phase, the beginning of plan 
development, and the preliminary 
stages of the plan revision process. The 
assessment will identify and consider 
relevant and readily accessible material 
about ecological, social, and economic 
conditions and trends in the planning 
area, including best available scientific 
information. Trends and conditions 
identified in the assessment will then 
help describe a need to change the 
existing plan and inform the revision of 
the Plan. 
DATES: In the winter and spring of 2023, 
the public has been invited to engage 
and participate in the assessment phase 
of the revision process. Engagement 
opportunities are posted on the Lolo 
National Forest Plan Revision website, 
located at https://www.fs.usda.gov/goto/ 
lolo/planrevision. The Lolo National 
Forest will conduct consultation with 
Tribes as part of the assessment phase 
of revision. Information will also be 
shared through electronic mailing lists, 
social media, and media outlets. If 
members of the public are interested in 
learning more, please visit the website 
listed above and select the link to 
subscribe to updates on the Lolo Plan 
Revision. The public can also sign up by 
sending an email to 
SM.FS.LNFRevision@usda.gov. The 
Forest Service will produce a draft 
assessment for public review and 
comment, expected around May 2023. 
The Forest Service will review and 
incorporate public comments and 
additional information from tribal 
consultation on the assessment and 
produce a final assessment to inform 
plan revision for the Lolo National 
Forest. The Forest Service may then 
initiate procedures pursuant to the 
National Environmental Policy Act 
(NEPA) to prepare a revised Land 
Management Plan. 
ADDRESSES: For questions about Land 
Management Plan revision or comments 
on initiating the assessment phase of 
plan revision, please address mail to: 
Lolo National Forest Supervisor’s 
Office, Attn: Amanda Milburn—Lolo 
Plan Revision, 24 Fort Missoula Rd., 
Missoula, MT 59804, or via email to 

SM.FS.LNFRrevision@usda.gov. All 
correspondence, including names and 
addresses, will be part of the public 
record. More information on the 
planning process can also be found on 
the Lolo Plan Revision website at 
https://www.fs.usda.gov/goto/lolo/ 
planrevision. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Amanda Milburn, Plan Revision Team 
Leader, 406–438–6440. 

Individuals who use 
telecommunication devices for the deaf 
and hard of hearing (TDD) may call the 
Federal Relay Service (FRS) at 1–800– 
877–8339, 24 hours a day, every day of 
the year, including holidays. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
National Forest Management Act 
(NFMA) of 1976 requires that the Forest 
Service develop a Land and Resource 
Management Plan, often called a Forest 
Plan, for every national forest. Forest 
Plans provide the strategic direction for 
management of forest resources and are 
amendable as conditions change over 
time. The Lolo Forest Plan was adopted 
in 1986. This notice announces the start 
of the first stage of the plan revision 
process, during which updated 
information from the public, Tribes, 
other government agencies, and non- 
governmental parties, will be compiled 
into an assessment. Information relevant 
to these reports typically includes the 
status and trends of ecological, social, 
and economic conditions within the 
planning area and across the broader 
landscape. Federal Regulation 36 CFR 
219.6 requires the assessment of (1) 
Terrestrial ecosystems, aquatic 
ecosystems, and watersheds; (2) Air, 
soil, and water resources and quality; (3) 
System drivers, including dominant 
ecological processes, disturbance 
regimes, and stressors, such as natural 
succession, wildland fire, invasive 
species, and climate change, and the 
ability of terrestrial and aquatic 
ecosytems in the plan area to adapt to 
change; (4) Baseline assessment of 
carbon stocks; (5) Threatened, 
endangered, proposed, and candidate 
species, and potential species of 
conservation concern present in the 
plan area; (6) Social, cultural, and 
economic conditions; (7) Benefits 
people obtain from the National Forest 
System planning area (ecosystem 
services); (8) Multiple uses and their 
contributions to local, regional, and 
national economies; (9) Recreation 
settings, opportunities and access, and 
scenic character; (10); Renewable and 
nonrenewable energy and mineral 
resources; (11) Infrastructure, such as 
recreational facilities and transportation 
and utility corridors; (12) Areas of tribal 

importance; (13) Cultural and historic 
resources and uses; (14) Land status and 
ownership and access patterns; and (15) 
Existing designated areas located in the 
plan area including wilderness and wild 
and scenic rivers and potential need and 
opportunity for additional designated 
areas. 

During this assessment phase, the 
Forest Service invites other government 
agencies, Tribes, non-governmental 
parties, and the public to share 
information about social, economic, and 
environmental conditions of the Lolo 
National Forest and the broader 
landscape. Existing information about 
conditions on the Lolo National Forest, 
supplemented with information 
gathered through public engagement 
and tribal consultation, will be 
integrated into final resource 
assessments. The Forest Service will 
host public outreach forums to share 
progress and gather additional 
information. 

Responsible Official: The responsible 
official for the revision of the land and 
resource management plan for the Lolo 
National Forest is Carolyn Upton, Forest 
Supervisor, Lolo National Forest 
Supervisor’s Office, 24 Fort Missoula 
Road, Missoula, MT 59804, phone 406– 
329–3750. 

Dated: March 10, 2023. 
Troy Heithecker, 
Associate Deputy Chief, National Forest 
System. 
[FR Doc. 2023–05352 Filed 3–15–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3411–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

[A–580–867] 

Large Power Transformers From the 
Republic of Korea: Final Results of 
Antidumping Duty Administrative 
Review; 2020–2021 

AGENCY: Enforcement and Compliance, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 
SUMMARY: The U.S. Department of 
Commerce (Commerce) determines that 
Hyosung Heavy Industries Corporation 
(Hyosung) made sales of large power 
transformers from the Republic of Korea 
(Korea) at less than normal value during 
the period of review (POR) August 1, 
2020, through July 31, 2021. 
DATES: Applicable March 16, 2023. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: John 
Drury, AD/CVD Operations, Office VI, 
Enforcement and Compliance, 
International Trade Administration, 
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