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multinational nature of business, and 
international standards for regulating 
futures, swaps, options, and derivatives 
markets, as well as intermediaries. 
DATES: The meeting will be held on 
February 13, 2023, from approximately 
9:30 a.m. to 3 p.m. EST. Please note that 
the meeting may end early if the GMAC 
has completed its business. Members of 
the public who wish to submit written 
statements in connection with the 
meeting should submit them by 
February 20, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will take place 
in the Conference Center at the CFTC’s 
headquarters, Three Lafayette Centre, 
1155 21st Street NW, Washington, DC 
20581 subject to CFTC facility health 
protocols in place at that time. You may 
submit public comments, identified by 
‘‘Global Markets Advisory Committee,’’ 
through the CFTC website at https://
comments.cftc.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments 
through the Comments Online process 
on the website. If you are unable to 
submit comments online, contact Gates 
S. Hurand, Designated Federal Officer, 
or Meghan Tente, Alternate Designated 
Federal Officer, via the contact 
information listed in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section of this 
notice, to discuss alternate means of 
submitting your comments. Any 
statements submitted in connection 
with the committee meeting will be 
made available to the public, including 
publication on the CFTC website, 
https://www.cftc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Gates S. Hurand, GMAC Designated 
Federal Officer, Commodity Futures 
Trading Commission, Three Lafayette 
Centre, 1155 21st Street NW, 
Washington, DC 20581; (202) 418–5000; 
or Meghan Tente, GMAC Alternate 
Designated Federal Officer, Commodity 
Futures Trading Commission, Three 
Lafayette Centre, 1155 21st Street NW, 
Washington, DC; (202) 418–5000. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
meeting will be open to the public. 
Seating for the public may be limited 
due to the CDC’s COVID–19 Community 
Level, which may require facilitating 
physical distancing to avoid 
overcrowding and additional 
restrictions. Members of the public may 
listen to the meeting by telephone by 
calling a domestic or international 
number to connect to a live, listen-only 
audio feed. Call-in participants should 
be prepared to provide their first name, 
last name, and affiliation. 

Domestic Numbers: +1 669 254 5252, 
+1 646 828 7666, +1 669 216 1590, +1 
551 285 1373, 833 568 8864 (Toll Free), 
or 833 435 1820 (Toll Free). 

International Numbers: Will be posted 
on the CFTC’s website, https://
www.cftc.gov, on the page for the 
meeting, under Related Links. 

Webinar ID: 161 214 0349. 
Pass Code/Pin Code: 777139. 
The meeting will also be open to the 

public via webcast on the https://
www.cftc.gov website. The meeting 
agenda may change to accommodate 
other GMAC priorities. For agenda 
updates, please visit the GMAC 
committee site at: https://www.cftc.gov/ 
About/AdvisoryCommittees/GMAC. 

All written submissions provided to 
the CFTC in any form will also be 
published on the CFTC’s website. 
Persons requiring special 
accommodations to attend the meeting 
because of a disability should notify the 
contact person above. 
(Authority: 5 U.S.C. app. 2 section 10(a)(2).) 

Dated: January 12, 2023. 
Christopher Kirkpatrick, 
Secretary of the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2023–00841 Filed 1–17–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6351–01–P 

DELAWARE RIVER BASIN 
COMMISSION 

Notice of Public Hearing and Business 
Meeting; February 8 and March 8, 2023 

Notice is hereby given that the 
Delaware River Basin Commission will 
hold a public hearing on Wednesday, 
February 8, 2023. A business meeting 
will be held the following month on 
Wednesday, March 8, 2023. Both the 
hearing and the business meeting are 
open to the public. Both will be 
conducted remotely. Details about the 
remote platforms for the two events will 
be posted on the Commission’s website, 
www.drbc.gov, at least ten days prior to 
the respective meeting dates. 

Public Hearing. The Commission will 
conduct the public hearing virtually on 
February 8, 2023, commencing at 1:30 
p.m. Hearing items will include draft 
dockets for withdrawals, discharges, 
and other projects that could have a 
substantial effect on the basin’s water 
resources. A list of the projects 
scheduled for hearing, including project 
descriptions, will be posted on the 
Commission’s website, www.drbc.gov, 
in a long form of this notice at least ten 
days before the hearing date. 

Written comments on matters 
scheduled for hearing on February 8, 
2023 will be accepted through 5:00 p.m. 
on Monday, February 13, 2023. 

The public is advised to check the 
Commission’s website periodically 
during the ten days prior to the hearing 

date, as items scheduled for hearing 
may be postponed if additional time is 
needed to complete the Commission’s 
review. Items also may be added up to 
ten days prior to the hearing date. In 
reviewing docket descriptions, the 
public is asked to be aware that the 
details of projects may change during 
the Commission’s review, which is 
ongoing. 

Public Meeting. The public business 
meeting on March 8, 2023 will begin at 
10:30 a.m. and will include: adoption of 
the Minutes of the Commission’s 
December 7, 2022 business meeting; 
announcements of upcoming meetings 
and events; a report on hydrologic 
conditions; reports by the Executive 
Director and the Commission’s General 
Counsel; and consideration of any items 
for which a hearing has been completed 
or is not required. The agenda is 
expected to include consideration of the 
draft dockets for withdrawals, 
discharges, and other projects that were 
subjects of the public hearing on 
February 8, 2023. 

After all scheduled business has been 
completed and as time allows, the 
business meeting will be followed by up 
to one hour of Open Public Comment, 
an opportunity to address the 
Commission on any topic concerning 
management of the Basin’s water 
resources outside the context of a duly 
noticed, on-the-record public hearing. 

There will be no opportunity for 
additional public comment for the 
record at the March 8, 2023 business 
meeting on items for which a hearing 
was completed on February 8, 2023 or 
a previous date. Commission 
consideration on March 8, 2023 of items 
for which the public hearing is closed 
may result in approval of the item (by 
docket or resolution) as proposed, 
approval with changes, denial, or 
deferral. When the Commissioners defer 
an action, they may announce an 
additional period for written comment 
on the item, with or without an 
additional hearing date, or they may 
take additional time to consider the 
input they have already received 
without requesting further public input. 
Any deferred items will be considered 
for action at a public meeting of the 
Commission on a future date. 

Advance Registration and Sign-Up for 
Oral Comment. Links for registering to 
attend the public hearing and the 
business meeting will be posted at 
www.drbc.gov at least ten days before 
each meeting date. Registrants who wish 
to comment on the record during the 
public hearing on February 8, 2023 or to 
address the Commissioners informally 
during the Open Public Comment 
portion of the meeting on March 8, 2023 
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as time allows, will be asked to so 
indicate when registering. The 
Commission’s hearing and business 
meeting will also be livestreamed on 
YouTube at https://www.youtube.com/@
DRBC_1961. For assistance, please 
contact Ms. Patricia Hausler of the 
Commission staff, at patricia.hausler@
drbc.gov. 

Addresses for Written Comment. 
Written comment on items scheduled 
for hearing may be made through the 
Commission’s web-based comment 
system, a link to which is provided at 
www.drbc.gov. Use of the web-based 
system ensures that all submissions are 
captured in a single location and their 
receipt is acknowledged. Exceptions to 
the use of this system are available 
based on need, by writing to the 
attention of the Commission Secretary, 
DRBC, P.O. Box 7360, 25 Cosey Road, 
West Trenton, NJ 08628–0360. For 
assistance, please contact Patricia 
Hausler at patricia.hausler@drbc.gov. 

Accommodations for Special Needs. 
Individuals in need of an 
accommodation as provided for in the 
Americans with Disabilities Act who 
wish to attend the meeting or hearing 
should contact the Commission 
Secretary directly at 609–883–9500 ext. 
203 or through the Telecommunications 
Relay Services (TRS) at 711, to discuss 
how we can accommodate your needs. 

Additional Information, Contacts. 
Additional public records relating to 
hearing items may be examined at the 
Commission’s offices by appointment by 
contacting Denise McHugh, 609–883– 
9500, ext. 240. For other questions 
concerning hearing items, please contact 
David Kovach, Project Review Section 
Manager at 609–883–9500, ext. 264. 

Authority. Delaware River Basin 
Compact, Public Law 87–328, Approved 
September 27, 1961, 75 Statutes at 
Large, 688, sec. 14.4. 

Dated: January 10, 2023. 

Pamela M. Bush, 
Commission Secretary and Assistant General 
Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2023–00849 Filed 1–17–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket No.: ED–2022–SCC–0129] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget for Review 
and Approval; Comment Request; 
Accrediting Agencies Reporting 
Activities for Institutions and 
Programs—Database of Accredited 
Postsecondary Institution and 
Programs (DAPIP) 

AGENCY: Office of Postsecondary 
Education (OPE), Department of 
Education (ED). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 
1995, the Department is proposing an 
extension without change of a currently 
approved information collection request 
(ICR). 
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before February 
17, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for proposed 
information collection requests should 
be submitted within 30 days of 
publication of this notice. Click on this 
link www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain to access the site. Find this 
information collection request (ICR) by 
selecting ‘‘Department of Education’’ 
under ‘‘Currently Under Review,’’ then 
check the ‘‘Only Show ICR for Public 
Comment’’ checkbox. Reginfo.gov 
provides two links to view documents 
related to this information collection 
request. Information collection forms 
and instructions may be found by 
clicking on the ‘‘View Information 
Collection (IC) List’’ link. Supporting 
statements and other supporting 
documentation may be found by 
clicking on the ‘‘View Supporting 
Statement and Other Documents’’ link. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
specific questions related to collection 
activities, please contact Herman 
Bounds, (202) 453–6128. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 

that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: Accrediting 
Agencies Reporting Activities for 
Institutions and Programs—Database of 
Accredited Postsecondary Institution 
and Programs (DAPIP). 

OMB Control Number: 1840–0838. 
Type of Review: Extension without 

change of a currently approved ICR. 
Respondents/Affected Public: Private 

sector. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses: 9,014. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Burden Hours: 751. 
Abstract: Sections 496(a)(7), (a)(8), 

(c)(7), and (c)(8) of the Higher Education 
Act (HEA), and Federal regulations at 34 
CFR 34 CFR 602.26 and 602.27 contain 
certain requirements for reporting by 
recognized accrediting agencies to the 
Department on the institutions and 
programs the agencies accredit. This 
collection specifies the required and 
requested reporting. It also discusses the 
channel for reporting this information, 
and reporting information the 
accrediting agency may wish to submit 
voluntarily to ensure that the 
Department’s Database of Accredited 
Postsecondary Institutions and 
Programs is accurate and 
comprehensive. 

Dated: January 11, 2023. 
Kun Mullan, 
PRA Coordinator, Strategic Collections and 
Clearance, Governance and Strategy Division, 
Office of Chief Data Officer, Office of 
Planning, Evaluation and Policy 
Development. 
[FR Doc. 2023–00744 Filed 1–17–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket ID ED–2021–IES–0046] 

Privacy Act of 1974; System of 
Records—National Center for 
Education Statistics (NCES) 
Longitudinal, Cross-Sectional, and 
International Studies 

AGENCY: National Center for Education 
Statistics, Institute of Education 
Sciences, Department of Education. 
ACTION: Notice of a modified system of 
records. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Privacy Act of 1974, as amended 
(Privacy Act), the U.S. Department of 
Education (Department) publishes this 
notice of a modified system of records 
entitled ‘‘National Center for Education 
Statistics (NCES) Longitudinal, Cross- 
sectional, and International Studies,’’ 
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