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Individuals in the United States who are 
deaf, deafblind, hard of hearing, or have 
a speech disability may dial 711 (TTY, 
TDD, or TeleBraille) to access 
telecommunications relay services. 
Individuals outside the United States 
should use the relay services offered 
within their country to make 
international calls to the point-of- 
contact in the United States. You may 
also view the ICR at http://
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAMain. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with the PRA and 5 CFR 
1320.8(d)(1), all information collections 
require approval under the PRA. 

As part of our continuing effort to 
reduce paperwork and respondent 
burdens, we invite the public and other 
Federal agencies to comment on new, 
proposed, revised, and continuing 
collections of information. This helps us 
assess the impact of our information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand our 
information collection requirements and 
provide the requested data in the 
desired format. 

We are especially interested in public 
comment addressing the following: 

(1) Whether or not the collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether or not the 
information will have practical utility; 

(2) The accuracy of our estimate of the 
burden for this collection of 
information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; and 

(4) How the agency might minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology, e.g., permitting 
electronic submission of response. 

Comments that you submit in 
response to this notice are a matter of 
public record. We will include or 
summarize each comment in our request 
to OMB to approve this ICR. Before 
including your address, phone number, 
email address, or other personal 
identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment—including your 
personal identifying information—may 
be made publicly available at any time. 
While you can ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public review, we 
cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

Abstract: This information collection 
request seeks to reinstate a previously 
discontinued collection. The 
Comprehensive Survey of the American 
Public (CSAP) is the only national 
information collection by the NPS that 
describes visitors and non-visitors to 
units of the National Park System. 
Information on non-visitors, including 
their demographic characteristics and 
reasons for their non-visitation, is 
especially important in designing 
programs to reach underserved 
populations more effectively. The CSAP 
is administered every 5 years, a period 
determined to be long enough to 
identify important trends in key 
measures and to survey visitor and non- 
visitor perceptions, attitudes, behaviors, 
and knowledge related to the programs, 
services, and recreational opportunities 
offered by the NPS. Based on the strong 
mandate for socioeconomic monitoring 
expressed in the NPS strategic goals for 
science and the Department of the 
Interior priorities for 2018–2022, this 
information collection will provide the 
high-quality data required to enhance 
the development of programs and 
resources within the NPS. In addition to 
telephone surveys, the 2022 CSAP will 
use online data collecting methods as an 
option to mitigate expenses and address 
the diminishing return rate of telephone 
surveys in the previous iterations. 

Title of Collection: 2022 
Comprehensive Survey of the American 
Public. 

OMB Control Number: 1024–0254. 
Form Number: None. 
Type of Review: Reinstate a 

previously approved information 
collection. 

Respondents/Affected Public: 
Individuals or households. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Respondents: 3,500 (1,750 phone and 
1,750 online). 

Estimated Completion Time per 
Response: Varies by the response: 25 
minutes (phone) and 15 minutes 
(online). 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Burden Hours: 1,167. 

Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
Frequency of Collection: Once. 
Total Estimated Annual Nonhour 

Burden Cost: None. 
An agency may not conduct or 

sponsor nor is a person required to 
respond to a collection of information 
unless it displays a currently valid OMB 
control number. 

The authority for this action is the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(44 U.S.C. 3501 et seq.). 

Phadrea Ponds, 
Information Collection Clearance Officer, 
National Park Service. 
[FR Doc. 2022–24482 Filed 11–9–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4312–52–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

National Park Service 

[NPS–AKR–ANIA–CAKR–GAAR–LACL– 
WRST–34486; PPAKAKROR4, 
PPMPRLE1Y.LS0000] 

Request for Nominations for the 
National Park Service Alaska Region 
Subsistence Resource Commission 
Program 

AGENCY: National Park Service, Interior. 
ACTION: Request for nominations. 

SUMMARY: The National Park Service 
(NPS) is seeking nominations for 
individuals to represent subsistence 
users on the following Subsistence 
Resource Commissions (SRC): the 
Aniakchak National Monument SRC, 
the Cape Krusenstern National 
Monument SRC, the Gates of the Arctic 
SRC, the Lake Clark National Park SRC, 
and the Wrangell-St. Elias National Park 
SRC. 
DATES: Nominations must be 
postmarked by February 8, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: Nominations should be sent 
to: Eva Patton, Regional Subsistence 
Program Manager, National Park Service 
Alaska Regional Office, 240 W 5th 
Avenue, Anchorage, AK 99501, or eva_
patton@nps.gov, or via telephone (907) 
644–3601. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Eva 
Patton via telephone at (907) 644–3601. 
Individuals in the United States who are 
deaf, deafblind, hard of hearing, or have 
a speech disability may dial 711 (TTY, 
TDD, or TeleBraille) to access 
telecommunications relay services. 
Individuals outside the United States 
should use the relay services offered 
within their country to make 
international calls to the point-of- 
contact in the United States. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The NPS 
SRC program is authorized under 
section 808 of the Alaska National 
Interest Lands Conservation Act (16 
U.S.C. 3118). The SRCs hold meetings to 
develop NPS subsistence program 
recommendations and advise on related 
regulatory proposals and resource 
management issues. 

Each SRC is composed of nine 
representative members: (a) three 
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members appointed by the Secretary of 
the Interior; (b) three members 
appointed by the Governor of the State 
of Alaska; and (c) three members 
appointed by a Regional Advisory 
Council (RAC), established pursuant to 
16 U.S.C. 3115, which has jurisdiction 
within the area in which the park is 
located. Each of the three members 
appointed by the RAC must be a 
member of either the RAC or a local 
advisory committee within the region 
who also engages in subsistence uses 
within the park or national monument. 

We are now seeking nominations for 
those members of each of the SRCs 
listed above. Members will be appointed 
for a term of three years. Members of the 
SRC serve without compensation. 
However, while away from their homes 
or regular places of business in the 
performance of services for the SRC, and 
as approved by the Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO), members may be allowed 
travel expenses, including per diem in 
lieu of subsistence, in the same manner 
as persons employed intermittently in 
Government service are allowed such 
expenses under Section 5703 of Title 5 
of the United States Code. 

SRC meetings will take place at such 
times as designated by the DFO. 
Members are expected to make every 
effort to attend all meetings. Members 
may not appoint deputies or alternates. 

We are seeking nominations for 
members to represent subsistence users 
on each of the five SRCs listed above. 
All those interested in serving as 
members, including current members 
whose terms are expiring, must follow 
the same nomination process. 

Nominations should be typed and 
should include a resume providing an 
adequate description of the nominee’s 
qualifications, including information 
that would enable the Department of the 
Interior to make an informed decision 
regarding meeting the membership 
requirements of the SRC, and to permit 
the Department to contact a potential 
member. 

(Authority: 5 U.S.C. Appendix 2) 

Alma Ripps, 
Chief, Office of Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2022–24590 Filed 11–9–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4312–52–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of Workers’ Compensation 
Programs 

Advisory Board on Toxic Substances 
and Worker Health 

AGENCY: Office of Workers’ 
Compensation Programs. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting of 
the Advisory Board on Toxic Substances 
and Worker Health (Advisory Board) for 
the Energy Employees Occupational 
Illness Compensation Program Act 
(EEOICPA). 

SUMMARY: The Advisory Board will meet 
November 30–December 1, 2022, in Las 
Vegas, Nevada, near the Nevada Test 
Site covered facility. Submission of 
comments, requests to speak, materials 
for the record, and requests for special 
accommodations: You must submit 
comments, materials, requests to speak 
at the Advisory Board meeting, and 
requests for accommodations by 
November 23, 2022, identified by the 
Advisory Board name and the meeting 
date of November 30–December 1, 2022, 
by any of the following methods: 

• Electronically: Send to: 
EnergyAdvisoryBoard@dol.gov (specify 
in the email subject line, for example 
‘‘Request to Speak: Advisory Board on 
Toxic Substances and Worker Health’’). 

• Mail, express delivery, hand 
delivery, messenger, or courier service: 
Submit one copy to the following 
address: U.S. Department of Labor, 
Office of Workers’ Compensation 
Programs, Advisory Board on Toxic 
Substances and Worker Health, Room 
S–3522, 200 Constitution Ave. NW, 
Washington, DC 20210. 

Instructions: Your submissions must 
include the Agency name (OWCP), the 
committee name (the Advisory Board), 
and the meeting date (November 30– 
December 1, 2022). Due to security- 
related procedures, receipt of 
submissions by regular mail may 
experience significant delays. For 
additional information about 
submissions, see the SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION section of this notice. 

OWCP will make available publicly, 
without change, any comments, requests 
to speak, and speaker presentations, 
including any personal information that 
you provide. Therefore, OWCP cautions 
interested parties against submitting 
personal information such as Social 
Security numbers and birthdates. 
ADDRESSES: The Advisory Board will 
meet at the JW Marriott Las Vegas Resort 
& Spa, 221 N Rampart Blvd., Las Vegas, 
Nevada 89145. Telephone: 877–869– 
8777. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
press inquiries: Ms. Laura McGinnis, 
Office of Public Affairs, U.S. 
Department of Labor, Room S–1028, 200 
Constitution Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20210; telephone (202) 693–4672; email 
Mcginnis.Laura@DOL.GOV. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Advisory Board will meet: Tuesday, 
November 29, 2022, for a fact-finding 
site visit to the Nevada Test Site, 
accompanied by the Designated Federal 
Officer; Wednesday, November 30, 
2022, from 9:00 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. Pacific 
time; and Thursday, December 1, 2022, 
from 8:30 a.m. to 11:00 a.m. Pacific time 
in Las Vegas, Nevada. Some Advisory 
Board members may attend the meeting 
by teleconference. The teleconference 
number and other details for 
participating remotely will be posted on 
the Advisory Board’s website, http://
www.dol.gov/owcp/energy/regs/ 
compliance/AdvisoryBoard.htm, 72 
hours prior to the commencement of the 
first meeting date. Advisory Board 
meetings are open to the public. 

Public comment session: Wednesday, 
November 30, 2022, from 4:45 p.m. to 
5:30 p.m. Pacific time. Please note that 
the public comment session ends at the 
time indicated or following the last call 
for comments, whichever is earlier. 
Members of the public who wish to 
provide public comments should plan 
to either be at the meeting location or 
call in to the public comment session at 
the start time listed. 

The Advisory Board is mandated by 
Section 3687 of EEOICPA. The Secretary 
of Labor established the Board under 
this authority and Executive Order 
13699 (June 26, 2015). The purpose of 
the Advisory Board is to advise the 
Secretary with respect to: (1) the Site 
Exposure Matrices (SEM) of the 
Department of Labor; (2) medical 
guidance for claims examiners for 
claims with the EEOICPA program, with 
respect to the weighing of the medical 
evidence of claimants; (3) evidentiary 
requirements for claims under Part B of 
EEOICPA related to lung disease; (4) the 
work of industrial hygienists and staff 
physicians and consulting physicians of 
the Department of Labor and reports of 
such hygienists and physicians to 
ensure quality, objectivity, and 
consistency; (5) the claims adjudication 
process generally, including review of 
procedure manual changes prior to 
incorporation into the manual and 
claims for medical benefits; and (6) such 
other matters as the Secretary considers 
appropriate. The Advisory Board 
sunsets on December 19, 2024. 

The Advisory Board operates in 
accordance with the Federal Advisory 
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