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the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand the 
Department’s information collection 
requirements and provide the requested 
data in the desired format. ED is 
soliciting comments on the proposed 
information collection request (ICR) that 
is described below. The Department of 
Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: State and Local 
Educational Agency Record and 
Reporting Requirements under Part B of 
the Individuals with Disabilities 
Education Act. 

OMB Control Number: 1820–0600. 
Type of Review: An extension without 

change of a currently approved 
collection. 

Respondents/Affected Public: State, 
Local, and Tribal Governments. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Responses: 75,476. 

Total Estimated Number of Annual 
Burden Hours: 362,649. 

Abstract: OMB Information Collection 
1820–0600 reflects the provisions in the 
Act and the part B regulations requiring 
States and/or local educational agencies 
(LEAs) to collect and maintain 
information or data and, in some cases, 
report information or data to other 
public agencies or to the public. 
However, such information or data are 
not reported to the Secretary. Data are 
collected in the areas of private schools, 
parentally placed private school 
students, State high cost fund, 
notification of free and low cost legal 
services, early intervening services, 
notification of hearing officers and 
mediators, State complaint procedures, 
and the LEA application under part B. 

Dated: October 13, 2022. 
Juliana Pearson, 
PRA Coordinator, Strategic Collections and 
Clearance, Governance and Strategy Division, 
Office of Chief Data Officer, Office of 
Planning, Evaluation and Policy 
Development. 
[FR Doc. 2022–22637 Filed 10–17–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

President’s Council of Advisors on 
Science and Technology (PCAST) 

AGENCY: Office of Science, Department 
of Energy. 
ACTION: Notice of partially-closed virtual 
meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces an 
open meeting of the President’s Council 
of Advisors on Science and Technology 
(PCAST). The Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (FACA) requires that 
public notice of these meetings be 
announced in the Federal Register. 
DATES: Wednesday, November 9, 2022; 
11:15 a.m.–4:10 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: Information to participate 
virtually can be found on the PCAST 
website closer to the meeting at: 
www.whitehouse.gov/PCAST/meetings. 
Due to the COVID–19 pandemic, this 
meeting will be held virtually for 
members of the public and in-person for 
PCAST members. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Dr. 
Sarah Domnitz, Designated Federal 
Officer, PCAST, Phone (202) 881–6399 
or email: PCAST@ostp.eop.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: PCAST is 
an advisory group of the nation’s 
leading scientists and engineers, 
appointed by the President to augment 
the science and technology advice 
available to him from the White House, 
cabinet departments, and other Federal 
agencies. See the Executive Order at 
whitehouse.gov. PCAST is consulted on 
and provides analyses and 
recommendations concerning a wide 
range of issues where understanding of 
science, technology, and innovation 
may bear on the policy choices before 
the President. The Designated Federal 
Officer is Dr. Sarah Domnitz. 
Information about PCAST can be found 
at: www.whitehouse.gov/PCAST. 

Tentative Agenda 
Open Portion of the Meeting: PCAST 

will hear from invited speakers on and 
discuss cyber resilience and the 
economic impacts of extreme weather. 
There will also be discussion and 
consideration for approval of a report 
from the Advanced Biomanufacturing 
Sub-Committee. Additional information 
and the meeting agenda, including any 
changes that arise, will be posted on the 
PCAST website at: 
www.whitehouse.gov/PCAST/meetings. 

Public Participation: The meeting is 
open to the public. The meeting will be 
held virtually for members of the public. 

It is the policy of the PCAST to accept 
written public comments no longer than 
10 pages and to accommodate oral 

public comments whenever possible. 
The PCAST expects that public 
statements presented at its meetings will 
not be repetitive of previously 
submitted oral or written statements. 

The public comment period for this 
meeting will take place on November 9, 
2022, at a time specified in the meeting 
agenda. This public comment period is 
designed only for substantive 
commentary on PCAST’s work, not for 
business marketing purposes. 

Oral Comments: To be considered for 
the public speaker list at the meeting, 
interested parties should register to 
speak at PCAST@ostp.eop.gov, no later 
than 12 p.m. eastern time on Nov. 2, 
2022. To accommodate as many 
speakers as possible, the time for public 
comments will be limited to two (2) 
minutes per person, with a total public 
comment period of up to 10 minutes. If 
more speakers register than there is 
space available on the agenda, PCAST 
will select speakers on a first-come, 
first-served basis from those who 
registered. Those not able to present oral 
comments may file written comments 
with the council. 

Written Comments: Although written 
comments are accepted continuously, 
written comments should be submitted 
to PCAST@ostp.eop.gov no later than 12 
p.m. eastern time on Nov. 2, 2022, so 
that the comments can be made 
available to the PCAST members for 
their consideration prior to this meeting. 

PCAST operates under the provisions 
of FACA, all public comments and/or 
presentations will be treated as public 
documents and will be made available 
for public inspection, including being 
posted on the PCAST website at: 
www.whitehouse.gov/PCAST/meetings. 

Minutes: Minutes will be available 
within 45 days at: www.whitehouse.gov/ 
PCAST/meetings. 

Signing Authority 

This document of the Department of 
Energy was signed on October 13, 2022, 
by Shena Kennerly, Acting Committee 
Management Officer, pursuant to 
delegated authority from the Secretary 
of Energy. That document with the 
original signature and date is 
maintained by DOE. For administrative 
purposes only, and in compliance with 
requirements of the Office of the Federal 
Register, the undersigned DOE Federal 
Register Liaison Officer has been 
authorized to sign and submit the 
document in electronic format for 
publication, as an official document of 
the Department of Energy. This 
administrative process in no way alters 
the legal effect of this document upon 
publication in the Federal Register. 
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Signed in Washington, DC, on October 13, 
2022. 
Treena V. Garrett, 
Federal Register Liaison Officer, U.S. 
Department of Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2022–22626 Filed 10–17–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2452–236] 

Consumers Energy Company; Notice 
of Application Accepted for Filing and 
Soliciting Comments, Motions To 
Intervene, and Protests 

Take notice that the following 
hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Application Type: Non-capacity 
Amendment of License and Request for 
Temporary Variance. 

b. Project No: 2452–236. 
c. Date Filed: September 2, 2022, as 

supplemented on September 16, 2022. 
d. Applicant: Consumers Energy 

Company. 
e. Name of Project: Hardy 

Hydroelectric Project. 
f. Location: The project is located on 

the Muskegon River in Newaygo 
County, Michigan. 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 
Act, 16 U.S.C. 791a–825r. 

h. Applicant Contact: David 
McIntosh, Senior Licensing Engineer, 
Consumers Energy Company, 330 
Chestnut Street, Cadillac, MI 49601, 
DAVID.MCINTOSH@cmsenergy.com, 
Phone: (800) 477–5050. 

i. FERC Contact: Elizabeth Moats, 
(202) 502–6632, Elizabeth.OsierMoats@
ferc.gov. 

j. Deadline for filing comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests: 
November 11, 2022. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filing. Please file comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests using 
the Commission’s eFiling system at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
efiling.asp. Commenters can submit 
brief comments up to 6,000 characters, 
without prior registration, using the 
eComment system at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
ecomment.asp. You must include your 
name and contact information at the end 
of your comments. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, you 
may submit a paper copy. Submissions 

sent via the U.S. Postal Service must be 
addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street NE, Room 
1A, Washington, DC 20426. 
Submissions sent via any other carrier 
must be addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. The first 
page of any filing should include the 
docket number P–2452–236. Comments 
emailed to Commission staff are not 
considered part of the Commission 
record. 

The Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure require all intervenors 
filing documents with the Commission 
to serve a copy of that document on 
each person whose name appears on the 
official service list for the project. 
Further, if an intervenor files comments 
or documents with the Commission 
relating to the merits of an issue that 
may affect the responsibilities of a 
particular resource agency, they must 
also serve a copy of the document on 
that resource agency. 

k. Description of Request: The 
licensee requests a non-capacity 
amendment of its license to upgrade the 
project’s auxiliary spillway with: (1) a 
new 320-foot-wide labyrinth crested 
control section; (2) a new converging 
chute section; (3) a stilling basin; (4) a 
section of articulated concrete blocks; 
and (5) a terminal structure that extends 
to the Muskegon River. The licensee 
proposes to begin construction during 
summer 2023 and construction 
activities would last approximately 3 
years. The licensee’s proposal would 
require replacing and widening the road 
on the dam crest and temporary closure 
of several recreation sites (e.g., Hardy 
Dam Nature Trail, Hardy Dam Marina, 
and Operator’s Village Fishing Pier). 

To complete the construction 
described above, the licensee proposes 
to extend the already permitted 
temporary variance from Article 401, 
approved by the Commission on 
September 6, 2022. Article 401 allows 
the licensee to, among other things, 
drawdown the reservoir elevation 12 
feet below the normal operating 
elevation from January 1 to April 30. 
The temporary variance approved on 
September 6, 2022, allows the winter 
drawdown to occur from November 1 
until the Friday before Memorial Day 
from September 2022 through December 
10, 2025. On September 16, 2022, the 
licensee requested to extend the 
temporary variance to incorporate 
drawdown periods from September 1, 
2023, to July 31, 2024; from November 
1, 2024, to the end of May 2025; and 
from November 1, 2025, to July 31, 

2026; and resume the licensed winter 
drawdown period on January 1, 2027. 

l. Locations of the Application: This 
application may be viewed on the 
Commission’s website at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. You may 
also register online at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, call 1–866–208–3676 or 
email FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, for 
TTY, call (202) 502–8659. Agencies may 
obtain copies of the application directly 
from the applicant. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene: Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214, 
respectively. In determining the 
appropriate action to take, the 
Commission will consider all protests or 
other comments filed, but only those 
who file a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Rules may become a party to the 
proceeding. Any comments, protests, or 
motions to intervene must be received 
on or before the specified comment date 
for the particular application. 

o. Filing and Service of Documents: 
Any filing must (1) bear in all capital 
letters the title ‘‘COMMENTS’’, 
‘‘PROTEST’’, or ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’ as applicable; (2) set forth 
in the heading the name of the applicant 
and the project number of the 
application to which the filing 
responds; (3) furnish the name, address, 
and telephone number of the person 
commenting, protesting or intervening; 
and (4) otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 385.2001 
through 385.2005. All comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
set forth their evidentiary basis. Any 
filing made by an intervenor must be 
accompanied by proof of service on all 
persons listed in the service list 
prepared by the Commission in this 
proceeding, in accordance with 18 CFR 
385.2010. 

Dated: October 12, 2022. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–22602 Filed 10–17–22; 8:45 am] 
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