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with Indian Tribal Governments), 
because it will not have a substantial 
direct effect on one or more Indian 
tribes, on the relationship between the 
Federal Government and Indian tribes, 
or on the distribution of power and 
responsibilities between the Federal 
Government and Indian tribes. 

K. Energy Effects 
We have analyzed this rule under 

Executive Order 13211 (Actions 
Concerning Regulations That 
Significantly Affect Energy Supply, 
Distribution, or Use). We have 
determined that it is not a ‘‘significant 
energy action’’ under that order because 
it is not a ‘‘significant regulatory action’’ 
under Executive Order 12866 and is not 
likely to have a significant adverse effect 
on the supply, distribution, or use of 
energy. 

L. Technical Standards 
The National Technology Transfer 

and Advancement Act, codified as a 
note to 15 U.S.C. 272, directs agencies 
to use voluntary consensus standards in 
their regulatory activities unless the 
agency provides Congress, through 
OMB, with an explanation of why using 
these standards would be inconsistent 
with applicable law or otherwise 
impractical. Voluntary consensus 
standards are technical standards (e.g., 
specifications of materials, performance, 
design, or operation; test methods; 
sampling procedures; and related 
management systems practices) that are 
developed or adopted by voluntary 
consensus standards bodies. 

This rule does not use technical 
standards. Therefore, we did not 
consider the use of voluntary consensus 
standards. 

M. Environment 
We have analyzed this rule under 

Department of Homeland Security 
Management Directive 023–01, Rev. 1, 
associated implementing instructions, 
and Environmental Planning 
COMDTINST 5090.1 (series), which 
guide the Coast Guard in complying 
with the National Environmental Policy 
Act of 1969 (42 U.S.C. 4321–4370f), and 
have made a determination that this 
action is one of a category of actions that 
do not individually or cumulatively 
have a significant effect on the human 
environment. A Record of 
Environmental Consideration 
supporting this determination is 
available in the docket. For instructions 
on locating the docket, see the 
ADDRESSES section of this preamble. 
This rule meets the criteria for 
categorical exclusions A3 and L54 in 
Appendix A, Table 1 of DHS Instruction 

Manual 023–01–001–01, Rev 1. 
Categorical exclusion A3 pertains to 
‘‘promulgation of rules of a strictly 
administrative or procedural nature;’’ 
and those that ‘‘interpret or amend an 
existing regulation without changing its 
environmental effect.’’ Categorical 
exclusion L54 pertains to regulations 
that are editorial or procedural. This 
rule is a standalone action to delete an 
incorrect statement about field 
preemption of State or local regulations 
on the topic of inland navigation, the 
legal implications of which were 
recently recognized. This rule is not part 
of a larger action, and it will not result 
in significant impacts to the human 
environment. Removing the incorrect 
language will affirm the ability of States 
to legally regulate inland navigation as 
they long have done, well before the 
Inland Rules were established. 

VI. Public Participation and Request for 
Comments 

The Coast Guard views public 
participation as essential to effective 
rulemaking, and will consider all 
comments and material received on this 
interim rule during the comment period. 
If you submit a comment, please include 
the docket number for this interim rule, 
indicate the specific section of this 
document to which each comment 
applies, and provide a reason for each 
suggestion or recommendation. 

Submitting comments. We encourage 
you to submit comments through the 
Federal Decision Making Portal at 
https://www.regulations.gov. To do so, 
go to https://www.regulations.gov, type 
USCG–2022–0071 in the search box, 
and click ‘‘Search.’’ Next, look for this 
document in the Search Results column, 
and click on it. Then click on the 
Comment option. If you cannot submit 
your material by using https://
www.regulations.gov, call or email the 
person in the FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT section of this interim rule for 
alternate instructions. 

Viewing material in the docket. To 
view documents mentioned in this 
interim rule as being available in the 
docket, find the docket as described in 
the previous paragraph, and then select 
‘‘Supporting & Related Material’’ in the 
Document Type column. Public 
comments will also be placed in our 
online docket and can be viewed by 
following instructions on the https://
www.regulations.gov Frequently Asked 
Questions web page. We review all 
comments received, but we will only 
post comments that address the topic of 
the interim rule. We may choose not to 
post off-topic, inappropriate, or 
duplicate comments that we receive. 

Personal information. We accept 
anonymous comments. Comments we 
post to https://www.regulations.gov will 
include any personal information you 
have provided. For more about privacy 
and submissions to the docket in 
response to this document, see DHS’s 
eRulemaking System of Records notice 
(85 FR 14226, March 11, 2020). 

Public meeting. We are not planning 
to hold a public meeting, but we will 
consider doing so if we determine from 
public comments that a meeting would 
be helpful. We would issue a separate 
Federal Register notice to announce the 
date, time, and location of such a 
meeting. 

List of Subjects in 33 CFR Part 83 

Navigation (water); Waterways. 
For the reasons discussed in the 

preamble, the Coast Guard amends 33 
CFR part 83 as follows: 

PART 83—NAVIGATION RULES 

■ 1. The authority citation for 33 CFR 
part 83 is revised to read as follows: 

Authority: 33 U.S.C. 2071; DHS Delegation 
No. 00170.1, Revision No. 01.2. 

■ 2. Amend § 83.01 by revising 
paragraph (a) to read as follows: 

§ 83.01 Application (Rule 1). 

(a) These Rules apply to all vessels 
upon the inland waters of the United 
States, and to vessels of the United 
States on the Canadian waters of the 
Great Lakes to the extent that there is no 
conflict with Canadian law. 
* * * * * 

Dated: August 31, 2022. 
W.R. Arguin, 
Rear Admiral, U.S. Coast Guard, Assistant 
Commandant for Prevention Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2022–19154 Filed 9–2–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–04–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 100 

[Docket No. USCG–2022–0691] 

Regulated Area; San Francisco Bay 
Navy Fleet Week Parade of Ships and 
Blue Angels Demonstration, San 
Francisco, CA 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, DHS. 
ACTION: Notification of enforcement of 
regulation. 

SUMMARY: The Coast Guard will enforce 
the limited access area in the navigable 
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waters of the San Francisco Bay for the 
San Francisco Bay Navy Fleet Week 
Parade of Ships and Blue Angels 
Demonstration from October 7 through 
October 9, 2022. This action is 
necessary to ensure the safety of event 
participants and spectators. During the 
enforcement period, unauthorized 
persons or vessels are prohibited from 
entering into, transiting through, or 
anchoring in the regulated area, unless 
authorized by the Patrol Commander 
(PATCOM). 
DATES: The regulations in 33 CFR 
100.1105 will be enforced from 1:30 
p.m. until 7 p.m. on October 6, 2022; 
from 9:30 a.m. until 5 p.m. on October 
7, 2022; and from 11:30 a.m. until 5 
p.m. daily on October 8, 2022 and 
October 9, 2022, as identified in the 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION section 
below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have questions about this 
notification of enforcement, call or 
email Lieutenant Anthony Solares, 
Coast Guard Sector San Francisco, 
Waterways Management Division, 415– 
399–3585, SFWaterways@uscg.mil. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Coast 
Guard will enforce the limited access 
area for the annual San Francisco Bay 
Navy Fleet Week Parade of Ships and 
Blue Angels Demonstration in 33 CFR 
100.1105. 

The regulated area ‘‘Alpha’’ in 
§ 100.1105(b)(1) for the Navy Parade of 
Ships will be enforced from 9:30 a.m. 
until 12 p.m. on October 7, 2022. The 
regulated area ‘‘Bravo’’ in 
§ 100.1105(b)(2) for the U.S. Navy Blue 
Angels will be enforced from 1:30 p.m. 
until 7 p.m. on October 6, 2022, and 
11:30 a.m. until 5 p.m. daily from 
October 7, 2022 through October 9, 
2022. 

Regulated area ‘‘Alpha’’ will be 
enforced during the Navy Parade of 
Ships and is bounded by a line 
connecting the following points and 
thence along the shore to the point of 
beginning: 

Latitude Longitude 

37°48′40″ N 122°28′38″ W 
37°49′10″ N 122°28′41″ W 
37°49′31″ N 122°25′18″ W 
37°49′06″ N 122°24′08″ W 
37°47′53″ N 122°22′42″ W 
37°46′00″ N 122°22′00″ W 
37°46′00″ N 122°23′07″ W 

Under the provisions of 33 CFR 
100.1105, except for persons or vessels 
authorized by the PATCOM, in 
regulated area ‘‘Alpha’’ no person or 
vessel may enter the parade route or 
remain within 500 yards of any Navy 

parade vessel. No person or vessel shall 
anchor, block, loiter in, or impede the 
through transit of ship parade 
participants or official patrol vessels in 
regulated area ‘‘Alpha.’’ 

Regulated area ‘‘Bravo’’ will be 
enforced during the Navy Blue Angels 
Demonstration and is bounded by a line 
connecting the following points and 
thence along the pierheads and 
bulwarks to the point of beginning: 

Latitude Longitude 

37°48′27.5″ N 122°24′04″ W 
37°49′31″ N 122°24′18″ W 
37°49′00″ N 122°27′52″ W 
37°48′19″ N 122°27′40″ W 

Except for persons or vessels 
authorized by the PATCOM, no person 
or vessel may enter or remain within 
regulated area ‘‘Bravo.’’ 

When hailed or signaled by U.S. Coast 
Guard patrol personnel by siren, radio, 
flashing light, or other means, a person 
or vessel shall come to an immediate 
stop. Persons or vessels shall comply 
with all directions given; failure to do 
so may result in expulsion from the 
area, citation for failure to comply, or 
both. The Coast Guard may be assisted 
by other Federal, State, or local law 
enforcement agencies in enforcing this 
regulation. 

The PATCOM shall be designated by 
the Commander, Coast Guard Sector San 
Francisco, California. The PATCOM is 
empowered to forbid and control the 
movement of all vessels in the regulated 
areas. 

In addition to this notification of 
enforcement in the Federal Register, the 
Coast Guard plans to provide 
notification of this enforcement period 
via the Local Notice to Mariners. 

Dated: August 30, 2022. 
Taylor Q. Lam, 
Captain, U.S. Coast Guard, Captain of the 
Port, San Francisco. 
[FR Doc. 2022–19203 Filed 9–2–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–04–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 165 

[Docket Number USCG–2022–0695] 

RIN 1625–AA00 

Safety Zone; Susquehanna River, 
Havre de Grace, MD 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, DHS. 
ACTION: Temporary final rule. 

SUMMARY: The Coast Guard is 
establishing a temporary safety zone for 
certain waters of the Susquhanna River. 
This action is necessary to provide for 
the safety of life on these navigable 
waters of the Susquehanna River at 
Havre de Grace, MD, on September 10, 
2022, (with alternate date of September 
11, 2022) from potential hazards during 
a fireworks display. Entry of vessels or 
persons into this zone is prohibited 
unless specifically authorized by the 
Captain of the Port, Maryland-National 
Capital Region or a designated 
representative. 

DATES: This rule is effective from 8 p.m. 
on September 10, 2022, through 11 p.m. 
on September 11, 2022. This rule will be 
enforced from 8 p.m. until 11 p.m. on 
September 10, 2022, or those same 
hours on September 11, 2022, in the 
case of inclement weather on September 
10, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: To view documents 
mentioned in this preamble as being 
available in the docket, go to https://
www.regulations.gov, type USCG–2022– 
0695 in the search box and click 
‘‘Search.’’ Next, in the Document Type 
column, select ‘‘Supporting & Related 
Material.’’ 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have questions on this rule, call or 
email MST2 Courtney Perry, Sector 
Maryland-National Capital Region 
Waterways Management Division, U.S. 
Coast Guard; telephone 410–576–2596, 
email Courtney.E.Perry@uscg.mil. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Table of Abbreviations 

CFR Code of Federal Regulations 
DHS Department of Homeland Security 
FR Federal Register 
NPRM Notice of proposed rulemaking 
§ Section 
U.S.C. United States Code 

II. Background Information and 
Regulatory History 

The Coast Guard is issuing this 
temporary rule without prior notice and 
opportunity to comment pursuant to 
authority under section 4(a) of the 
Administrative Procedure Act (APA) (5 
U.S.C. 553(b)). This provision 
authorizes an agency to issue a rule 
without prior notice and opportunity to 
comment when the agency for good 
cause finds that those procedures are 
impracticable and contrary to the public 
interest. Under 5 U.S.C. 553(b)(B), the 
Coast Guard finds that good cause exists 
for not publishing a notice of proposed 
rulemaking (NPRM) with respect to this 
rule. It would be impracticable and 
contrary to the public interest to publish 
an NPRM becasue we must take 
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