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Sierra Nevada (USDA Forest Service 
2019, referred to as the Conservation 
Strategy). The Conservation Strategy 
provides updated management 
recommendations, based on best 
available science, that focus on 
maintaining high-quality spotted owl 
habitat while increasing habitat 
resiliency across landscapes. 

Substantive Provisions 

In accordance with 36 CFR 219.13, 
the Responsible Official has determined 
the following specific substantive 
requirement(s) within §§ 219.8 through 
219.11 are directly related to the plan 
direction being added, modified, or 
removed by the proposed amendments: 
36 CFR 219.8(a)(1): Sustainability, (a) 
Ecological sustainability. (1) Ecosystem 
Integrity; 36 CFR 219.9(a)(1) and (2) and 
(b): Diversity of Plant and Animal 
Communities, (a) Ecosystem plan 
components, (1) Ecosystem integrity and 
(2) Ecosystem diversity and (b) 
Additional Species-Specific Plan 
Components; 36 CFR 219.10(a)(1), (5), 
(7), and (8): Multiple Use, (a) Integrated 
resource management for multiple use; 
(1) Aesthetic values, cultural and 
heritage resources, ecosystem services, 
fish and wildlife species, forage, 
geologic features, grazing and 
rangelands, habitat and habitat 
connectivity, recreation settings and 
opportunities, riparian areas, scenery, 
soil, surface and subsurface water 
quality, timber, trails, vegetation, 
viewsheds, and other relevant resources 
and uses; (5) Habitat conditions, subject 
to the requirements of § 219.9, for 
wildlife, fish, and plants commonly 
enjoyed and used by the public; for 
hunting, fishing, trapping, gathering, 
observing, subsistence, and other 
activities (in collaboration with 
federally recognized Tribes, Alaska 
Native Corporations, other Federal 
agencies, and State and local 
governments); (7) Reasonably 
foreseeable risks to ecological, social, 
and economic sustainability; and (8) 
System drivers, including dominant 
ecological processes, disturbance 
regimes, and stressors, such as natural 
succession, wildland fire, invasive 
species, and climate change; and the 
ability of the terrestrial and aquatic 
ecosystems on the plan area to adapt to 
change (§ 219.8). 

Preliminary Alternatives 

An alternative that does not adopt the 
proposed project-specific forest plan 
amendments would be developed and 
analyzed. Other alternatives would be 
developed based on scoping input. 

Expected Impacts 
Among the significant impacts 

expected to be analyzed in the EIS are: 
Effects on habitat for the California 
spotted owl and other old forest- 
associated species, impacts on roadless 
area characteristics in IRAs, and impacts 
on the density and distibution of trees 
greater than 30 inches DBH. 

Responsible Official 
The Responsible Official is the Forest 

Supervisor of the Tahoe National Forest. 

Scoping Comments and the Objection 
Process 

This notice of intent initiates the 
scoping process, which guides the 
development of the environmental 
impact statement. In this process, the 
Agency is requesting comments on 
potential alternatives and impacts, and 
identification of any relevant 
information, studies or analyses of any 
kind concerning impacts affecting the 
quality of the human environment. 
Please visit the North Yuba Forest 
Partnership website for information 
about public meetings: https://
yubaforests.org. 

It is important that reviewers provide 
their comments at such times and in 
such manner that they are useful to the 
Agency’s preparation of the 
environmental impact statement. 
Therefore, comments should be 
provided prior to the close of the 
comment period and should clearly 
articulate the reviewer’s concerns and 
contentions. Commenting during 
scoping and any other designated 
opportunity to comment provided by 
the Responsible Official will also 
establish standing to object once the 
final EIS and Draft Record of Decision 
has been published. Comments received 
in response to this solicitation, 
including names and addresses of those 
who comment, will be part of the public 
record for this proposed action. 
Comments submitted anonymously will 
be accepted and considered, however, 
they will not be used to establish 
standing for the objection process. 

Nature of Decision To Be Made 
The EIS will support staged decision- 

making, which will be documented in 
multiple records of decisions for sub- 
project areas that have completed 
surveys. For all decisions, the 
Responsible Official will consider all 
reasonable alternatives in light of the 
purpose and need and environmental 
effects to decide whether to implement 
the proposed action, implement one of 
the other action alternatives, or decide 
to take no action for one or more of the 
sub-project areas within the Landscape. 

In the initial record of decision, the 
Responsible Official will also determine 
whether to modify, remove, and add 
specific forest plan components that 
would apply to actions in the North 
Yuba Landscape Resilience Project area 
during the life of the Project. 
Subsequent decisions will be made as 
required surveys are completed and sub- 
project areas reviewed for possible new 
information and/or changed 
circumstances. 

Dated: September 10, 2021. 
Barnie Gyant, 
Associate Deputy Chief, National Forest 
System. 
[FR Doc. 2021–20044 Filed 9–15–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3411–15–P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the South 
Carolina Advisory Committee to the 
U.S. Commission on Civil Rights 

AGENCY: U.S. Commission on Civil 
Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act that 
the South Carolina Advisory Committee 
(Committee) to the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights will hold a meeting on 
Thursday, September 30, 2021, at 12:00 
p.m. Eastern Time. The Committee will 
discuss civil rights concerns in the state. 
DATES: The meeting will take place on 
Thursday, September 30, 2021, from 
12:00 p.m.–1:30 p.m. Eastern Time. 
ADDRESSES: (Audio/Visual): https://
tinyurl.com/yf2hwdft. Telephone 
(Audio Only): Dial 800–360–9505 USA 
Toll Free; Access code: 433 716 81. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Barbara Delaviez, DFO, at bdelaviez@
usccr.gov or (202) 376–8473. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Members 
of the public can listen to these 
discussions. Committee meetings are 
available to the public through the 
above call-in number. Any interested 
member of the public may call this 
number and listen to the meeting. An 
open comment period will be provided 
to allow members of the public to make 
a statement as time allows. Callers can 
expect to incur regular charges for calls 
they initiate over wireless lines, 
according to their wireless plan. The 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
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telephone number. Individuals who are 
deaf, deafblind and hard of hearing may 
also follow the proceedings by first 
calling the Federal Relay Service at 1– 
800–877–8339 and providing the 
Service with the conference call number 
and conference ID number. 

Members of the public are also 
entitled to submit written comments; 
the comments must be received in the 
regional office within 30 days following 
the meeting. Written comments may be 
emailed to Liliana Schiller at lschiller@
usccr.gov. Persons who desire 
additional information may contact the 
Regional Programs Unit at (312) 353– 
8311. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Regional Programs Unit Office, as they 
become available, both before and after 
the meeting. Records of the meeting will 
be available via www.facadatabase.gov 
under the Commission on Civil Rights, 
South Carolina Advisory Committee 
link. Persons interested in the work of 
this Committee are directed to the 
Commission’s website, http://
www.usccr.gov, or may contact the 
Regional Programs Unit at the above 
email or street address. 

Agenda 
Roll Call 
Introduction of Liliana Schiller 
Discussion on Subminimum Wages 
Concept Stage 
Next Steps 
Open Comment 
Adjourn 

Dated: September 13, 2021. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2021–20015 Filed 9–15–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Census Bureau 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; Household Pulse Survey 

On July 20, 2021, the Department of 
Commerce received clearance from the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 to 
conduct Phase 3.2 of the Household 
Pulse Survey (OMB No. 0607–1013, 
Exp. 10/31/23). The Household Pulse 
Survey was designed to meet a need for 
timely information associated with 
household experiences during the 
Covid–19 pandemic. The Department is 

committed to ensuring that the data 
collected by the Household Pulse 
Survey continue to meet information 
needs as they may evolve over the 
course of the pandemic. This notice 
serves to inform of the Department’s 
intent to request clearance from OMB to 
make some revisions to the Household 
Pulse Survey questionnaire. To ensure 
that the data collected by the Household 
Pulse Survey continue to meet 
information needs as they evolve over 
the course of the pandemic, the Census 
Bureau submits this Request for 
Revision to an Existing Collection for a 
revised Phase 3.3 questionnaire. 
Specifically, Phase 3.3 includes 
modifications to questions relating to 
vaccinations that expand response 
options for the number of doses and 
brand of Covid–19 vaccine received; 
three items asked in prior phases that 
have been reinstated with regard to 
unemployment insurance benefits, with 
a modified reference period; and a 
question that was reinstated relating to 
use of public transit and ridesharing. 

It is the Department’s intention to 
commence data collection using the 
revised instrument on or about October 
27, 2021. The Department invites the 
general public and other Federal 
agencies to comment on proposed, and 
continuing information collections, 
which helps us assess the impact of our 
information collection requirements and 
minimize the public’s reporting burden. 
Public comments were previously 
sought on the Household Pulse Survey 
via the Federal Register on May 19, 
2020, June 3, 2020, February 1, 2021, 
April 13, 2021, and again on June 24, 
2021. This notice allows for an 
additional 30 days for public comments 
on the proposed revisions. 

Agency: U.S. Census Bureau, 
Department of Commerce. 

Title: Household Pulse Survey. 
OMB Control Number: 0607–1013. 
Form Number(s): None. 
Type of Request: Request for a 

Revision of a Currently Approved 
Collection. 

Number of Respondents: 3,150,000. 
Average Hours per Response: 20 

minutes. 
Burden Hours: 1,039,500. 
Needs and Uses: Data produced by 

the Household Pulse Survey are 
designed to inform on a range of topics 
related to households’ experiences 
during the Covid–19 pandemic. Topics 
to date have included employment, 
facility to telework, travel patterns, 
income loss, spending patterns, food 
and housing security, access to benefits, 
mental health and access to care, intent 
to receive the COVID–19 vaccine, and 
educational disruption (K–12 and post- 

secondary). The requested revision, if 
approved by OMB, will add previously 
approved items to the Phase 3.3 
questionnaire. The overall burden 
change to the public will be 
insignificant. 

The Household Pulse Survey was 
initially launched in April, 2020 as an 
experimental project (see https://
www.census.gov/data/experimental- 
data-products.html) under emergency 
clearance from the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) initially 
granted April 19, 2020; regular 
clearance was subsequently sought and 
approved by OMB on October 30, 2020 
(OMB No. 0607–1013; Exp. 10/30/2023). 

Affected Public: Households. 
Frequency: Households will be 

selected once to participate in a 20- 
minute survey. 

Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
Legal Authority: Title 13, United 

States Code, Sections 8(b), 182 and 196. 
This information collection request 

may be viewed at www.reginfo.gov. 
Follow the instructions to view the 
Department of Commerce collections 
currently under review by OMB. 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be 
submitted within 30 days of the 
publication of this notice on the 
following website www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain. Find this 
particular information collection by 
selecting ‘‘Currently under 30-day 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function and 
entering either the title of the collection 
or the OMB Control Number 0607–1013. 

Sheleen Dumas, 
Department PRA Clearance Officer, Office of 
the Chief Information Officer, Commerce 
Department. 
[FR Doc. 2021–20052 Filed 9–15–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–07–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[B–62–2021] 

Foreign-Trade Zone (FTZ) 7— 
Mayaguez, Puerto Rico; Notification of 
Proposed Production Activity; Lilly del 
Caribe, Inc. (Pharmaceutical Products); 
Carolina, Puerto Rico 

Lilly del Caribe, Inc., submitted a 
notification of proposed production 
activity to the FTZ Board (the Board) for 
its facility in Carolina, Puerto Rico 
within Subzone 7K. The notification 
conforming to the requirements of the 
Board’s regulations (15 CFR 400.22) was 
received on September 8, 2021. 
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