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III. Data 

OMB Control Number: 0693–0032. 
Form Number(s): None. 
Type of Review: Regular submission 

(revision of a current information 
collection). 

Affected Public: Business or other for- 
profit organizations. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
51. 

Estimated Time Per Response: 20 
Hours for Quarterly Review, 4 Hours for 
Semi-Annual Review, 30 hours for the 
Annual Review; 80 hours for Panel 
Review. Recipients of Special Funding 
awards should anticipate an additional 
burden of 2 hours quarterly/ 
semiannually (per award) based on the 
requirements of the cooperative 
agreement. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 5,508 hours for Quarterly, Semi- 
annual, and Annual Review; and 1,360 
hours for Panel Review. 

Estimated Total Annual Cost to 
Public: $0. 

Respondent’s Obligation: Mandatory. 
Legal Authority: 

IV. Request for Comments 

We are soliciting public comments to 
permit the Department/Bureau to: (a) 
Evaluate whether the proposed 
information collection is necessary for 
the proper functions of the Department, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; (b) Evaluate the 
accuracy of our estimate of the time and 
cost burden for this proposed collection, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
Evaluate ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; and (d) Minimize the 
reporting burden on those who are to 
respond, including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

Comments that you submit in 
response to this notice are a matter of 
public record. We will include or 
summarize each comment in our request 
to OMB to approve this ICR. Before 
including your address, phone number, 
email address, or other personal 
identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment—including your 
personal identifying information—may 
be made publicly available at any time. 
While you may ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public review, we 

cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

Sheleen Dumas, 
Department PRA Clearance Officer, Office of 
the Chief Information Officer, Commerce 
Department. 
[FR Doc. 2021–14286 Filed 7–2–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–13–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

[RTID 0648–XB206] 

Pacific Fishery Management Council; 
Public Meeting 

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Pacific Fishery 
Management Council (Pacific Council) 
will hold an online meeting to consider 
information on marine planning and 
offshore development planning and 
activities. This meeting is open to the 
public. 
DATES: The online meeting will be held 
Thursday, July 22, 2021 and Friday, July 
23, 2021, from 9 a.m. to 5 p.m., Pacific 
Daylight Time, each day. Exact meeting 
times may be adjusted in advance, and 
the meeting may be adjourned early if 
work for that day has been completed. 
The meeting agenda with specific times 
will be posted to the Pacific Council 
website in advance of the meeting. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be held 
online. Specific meeting information, 
including directions on how to join the 
meeting and system requirements will 
be provided in the meeting 
announcement on the Pacific Council’s 
website (see www.pcouncil.org). You 
may send an email to Mr. Kris 
Kleinschmidt (kris.kleinschmidt@
noaa.gov, (503) 820–2412) for technical 
assistance. 

Council address: Pacific Fishery 
Management Council, 7700 NE 
Ambassador Place, Suite 101, Portland, 
OR 97220–1384. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Kerry Griffin, Pacific Council; 
telephone: (503) 820–2409. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Representatives of the United States 
Bureau of Ocean Energy Management 
and the Pacific Council will present 
information related to the planning 
process for identifying potential 
offshore wind energy sites in the U.S. 
Exclusive Economic Zone. 

Representatives of Pacific Council 
Advisory Bodies will consider the 
information presented, provide feedback 
and advice, and develop reports to the 
Pacific Council for its consideration. A 
meeting agenda will be posted to the 
Pacific Council’s website in advance of 
the meeting. 

Although non-emergency issues not 
contained in the meeting agenda may be 
discussed, those issues may not be the 
subject of formal action during this 
meeting. Action will be restricted to 
those issues specifically listed in this 
document and any issues arising after 
publication of this document that 
require emergency action under section 
305(c) of the Magnuson-Stevens Fishery 
Conservation and Management Act, 
provided the public has been notified of 
the intent to take final action to address 
the emergency. 

Special Accommodations 

Requests for sign language 
interpretation or other auxiliary aids 
should be directed to Mr. Kris 
Kleinschmidt (kris.kleinschmidt@
noaa.gov; (503) 820–2412) at least 10 
days prior to the meeting date. 

Authority: 16 U.S.C. 1901 et seq. 

Dated: June 29, 2021. 
Diane M. DeJames-Daly, 
Acting Deputy Director, Office of Sustainable 
Fisheries, National Marine Fisheries Service. 
[FR Doc. 2021–14291 Filed 7–2–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

[RTID 0648–XB210] 

Endangered Species; File Nos. 24140 
and 24368 

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice; receipt of application. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given that 
Jane Provancha, Herndon Solutions 
Group, LLC., 2562 Meadow Lane, 
Cocoa, FL 32926 and the NMFS 
Southeast Fisheries Science Center 
(SEFSC), 75 Virginia Beach Drive, 
Miami, FL 33149 (Responsible Party: 
Lisa Desfosse), have applied in due form 
for permits to take green (Chelonia 
mydas), hawksbill (Eretmochelys 
imbricata), Kemp’s ridley (Lepidochelys 
kempii), leatherback (Dermochelys 
coriacea), loggerhead (Caretta caretta), 
olive ridley (L. olivacea), and 
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unidentified hardshell sea turtles for 
purposes of scientific research. 
DATES: Written, telefaxed, or email 
comments must be received on or before 
August 5, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: The application and related 
documents are available for review by 
selecting ‘‘Records Open for Public 
Comment’’ from the ‘‘Features’’ box on 
the Applications and Permits for 
Protected Species (APPS) home page, 
https://apps.nmfs.noaa.gov, and then 
selecting File No. 24140 or 24368 from 
the list of available applications. These 
documents are also available upon 
written request via email to 
NMFS.Pr1Comments@noaa.gov. 

Written comments on this application 
should be submitted via email to 
NMFS.Pr1Comments@noaa.gov. Please 
include the relevant File No. in the 
subject line of the email comment. 

Those individuals requesting a public 
hearing should submit a written request 
via email to NMFS.Pr1Comments@
noaa.gov. The request should set forth 
the specific reasons why a hearing on 
this application would be appropriate. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Amy Hapeman or Erin Markin, (301) 
427–8401. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
subject permit is requested under the 
authority of the Endangered Species Act 
of 1973, as amended (ESA; 16 U.S.C. 
1531 et seq.) and the regulations 
governing the taking, importing, and 
exporting of endangered and threatened 
species (50 CFR parts 222–226). 

File No. 24140: The applicant 
proposes to continue long term 
monitoring of the relative health, 
abundance, and distribution of green, 
loggerhead, Kemp’s ridley and 
hawksbill sea turtles inhabiting the 
northern Indian River Lagoon, including 
the Mosquito Lagoon, Banana River in 
Volusia and Brevard Counties, Florida. 
Annually up to 30 greens, 30 
loggerheads, one Kemp’s ridley and one 
hawksbill would be captured by tangle 
net. Turtles would be measured, 
weighed, flipper tagged, and passive 
integrated transponder (PIT) tagged, 
photographed, and released. Green and 
loggerhead sea turtles would also be 
scute, skin, and blood sampled, and 
gastric lavaged prior to release. Up to 10 
green and 10 loggerhead sea turtles may 
be released with sonic transmitters. The 
permit would be valid for 10 years. 

File No. 24368: The SEFSC proposes 
to continue studying sea turtles legally 
bycaught within commercial fisheries 
and during other human activities 
operating in the Atlantic Ocean, Gulf of 
Mexico, Caribbean Sea, and the high 
seas. The objective is to better 

understand movement and migration, 
habitat use, genetics, and population 
dynamics of the sea turtle species that 
interact with these human activities. Up 
to 111 green, 31 hawksbill, 260 Kemp’s 
ridley, 117 leatherback, 490 loggerhead, 
20 olive ridley, and 23 unidentified/ 
hybrid live turtles would be 
photographed, measured, weighed, 
flipper tagged and PIT tagged, skin 
biopsied, and released annually. 
Carcasses, tissues or parts also may be 
salvaged from dead sea turtles. This 
work includes the import of biological 
samples or dead parts collected on the 
high seas. The permit would be valid for 
10 years. 

Dated: June 29, 2021. 
Julia Marie Harrison, 
Chief, Permits and Conservation Division, 
Office of Protected Resources, National 
Marine Fisheries Service. 
[FR Doc. 2021–14275 Filed 7–2–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; Socioeconomics of Coral 
Reef Conservation, Puerto Rico 2022 
Survey 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and clearance in accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995, on or after the date of publication 
of this notice. We invite the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
comment on proposed, and continuing 
information collections, which helps us 
assess the impact of our information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. Public 
comments were previously requested 
via the Federal Register on January 25, 
2021 (86 FR 6876) during a 60-day 
comment period and again on April, 16, 
2021 (86 FR 20120) during a 30-day 
comment period. This notice allows for 
an additional 30 days for public 
comments. 

Agency: National Oceanic & 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce. 

Title: Socioeconomics of Coral Reef 
Conservation, Puerto Rico 2022 Survey. 

OMB Control Number: 0648–0646. 
Form Number(s): None. 

Type of Request: New information 
collection. 

Number of Respondents: 1,800. 
Average Hours per Response: 20 

minutes (0.33 hours). 
Total Annual Burden Hours: 600 

hours. 
Needs and Uses: This request is for a 

new information collection under the 
currently approved hybrid-generic 
information collection under OMB 
Control Number 0648–0646. The 
information collection is part of the 
National Coral Reef Monitoring Program 
(NCRMP), which was established by the 
National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration (NOAA) Coral Reef 
Conservation Program (CRCP) under the 
authority of the Coral Reef Conservation 
Act of 2000. The CRCP was created to 
safeguard and ensure the welfare of the 
coral reef ecosystems along the 
coastlines of America’s states and 
territories. In accordance with its 
mission goals, NOAA developed a 
survey to track relevant information 
regarding each jurisdiction’s population, 
social and economic structure, the 
benefits of coral reefs and related 
habitats, the impacts of society on coral 
reefs, and the impacts of coral 
management on communities. The 
survey is repeated in each jurisdiction 
every five to seven years in order to 
provide longitudinal data and 
information for managers to effectively 
conserve coral reefs for current and 
future generations. 

The purpose of this information 
collection is to obtain human 
dimensions information from residents 
in Puerto Rico. Specifically, NOAA is 
seeking information on the behaviors 
and activities related to coral reefs, as 
well as information on perceptions of 
coral reef conditions and attitudes 
toward specific reef conservation 
activities. The survey has a core set of 
questions that are the same for all 
jurisdictions to allow for information to 
be tracked over time. To account for 
geographical, cultural and linguistic 
differences between jurisdictions, the 
survey questions include items that are 
specific to the local context and 
developed based on jurisdictional 
partner feedback. 

We intend to use the information 
collected through this survey 
instrument for research purposes, as 
well as for measuring and improving the 
results of our reef protection programs. 
Because many of our efforts to protect 
reefs rely on education and changing 
attitudes toward reef protection, the 
information collected will allow CRCP 
to ensure that programs are designed 
appropriately at the start, future 
program evaluation efforts are as 
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