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*H Language added. 
*I Language added. 

*J Language omitted for clarity. 
*K Omitted text for clarity. 

paid as a result of his criminal sentence, 
he answered precisely to the cent. Tr. 
51. When he talked about the mistake in 
the billing, he corrected himself when 
he initially said ‘‘we,’’ and stated 
unequivocally that it was ‘‘really’’ him. 
Id. 49. In a situation such as this one 
that involved a mistake, it would have 
been very easy for Respondent to have 
shifted the blame or mitigated the 
circumstances surrounding his crime, 
but he unfalteringly maintained that it 
was his responsibility.] *H 

Additionally, Respondent has 
consistently demonstrated that he has 
taken the necessary steps to correct the 
error. The Respondent has returned to 
clinical care, and is not involved in 
billing or any other administrative 
responsibility. [Respondent recognized 
that he should not hold a management 
or administrative position and 
Respondent changed his practice area. 
By doing so, Respondent has made the 
effort to ensure that there is no 
recurrence of his mistake in the future. 
I find this to be further evidence of his 
acceptance of responsibility that 
demonstrates that he has taken active 
steps to prevent future mistakes. He also 
attends a few conferences a year, 
receives regulatory update mailings, and 
stated that his role as adjunct faculty 
‘‘forces [him] to stay current.’’ Id. at 
41.] *I 

Although correcting improper 
behavior and practices is very important 
to establish acceptance of responsibility, 
conceding wrongdoing is critical to 
reestablishing trust with the Agency. 
Holiday CVS, L.L.C., 77 FR 62,316, 
62,346 (2012); Daniel A. Glick, D.D.S., 
80 FR at 74,801. Based upon the 
evidence presented, I find that the 
Respondent has demonstrated the full 
measure of acceptance of responsibility, 
and has fully demonstrated that he is 
remorseful for his actions and has taken 
considerable steps to ensure that this 
conduct will not be repeated. 

Loss of Trust 
Where the Government has sustained 

its burden and established that a 
registrant has committed acts 
inconsistent with the public interest, 
that registrant must present sufficient 
mitigating evidence to assure the Acting 
Administrator that he can be entrusted 
with the responsibility commensurate 
with such a registration. Medicine 
Shoppe, 73 FR at 387. 

As demonstrated by the evidence 
presented in this matter, it is clear to me 
that the Respondent has unequivocally 
accepted responsibility for his conduct. 

His underlying criminal conduct did not 
relate to his handling of controlled 
substances and the Government has not 
alleged or demonstrated any 
deficiencies by the Respondent related 
to controlled substance. [ ] *J 

There is no indication that the 
Respondent has ever improperly 
handled controlled substances or that he 
represents a danger to the public. Based 
upon the evidence presented, and 
consistent with Jackson, Miller, and 
Stein, the Respondent has clearly 
demonstrated that he can be entrusted 
to properly maintain his COR. 

Recommendation 
Considering the entire record before 

me, the conduct of the hearing, and 
observation of the testimony of the 
witnesses presented, I find that the 
Government has met its burden of proof 
and has established a prima facie case 
for revocation. However, [ ] *K the 
evidence suggests that the Respondent 
has unequivocally accepted 
responsibility, is remorseful for his 
conduct, has withdrawn from any 
responsibilities related to billing or 
other administrative duties, and has 
presented convincing evidence 
demonstrating that the Agency can 
entrust him to maintain his COR. 

Therefore, I recommend the 
Respondent’s DEA Certificates of 
Registration MJ3401609 and MJ4509331 
should not be revoked and any pending 
applications for renewal or modification 
of such registration, or for additional 
DEA registrations, be granted. 
Signed: February 19, 2020. 
Mark M. Dowd, 
U.S. Administrative Law Judge 

[FR Doc. 2021–14163 Filed 7–1–21; 8:45 am] 
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AGENCY: Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, Department of Justice. 
ACTION: 30-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice, 
Federal Bureau of Investigation, 
Laboratory Division (LD) has submitted 

the following Information Collection 
Request to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) for review and 
clearance in accordance with the 
established review procedures of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. The 
proposed information collection is 
published to obtain comments from the 
public and affected agencies. 
DATES: The Department of Justice 
encourages public comment and will 
accept input until August 2, 2021. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and/or 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Extension of a currently approved 
collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
Customer Satisfaction Assessment. 

3. The agency form number: FD–1000. 
4. Affected public who will be asked 

or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Respondents primarily include 
federal, state, and local law 
enforcement. Respondents also include 
the intelligence community, Department 
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of Defense, and international police 
agencies personnel and/or crime 
laboratory personnel. This collection is 
a brief questionnaire regarding 
customers’ satisfaction with the services 
provided by the Federal Bureau of 
Investigation Laboratory. This collection 
is needed to evaluate the quality of 
services provided by the Federal Bureau 
of Investigation Laboratory. The Federal 
Bureau of Investigation Laboratory is 
accredited by the ANSI National 
Accreditation Board (ANAB). A 
requirement for maintaining 
accreditation is to evaluate the level of 
service provided by the Federal Bureau 
of Investigation Laboratory to our 
customers. To meet this requirement the 
Federal Bureau of Investigation 
Laboratory is requesting its customers to 
complete and return the Customer 
Satisfaction Assessment. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: An estimated 500 respondents 
will complete the Customer Satisfaction 
Assessment survey in 2021. This 
estimate is based on the number of 
respondents in prior years of this 
collection. It is estimated that 
respondents will need 5 minutes to 
complete a questionnaire. 

6. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: The estimated public burden 
associated with this collection is 42 
hours. It is estimated that respondents 
will need 5 minutes to complete a 
questionnaire. The burden hours for 
collecting respondent data sum to 
approximately 42 hours (500 
respondents × 5 minutes = 41.67 hours). 

If additional information is required 
contact: Melody Braswell, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, 3E.405A, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: June 28, 2021. 

Melody Braswell, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2021–14071 Filed 7–1–21; 8:45 am] 
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AGENCY: Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, Department of Justice. 
ACTION: 30-Day notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice, 
Federal Bureau of Investigation, 
Criminal Justice Information Services 
Division, will be submitting the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
for review and approval in accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995. 

DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 30 days until 
August 2, 2021. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, including whether the 
information will have practical utility. 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used. 

—Evaluate how the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected can be enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Extension of a previously approved 
collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
Cargo Theft Incident Report 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
There is no form number for this 
collection. The applicable component 
within the Department of Justice is the 
Criminal Justice Information Services 
Division of the Federal Bureau of 
Investigation. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: 

Primary: Law enforcement agencies. 
Abstract: This survey is needed to 

collect reports of cargo theft offenses 
reported by federal, state, local, and 
tribal law enforcement agencies. It 
should be noted that cargo theft offenses 
are being collected under the National 
Incident-Based Reporting System as of 
January 1, 2021. Therefore, this data 
collection will serve to collect updates 
to incidents only. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: The Federal Bureau of 
Investigation Uniform Crime Reporting 
Program’s Cargo Theft Incident Report 
Estimation: It is estimated the Cargo 
Theft Incident Report Estimation will 
generate 4,528 feedback responses per 
year with an estimated response time of 
five minutes per response. 

6. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are approximately 378 
hours, annual burden, associated with 
this information collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Melody Braswell, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, 3E.405A, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: June 28, 2021. 

Melody Braswell, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2021–14070 Filed 7–1–21; 8:45 am] 
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