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7 The applicant has 15 days from the submittal of 
a motion to intervene to file a written objection to 
the intervention. 

8 18 CFR 385.214(c)(1). 
9 18 CFR 385.214(b)(3) and (d). 

All timely, unopposed 7 motions to 
intervene are automatically granted by 
operation of Rule 214(c)(1).8 Motions to 
intervene that are filed after the 
intervention deadline are untimely, and 
may be denied. Any late-filed motion to 
intervene must show good cause for 
being late and must explain why the 
time limitation should be waived and 
provide justification by reference to 
factors set forth in Rule 214(d) of the 
Commission’s Rules and Regulations.9 
A person obtaining party status will be 
placed on the service list maintained by 
the Secretary of the Commission and 
will receive copies (paper or electronic) 
of all documents filed by the applicant 
and by all other parties. 

Tracking the Proceeding 

Throughout the proceeding, 
additional information about the project 
will be available from the Commission’s 
Office of External Affairs, at (866) 208– 
FERC, or on the FERC website at http:// 
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link 
as described above. The eLibrary link 
also provides access to the texts of all 
formal documents issued by the 
Commission, such as orders, notices, 
and rulemakings. 

In addition, the Commission offers a 
free service called eSubscription which 
allows you to keep track of all formal 
issuances and submittals in specific 
dockets. This can reduce the amount of 
time you spend researching proceedings 
by automatically providing you with 
notification of these filings, document 
summaries, and direct links to the 
documents. For more information and to 
register, go to www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp. 

Intervention Deadline: 5:00 p.m. 
Eastern Time on May 6, 2021. 

Dated: April 15, 2021. 

Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08214 Filed 4–20–21; 8:45 am] 
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Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. OR21–9–000] 

Enbridge Energy, Limited Partnership; 
Notice of Filing of Supplement to 
Facilities Surcharge Settlement 

Take notice that on April 14, 2021, 
pursuant to 18 CFR 385.602, Enbridge 
Energy, Limited Partnership, with the 
support of the Canadian Association of 
Petroleum Producers, submitted a 
Supplement to the Facilities Surcharge 
Settlement approved by the Commission 
on June 30, 2004, in Docket No. OR04– 
2–000, at 107 FERC ¶ 61,336 (2004). 

Initial comments and reply comments 
on the Settlement Supplement should 
be submitted on or before the dates 
indicated below. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. Anyone filing a motion 
to intervene, or protest must serve a 
copy of that document on the Applicant. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, the Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://
www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to file 
electronically may mail similar 

pleadings to the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First Street 
NE, Washington, DC 20426. Hand 
delivered submissions in docketed 
proceedings should be delivered to 
Health and Human Services, 12225 
Wilkins Avenue, Rockville, Maryland 
20852. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on May 4, 2021. 

Reply Comments: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on May 14, 2021. 

Dated: April 15, 2021. 

Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08217 Filed 4–20–21; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 4428–011] 

Walden Hydro, LLC; Notice of Waiver 
Period for Water Quality Certification 
Application 

April 15, 2021. 

On April 2, 2021, Walden Hydro, LLC 
filed with the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission a copy of its application for 
a Clean Water Act section 401(a)(1) 
water quality certification submitted to 
New York State Department of 
Environmental Conservation (New York 
DEC), in conjunction with the above 
captioned project. Pursuant to 40 CFR 
121.6, we hereby notify the New York 
DEC of the following: 

Date of Receipt of the Certification 
Request: April 1, 2021 

Reasonable Period of Time to Act on 
the Certification Request: One year. 

Date Waiver Occurs for Failure to Act: 
April 1, 2022. 

If New York DEC fails or refuses to act 
on the water quality certification request 
by the above waiver date, then the 
agency’s certifying authority is deemed 
waived pursuant to section 401(a)(1) of 
the Clean Water Act, 33 U.S.C. 
1341(a)(1). 

Dated: April 15, 2021. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–08239 Filed 4–20–21; 8:45 am] 
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