
12713 Federal Register / Vol. 86, No. 41 / Thursday, March 4, 2021 / Notices 

The views of the Commission are 
contained in USITC Publication 5170 
(March 2021), entitled 
Pentafluoroethane (R–125) from China: 
Investigation Nos. 701–TA–662 and 
731–TA–1554 (Preliminary). 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: February 26, 2021. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2021–04432 Filed 3–3–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

[OMB Number 1125–0003] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed Collection 
Comments Requested; Fee Waiver 
Request 

AGENCY: Executive Office for 
Immigration Review, Department of 
Justice. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Justice 
(DOJ), Executive Office for Immigration 
Review (EOIR), will be submitting the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until May 
3, 2021. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments 
especially on the estimated public 
burden or associated response time, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact 
Lauren Alder Reid, Assistant Director, 
Office of Policy, Executive Office for 
Immigration Review, 5107 Leesburg 
Pike, Suite 2500, Falls Church, VA 
22041, telephone: (703) 305–0289. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Executive Office for 
Immigration Review, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 

proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Revision and extension of a currently 
approved collection. 

2. The Title of the Form/Collection: 
Fee Waiver Request. 

3. The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
The form number is EOIR–26A, 
Executive Office for Immigration 
Review, United States Department of 
Justice. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: An individual 
submitting an appeal or motion to the 
Board of Immigration Appeals. An 
individual submitting an application or 
motion to the Office of the Chief 
Immigration Judge. Other: Attorneys 
and qualified representatives 
representing an alien in immigration 
proceedings before EOIR. Abstract: The 
information on the fee waiver request 
form is used by the Board of 
Immigration Appeals and the Office of 
the Chief Immigration Judge to 
determine whether the requisite fee for 
an application, motion or appeal will be 
waived due to an individual’s financial 
situation. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: It is estimated that 5,499 
respondents will complete the form 
annually with an average of 1 hour per 
response. 

6. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: The estimated public burden 
associated with this collection is 5,499 
hours. It is estimated that respondents 
will take 1 hour to complete the form. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Melody Braswell, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 

Square, 145 N Street NE, 3E.405B, 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: February 26, 2021. 
Melody D. Braswell, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2021–04418 Filed 3–3–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–30–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed 
Consent Decree Under the Resource 
Conservation and Recovery Act 

On January 20, 2021, the Department 
of Justice lodged a proposed consent 
decree with the United States District 
Court for the District of Utah in the 
lawsuit entitled United States of 
America v. Magnesium Corporation of 
America, et al., Civil Action No. 
2:01CV0040–DBB. 

If approved by the court, the consent 
decree would resolve the claims of the 
United States against US Magnesium 
LLC (‘‘USM’’), the Renco Group, Inc. 
(‘‘Group’’), the Ira Leon Rennert 
Revocable Trusts (‘‘Trusts’’), and Mr. Ira 
Leon Rennert (‘‘Rennert’’), collectively 
‘‘Defendants,’’ for injunctive relief and 
civil penalties for alleged violations of 
the Resource Conservation and 
Recovery Act (‘‘RCRA’’) at USM’s 
magnesium production facility in 
Rowley, Utah. The consent decree 
would require USM to: (1) Make 
extensive process modifications at the 
facility, including construction of a 
filtration plant to treat all wastewaters, 
that will reduce the environmental 
impacts from its production operations 
and ensure greater protection for its 
workers; (2) establish appropriate 
financial assurance for closure or 
corrective action of certain waste 
management areas in the operating areas 
of the facility; (3) pay a civil penalty of 
$250,000; and (4) perform the CERCLA 
Response Action, which includes 
construction of a barrier wall around 
1,700 acres of the operating portions of 
the facility to prevent leaks or breaches 
of hazardous materials to the Great Salt 
Lake, and the payment of EPA costs 
incurred in connection with the 
CERCLA Response Action. 

In return for the Settling Defendants’ 
compliance with these requirements, 
the consent decree would resolve past 
RCRA violations at the Rowley facility 
that the United States’ complaint 
alleges. Provided that the Settling 
Defendants remain in compliance with 
the consent decree’s requirements, 
including payment of EPA CERCLA 
Response Action costs, the United 
States would covenant not to sue the 
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Settling Defendants under CERCLA for 
the CERCLA Response Action and 
EPA’s CERCLA Response Action costs. 

On February 3, 2021, the Department 
of Justice published notice of the 
lodging of the proposed consent decree. 
86 FR 8037. The notice started a 30-day 
period for the submission of comments 
on the proposed consent decree. The 
Department of Justice has received a 
request for an extension of the comment 
period, which expires on March 5, 2021. 
In consideration of the request, notice is 
hereby given that the Department of 
Justice has extended the comment 
period on the proposed consent decree 
by an additional 14 days, up to and 
including March 19, 2021. Comments 
should be addressed to the Assistant 
Attorney General, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division, and should 
refer to United States of America v. 
Magnesium Corporation of America, et 
al., Civil Action No. 2:01CV0040–DBB; 
D.J. Ref. No. 90–7–1–06980. Comments 
may be submitted either by email or by 
mail: 

To submit 
comments: Send them to: 

By email ....... pubcomment-ees.enrd@
usdoj.gov. 

By mail ......... Assistant Attorney General, 
U.S. DOJ—ENRD, P.O. 
Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

During the public comment period, 
the consent decree may be examined 
and downloaded at this Justice 
Department website: http://
www.justice.gov/enrd/consent-decrees. 
We will provide a paper copy of the 
consent decree upon written request 
and payment of reproduction costs. 
Please mail your request and payment 
to: Consent Decree Library, U.S. DOJ— 
ENRD, P.O. Box 7611, Washington, DC 
20044–7611. 

Please enclose a check or money order 
for $101.00 (25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the United 
States Treasury. For a paper copy 
without the Appendices and signature 
pages, the cost is $20.00. 

Jeffrey Sands, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section, Environment and 
Natural Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2021–04438 Filed 3–3–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

NATIONAL SCIENCE FOUNDATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Comment Request; Grantee 
Reporting Requirements for the 
Graduate Research Fellowship 
Program 

AGENCY: National Science Foundation. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The National Science 
Foundation (NSF) is announcing plans 
to reinstate this collection. In 
accordance with the requirements of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, we 
are providing opportunity for public 
comment on this action. After obtaining 
and considering public comment, NSF 
will prepare the submission requesting 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) clearance of this collection for no 
longer than 3 years. 
DATES: Written comments on this notice 
must be received by May 3, 2021 to be 
assured consideration. Comments 
received after that date will be 
considered to the extent practicable. 
Send comments to address below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Suzanne H. Plimpton, Reports Clearance 
Officer, National Science Foundation, 
2415 Eisenhower Avenue, Suite 
W18253, Alexandria, Virginia 22314; 
telephone (703) 292–7556; or send email 
to splimpto@nsf.gov. Individuals who 
use a telecommunications device for the 
deaf (TDD) may call the Federal 
Information Relay Service (FIRS) at 1– 
800–877–8339, which is accessible 24 
hours a day, 7 days a week, 365 days a 
year (including Federal holidays). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Comments: Comments are invited on 
(a) whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
NCSES, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the NCSES’s estimate 
of the burden of the proposed collection 
of information; (c) ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected, including 
through the use of automated collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology; and (d) ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology. 

Title of Collection: Grantee Reporting 
Requirements for the Graduate Research 
Fellowship Program. 

OMB Number: 3145–0223. 
Expiration Date of Approval: Not 

applicable. 

Type of Request: Intent to seek 
approval to reinstate an information 
collection. 

Abstract 
Proposed Project: The purpose of the 

NSF Graduate Research Fellowship 
Program is to help ensure the vitality 
and diversity of the scientific and 
engineering workforce of the United 
States. The program recognizes and 
supports outstanding graduate students 
who are pursuing research-based 
master’s and doctoral degrees in 
science, technology, engineering, and 
mathematics (STEM) and in STEM 
education. The GRFP provides three 
years of support, to be used during a 
five-year fellowship period, for the 
graduate education of individuals who 
have demonstrated their potential for 
significant research achievements in 
STEM and STEM education. 

The Graduate Research Fellowship 
Program uses several sources of 
information in assessing and 
documenting program performance and 
impact. These sources include reports 
from program evaluation, the GRFP 
Committee of Visitors, and data 
compiled from the applications. In 
addition, GRFP Fellows submit annual 
activity reports to NSF. 

The GRFP Completion report is 
proposed as a continuing component of 
the annual reporting requirement for the 
program. This report, submitted by the 
GRFP Institution, certifies the 
completion status of Fellows at the 
institution (e.g., in progress, completed, 
graduated, transferred, or withdrawn). 
The existing Completion Report, Grants 
Roster Report, and the Program Expense 
Report comprise the GRFP Annual 
Reporting requirements from the 
Grantee GRFP institution. Through 
submission of the Completion Report to 
NSF GRFP institutions certify the 
current status of all GRFP Fellows at the 
institution as either: In Progress, 
Graduated, Transferred, or Withdrawn. 
For Graduate Fellows with Graduated 
status, the graduation date is a required 
reporting element. Collection of this 
information allows the program to 
obtain information on the current status 
of Fellows, the number and/or 
percentage of Graduate Fellowship 
recipients who complete a science or 
engineering graduate degree, and an 
estimate of time to degree completion. 
The report must be certified and 
submitted by the institution’s 
designated Coordinating Official (CO) 
annually. 

Use of the Information: The 
completion report data provides NSF 
with accurate Fellow information 
regarding completion of the Fellows’ 
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