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B. How can I get copies of this document 
and other related information? 

The docket for this action, identified 
by docket identification (ID) number 
EPA–HQ–OPP–2009–0308, is available 
at http://www.regulations.gov or at the 
Office of Pesticide Programs Regulatory 
Public Docket (OPP Docket) in the 
Environmental Protection Agency 
Docket Center (EPA/DC), West William 

Jefferson Clinton Bldg., Rm. 3334, 1301 
Constitution Ave. NW, Washington, DC 
20460–0001. 

Due to public health concerns related 
to COVID–19, the EPA Docket Center 
(EPA/DC) and Reading Room is closed 
to visitors with limited exceptions. The 
staff continues to provide remote 
customer service via email, phone, and 
webform. For the latest status 
information on EPA/DC services and 

docket access, visit http://www.epa.gov/ 
dockets. 

II. What action is the Agency taking? 

This notice announces the 
amendments to delete the uses, as 
requested by the registrant, for products 
registered under FIFRA section 3 (7 
U.S.C. 136a). The registration is listed in 
Table 1 of this unit. 

TABLE 1—PRODUCT REGISTRATION AMENDMENTS TO DELETE CERTAIN USES 

EPA registration No. Product name Uses deleted 

47000–123 ........................... Clean Crop Livestock 1% Rabon Dust ........................... On dogs and cats and in kennels and dog houses. 

Table 2 of this unit includes the name 
and address of record for the registrant 

of the product in Table 1 of this unit. 
The EPA company number corresponds 

to the first part of the EPA registration 
number of the product listed above. 

TABLE 2—REGISTRANT OF AMENDED PRODUCTS 

EPA company No. Company name and address 

47000 .............................................. Chem-Tech, Ltd., 620 Lesher Place, Lansing, MI 48912. 

III. Summary of Public Comments 
Received and Agency Response to 
Comments 

During the 30-day public comment 
period provided, EPA received no 
comments in response to the August 6, 
2020 Federal Register notice 
announcing the Agency’s receipt of the 
request for voluntary deletion of uses for 
the products listed in Table 1 of Unit II. 

IV. Termination Order 
Pursuant to FIFRA section 6(f) (7 

U.S.C. 136d(f)), EPA hereby approves 
the requested amendments to terminate 
uses of TCVP for the registration 
identified in Table 1 of Unit II. 
Accordingly, the Agency hereby orders 
that the product registrations identified 
in Table 1 of Unit II. are amended to 
terminate uses on dogs, cats and in 
kennels and dog houses. The effective 
date of the amendments to terminate 
affected uses that are the subject of this 
notice is February 18, 2021. Any 
distribution, sale, or use of existing 
stocks of the products identified in 
Table 1 of Unit II. in a manner 
inconsistent with any of the provisions 
for disposition of existing stocks set 
forth in Unit VI. will be a violation of 
FIFRA. 

V. What is the Agency’s authority for 
taking this action? 

Section 6(f)(1) of FIFRA (7 U.S.C. 
136d(f)(1)) provides that a registrant of 
a pesticide product may at any time 
request that any of its pesticide 
registrations be canceled or amended to 

terminate one or more uses. FIFRA 
further provides that, before acting on 
the request, EPA must publish a notice 
of receipt of any such request in the 
Federal Register. Thereafter, following 
the public comment period, the EPA 
Administrator may approve such a 
request. The notice of receipt for this 
action was published for comment in 
the Federal Register of August 6, 2020 
[(volume 85 number 152) (FRL–10012– 
80)]. The comment period closed on 
September 8, 2020. 

VI. Provisions for Disposition of 
Existing Stocks 

Existing stocks are those stocks of 
registered pesticide products that are 
currently in the United States and that 
were packaged, labeled, and released for 
shipment prior to the effective date of 
the cancellation action. The existing 
stocks provisions for the products 
subject to this order are as follows. 

Chem-Tech may not ‘‘release for 
shipment,’’ as that term is defined by 40 
CFR 152.3, any product under EPA Reg. 
No. 47000–123 as of February 18, 2021 
and may not sell or distribute existing 
stocks except for export consistent with 
FIFRA section 17 (7 U.S.C. 136o) or for 
proper disposal. Chem-Tech may sell or 
distribute existing stocks of EPA Reg. 
No. 47000–123 until exhausted. 

Persons other than the registrants may 
sell, distribute, or use existing stocks of 
canceled products until supplies are 
exhausted, provided that such sale, 
distribution, or use is consistent with 
the terms of the previously approved 

labeling on, or that accompanied, the 
canceled products. 

Authority: 7 U.S.C. 136 et seq. 

Dated: February 3, 2021. 
Mary Reaves, 
Director, Pesticide Re-Evaluation Division, 
Office of Pesticide Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2021–03226 Filed 2–17–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–10016–64–OMS] 

Cross-Media Electronic Reporting: 
Authorized Program Revision 
Approval, State of New Hampshire 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces the 
Environment Protection Agency (EPA) 
approval of the State of New 
Hampshire’s request to revise/modify 
certain of its EPA-authorized programs 
to allow electronic reporting. 
DATES: EPA approves the authorized 
program revisions/modifications as of 
February 18, 2021. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Shirley M. Miller, CROMERR Program 
Manager, U.S. Environmental Protection 
Agency, Office of Information 
Management, Mail Stop 2824T, 1200 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW, Washington, 
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DC 20460, (202) 566–2908, 
miller.shirley@epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: On 
October 13, 2005, the final Cross-Media 
Electronic Reporting Rule (CROMERR) 
was published in the Federal Register 
(70 FR 59848) and codified as part 3 of 
title 40 of the CFR. CROMERR 
establishes electronic reporting as an 
acceptable regulatory alternative to 
paper reporting and establishes 
requirements to assure that electronic 
documents are as legally dependable as 
their paper counterparts. Subpart D of 
CROMERR requires that state, tribal or 
local government agencies that receive, 
or wish to begin receiving, electronic 
reports under their EPA-authorized 
programs must apply to EPA for a 
revision or modification of those 
programs and obtain EPA approval. 
Subpart D provides standards for such 
approvals based on consideration of the 
electronic document receiving systems 
that the state, tribe, or local government 
will use to implement the electronic 
reporting. Additionally, § 3.1000(b) 
through (e) of 40 CFR part 3, subpart D 
provides special procedures for program 
revisions and modifications to allow 
electronic reporting, to be used at the 
option of the state, tribe or local 
government in place of procedures 
available under existing program- 
specific authorization regulations. An 
application submitted under the subpart 
D procedures must show that the state, 
tribe or local government has sufficient 
legal authority to implement the 
electronic reporting components of the 
programs covered by the application 
and will use electronic document 
receiving systems that meet the 
applicable subpart D requirements. 

On September 17, 2020, the New 
Hampshire Department of 
Environmental Services (NHDES) 
submitted an application titled 
Compliance Monitoring Data Portal for 
revisions/modifications to its EPA- 
approved programs under title 40 CFR 
to allow new electronic reporting. EPA 
reviewed NHDES’s request to revise/ 
modify its EPA-authorized programs 
and, based on this review, EPA 
determined that the application met the 
standards for approval of authorized 
program revisions/modifications set out 
in 40 CFR part 3, subpart D. In 
accordance with 40 CFR 3.1000(d), this 
notice of EPA’s decision to approve 
New Hampshire’s request to revise its 
Part 142—National Primary Drinking 
Water Regulations Implementation 
program to allow electronic reporting 
under 40 CFR part 141 is being 
published in the Federal Register. 

NHDES was notified of EPA’s 
determination to approve its application 
with respect to the authorized programs 
listed above. 

Also, in today’s notice, EPA is 
informing interested persons that they 
may request a public hearing on EPA’s 
action to approve the State of New 
Hampshire’s request to revise its 
authorized public water system program 
under 40 CFR part 142, in accordance 
with 40 CFR 3.1000(f). Requests for a 
hearing must be submitted to EPA 
within 30 days of publication of today’s 
Federal Register notice. Such requests 
should include the following 
information: 

(1) The name, address and telephone 
number of the individual, organization 
or other entity requesting a hearing; 

(2) A brief statement of the requesting 
person’s interest in EPA’s 
determination, a brief explanation as to 
why EPA should hold a hearing, and 
any other information that the 
requesting person wants EPA to 
consider when determining whether to 
grant the request; 

(3) The signature of the individual 
making the request, or, if the request is 
made on behalf of an organization or 
other entity, the signature of a 
responsible official of the organization 
or other entity. 

In the event a hearing is requested 
and granted, EPA will provide notice of 
the hearing in the Federal Register not 
less than 15 days prior to the scheduled 
hearing date. Frivolous or insubstantial 
requests for hearing may be denied by 
EPA. Following such a public hearing, 
EPA will review the record of the 
hearing and issue an order either 
affirming today’s determination or 
rescinding such determination. If no 
timely request for a hearing is received 
and granted, EPA’s approval of the State 
of New Hampshire’s request to revise its 
part 142—National Primary Drinking 
Water Regulations Implementation 
program to allow electronic reporting 
will become effective 30 days after 
today’s notice is published, pursuant to 
CROMERR section 3.1000(f)(4). 

Dated: January 14, 2021. 
Jennifer Campbell, 
Director, Office of Information Management. 
[FR Doc. 2021–03301 Filed 2–17–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL ELECTION COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Meeting 

TIME AND DATE: Tuesday, February 23, 
2021 at 10:00 a.m. and its continuation 

at the conclusion of the open meeting 
on February 25, 2021. 
PLACE: 1050 First Street NE, 
Washington, DC (This meeting will be a 
virtual meeting). 
STATUS: This meeting will be closed to 
the public. 
MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED: Compliance 
matters pursuant to 52 U.S.C. 30109. 

Matters concerning participation in 
civil actions or proceedings or 
arbitration. 
* * * * * 
CONTACT PERSON FOR MORE INFORMATION: 
Judith Ingram, Press Officer, Telephone: 
(202) 694–1220. 

Laura E. Sinram, 
Acting Secretary and Clerk of the 
Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2021–03394 Filed 2–16–21; 4:15 pm] 

BILLING CODE 6715–01–P 

FEDERAL MARITIME COMMISSION 

Notice of Agreements Filed 

The Commission hereby gives notice 
of the filing of the following agreement 
under the Shipping Act of 1984. 
Interested parties may submit 
comments, relevant information, or 
documents regarding the agreements to 
the Secretary by email at Secretary@
fmc.gov, or by mail, Federal Maritime 
Commission, Washington, DC 20573. 
Comments will be most helpful to the 
Commission if received within 12 days 
of the date this notice appears in the 
Federal Register. Copies of agreements 
are available through the Commission’s 
website (www.fmc.gov) or by contacting 
the Office of Agreements at (202)-523– 
5793 or tradeanalysis@fmc.gov. 

Agreement No.: 201354. 
Agreement Name: CMA CGM/COSCO 

Jamaica—Puerto Rico Space Charter 
Agreement. 

Parties: CMA CGM S.A. and COSCO 
SHIPPING Lines Co., Ltd. 

Filing Party: Draughn Arbona, CMA 
CGM S.A. 

Synopsis: This agreement authorizes 
CMA CGM to charter space to COSCO 
on certain vessels CMA CGM operates 
in the Trade from Jamaica to Puerto 
Rico. 

Proposed Effective Date: 2/8/2021. 
Location: https://www2.fmc.gov/ 

FMC.Agreements.Web/Public/ 
AgreementHistory/39505. 

Dated: February 12, 2021. 
Rachel E. Dickon, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2021–03245 Filed 2–17–21; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6730–02–P 
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