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assess the impact of its information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand the 
Department’s information collection 
requirements and provide the requested 
data in the desired format. ED is 
soliciting comments on the proposed 
information collection request (ICR) that 
is described below. The Department of 
Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) Is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: 2019 Temporary 
Emergency Impact Aid for Displaced 
Students. 

OMB Control Number: 1810–NEW. 
Type of Review: A new information 

collection. 
Respondents/Affected Public: State, 

Local, and Tribal Governments. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses: 56. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Burden Hours: 2,240. 
Abstract: This is an emergency 

collection request for 2019 Temporary 
Emergency Impact Aid for Displaced 
Students. The Additional Supplemental 
Appropriations for Disaster Relief Act, 
2019 (Pub. L. 116–20, hereafter referred 
to as the Disaster Supplemental) was 
signed into law by President Trump on 
June 6, 2019. The law provides $165 
million for education-related disaster 
recovery activities for certain natural 
disasters in 2018 and 2019 for which a 
major disaster or emergency (covered 
disasters) has been declared by the 
President. 

The Department of Education plans to 
use the discretion afforded to the 
Secretary by the Disaster Supplemental 
to implement four programs: Immediate 
Aid to Restart School Operations 
program (Restart), Emergency Impact 
Aid for Displaced Students (EIA), 
Emergency Assistance to Institutions of 
Higher Education program (Emergency 
Assistance to IHEs), and Project School 
Emergency Response to Violence 
(Project SERV). 

Under this request, the Department is 
seeking emergency clearance for the 
2019 Restart Program. Under this 

program, the Department will award 
Restart funding to SEAs, which, in turn, 
will provide assistance to LEAs to 
defray expenses related to the restart of 
operations in, the reopening of, and the 
re-enrollment of students in elementary 
and secondary schools that serve an area 
affected by a covered disaster. 

Due to the severe impact (e.g., 
physical, social, emotional) of the 
covered programs and the degree to 
which they have disrupted teaching and 
learning, we are requesting emergency 
clearance by August 30, 2019. In light of 
the late enactment of the Disaster 
Supplemental and the fact that the 
2018–2019 school year is effectively 
over, it is critical that these data are 
collected quickly, to enable ED to make 
timely payments and provide necessary 
relief. 

Additional Information: An 
emergency clearance approval for the 
use of the system is described below 
due to the following conditions: 

The Additional Supplemental 
Appropriations for Disaster Relief Act of 
2019, signed into law by President 
Trump on June 06, 2019, included new 
funding to support disaster relief. The 
U.S. Department of Education 
(Department) will award up to $165 
million to assist K–12 schools and 
school districts in meeting the 
educational needs of students affected 
by Hurricanes Florence and Michael, 
Typhoon Mangkhut, Super Typhoon 
Yutu, and wildfires, earthquakes, and 
volcanic eruptions occurring in calendar 
year 2018 and tornadoes and floods 
occurring in calendar year 2019 in those 
areas for which a major disaster or 
emergency is declared under section 
401 or 501 of the Robert T. Stafford 
Disaster Relief and Emergency Act (42 
U.S.C. 5170 and 5190).This disaster 
assistance will help schools and school 
districts return to their full capabilities 
as quickly and effectively as possible. 
Pursuant to 5 CFR 1320.13, the 
Department requests that OMB review 
and approved this collection by August 
30, 2019 under its emergency 
procedures, based on harm to public 
due to an unanticipated/unforeseen 
natural disaster event that occurred 
beyond ED’s control. 

Dated: August 22, 2019. 

Kate Mullan, 
PRA Coordinator, Information Collection 
Clearance Program, Information Management 
Branch, Office of the Chief Information 
Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2019–18467 Filed 8–27–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Agency Information Collection 
Extension 

AGENCY: U.S. Department of Energy. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Energy 
(DOE) has submitted an information 
collection request to the OMB for an 
extension under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. The 
information collection requests a three- 
year extension of its Environment, 
Safety and Health reporting 
requirements, OMB Control Number 
1910–0300. This information collection 
request covers information necessary for 
the DOE to exercise management 
oversight and control over Management 
and Operating (M&O) contractors of the 
DOE’s Government-Owned Contractor- 
Operated (GOCO) facilities, and offsite 
contractors. The contractor management 
oversight and control function concerns 
the ways in which the DOE’s contractors 
provide goods and services for DOE 
organizations and activities in 
accordance with the terms of their 
contract(s); the applicable statutory, 
regulatory and mission support 
requirements of the DOE; and 
regulations in the functional area 
covered in this request. 
DATES: Comments regarding this 
collection must be received on or before 
September 27, 2019. If you anticipate 
difficulty in submitting comments 
within that period of time allowed by 
this notice, please advise the OMB Desk 
Officer of your intention to make a 
submission as soon as possible. The 
Desk Officer may be telephoned at (202) 
395–4718. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments should 
be sent to the DOE Desk Officer, Office 
of Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Room 10102, 
735 17th Street NW, Washington, DC 
20503, and to Sandra K. Dentinger, AU– 
70/E–455 Germantown Building, U.S. 
Department of Energy, 1000 
Independence Ave. SW, Washington, 
DC 20585–1290 or by fax at (301) 903– 
0048, by email at Sandra.Dentinger@
hq.doe.gov, or information about the 
collection instruments may be obtained 
at: https://energy.gov/ehss/information- 
collection. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
copies of the information collection 
instrument and instructions should be 
directed to Sandra K. Dentinger at 
Sandra.Dentinger@hq.doe.gov, or (301) 
903–5139. 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 20:14 Aug 27, 2019 Jkt 247001 PO 00000 Frm 00018 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\28AUN1.SGM 28AUN1jb
el

l o
n 

D
S

K
3G

LQ
08

2P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

mailto:Sandra.Dentinger@hq.doe.gov
mailto:Sandra.Dentinger@hq.doe.gov
mailto:Sandra.Dentinger@hq.doe.gov
https://energy.gov/ehss/information-collection
https://energy.gov/ehss/information-collection


45138 Federal Register / Vol. 84, No. 167 / Wednesday, August 28, 2019 / Notices 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
information collection request contains 
the following: (1) OMB No: 1910–0300; 
(2) Information Collection Request Title: 
Environment, Safety and Health; (3) 
Type of Review: renewal; (4) Purpose: 
The collections are used by DOE to 
exercise management oversight and 
control over its contractors in the ways 
in which the DOE’s contractors provide 
goods and services for DOE 
organizations and activities in 
accordance with the terms of their 
contract(s); the applicable statutory, 
regulatory and mission support 
requirements of the Department. The 
collections are: Computerized Accident/ 
Incident Reporting System (CAIRS); 
Occurrence Reporting and Processing 
System (ORPS); Noncompliance 
Tracking System (NTS); Radiation 
Exposure Monitoring System (REMS); 
Annual Fire Protection Summary 
Application; Safety Basis Information 
System; and Lessons Learned System; 
(5) Annual Estimated Number of 
Respondents: 845; (6) Annual Estimated 
Number of Total Responses: 82,155; (7) 
Response Obligation: Required, except 
for Noncompliance Tracking System 
(see Statutory Authority section below); 
(8) Annual Estimated Number of Burden 
Hours: 37,280; (9) Annual Estimated 
Reporting and Recordkeeping Cost 
Burden: $0. 

Statutory Authority: Section 641 of 
the Department of Energy Organization 
Act, codified at 42 U.S.C. 7251, and the 
following additional authorities: 

Computerized Accident/Incident 
Reporting System (CAIRS): DOE Order 
231.1B (June 27, 2011). 

Occurrence Reporting and Processing 
System (ORPS): DOE Order 232.2 
(August 30, 2011). 

Noncompliance Tracking System 
(NTS): 10 CFR part 820; 10 CFR part 
851. 

Radiation Exposure Monitoring 
System (REMS): 10 CFR part 835; DOE 
Order 231.1B (June 27, 2011). 

Annual Fire Protection Summary 
Application: DOE Order 231.1B (June 
27, 2011). 

Safety Basis Information System: 10 
CFR part 830; DOE O 231.1B (June 27, 
2011). 

Lessons Learned System: DOE Order 
210.2A (April 8, 2011). 

Signed in Washington, DC, on August 15, 
2019. 
Matthew B. Moury, 
Associate Under Secretary for Environment, 
Health, Safety and Security. 
[FR Doc. 2019–18614 Filed 8–27–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER19–2644–000] 

Whitney Hill Wind Power, LLC; 
Supplemental Notice That Initial 
Market-Based Rate Filing Includes 
Request for Blanket Section 204 
Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced Whitney Hill Wind 
Power, LLC’s application for market- 
based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Anyone filing a motion to 
intervene or protest must serve a copy 
of that document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is September 
10, 2019. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the intervention or protest to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. 

The filings in the above-referenced 
proceeding are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the appropriate link in the 
above list. They are also available for 
electronic review in the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room in Washington, 
DC. There is an eSubscription link on 
the website that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 

Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Dated: August 21, 2019. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2019–18471 Filed 8–27–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 14974–000] 

Lock+TM Hydro Friends Fund XXI, LLC; 
Notice of Preliminary Permit 
Application Accepted for Filing and 
Soliciting Comments, Motions To 
Intervene, and Competing Applications 

August 22, 2019. 
On March 1, 2019, Lock∂TM Hydro 

Friends Fund XXI, LLC, filed an 
application for a preliminary permit, 
pursuant to section 4(f) of the Federal 
Power Act (FPA), proposing to study the 
feasibility of the East Branch Dam 
Hydropower Project to be located at the 
U.S. Army Corps of Engineers’ (Corps) 
East Branch Dam on the Clarion River 
in Elk County, Pennsylvania. The sole 
purpose of a preliminary permit, if 
issued, is to grant the permit holder 
priority to file a license application 
during the permit term. A preliminary 
permit does not authorize the permit 
holder to perform any land-disturbing 
activities or otherwise enter upon lands 
or waters owned by others without the 
owners’ express permission. 

The proposed project would consist of 
the following: (1) A new 30-foot-long, 
30-foot-wide, 160-foot-high Large Frame 
Module; (2) two turbine-generator units 
with a total rated capacity of 1.6 
megawatts; (3) a new 4-foot-long, 4-foot- 
wide, 3-foot-high pad-mounted 
transformer; (4) a new 200-foot-long, 13- 
kilovolt transmission line connecting 
the new transformer to an existing 
distribution line; and (5) appurtenant 
facilities. The proposed project would 
have an annual generation of 7,100 
megawatt-hours. 

Applicant Contact: Wayne Krouse, 
Lock∂TM Hydro Friends Fund XXI, LLC, 
P.O. Box 43796, Birmingham, AL 35243; 
phone: 877–556–6566 ext. 709. 

FERC Contact: Woohee Choi; phone: 
(202) 502–6336. 

Deadline for filing comments, motions 
to intervene, competing applications 
(without notices of intent), or notices of 
intent to file competing applications: 60 
days from the issuance of this notice. 
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