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to change. Please note that the subjects 
that will be discussed by the 
Committees and the Board may involve 
commercial or financial information 
that is privileged or confidential or 
other legal matters affecting the FirstNet 
Authority. As such, the Committee 
Chairs and Board Chair may call for a 
vote to close the meetings only for the 
time necessary to preserve the 
confidentiality of such information, 
pursuant to 47 U.S.C. 1424(e)(2). 

Times and Dates of Meeting: A 
combined meeting of the FirstNet 
Authority Board and FirstNet Authority 
Board Committees will be held on June 
26, 2019 between 10:00 a.m. and 12:30 
p.m. (EDT). The meeting of the FirstNet 
Authority Board and the Governance 
and Personnel, Technology, Public 
Safety Advocacy, and Finance 
Committees will be open to the public 
from 10:00 a.m. to 12:30 p.m. (EDT). 
The times listed above are subject to 
change. Please refer to the FirstNet 
Authority’s website at www.firstnet.gov 
for the most up-to-date information. 

Place: The meetings on June 26, 2019 
will be held at the JW Marriott, 10 South 
West Street, Indianapolis, IN 46204. 
Members of the public may listen to the 
meeting by dialing toll free 1–877–918– 
2312 and entering participant code 
6420867#. The meeting will also be 
webcast. Please refer to the FirstNet 
Authority’s website at www.firstnet.gov 
for webcast instructions and other 
information. 

Other Information: These meetings 
are open to the public and press on a 
first-come, first-served basis. Space is 
limited. To ensure an accurate 
headcount, all expected attendees are 
asked to provide notice of intent to 
attend by sending an email to 
BoardRSVP@firstnet.gov. If the number 
of RSVPs indicates that expected 
attendance has reached its capacity, the 
FirstNet Authority will respond to all 
subsequent notices indicating that 
capacity has been reached and that in- 
person viewing may no longer be 
available but that the meeting may still 
be viewed by webcast as detailed below. 
For access to the meetings, valid 
government issued photo identification 
may be requested for security reasons. 

The Combined Committee and Board 
Meetings are accessible to people with 
disabilities. Individuals requiring 
accommodations, such as sign language 
interpretation or other ancillary aids, are 
asked to notify Ms. Miller-Kuwana by 
telephone at (571) 665–6177 or email at 
Karen.Miller-Kuwana@firstnet.gov at 
least five (5) business days before the 
applicable meeting. 

The meeting will also be webcast. 
Please refer to the FirstNet Authority’s 

website at www.firstnet.gov for webcast 
instructions and other information. 
Viewers experiencing any issues with 
the live webcast may email support@
sparkstreetdigital.com or call 202–684– 
3361 x3 for support. A variety of 
automated troubleshooting tests are also 
available via the ‘‘Troubleshooting 
Tips’’ button on the webcast player. The 
meetings will also be available to 
interested parties by phone. To be 
connected to the meetings in listen-only 
mode by telephone, please dial toll free 
1–877–918–2312 and enter participant 
code 6420867#. If you experience 
technical difficulty, please contact the 
Conferencing Center customer service at 
1–866–900–1011. 

Records: The FirstNet Authority 
maintains records of all Board 
proceedings. Minutes of the Board 
Meeting and the Committee meetings 
will be available at www.firstnet.gov. 

Dated: June 10, 2019. 
Karen Miller-Kuwana, 
Board Secretary, First Responder Network 
Authority. 
[FR Doc. 2019–12536 Filed 6–13–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–TL–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

University of Connecticut; Notice of 
Decision on Application for Duty-Free 
Entry of Scientific Instruments 

This is a decision pursuant to Section 
6(c) of the Educational, Scientific, and 
Cultural Materials Importation Act of 
1966 (Pub. L. 89–651, as amended by 
Public Law 106–36; 80 Stat. 897; 15 CFR 
part 301). On April 11, 2019, the 
Department of Commerce published a 
notice in the Federal Register 
requesting public comment on whether 
instruments of equivalent scientific 
value, for the purposes for which the 
instruments identified in the docket(s) 
below are intended to be used, are being 
manufactured in the United States. See 
Application(s) for Duty-Free Entry of 
Scientific Instruments, 84 FR 14654 
(April 11, 2019) (Notice). We received 
no public comments. Related records 
can be viewed between 8:30 a.m. and 
5:00 p.m. in Room 3720, U.S. 
Department of Commerce, 14th and 
Constitution Ave. NW, Washington, DC 

Docket Number: 18–010. Applicant: 
University of Connecticut, Storrs, CT 
06269. Instrument: STED Confocal 
Microscope. Manufacturer: Abberior 
Instruments GmBH, Germany. Intended 
Use: See Notice at 14654. Comments: 
None received. Decision: Approved. We 
know of no instruments of equivalent 

scientific value to the foreign 
instruments described below, for such 
purposes as this is intended to be used, 
that were being manufactured in the 
United States at the time of order. 
Reasons: The instrument will be used to 
study a variety of biological material 
related to medical research. Scientists at 
the University of Connecticut will be 
able to reveal the protein nano-structure 
of: Mouse/rat brain tissue and cells, 
mouse colon tissue, fruit fly 
chromosomes, mouse spinal cord tissue, 
and mammalian or invertebrate cultured 
cells. The experiments to be conducted 
involve taking the material and 
examining it with various wavelengths 
of light to obtain fluorescent images of 
cellular structures with high levels of 
detail. The objectives pursued by 
research with this equipment are 
understanding of the normal and 
pathological mechanisms of cellular 
function relating to human health and 
disease. The techniques used by 
employing this equipment include using 
the method of stimulated emission 
depletion (STED), which enables the 
visualization of high resolution, 
microscopic structure of biological 
specimens. 

Dated: June 10, 2019. 
Gregory W. Campbell, 
Director, Subsidies Enforcement, Enforcement 
and Compliance. 
[FR Doc. 2019–12610 Filed 6–13–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

[A–570–028] 

Hydrofluorocarbon Blends From the 
People’s Republic of China: 
Preliminary Results of Antidumping 
Duty Administrative Review and Final 
Rescission, in Part; 2017–2018 

AGENCY: Enforcement and Compliance, 
International Trade Administration, 
United States Department of Commerce. 
SUMMARY: On October 4, 2018, the 
Department of Commerce (Commerce) 
initiated an administrative review of the 
antidumping duty order on 
hydrofluorocarbon blends (HFCs) from 
the People’s Republic of China (China) 
for 13 companies. Based on timely 
withdrawal of requests for review, we 
are now rescinding this administrative 
review with respect to 12 of these 
companies. 
DATES: Applicable June 14, 2019. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Andrew Medley or Manuel Rey, AD/ 
CVD Operations, Office II, Enforcement 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 17:04 Jun 13, 2019 Jkt 247001 PO 00000 Frm 00003 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\14JNN1.SGM 14JNN1jb
el

l o
n 

D
S

K
3G

LQ
08

2P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

mailto:Karen.Miller-Kuwana@firstnet.gov
mailto:support@sparkstreetdigital.com
mailto:support@sparkstreetdigital.com
mailto:BoardRSVP@firstnet.gov
http://www.firstnet.gov
http://www.firstnet.gov
http://www.firstnet.gov
http://www.firstnet.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2019-06-14T00:48:50-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




