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may file a comment through that Web 
site. 

If you file your comment on paper, 
write ‘‘Consumer Fraud Survey 2016: 
Paperwork Comment, FTC File No. 
P105502’’ on your comment and on the 
envelope, and mail it to the following 
address: Federal Trade Commission, 
Office of the Secretary, 600 
Pennsylvania Avenue NW., Suite CC– 
5610 (Annex J), Washington, DC 20580, 
or deliver your comment to the 
following address: Federal Trade 
Commission, Office of the Secretary, 
Constitution Center, 400 7th Street SW., 
5th Floor, Suite 5610 (Annex J), 
Washington, DC 20024. If possible, 
submit your paper comment to the 
Commission by courier or overnight 
service. 

Comments on the information 
collection requirements subject to 
review under the PRA should 
additionally be submitted to OMB. If 
sent by U.S. mail, they should be 
addressed to Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget, Attention: 
Desk Officer for the Federal Trade 
Commission, New Executive Office 
Building, Docket Library, Room 10102, 
725 17th Street NW., Washington, DC 
20503. Comments sent to OMB by U.S. 
postal mail, however, are subject to 
delays due to heightened security 
precautions. Thus, comments instead 
should be sent by facsimile to (202) 
395–5806. 

The FTC Act and other laws that the 
Commission administers permit the 
collection of public comments to 
consider and use in this proceeding as 
appropriate. The Commission will 
consider all timely and responsive 
public comments that it receives on or 
before January 5, 2017. For information 
on the Commission’s privacy policy, 
including routine uses permitted by the 
Privacy Act, see http://www.ftc.gov/ftc/ 
privacy.htm. 

David C. Shonka, 
Acting General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2016–29149 Filed 12–5–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6750–01–P 

GULF COAST ECOSYSTEM 
RESTORATION COUNCIL 

[Docket No. 112062016–1111–07] 

Amendment to Initial Funded Priorities 
List 

AGENCY: Gulf Coast Ecosystem 
Restoration Council. 
ACTION: Notice of amendment to Initial 
Funded Priorities List. 

SUMMARY: On November 16, 2016, the 
Gulf Coast Ecosystem Restoration 
Council (Council) amended its Initial 
Funded Priorities List (FPL) to change 
the Responsible Council Member of the 
FPL activity entitled ‘‘GOMA 
Coordination’’ from the State of 
Alabama to the Department of 
Commerce. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Please send questions by email to 
john.ettinger@restorethegulf.gov or 
contact John Ettinger at (504) 444–3522. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 
The Deepwater Horizon oil spill led to 

passage of the Resources and 
Ecosystems Sustainability, Tourist 
Opportunities, and Revived Economies 
of the Gulf Coast States Act of 2012 
(RESTORE Act), which dedicates 80% 
of all Clean Water Act administrative 
and civil penalties related to the oil spill 
to the Gulf Coast Restoration Trust Fund 
(Trust Fund). The RESTORE Act also 
established the Council as an 
independent federal entity comprised of 
the governors of five Gulf Coast states 
and the department heads of six federal 
agencies. Among other responsibilities, 
the Council administers a portion of the 
Trust Fund known as the Council- 
Selected Restoration Component in 
order to ‘‘undertake projects and 
programs, using the best available 
science, which would restore and 
protect the natural resources, 
ecosystems, fisheries, marine and 
wildlife habitats, beaches, coastal 
wetlands, and economy of the Gulf 
Coast.’’ Additional information on the 
Council can be found here: https://
www.restorethegulf.gov. 

On December 9, 2015, the Council 
approved an Initial FPL, which includes 
projects and programs approved for 
funding under the Council-Selected 
Restoration Component, along with 
activities that the Council identified as 
priorities for potential future funding. 
The FPL included the project entitled 
‘‘GOMA Coordination’’ to support 
further development of a Monitoring 
Community of Practice using expertise 
from existing Gulf of Mexico Alliance 
Priority Issue Teams. As approved in 
the FPL, the Responsible Council 
Member of this activity was the State of 
Alabama. 

On November 16, 2016, the Council 
voted to change the Responsible Council 
Member of the FPL activity entitled 
‘‘GOMA Coordination’’ from the State of 
Alabama to the Department of 
Commerce. The Department of 
Commerce is a co-sponsor of a closely 
related FPL activity entitled ‘‘Council 

Monitoring & Assessment Program 
Development.’’ This proposed 
amendment would increase 
administrative efficiency and facilitate 
project implementation and tracking. No 
other aspect of this FPL activity will 
change. 

Additional information on this project 
is available in an activity-specific 
appendix to the FPL, which can be 
found here: https://
www.restorethegulf.gov. 

Will D. Spoon, 
Program Analyst, Gulf Coast Ecosystem 
Restoration Council. 
[FR Doc. 2016–29238 Filed 12–5–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–58–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Disease, Disability, and Injury 
Prevention and Control Special 
Emphasis Panel (SEP): Initial Review 

In accordance with Section 10(a)(2) of 
the Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(Pub. L. 92–463), the Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention (CDC) 
announces a meeting for the initial 
review of applications in response to 
Funding Opportunity Announcement 
(FOA) PAR15–352, Occupational Safety 
and Health Training Projects. 

Times and Dates: 
1:00 p.m.–6:00 p.m., EST, January 18, 

2016 (Closed). 
1:00 p.m.–6:00 p.m., EST, January 19, 

2016 (Closed). 
Place: Teleconference. 
Status: The meeting will be closed to 

the public in accordance with 
provisions set forth in Section 
552b(c)(4) and (6), Title 5 U.S.C., and 
the Determination of the Director, 
Management Analysis and Services 
Office, CDC, pursuant to Public Law 92– 
463. 

Matters for Discussion: The meeting 
will include the initial review, 
discussion, and evaluation of 
applications received in response to 
‘‘Occupational Safety and Health 
Training Projects’’, PAR15–352. 

Contact Person for More Information: 
Nina L. Turner, Ph.D., Scientific Review 
Officer, CDC, 1095 Willowdale Road, 
Mailstop L1055, Morgantown, WV 
Telephone:(304) 285–6047, NTURNER@
CDC.GOV. 

The Director, Management Analysis 
and Services Office, has been delegated 
the authority to sign Federal Register 
notices pertaining to announcements of 
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meetings and other committee 
management activities, for both the 
Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention and the Agency for Toxic 
Substances and Disease Registry. 

Elaine L. Baker, 
Director, Management Analysis and Services 
Office, Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2016–29176 Filed 12–5–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4163–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

Office for State, Tribal, Local and 
Territorial Support (OSTLTS) 

In accordance with Presidential 
Executive Order No. 13175, November 
6, 2000, and the Presidential 
Memorandum of November 5, 2009, and 
September 23, 2004, Consultation and 
Coordination with Indian Tribal 
Governments, CDC/Agency for Toxic 
Substances and Disease Registry 
(ATSDR), announces the following 
meetings and Tribal Consultation 
Session: 

Name: Tribal Caucus, CDC/ATSDR 
Tribal Advisory Committee (TAC) 
Meeting and 16th Biannual Tribal 
Consultation Session 

Times and Dates: 
8:00 a.m.–5:00 p.m., EST, February 

14, 2017 (Tribal Caucus) 
8:00 a.m.–5:00 p.m., EST, February 

15, 2017 (TAC Meeting and 16th 
Biannual Tribal Consultation Session) 

Place: The Tribal Caucus, TAC 
Meeting and Tribal Consultation 
Session will be held at CDC, Global 
Communications Center, Building 19, 
Auditorium B3, 1600 Clifton Road NE., 
Atlanta, Georgia 30329. 

Status: The meetings are being hosted 
by CDC/ATSDR in-person only and are 
open to the public. Attendees must pre- 
register for the event by Friday, January 
13, 2017, at the following link: http://
www.cdc.gov/tribal/meetings.html. 

Purpose: The purpose of these 
recurring meetings is to advance CDC 
and ATSDR support for and 
collaboration with American Indian and 
Alaska Native (AI/AN) tribes, and to 
improve the health of AI/AN tribes by 
pursuing goals that include assisting in 
eliminating the health disparities faced 
by AI/AN tribes; ensuring that access to 
critical health and human services and 
public health services is maximized to 
advance or enhance the social, physical, 

and economic status of AI/ANs; and 
promoting health equity for all Indian 
people and communities. To advance 
these goals, CDC and ATSDR conducts 
government-to-government 
consultations with elected tribal 
officials or their authorized 
representatives. Consultation is an 
enhanced form of communication that 
emphasizes trust, respect, and shared 
responsibility. It is an open and free 
exchange of information and opinion 
among parties that leads to mutual 
understanding and comprehension. 

Matters for Discussion: The TAC 
Meeting and Biannual Tribal 
Consultation Session will provide 
opportunities for tribal leaders to speak 
openly about the public health issues 
affecting their tribes. These meetings 
will include, but are not limited to, 
discussions about advancing CDC’s 
tribal budget consultation process, 
connecting cultural and traditional 
practices to evidence-based 
interventions, and expanding disease 
prevention efforts throughout Indian 
country. 

Tribes will also have an opportunity 
to present testimony about tribal health 
issues. All Tribal leaders are encouraged 
to submit written testimony by 5:00 
p.m., EST, Friday, January 13, 2017, to 
LCDR Jessica Damon, Public Health 
Advisor for the Tribal Support Unit, 
OSTLTS, via mail to 4770 Buford 
Highway NE., MS E–70, Atlanta, 
Georgia, 30341–3717 or email to 
TribalSupport@cdc.gov. 

Based on the number of tribal leaders 
giving testimony and the time available, 
it may be necessary to limit the time for 
each presenter. 

The agenda is subject to change as 
priorities dictate. 

Information about the TAC, CDC/ 
ATSDR’s Tribal Consultation Policy, 
and previous meetings can be found at 
http://www.cdc.gov/tribal. 

Contact person for more information: 
LCDR Jessica Damon, Public Health 
Advisor, CDC/OSTLTS, 4770 Buford 
Highway NE., MS E–70, Atlanta, 
Georgia 30341–3717; email: 
TribalSupport@cdc.gov or telephone 
(404) 498–0563. 

The Director, Management Analysis 
and Services Office, has been delegated 
the authority to sign Federal Register 
notices pertaining to announcements of 
meetings and other committee 
management activities, for both the 
Centers for Disease Control and 

Prevention, and the Agency for Toxic 
Substances and Disease Registry. 

Elaine L. Baker, 
Director, Management Analysis and Services 
Office, Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2016–29175 Filed 12–5–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4163–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

Title: ACF Program Instruction— 
Children’s Justice Act. 

OMB No.: 0970–0425. 
Description: The Program Instruction, 

prepared in response to the enactment 
of the Children’s Justice Act (CJA), Title 
II of Public Law 111–320, Child Abuse 
Prevention and Treatment Act 
Reauthorization of 2010, provides 
direction to the States and Territories to 
accomplish the purposes of assisting 
States in developing, establishing and 
operating programs designed to 
improve: (1) The assessment and 
investigation of suspected child abuse 
and neglect cases, including cases of 
suspected child sexual abuse and 
exploitation, in a manner that limits 
additional trauma to the child and the 
child’s family; (2) the assessment and 
investigation of cases of suspected child 
abuse-related fatalities and suspected 
child neglect-related fatalities; (3) the 
investigation and prosecution of cases of 
child abuse and neglect, including child 
sexual abuse and exploitation; and (4) 
the assessment and investigation of 
cases involving children with 
disabilities or serious health-related 
problems who are suspected victims of 
child abuse or neglect. This Program 
Instruction contains information 
collection requirements that are found 
in Public Law 111–320 at Sections 
107(b) and 107(d), and pursuant to 
receiving a grant award. The 
information being collected is required 
by statute to be submitted pursuant to 
receiving a grant award. The 
information submitted will be used by 
the agency to ensure compliance with 
the statute; to monitor, evaluate and 
measure grantee achievements in 
addressing the investigation and 
prosecution of child abuse and neglect; 
and to report to Congress. 

Respondents: State governments 
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