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(b) The accuracy of the FDIC’s 
estimate of the burden of the collection 
of information; 

(c) Ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; 

(d) Ways to minimize the burden of 
the collection on respondents, including 
through the use of automated collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology; and 

(e) Estimates of capital or start-up 
costs and costs of operation, 
maintenance, and purchase of services 
to provide information. 

Dated at Washington, DC, this 21st day of 
November. 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 
Robert E. Feldman, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2016–28344 Filed 11–23–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Change in Bank Control Notices; 
Acquisitions of Shares of a Bank or 
Bank Holding Company 

The notificants listed below have 
applied under the Change in Bank 
Control Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)) and 
§ 225.41 of the Board’s Regulation Y (12 
CFR 225.41) to acquire shares of a bank 
or bank holding company. The factors 
that are considered in acting on the 
notices are set forth in paragraph 7 of 
the Act (12 U.S.C. 1817(j)(7)). 

The notices are available for 
immediate inspection at the Federal 
Reserve Bank indicated. The notices 
also will be available for inspection at 
the offices of the Board of Governors. 
Interested persons may express their 
views in writing to the Reserve Bank 
indicated for that notice or to the offices 
of the Board of Governors. Comments 
must be received not later than 
December 9, 2016. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Chicago 
(Colette A. Fried, Assistant Vice 
President) 230 South LaSalle Street, 
Chicago, Illinois 60690–1414: 

1. Mike Weis and Valerie Weis, 
Norwalk, Iowa, individually and as 
controlling shareholders of Interstate 
Enterprises, Ltd. a wholly-owned 
subsidiary of Interstate Telephone 
Company, Truro, Iowa, and as a group 
acting in concert with: Paul Cain, Van 
Meter, Iowa; Kelly Cain, Van Meter, 
Iowa; David Cain, Van Meter, Iowa; 
Meghan E. Cain, Van Meter, Iowa; 
Stephen Cain, Winterset, Iowa; Marvin 
A. Eivins, Winterset, Iowa; Lillian K. 
Eivins, Winterset, Iowa; Susan Eivins 
Brakhane, Winterset, Iowa; James W. 

Mease, Winterset, Iowa; Sue A. Mease, 
Winterset, Iowa; Justin J. Mease, 
Ankeny, Iowa; April S. Schaefer, Cedar 
Rapids, Iowa; Shane K. Pashek, 
Winterset, Iowa; Ann Pashek, Winterset, 
Iowa; Taylor E. Pashek, Winterset, Iowa; 
S. James Smith, Winterset, Iowa; Linda 
J. Smith, Earlham, Iowa; Kari L. Brett, 
Altoona, Iowa; Ellen D. Wade, Beacon, 
New York; M. Randall Townsend, 
Winterset, Iowa; Kimberly A. Townsend, 
Winterset, Iowa; Megan A. Townsend, 
Winterset, Iowa; David E. Trask, 
Winterset, Iowa; Judith A. Trask, 
Winterset, Iowa; and Kristin Elizabeth 
Weis, Winterset, Iowa; to acquire control 
voting shares of Farmers and Merchants 
Bancorp, Winterset, Iowa, and thereby 
indirectly control Farmers & Merchants 
State Bank, Winterset, Iowa. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, November 21, 2016. 
Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2016–28386 Filed 11–23–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 
Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The applications will also be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 

Governors not later than December 21, 
2016. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of St. Louis 
(David L. Hubbard, Senior Manager) 
P.O. Box 442, St. Louis, Missouri 
63166–2034. Comments can also be sent 
electronically to 
Comments.applications@stls.frb.org: 

1. Lonoke Bancshares, Inc., Lonoke, 
Arkansas; to indirectly acquire 100 
percent of Pinnacle Bancshares, Inc., 
Rogers, Arkansas, and thereby indirectly 
acquire Pinnacle Bank, Rogers, 
Arkansas. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, November 21, 2016. 
Yao-Chin Chao, 
Assistant Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2016–28387 Filed 11–23–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention 

[Docket No. CDC–2016–0110] 

Draft Guideline Update—CDC 
Recommendations on Use of 
Chlorhexidine-Impregnated Dressings 
for Prevention of Intravascular 
Catheter-Related Infections 

AGENCY: Centers for Disease Control and 
Prevention (CDC), Department of Health 
and Human Services (DHHS). 
ACTION: Notice of availability and 
request for public comments. 

SUMMARY: The Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention (CDC), located 
within the Department of Health and 
Human Services (HHS) announces the 
opening of a docket to obtain public 
comment on the Draft Update of CDC 
Recommendations on Use of 
Chlorhexidine-Impregnated Dressings 
for Prevention of Intravascular Catheter- 
Related Infections (Draft 
Recommendation Update). The Draft 
Recommendation Update addresses new 
and updated strategies for the 
prevention of intravascular catheter- 
related infections in healthcare settings. 
CDC is providing a supporting appendix 
in the docket that includes primary 
evidence, study evaluation, and data 
evaluation tables that were used in 
developing the Draft Recommendation 
Update. 

DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before January 24, 2017. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by Docket No. CDC–2016– 
0110 by any of the following methods: 
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• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Division of Healthcare Quality 
Promotion, National Center for 
Emerging and Zoonotic Infectious 
Diseases, Centers for Disease Control 
and Prevention, 1600 Clifton Road NE., 
MS–A07, Atlanta, GA 30329, Attn: 
Docket No. CDC–2016–0110. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name and 
Docket Number. All relevant comments 
received will be posted without change 
to http://regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided. For 
access to the docket to read background 
documents or comments received, go to 
http://www.regulations.gov. 

Written materials identified by Docket 
No. CDC–2016–0110, will be available 
for public inspection Monday through 
Friday, except for legal holidays, 9 a.m. 
until 4:30 p.m. Eastern Standard Time, 
at CDC Library, 1600 Clifton Road NE., 
Atlanta, Georgia 30329. Please call 
ahead to (404) 639–1717 and request a 
Library representative to schedule your 
visit. All public comments will be 
reviewed and considered prior to 
finalizing the Draft Recommendation 
Update. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Contact Erin Stone, Division of 
Healthcare Quality Promotion, National 
Center for Emerging and Zoonotic 
Infectious Diseases, Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention, 1600 Clifton 
Road NE., Mailstop A–31, Atlanta, 
Georgia 30329; Telephone: (404) 639– 
4000. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Since 
2014 CDC has collaborated with 
national partners, academicians, public 
and private health professionals, and 
other partners to create this Draft 
Recommendation Update. CDC received 
input from the Healthcare Infection 
Control Practices Advisory Committee 
(HICPAC) throughout the development 
of the Draft Recommendation Update. 
HICPAC includes representatives from 
public health, infectious diseases, 
regulatory and other federal agencies, 
professional societies, and other 
stakeholders. This Draft 
Recommendation Update is not a 
federal rule or regulation. 

The Draft Recommendation Update is 
designed for use by infection prevention 
staff, healthcare epidemiologists, 
administrators, nurses, and personnel 
responsible for developing, 
implementing, and evaluating infection 
prevention and control programs for 
healthcare settings across the 
continuum of care. The 
recommendations contained in the Draft 

Recommendation Update are based on a 
targeted systematic review of the best 
available evidence for a specific topic 
related to the prevention of 
intravascular catheter-related infections. 

Dated: November 21, 2016. 
Sandra Cashman, 
Executive Secretary, Centers for Disease 
Control and Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2016–28385 Filed 11–23–16; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4163–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Food and Drug Administration 

[Docket No. FDA–2015–D–2537] 

Submission of Quality Metrics Data; 
Draft Guidance for Industry; 
Availability; Request for Comments 

AGENCY: Food and Drug Administration, 
HHS. 
ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Food and Drug 
Administration (FDA or Agency) is 
announcing the availability of a revised 
draft guidance for industry entitled 
‘‘Submission of Quality Metrics Data.’’ 
In order to help develop compliance 
and inspection policies and practices, 
improve the Agency’s ability to predict, 
and therefore possibly mitigate, future 
drug shortages, and to encourage the 
pharmaceutical industry to implement 
state-of-the-art, innovative quality 
management systems for pharmaceutical 
manufacturing, FDA intends to initiate 
a quality metrics reporting program. The 
revised draft guidance describes FDA’s 
plans for an initial, voluntary phase of 
this program. FDA expects that this 
voluntary phase will allow the Agency 
to learn more about a limited set of 
quality metrics and associated analytics, 
and to help inform future FDA 
decisionmaking about its quality metrics 
program. This revised draft also 
provides an opportunity to gain 
additional perspectives from industry 
participants on the future use of quality 
metrics data. 
DATES: Although you can comment on 
any guidance at any time (see 21 CFR 
10.115(g)(5)), to ensure that the Agency 
considers your comment on this draft 
guidance before it begins work on the 
final version of the guidance, submit 
either electronic or written comments 
on the draft guidance by January 24, 
2017. 

ADDRESSES: You may submit comments 
as follows: 

Electronic Submissions 

Submit electronic comments in the 
following way: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: 
https://www.regulations.gov/. Follow 
the instructions for submitting 
comments. Comments submitted 
electronically, including attachments, to 
https://www.regulations.gov/ will be 
posted to the docket unchanged. 
Because your comment will be made 
public, you are solely responsible for 
ensuring that your comment does not 
include any confidential information 
that you or a third party may not wish 
to be posted, such as medical 
information, your or anyone else’s 
Social Security number, or confidential 
business information, such as a 
manufacturing process. Please note that 
if you include your name, contact 
information, or other information that 
identifies you in the body of your 
comments, that information will be 
posted on https://www.regulations.gov/. 

• If you want to submit a comment 
with confidential information that you 
do not wish to be made available to the 
public, submit the comment as a 
written/paper submission and in the 
manner detailed (see ‘‘Written/Paper 
Submissions’’ and ‘‘Instructions’’). 

Written/Paper Submissions 

Submit written/paper submissions as 
follows: 

• Mail/Hand delivery/Courier (for 
written/paper submissions): Division of 
Dockets Management (HFA–305), Food 
and Drug Administration, 5630 Fishers 
Lane, Rm. 1061, Rockville, MD 20852. 

• For written/paper comments 
submitted to the Division of Dockets 
Management, FDA will post your 
comment, as well as any attachments, 
except for information submitted, 
marked and identified, as confidential, 
if submitted as detailed in 
‘‘Instructions.’’ 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the Docket No. FDA– 
2015–D–2537 for ‘‘Submission of 
Quality Metrics Data.’’ Received 
comments will be placed in the docket 
and, except for those submitted as 
‘‘Confidential Submissions,’’ publicly 
viewable at https://
www.regulations.gov/ or at the Division 
of Dockets Management between 9 a.m. 
and 4 p.m., Monday through Friday. 

• Confidential Submissions—To 
submit a comment with confidential 
information that you do not wish to be 
made publicly available, submit your 
comments only as a written/paper 
submission. You should submit two 
copies total. One copy will include the 
information you claim to be confidential 
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