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OFFICE OF SCIENCE AND 
TECHNOLOGY POLICY 

Public Meeting of the Office of Science 
and Technology Policy 

ACTION: Notice of Public Meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Office of Science and 
Technology Policy will hold a public 
meeting on July 22, 2015, for interested 
stakeholders to discuss implementation 
of the U.S. Government Policy for 
Institutional Oversight of Life Sciences 
Dual Use Research of Concern. The 
purpose of the meeting is to inform and 
engage stakeholders; collect feedback 
about resources needed to effectively 
implement the policy; and discuss 
stakeholder experiences, challenges, 
and innovative practices. 
DATES: July 22, 2015 from 9:00 a.m. to 
4:45 p.m. EST. 
ADDRESSES: National Institutes of 
Health, 9000 Rockville Pike, Bethesda, 
Maryland 20892, Building 10, Lipsett 
Auditorium. Meeting information and 
updates will be posted http://
www.phe.gov. 

Registration: Due to space limitations, 
pre-registration for the workshop is 
required. Registration is on a first-come, 
first-served basis and subject to space 
limitations. Registration will open on 
May 15, 2015. Individuals planning to 
attend the workshop should register 
online at www.PHE.gov/
DURCworkshop. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
information regarding this notice, please 
email DURC@ostp.gov. Additional 
information about the workshop, 
including the agenda, is posted at 
http://www.phe.gov. 

Meeting Accomodations: Individuals 
requiring special accommodation to 
access this public meeting should email 
DURC@ostp.gov. at least ten business 
days prior to the meeting so that 
appropriate arrangements can be made. 

Stacy L. Murphy, 
Operations Manager/Acting Security Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2015–11683 Filed 5–13–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3270–F5–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

Proposed Collection; Comment 
Request 

Upon Written Request Copies Available 
From: Securities and Exchange 
Commission, Office of FOIA Services, 
100 F Street NE., Washington, DC 
20549–2736. 

Extension: 

Form TH, SEC File No. 270–377, OMB 
Control No. 3235–0425. 

Notice is hereby given that, pursuant 
to the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(44 U.S.C. 3501 et seq.), the Securities 
and Exchange Commission 
(‘‘Commission’’) is soliciting comments 
on the collection of information 
summarized below. The Commission 
plans to submit this existing collection 
of information to the Office of 
Management and Budget for extension 
and approval. 

Form TH (17 CFR 239.65, 249.447, 
269.10 and 274.404) under the 
Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77a et 
seq.), the Securities Exchange Act of 
1934 (15 U.S.C. 78a et seq.), the Trust 
Indenture Act of 1939 (15 U.S.C. 77aaa 
et seq.) and the Investment Company 
Act of 1940 (15 U.S.C. 80a–1 et seq.) is 
used by registrants to notify the 
Commission that an electronic filer is 
relying on the temporary hardship 
exemption for the filing of a document 
in paper form that would otherwise be 
required to be filed electronically as 
prescribed by Rule 201(a) of Regulation 
S–T. Form TH must be filed every time 
an electronic filer experiences 
unanticipated technical difficulties 
preventing the timely preparation and 
submission of a required electronic 
filing. Approximately 5 registrants file 
Form TH and it takes an estimated 0.33 
hours per response for a total annual 
burden of 2 hours. 

Written comments are invited on: (a) 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of the burden imposed by the collection 
of information; (c) ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; and (d) ways to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on respondents, including 
through the use of automated collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology. Consideration will be given 
to comments and suggestions submitted 
in writing within 60 days of this 
publication. 

Please direct your written comments 
to Pamela Dyson, Director/Chief 
Information Officer, Securities and 
Exchange Commission, c/o Remi Pavlik- 
Simon, 100 F Street NE., Washington, 
DC 20549 or send an email to: PRA_
Mailbox@sec.gov. 

Dated: May 8, 2015. 
Robert W. Errett, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–11598 Filed 5–13–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SECURITIES AND EXCHANGE 
COMMISSION 

[File No. 500–1] 

In the Matter of InferX Corp., and 
Sedona Corp.; Order of Suspension of 
Trading 

May 12, 2015. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of InferX Corp. 
(CIK No. 1329548), a void Delaware 
corporation with its principal place of 
business listed as Tysons Corner, 
Virginia, with stock quoted on OTC 
Link (previously, ‘‘Pink Sheets’’) 
operated by OTC Markets Group, Inc. 
(‘‘OTC Link’’) under the ticker symbol 
NFRX, because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
September 30, 2012. On May 23, 2014, 
InferX received a delinquency letter sent 
by the Division of Corporation Finance 
requesting compliance with their 
periodic filing obligations. 

It appears to the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that there is a 
lack of current and accurate information 
concerning the securities of Sedona 
Corp. (CIK No. 764843), a Pennsylvania 
corporation with its principal place of 
business listed as King of Prussia, 
Pennsylvania, with stock quoted on 
OTC Link under the ticker symbol 
SDNA, because it has not filed any 
periodic reports since the period ended 
March 31, 2010. On January 28, 2013, 
Sedona received a delinquency letter 
sent by the Division of Corporation 
Finance requesting compliance with 
their periodic filing obligations. 

The Commission is of the opinion that 
the public interest and the protection of 
investors require a suspension of trading 
in the securities of the above-listed 
companies. 

Therefore, it is ordered, pursuant to 
Section 12(k) of the Securities Exchange 
Act of 1934, that trading in the 
securities of the above-listed companies 
is suspended for the period from 9:30 
a.m. EDT on May 12, 2015, through 
11:59 p.m. EDT on May 26, 2015. 

By the Commission. 

Jill M. Peterson, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–11751 Filed 5–12–15; 4:15 pm] 
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