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(b) If comments are received from the 
NMFS West Coast Regional 
Administrator or NMFS Office of 
Protected Resources on the draft report, 
a final report shall be submitted to 
NMFS within 30 days thereafter. If no 
comments are received from NMFS, the 
draft report will be considered to be the 
final report. 

(c) In the unanticipated event that the 
construction activities clearly cause the 
take of a marine mammal in a manner 
prohibited by this Authorization (if 
issued), such as an injury, serious 
injury, or mortality, WSDOT shall 
immediately cease all operations and 
immediately report the incident to the 
Chief, Permits and Conservation 
Division, Office of Protected Resources, 
NMFS, and the West Coast Regional 
Stranding Coordinators. The report must 
include the following information: 

(i) Time, date, and location (latitude/ 
longitude) of the incident; 

(ii) Description of the incident; 
(iii) Status of all sound source use in 

the 24 hours preceding the incident; 
(iv) Environmental conditions (e.g., 

wind speed and direction, sea state, 
cloud cover, visibility, and water 
depth); 

(v) Description of marine mammal 
observations in the 24 hours preceding 
the incident; 

(vi) Species identification or 
description of the animal(s) involved; 

(vii) The fate of the animal(s); and 
(viii) Photographs or video footage of 

the animal (if equipment is available). 
Activities shall not resume until 

NMFS is able to review the 
circumstances of the prohibited take. 
NMFS shall work with WSDOT to 
determine what is necessary to 
minimize the likelihood of further 
prohibited take and ensure MMPA 
compliance. WSDOT may not resume 
their activities until notified by NMFS 
via letter, email, or telephone. 

(E) In the event that WSDOT 
discovers an injured or dead marine 
mammal, and the lead PSO determines 
that the cause of the injury or death is 
unknown and the death is relatively 
recent (i.e., in less than a moderate state 
of decomposition as described in the 
next paragraph), WSDOT will 
immediately report the incident to the 
Chief, Permits and Conservation 
Division, Office of Protected Resources, 
NMFS, and the West Coast Regional 
Stranding Coordinators. The report must 
include the same information identified 
above. Activities may continue while 
NMFS reviews the circumstances of the 
incident. NMFS will work with WSDOT 
to determine whether modifications in 
the activities are appropriate. 

(F) In the event that WSDOT 
discovers an injured or dead marine 
mammal, and the lead PSO determines 
that the injury or death is not associated 
with or related to the activities 
authorized in the IHA (e.g., previously 
wounded animal, carcass with moderate 
to advanced decomposition, or 
scavenger damage), WSDOT shall report 
the incident to the Chief, Permits and 
Conservation Division, Office of 
Protected Resources, NMFS, and the 
West Coast Regional Stranding 
Coordinators, within 24 hours of the 
discovery. WSDOT shall provide 
photographs or video footage (if 
available) or other documentation of the 
stranded animal sighting to NMFS and 
the Marine Mammal Stranding Network. 
WSDOT can continue its operations 
under such a case. 

9. This Authorization may be 
modified, suspended or withdrawn if 
the holder fails to abide by the 
conditions prescribed herein or if the 
authorized taking is having more than a 
negligible impact on the species or stock 
of affected marine mammals, or if there 
is an unmitigable adverse impact on the 
availability of such species or stocks for 
subsistence uses. 

10. A copy of this Authorization and 
the Incidental Take Statement must be 
in the possession of each contractor who 
performs the construction work at the 
Anacortes Ferry Terminals. 

11. WSDOT is required to comply 
with the Terms and Conditions of the 
Incidental Take Statement 
corresponding to NMFS’ Biological 
Opinion. 

Dated: February 25, 2015. 
Donna S. Wieting, 
Director, Office of Protected Resources, 
National Marine Fisheries Service. 
[FR Doc. 2015–04425 Filed 3–3–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

BUREAU OF CONSUMER FINANCIAL 
PROTECTION 

Credit Union Advisory Council Meeting 

AGENCY: Bureau of Consumer Financial 
Protection. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice sets forth the 
announcement of a public meeting of 
the Credit Union Advisory Council 
(CUAC or Council) of the Consumer 
Financial Protection Bureau (Bureau). 
The notice also describes the functions 
of the Council. Notice of the meeting is 
permitted by section 6 of the CUAC 
Charter and is intended to notify the 
public of this meeting. Specifically, 
section X of the CUAC Charter states: 

(1) Each meeting of the Council shall 
be open to public observation, to the 
extent that a facility is available to 
accommodate the public, unless the 
Bureau, in accordance with paragraph 
(4) of this section, determines that the 
meeting shall be closed. The Bureau 
also will make reasonable efforts to 
make the meetings available to the 
public through live recording. (2) Notice 
of the time, place and purpose of each 
meeting, as well as a summary of the 
proposed agenda, shall be published in 
the Federal Register not more than 45 
or less than 15 days prior to the 
scheduled meeting date. Shorter notice 
may be given when the Bureau 
determines that the Council’s business 
so requires; in such event, the public 
will be given notice at the earliest 
practicable time. (3) Minutes of 
meetings, records, reports, studies, and 
agenda of the Council shall be posted on 
the Bureau’s Web site 
(www.consumerfinance.gov). (4) The 
Bureau may close to the public a portion 
of any meeting, for confidential 
discussion. If the Bureau closes a 
meeting or any portion of a meeting, the 
Bureau will issue, at least annually, a 
summary of the Council’s activities 
during such closed meetings or portions 
of meetings. 
DATES: The meeting date is Thursday, 
March 12, 2014, 3:00 p.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
Eastern Standard Time. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting location is 
Consumer Financial Protection Bureau, 
1275 First Street NE., Washington, DC 
20002. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jennifer Draper, Consumer Advisory 
Board & Councils, External Affairs, 1700 
G Street NW., Washington, DC 20552; 
telephone: 202–435–7176; CFPB_
CABandCouncilsEvents@cfpb.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 
Section 1014(a) of the Dodd-Frank 

Wall Street Reform and Consumer 
Protection Act (http://www.sec.gov/
about/laws/wallstreetreform-cpa.pdf) 
(Dodd-Frank Act) provides: ‘‘The 
Director shall establish a Credit Union 
Advisory Board to advise and consult 
with the Bureau in the exercise of its 
functions under the Federal consumer 
financial laws, and to provide 
information on emerging practices in 
the consumer financial products or 
services industry, including regional 
trends, concerns, and other relevant 
information.’’ 12 U.S.C. 5494. 

(a) The purpose of the Council is 
outlined in section 1014(a) of the Dodd- 
Frank Act (http://www.sec.gov/about/
laws/wallstreetreform-cpa.pdf), which 
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states that the Council shall ‘‘advise and 
consult with the Bureau in the exercise 
of its functions under the Federal 
consumer financial laws’’ and ‘‘provide 
information on emerging practices in 
the consumer financial products or 
services industry, including regional 
trends, concerns, and other relevant 
information.’’ (b) To carry out the 
Council’s purpose, the scope of its 
activities shall include providing 
information, analysis, and 
recommendations to the Bureau. The 
Council will generally serve as a vehicle 
for market intelligence and expertise for 
the Bureau. Its objectives will include 
identifying and assessing the impact on 
consumers and other market 
participants of new, emerging, and 
changing products, practices, or 
services. (c) The Council will also be 
available to advise and consult with the 
Director and the Bureau on other 
matters related to the Bureau’s functions 
under the Dodd-Frank Act. 

II. Agenda 

The Credit Union Advisory Council 
will discuss financial education and 
financial capability. 

Persons who need a reasonable 
accommodation to participate should 
contact CFPB_504Request@cfpb.gov, 
202–435–9EEO, 1–855–233–0362, or 
202–435–9742 (TTY) at least ten 
business days prior to the meeting or 
event to request assistance. The request 
must identify the date, time, location, 
and title of the meeting or event, the 
nature of the assistance requested, and 
contact information for the requester. 
CFPB will strive to provide, but cannot 
guarantee that accommodation will be 
provided for late requests. 

Individuals who wish to attend the 
Credit Union Advisory Council meeting 
must RSVP to cfpb_
cabandcouncilsevents@cfpb.gov by 
noon, Tuesday, March 10, 2015. 
Members of the public must RSVP by 
the due date and must include ‘‘CUAC’’ 
in the subject line of the RSVP. 

III. Availability 

The Council’s agenda will be made 
available to the public on Friday, 
February 27, 2015, via 
consumerfinance.gov. Individuals 
should express in their RSVP if they 
require a paper copy of the agenda. 

A recording and transcript of this 
meeting will be available after the 
meeting on the CFPB’s Web site 
consumerfinance.gov. 

Dated: February 25, 2015. 
Christopher D’Angelo, 
Chief of Staff, Bureau of Consumer Financial 
Protection. 
[FR Doc. 2015–04360 Filed 3–3–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4810–AM–P 

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

[Docket No. ED–2015–ICCD–0021] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Comment Request; 2015–16 
National Teacher and Principal Survey 
(NTPS) Full-Scale Data Collection 

AGENCY: Department of Education (ED), 
Institute of Education Sciences/National 
Center for Education Statistics (IES). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. chapter 3501 et seq.), ED is 
proposing a revision of an existing 
information collection. 
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before May 4, 
2015. 

ADDRESSES: Comments submitted in 
response to this notice should be 
submitted electronically through the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal at http://
www.regulations.gov by selecting 
Docket ID number ED–2015–ICCD–0021 
or via postal mail, commercial delivery, 
or hand delivery. If the regulations.gov 
site is not available to the public for any 
reason, ED will temporarily accept 
comments at ICDocketMgr@ed.gov. 
Please note that comments submitted by 
fax or email and those submitted after 
the comment period will not be 
accepted; ED will only accept comments 
during the comment period in this 
mailbox when the regulations.gov site is 
not available. Written requests for 
information or comments submitted by 
postal mail or delivery should be 
addressed to the Director of the 
Information Collection Clearance 
Division, U.S. Department of Education, 
400 Maryland Avenue SW., LBJ, 
Mailstop L–OM–2–2E319, Room 2E103, 
Washington, DC 20202. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
specific questions related to collection 
activities, please contact Kashka 
Kubzdela, 202–502–7411. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department of Education (ED), in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA) (44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(2)(A)), provides the general 
public and Federal agencies with an 
opportunity to comment on proposed, 
revised, and continuing collections of 

information. This helps the Department 
assess the impact of its information 
collection requirements and minimize 
the public’s reporting burden. It also 
helps the public understand the 
Department’s information collection 
requirements and provide the requested 
data in the desired format. ED is 
soliciting comments on the proposed 
information collection request (ICR) that 
is described below. The Department of 
Education is especially interested in 
public comment addressing the 
following issues: (1) Is this collection 
necessary to the proper functions of the 
Department; (2) will this information be 
processed and used in a timely manner; 
(3) is the estimate of burden accurate; 
(4) how might the Department enhance 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (5) how 
might the Department minimize the 
burden of this collection on the 
respondents, including through the use 
of information technology. Please note 
that written comments received in 
response to this notice will be 
considered public records. 

Title of Collection: 2015–16 National 
Teacher and Principal Survey (NTPS) 
Full-Scale Data Collection. 

OMB Control Number: 1850–0598. 
Type of Review: A revision of an 

existing information collection. 
Respondents/Affected Public: 

Individuals. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses: 44,916. 
Total Estimated Number of Annual 

Burden Hours: 26,616. 
Abstract: The National Teacher and 

Principal Survey (NTPS) is a redesign of 
the Schools and Staffing Survey (SASS) 
and is ED’s primary source of 
information on the teacher and 
principal labor market and on what is 
happening in K–12 public schools from 
teachers’ and principals’ perspectives. 
NTPS is an in-depth, nationally 
representative survey of first through 
twelfth grade public school teachers, 
principals, and schools. Kindergarten 
teachers in schools with at least a first 
grade are also eligible for NTPS. Starting 
in 2015–2016, the NTPS will be 
conducted every two years utilizing core 
content and a series of rotating modules 
to allow timely collection of important 
education trends and conducting trend 
analyses. The NTPS is the Department’s 
regular source of data on salaries, out- 
of-pocket expenses, qualifications, and 
race/ethnic and age distribution of 
teachers; along with salaries and race/
ethnic and age distribution of 
principals; and school start times and 
student teacher ratios. This request is to 
conduct the 2015–16 NTPS full-scale 
data collection. 
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