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both of the existing sites as ‘‘magnet’’ 
sites. The ASF allows for the possible 
exemption of one magnet site from the 
‘‘sunset’’ time limits that generally 
apply to sites under the ASF, and the 
applicant proposes that Site 1 be so 
exempted. No subzones/usage-driven 
sites are being requested at this time. 
The application would have no impact 
on FTZ 42’s previously authorized 
subzone. 

In accordance with the FTZ Board’s 
regulations, Camille Evans of the FTZ 
Staff is designated examiner to evaluate 
and analyze the facts and information 
presented in the application and case 
record and to report findings and 
recommendations to the FTZ Board. 

Public comment is invited from 
interested parties. Submissions shall be 
addressed to the FTZ Board’s Executive 
Secretary at the address below. The 
closing period for their receipt is March 
27, 2015. Rebuttal comments in 
response to material submitted during 
the foregoing period may be submitted 
during the subsequent 15-day period to 
April 13, 2015. 

A copy of the application will be 
available for public inspection at the 
Office of the Executive Secretary, 
Foreign-Trade Zones Board, Room 
21013, U.S. Department of Commerce, 
1401 Constitution Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20230–0002, and in the 
‘‘Reading Room’’ section of the FTZ 
Board’s Web site, which is accessible 
via www.trade.gov/ftz. For further 
information, contact Camille Evans at 
Camille.Evans@trade.gov or (202) 482– 
2350. 

Dated: January 20, 2015. 
Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–01334 Filed 1–23–15; 8:45 am] 
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Foreign-Trade Zone (FTZ) 174—Pima 
County, Arizona, Notification of 
Proposed Production Activity, Global 
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Tuscon Regional Economic 
Opportunities, Inc., grantee of FTZ 174, 
submitted a notification of proposed 
production activity to the FTZ Board on 
behalf of Global Solar Energy, Inc. 
(Global Solar), located in Tucson, 
Arizona. The notification conforming to 
the requirements of the regulations of 

the FTZ Board (15 CFR 400.22) was 
received on January 14, 2015. 

A separate application for subzone 
designation at the Global Solar facility 
is planned and will be processed under 
Section 400.31 of the FTZ Board’s 
regulations. The facility is used for the 
production of thin film photovoltaic 
solar cells, strings, panels, and 
photovoltaic-coated stainless steel rolls 
based on copper-indium-gallium- 
diselenide (CIGS) technology. Pursuant 
to 15 CFR 400.14(b), FTZ activity would 
be limited to the specific foreign-status 
materials/components and specific 
finished products described in the 
submitted notification (as described 
below) and subsequently authorized by 
the FTZ Board. 

Production under FTZ procedures 
could exempt Global Solar from 
customs duty payments on the foreign 
status materials/components used in 
export production (estimated to be 35% 
of annual shipments). On its domestic 
sales, Global Solar would be able to 
choose the duty rate during customs 
entry procedures that applies to the thin 
film photovoltaic solar products (duty 
free) for the foreign-status materials/
components noted below. Customs 
duties also could possibly be deferred or 
reduced on foreign-status production 
equipment. 

The materials/components sourced 
from abroad include: Indium metal shot; 
gallium metal shot; selenium shot; 
gallium liquid; copper pellets; diodes; 
custom junction-boxes (unpotted); 
monolithic targets; stainless steel 
substrates; polymer film rolls; ethylene 
tetrafluoroethylene film rolls; 
junction-box pottant catalyst; 
junction-box pottant; and plastic slit 
input rolls (duty rates range from free to 
4.2%). The request indicates that the 
stainless steel substrates (HTSUS 
7220.20.1060 and 7220.20.1080) are 
subject to an antidumping/
countervailing duty (AD/CVD) order. 
The FTZ Board’s regulations (15 CFR 
400.14(e)) require that merchandise 
subject to AD/CVD actions be admitted 
to the proposed subzone in privileged 
foreign status (19 CFR 146.41). 

Public comment is invited from 
interested parties. Submissions shall be 
addressed to the FTZ Board’s Executive 
Secretary at the address below. The 
closing period for their receipt is March 
9, 2015. 

A copy of the notification will be 
available for public inspection at the 
Office of the Executive Secretary, 
Foreign-Trade Zones Board, Room 
21013, U.S. Department of Commerce, 
1401 Constitution Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20230–0002, and in the 
‘‘Reading Room’’ section of the FTZ 

Board’s Web site, which is accessible 
via www.trade.gov/ftz. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Diane Finver at Diane.Finver@trade.gov 
(202) 482–1367. 

Dated: January 16, 2015. 
Andrew McGilvray, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–01337 Filed 1–23–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

RIN 0648–XD737 

Pacific Fishery Management Council; 
Public Meeting 

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice; public meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Pacific Fishery 
Management Council’s (Pacific Council) 
Enforcement Consultants (EC) will hold 
an online webinar, which is open to the 
public. 
DATES: The webinar will be held 
Wednesday, February 18, 2015, from 10 
a.m. to 12 p.m. Pacific Time. 
ADDRESSES: To attend the webinar, visit 
http://www.gotomeeting.com/online/
webinar/join-webinar. Enter the webinar 
ID, which is 102–992–075, and your 
name and email address (required). 
Once you have joined the webinar, 
choose either your computer’s audio or 
select ‘‘Use Telephone.’’ If you do not 
select ‘‘Use Telephone’’ GoToMeeting 
will automatically connect you to the 
audio using your computer’s 
microphone and speakers (VolP). 

If you do not have a headset and 
speakers, or if there is excessive 
feedback, please use your telephone for 
the audio portion of the meeting by 
dialing this TOLL number +1 (480) 297– 
0022 (not a toll-free number); then enter 
the attendee phone audio access code 
953–904–034; then enter your audio 
phone pin (shown after joining the 
webinar). System Requirements for PC- 
based attendees: Windows® 7, Vista, or 
XP; for Mac®-based attendees: Mac OS® 
X 10.5 or newer; and for mobile 
attendees: iPhone®, iPad®, Android TM 
phone or Android tablet (See the 
GoToMeeting Webinar Apps). You may 
send an email to Mr. Kris Kleinschmidt 
or contact him at (503) 820–2425 for 
technical assistance. A listening station 
will also be provided at the Pacific 
Council office. 
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