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mail to Ms. Michele Kuester, Export- 
Import Bank of the United States, 811 
Vermont Ave. NW., Washington, DC 
20571. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Titles and Form Number: EIB11–04, 

Co-Financing with Foreign Export 
Credit Agency. 

OMB Number: 3048–0037. 
Type of Review: Regular. 
Need and Use: The information 

collected will provide information 
needed to determine compliance and 
creditworthiness for transaction 
requests submitted to the Export Import 
Bank under its insurance, guarantee, 
and direct loan programs. 

Affected Public: 
This form affects entities involved in 

the export of U.S. goods and services. 
Annual Number of Respondents: 60. 
Estimated Time per Respondent: 15 

minutes. 
Annual Burden Hours: 15 hours. 
Frequency of Reporting or Use: As 

needed. 
Government Expenses: 
Reviewing Time per Year: 15 hours. 
Average Wages per Hour: $42.50. 
Average Cost per Year: $637.50 

(time*wages). 
Benefits and Overhead: 20%. 
Total Government Cost: $765. 

Toya Woods, 
Office of the Chief Information Officer, 
Records Management Division. 
[FR Doc. 2014–26497 Filed 11–6–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6690–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

[OMB 3060–0755] 

Information Collection Being Reviewed 
by the Federal Communications 
Commission 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: As part of its continuing effort 
to reduce paperwork burdens, and as 
required by the Paperwork Reduction 
Act (PRA) of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501– 
3520), the Federal Communications 
Commission (FCC or the Commission) 
invites the general public and other 
Federal agencies to take this 
opportunity to comment on the 
following information collection. 
Comments are requested concerning: 
Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 

Commission, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
the accuracy of the Commission’s 
burden estimate; ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information collected; ways to minimize 
the burden of the collection of 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and ways to 
further reduce the information 
collection burden on small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 employees. 
The FCC may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid control 
number. No person shall be subject to 
any penalty for failing to comply with 
a collection of information subject to the 
PRA that does not display a valid Office 
of Management and Budget (OMB) 
control number. 
DATES: Written PRA comments should 
be submitted on or before January 6, 
2015. If you anticipate that you will be 
submitting comments, but find it 
difficult to do so within the period of 
time allowed by this notice, you should 
advise the contact listed below as soon 
as possible. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all PRA comments to 
Nicole Ongele, FCC, via email PRA@
fcc.gov and to Nicole.Ongele@fcc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information about the 
information collection, contact Nicole 
Ongele at (202) 418–2991. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

OMB Control Number: 3060–0755. 
Title: Sections 59.1 through 59.4, 

Infrastructure Sharing. 
Form Number: N/A. 
Type of Review: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Respondents: Business or other for- 

profit entities. 
Number of Respondents and 

Responses: 75 respondents; 1,125 
responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 1–2 
hours. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion 
reporting requirement and third party 
disclosure requirement. 

Obligation to Respond: Required to 
obtain or retain benefits. Statutory 
authority for this information collection 
is contained in 47 U.S.C. Section 259 of 
the Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended. 

Total Annual Burden: 2,025 hours. 
Total Annual Cost: No cost. 
Privacy Impact Assessment: No 

impact(s). 
Nature and Extent of Confidentiality: 

The Commission is not requesting 
respondents to submit confidential 

information to the Commission. If the 
Commission requests respondents to 
submit information which respondents 
believe is confidential, respondents may 
request confidential treatment of such 
data under 47 CFR 0.459 of the 
Commission’s rules. 

Needs and Uses: The three reporting 
and third party disclosure requirements 
are under section 259 of the 
Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended. They are (1) filing of tariffs, 
contracts or arrangements; (2) 
information concerning deployment of 
new services and equipment; and (3) 
notice upon termination of section 259 
agreements. The information collections 
by the Commission under the 
requirement that incumbent local 
exchange carriers (ILECs) file any tariffs, 
contracts and agreements for 
infrastructure sharing will be made 
available for public inspection. 
Incumbent LECs will provide timely 
information on planned deployments of 
new services and equipment to third 
parties (qualifying carriers). And, 
incumbent LECs will furnish third 
parties (qualifying carriers) with 60 day 
notice prior to termination of a section 
259 sharing agreement to protect 
customers from sudden changes in 
service. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene H. Dortch, 
Secretary. Office of the Secretary, Office of 
the Managing Director. 
[FR Doc. 2014–26488 Filed 11–6–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE 
CORPORATION 

Notice to All Interested Parties of the 
Termination of the Receivership of 
10440, Alabama Trust Bank, National 
Association Sylacauga, Alabama 

Notice is hereby given that the Federal 
Deposit Insurance Corporation (‘‘FDIC’’) 
as Receiver for Alabama Trust Bank, 
National Association, Sylacauga, 
Alabama (‘‘the Receiver’’) intends to 
terminate its receivership for said 
institution. The FDIC was appointed 
receiver of Alabama Trust Bank, 
National Association on May 18, 2012. 
The liquidation of the receivership 
assets has been completed. To the extent 
permitted by available funds and in 
accordance with law, the Receiver will 
be making a final dividend payment to 
proven creditors. 

Based upon the foregoing, the 
Receiver has determined that the 
continued existence of the receivership 
will serve no useful purpose. 
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