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National Office will advise States 
Offices of the proposals selected for 
further processing, State Offices will 
respond to applicants by letter. 

If the application is not accepted for 
further processing, the applicant will be 
notified of appeal rights under 7 CFR 
part 11. 

2. Administrative and National Policy 
All Farm Labor Housing loans and 

grants are subject to the restrictive-use 
provisions contained in 7 CFR 
3560.72(a)(2). 

3. Reporting 
Borrowers must maintain separate 

financial records for the operation and 
maintenance of the project and for 
tenant services. Tenant services will not 
be funded by Rural Development. Funds 
allocated to the operation and 
maintenance of the project may not be 
used to supplement the cost of tenant 
services, nor may tenant service funds 
be used to supplement the project 
operation and maintenance. Detailed 
financial reports regarding tenant 
services will not be required unless 
specifically requested by Rural 
Development, and then only to the 
extent necessary for Rural Development 
and the borrower to discuss the 
affordability (and competitiveness) of 
the service provided to the tenant. The 
project audit, or verification of accounts 
on Form RD 3560–10, ‘‘Borrower 
Balance Sheet,’’ together with an 
accompanying Form RD 3560–7, 
‘‘Multiple Family Housing Project 
Budget Utility Allowance,’’ [showing 
actual,] must allocate revenue and 
expense between project operations and 
the service component. 

VI. Equal Opportunity and Non- 
Discrimination Requirements 

Borrowers and applicants will comply 
with the provisions of 7 CFR Section 
3560.2. All housing must meet the 
accessibility requirements found at 7 
CFR Section 3560.60 (d). All applicants 
must submit or have on file a valid 
Form RD 400–1, ‘‘Equal Opportunity 
Agreement,’’ and Form RD 400–4, 
‘‘Assurance Agreement.’’ 

The U.S. Department of Agriculture 
(USDA) prohibits discrimination against 
its customers, employees, and 
applicants for employment on the bases 
of race, color, national origin, age, 
disability, sex, gender identity, religion, 
reprisal, and where applicable, political 
beliefs, marital status, familial or 
parental status, sexual orientation, or all 
or part of an individual’s income is 
derived from any public assistance 
program, or protected genetic 
information in employment or in any 

program or activity conducted or funded 
by the Department. (Not all prohibited 
bases will apply to all programs and/or 
employment activities.) 

If you wish to file an employment 
complaint, you must contact your 
Agency’s EEO Counselor (PDF) within 
45 days of the date of the alleged 
discriminatory act, event, or in the case 
of a personnel action. Additional 
information can be found online at 
http://www.ascr.usda.gov/com plaint_
filing_file.html. 

If you wish to file a Civil Rights 
program complaint of discrimination, 
complete the USDA Program 
Discrimination Complaint Form (PDF), 
found online at 
http://www.ascr.usda.gov/complaint_
filing_cust.html, or at any USDA office, 
or call (866) 632–9992 to request the 
form. You may also write a letter 
containing all of the information 
requested in the form. Send your 
completed complaint form or letter to us 
by mail at U.S. Department of 
Agriculture, Director, Office of 
Adjudication, 1400 Independence 
Avenue SW., Washington, DC 20250– 
9410, by fax (202) 690–7442 or email at 
program.intake@usda.gov. 

Individuals who are deaf, hard of 
hearing or have speech disabilities and 
you wish to file either an EEO or 
program complaint please contact 
USDA through the Federal Relay 
Service at (800) 877–8339 or (800) 845– 
6136 (in Spanish). 

Persons with disabilities who wish to 
file a program complaint, please see 
information above on how to contact us 
by mail directly or by email. If you 
require alternative means of 
communication for program information 
(e.g., Braille, large print, audiotape, etc.) 
please contact USDA’s TARGET Center 
at (202) 720–2600 (voice and TDD). 

Dated: June 25, 2014. 
Tony Hernandez, 
Administrator, Housing and Community 
Facilities Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2014–15358 Filed 6–30–14; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–XV–P 

BROADCASTING BOARD OF 
GOVERNORS 

Sunshine Act Meeting 

TIME AND DATE: Friday, June 27, 2014, 
12:00 p.m. e.d.t. 
PLACE: Broadcasting Board of 
Governors, Cohen Building, Room 3321, 
330 Independence Ave. SW., 
Washington, DC 20237. 
STATUS: Notice of closed meeting of the 
Broadcasting Board of Governors. 

MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED: The 
members of the Broadcasting Board of 
Governors (BBG) will meet in a closed 
session to discuss and consider the 
selection of a Director of Global Strategy 
for the Agency. This meeting will be 
closed to public observation pursuant to 
5 U.S.C. 552b(c)(6) in order to protect 
the privacy interests of candidates 
considered but not selected for the 
position. In accordance with the 
Government in the Sunshine Act and 
BBG policies, the meeting will be 
recorded and a transcript of the 
proceedings, subject to the redaction of 
information protected by 5 U.S.C. 
552b(c)(6), will be made available to the 
public. The publicly-releasable 
transcript will be available for 
download at www.bbg.gov within 21 
days of the date of the meeting. 

Information regarding member votes 
to close the meeting and expected 
attendees can also be found on the 
Agency’s public Web site. 

CONTACT PERSON FOR MORE INFORMATION: 
Persons interested in obtaining more 
information should contact Oanh Tran 
at (202) 203–4545. 

Oanh Tran, 
Director of Board Operations. 
[FR Doc. 2014–15499 Filed 6–27–14; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 8610–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Economic Development Administration 

Notice of Petitions by Firms for 
Determination of Eligibility To Apply 
for Trade Adjustment Assistance 

AGENCY: Economic Development 
Administration, Department of 
Commerce. 

ACTION: Notice and Opportunity for 
Public Comment. 

Pursuant to Section 251 of the Trade 
Act 1974, as amended (19 U.S.C. 2341 
et seq.), the Economic Development 
Administration (EDA) has received 
petitions for certification of eligibility to 
apply for Trade Adjustment Assistance 
from the firms listed below. 
Accordingly, EDA has initiated 
investigations to determine whether 
increased imports into the United States 
of articles like or directly competitive 
with those produced by each of these 
firms contributed importantly to the 
total or partial separation of the firm’s 
workers, or threat thereof, and to a 
decrease in sales or production of each 
petitioning firm. 
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