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Federal Register, 78 FR 39584, on July 
2, 2013, adding 22 CFR part 502. This 
rule established procedures for the BBG 
to respond to domestic requests for the 
agency’s program materials. 

Regulatory Findings and Analyses 
For the complete regulatory findings 

and analyses regarding this rulemaking, 
please refer to the findings and analyses 
included in the Supplementary 
Information section of the interim final 
rule, 78 FR 39584, which are adopted 
herein. This rule was submitted to and 
reviewed by OMB. As noted in the 
interim final rule, OMB designated this 
rule non-significant, as defined by 
Executive Order 12866. Regardless, the 
BBG has reviewed the rule to ensure its 
consistency with the regulatory 
principles set forth in Executive Orders 
12866 and 13563, and affirms that this 
rule is consistent with the guidance in 
these Executive Orders. 

Analysis of Comments 
The interim final rule, 78 FR 39584, 

contained a 60 day period for public 
comments that ended on September 2, 
2013. The BBG received one comment. 
The only comment expressed support 
for the BBG and encouraged the agency 
to continue broadcasting. 

Amendments to the Final Rule 
BBG proposes minor changes to make 

a technical amendment in paragraph 
502.3(b), correct a typographical error in 
paragraph 502.5(a), clarify the process 
for media and organization one-time 
requests for broadcast-quality agency 
program materials, and simplify 
explanations of requestors’ 
responsibilities to secure rights and 
licenses before using agency program 
materials that contain third-party 
copyrighted materials. 

List of Subjects in 22 CFR Part 502 
Broadcasting, Foreign relations, News 

media, Public affairs, Radio, Recordings, 
Smith-Mundt, Television. 

Accordingly, the interim final rule, 
amending 22 CFR part 502, published in 
the Federal Register on July 2, 2013, at 
78 FR 39584, is adopted as final, with 
the following changes: 

PART 502—DOMESTIC REQUESTS 
FOR BROADCASTING BOARD OF 
GOVERNORS PROGRAM MATERIALS 

■ 1. The authority citation for part 502 
continues to read as follows: 

Authority: 22 U.S.C. 1461, 1461–1a. 

■ 2. Section 502.3, in paragraph (b) 
introductory text, is amended by 
removing the clause ‘‘after their 
dissemination abroad’’. 

■ 3. Section 502.4 is revised to read as 
follows: 

§ 502.4 Media or organization one-time 
requests for broadcast quality agency 
program materials. 

Upon request, the Agency may 
provide a broadcast-quality copy of 
Agency program materials to media 
entities, educational organizations, not- 
for-profit corporations, or other 
requestors. Requestors will be informed 
if materials are subject to third party 
content holders’ restrictions. One-time 
requests for broadcast quality copies of 
Agency program materials should be 
directed to: 

(a) The Voice of America Office of 
Public Relations for broadcast-quality 
copies of Voice of America program 
materials; and 

(b) The TV Marti Division of the 
Office of Cuba Broadcasting for 
broadcast-quality copies of TV or Radio 
Marti program materials. 

■ 4. Section 502.5 is revised to read as 
follows: 

§ 502.5 Media or organization requests for 
ongoing subscriptions to broadcast quality 
agency program materials 

(a) Upon request, the Agency may 
make program materials available on an 
ongoing basis to Media entities, or other 
organizations, through a subscription 
agreement, provided that the Agency 
determines that entering into a 
subscription agreement to make 
program materials available on an 
ongoing basis would be consistent with 
the Agency’s mission and authorities. 
Requested, ongoing subscription 
agreements must be consistent with the 
Agency’s Policy for domestic 
distribution which incorporates the 
Broadcasting principles and standards 
and other requirements, found in 22 
U.S.C. 1461, 1461–1a, 1462, 6201, 6202, 
6203, 6204, 6205, 6206; Pub. L. 112– 
239, section 1078(b), 126 Stat. 1632, 
1958; agreements with third-parties that 
hold a copyright in Agency program 
materials; and Terms of Use on Agency 
Web sites. Requestors shall secure all 
necessary licenses from all persons or 
organizations that hold a copyright in 
any portion of program materials before 
making any use of those program 
materials, except uses of program 
materials permitted by the Copyright 
Act of 1976, as amended. 

(b) Media entities or other 
organizations may request ongoing 
subscriptions by filling out an 
application form found on the Web site 
for the Direct System, the Agency’s 
professional distribution system. 

■ 5. Section 502.6 is amended by 
removing the last sentence in paragraph 
(b)(2). 

Dated: November 5, 2013. 
Richard M. Lobo, 
Director, International Broadcasting Bureau. 
[FR Doc. 2013–26833 Filed 11–7–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8610–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 100 

[Docket No. USCG–2013–0869] 

RIN 1625–AA08 

Special Local Regulations; Recurring 
Marine Events in the Seventh Coast 
Guard District 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, DHS. 
ACTION: Notice of enforcement of 
regulation. 

SUMMARY: The Coast Guard will enforce 
the special local regulations pertaining 
to the Key West World Championship in 
the Atlantic Ocean, off Key West, FL 
from 9:30 a.m. until 4:30 p.m. on 
November 10, 2013. This action is 
necessary to protect race participants, 
participant vessels, spectators, and the 
general public from the hazards 
associated with high-speed boat races. 
The special local regulations establish 
regulated areas on the waters of the Key 
West Main Ship Channel, Key West 
Turning Basin, and Key West Harbor 
Entrance. During the enforcement 
period, no person or vessel may enter 
the regulated area without permission 
from the Captain of the Port. 
DATES: The regulations in 33 CFR 
100.701 will be enforced from 9:30 a.m. 
until 4:30 p.m. on November 10, 2013. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have questions on this notice, call 
or email Marine Science Technician 
First Class Ian G. Bowes, Sector Key 
West Prevention Department, Coast 
Guard; telephone 305–292–8809 
extension 5, email Ian.G.Bowes@
uscg.mil. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Coast 
Guard will enforce the Special Local 
Regulations for the annual Key West 
World Championship Super Boat Race 
in 33 CFR 100.701 on November 10, 
2013, from 9:30 a.m. until 4:30 p.m. 
These regulations can be found in the 
2013 issue of the Federal Register 33 
CFR 100.701. 

On November 6, 8, and 10, 2013, 
Super Boat International Productions, 
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Inc. is hosting the Key West World 
Championship, a series of high-speed 
boat races. Under the provisions of 33 
CFR 100.701, no unauthorized person or 
vessel may enter, transit through, 
anchor within, or remain in the 
established regulated areas. The event 
will be held on the waters of the 
Atlantic Ocean located southwest of Key 
West, Florida. Approximately 75 high- 
speed power boats will be participating 
in the races. It is anticipated that at least 
100 spectator vessels will be present 
during the races. 

The special local regulations will be 
enforced from 9:30 a.m. until 4:30 p.m. 
on November 10, 2013. The Coast Guard 
will provide notice of the regulated area 
by Local Notice to Mariners, Broadcast 
Notice to Mariners, and on-scene 
designated representatives. The Coast 
Guard may be assisted by other Federal, 
State, or local law enforcement agencies 
in enforcing this regulation. The events 
on November 6, 2013 and November 8, 
2013 will be enforced with actual 
notice. 

This notice is issued under authority 
of 33 CFR 100.701 and 5 U.S.C. 552(a). 
In addition to this notice in the Federal 
Register, the Coast Guard will provide 
the maritime community with advance 
notification of this enforcement period 
via a Broadcast Notice to Mariners. 

Dated: October 24, 2013. 
A.S. Young, Sr., 
Captain, U.S. Coast Guard, Captain of the 
Port Key West. 
[FR Doc. 2013–26816 Filed 11–7–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–04–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 117 

[Docket No. USCG–2013–0923] 

Drawbridge Operation Regulation; 
Lake Washington, Seattle, WA 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, DHS. 
ACTION: Notice of deviation from 
drawbridge regulation. 

SUMMARY: The Coast Guard has issued a 
temporary deviation from the operating 
schedule that governs the Evergreen 
Point Floating Bridge (State Route 520) 
across Lake Washington at Seattle, WA. 
The deviation is necessary to 
accommodate vehicular traffic attending 
football games at Husky Stadium at the 
University of Washington, Seattle, 
Washington. This deviation allows the 
bridge to remain in the closed position 

two hours before and two hours after 
each game. 
DATES: This deviation is effective from 
8:00 a.m. on November 9, 2013 through 
5:30 p.m. on November 29, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: The docket for this 
deviation, [USCG–2013–0923] is 
available at http://www.regulations.gov. 
Type the docket number in the 
‘‘SEARCH’’ box and click ‘‘SEARCH.’’ 
Click on Open Docket Folder on the line 
associated with this deviation. You may 
also visit the Docket Management 
Facility in Room W12–140 on the 
ground floor of the Department of 
Transportation West Building, 1200 
New Jersey Avenue SE., Washington, 
DC 20590, between 9 a.m. and 5 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, except Federal 
holidays. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have questions on this temporary 
deviation, call or email Steven M. 
Fischer, Thirteenth Coast Guard District 
Bridge Program Officer, telephone 206– 
220–7282, email Steven.M.Fischer3@
uscg.mil. If you have questions on 
viewing the docket, call Barbara 
Hairston, Program Manager, Docket 
Operations, telephone 202–366–9826. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Washington State Department of 
Transportation has requested that the 
draw span of the Evergreen Point 
Floating Bridge (State Route 520) remain 
closed to vessel traffic to facilitate rapid 
movement of pre-game and post game 
football traffic. Evergreen Point Floating 
Bridge (State Route 520) provides three 
navigational openings for vessel 
passage: The movable floating span, 
subject to this closure; and two fixed 
navigational openings, one on the east 
end of the bridge and one on the west 
end. The fixed navigational opening on 
the east end of the bridge provides a 
horizontal clearance of 207 feet and a 
vertical clearance of 57 feet. The 
opening on the west end of the bridge 
provides a horizontal clearance of 206 
feet and a vertical clearance of 44 feet. 
Vessels that are able to safely pass 
through the fixed navigational openings 
are allowed to do so during this closure 
period. Under normal conditions, 
during this time frame, the bridge 
operates in accordance with 33 CFR 
§ 17.1049(a), which states the bridge 
shall open on signal if at least two hours 
notice is given. 

This deviation period will cover the 
dates November 9, 2013 to November 
29, 2013 as follows. From 10:30 a.m. to 
12:30 p.m. and 3:30 p.m. to 5:30 p.m. on 
November 29, 2013. The times for the 
closures on November 9, 2013 will be 
determined and announced in the Coast 
Guard’s Local Notice to Mariners and 

Broadcast Notice to Mariners as it 
becomes available. Due to NCAA 
television scheduling, the time for the 
game is not currently available. 

The deviation allows the floating 
draw span of the Evergreen Point 
Floating Bridge on Lake Washington to 
remain in the closed position and need 
not open for maritime traffic for times 
to be determined on November 9, 2013, 
and from 10:30 a.m. to 12:30 p.m. and 
3:30 p.m. to 5:30 p.m. on November 29, 
2013. The bridge shall operate in 
accordance to 33 CFR § 117.1049(a) at 
all other times. Waterway usage on the 
Lake Washington Ship ranges from 
commercial tug and barge to small 
pleasure craft. Mariners will be notified 
and kept informed of the bridge’s 
operational status via the Coast Guard 
Notice to Mariners publication and 
Broadcast Notice to Mariners as 
appropriate. The draw span will be 
required to open, if needed, for vessels 
engaged in emergency response 
operations during this closure period. 

In accordance with 33 CFR 117.35(e), 
the drawbridge must return to its regular 
operating schedule immediately at the 
end of the designated time period. This 
deviation from the operating regulations 
is authorized under 33 CFR 117.35. 

Dated: October 25,2013. 
Daryl R. Peloquin, 
Acting Bridge Administrator. 
[FR Doc. 2013–26817 Filed 11–7–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–04–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 151, 155 and 160 

[Docket No. USCG–2008–1070] 

RIN 1625–AB27 

Nontank Vessel Response Plans and 
Other Response Plan Requirements 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, DHS. 
ACTION: Rule; information collection 
approval. 

SUMMARY: On September 30, 2013, the 
Coast Guard amended regulations on 
response plans for nontank vessels. The 
amendment triggered information 
collection requirements affecting an 
existing OMB-approved information 
collection requirement on vessel and 
facility response plans. This notice 
announces that the collection of 
information has been approved by the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) and can now be enforced. The 
OMB control number is 1625–0066. 
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