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information, network with other users, 
as well as post blogs and comments. 

The DHS invites interested persons to 
comment on the following form and 
instructions (hereinafter ‘‘Forms 
Package’’) for the S&T CyberFETCH: (1) 
Request a CyberFETCH Account (DHS 
Form 10073). Interested persons may 
receive a copy of the Forms Package by 
contacting the DHS S&T PRA 
Coordinator. This notice and request for 
comments is required by the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (Pub. L. 104–13, 
44 U.S.C. chapter 35). 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted until October 1, 2013. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit comments, identified 
by docket number DHS–2013–0047, by 
one of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Please follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Email: megan.mahle@hq.dhs.gov. 
Please include docket number DHS– 
2013–0047 in the subject line of the 
message. 

• Mail: Science and Technology 
Directorate, ATTN: CyberFETCH, 245 
Murray Drive, Mail Stop 0202, 
Washington, DC 20528. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
megan.mahle@hq.dhs.gov; (202) 254– 
2245 (Not a toll free number). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
information will be collected via the 
DHS S&T CyberFETCH secure Web site 
at http://www.cyberfetch.org/. The 
CyberFETCH Web site will only employ 
secure web-based technology (i.e., 
electronic registration form) to collect 
information from users to both reduce 
the burden and increase the efficiency 
of this collection. 

The Department is committed to 
improving its information collection 
and urges all interested parties to 
suggest how these materials can further 
reduce burden while seeking necessary 
information under the Act. 

DHS is particularly interested in 
comments that: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Suggest ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and 

(4) Suggest ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 

on those who are to respond, including 
through the use of appropriate 
automated, electronic, mechanical, or 
other technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology, e.g., permitting electronic 
submissions of responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Renewal of a currently approved 
collection 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Science and Technology, 
CyberForensics Electronic Technology 
Clearinghouse (CyberFETCH) program. 

(3) Agency Form Number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department of Homeland Security 
sponsoring the collection: Department of 
Homeland Security, Science & 
Technology Directorate, Cyber Security 
Division. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Individuals, consisting of 
federal, state and local law enforcement, 
private sector and academia 
practitioners. The information collected 
will be leveraged to determine the 
authenticity and suitability of the 
practitioner requesting access. Once 
approved, users will utilize the 
collaborative environment to upload 
documents/resources, exchange 
information, network with other users, 
as well as post blogs and comments. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: 

a. Estimate of the total number of 
respondents: 1000. 

b. An estimate of the time for an 
average respondent to respond: .25 
burden hours. 

c. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: 250 burden hours. 

Dated: July 2, 2013. 
Rick Stevens, 
Chief Information Officer for Science and 
Technology. 
[FR Doc. 2013–18582 Filed 8–1–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–9F–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

U.S. Customs and Border Protection 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Passenger List/Crew List 

AGENCY: U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection, Department of Homeland 
Security. 

ACTION: 30-Day notice and request for 
comments; Extension of an existing 
information collection. 

SUMMARY: U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection (CBP) of the Department of 
Homeland Security will be submitting 
the following information collection 
request to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for review and approval 
in accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act: Passenger List/Crew List 
(CBP Form I–418). This is a proposed 
extension of an information collection 
that was previously approved. CBP is 
proposing that this information 
collection be extended with a change to 
the burden hours. This document is 
published to obtain comments from the 
public and affected agencies. This 
information collection was previously 
published in the Federal Register (78 
FR 26648) on May 7, 2013, allowing for 
a 60-day comment period. This notice 
allows for an additional 30 days for 
public comments. This process is 
conducted in accordance with 5 CFR 
1320.10. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
received on or before September 3, 2013 
to be assured of consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments on 
this information collection to the Office 
of Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Office of Management and Budget. 
Comments should be addressed to the 
OMB Desk Officer for U.S. Customs and 
Border Protection, Department of 
Homeland Security, and sent via 
electronic mail to 
oira_submission@omb.eop.gov or faxed 
to (202) 395–5806. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information 
should be directed to Tracey Denning, 
U.S. Customs and Border Protection, 
Regulations and Rulings, Office of 
International Trade, 90 K Street NE., 
10th Floor, Washington, DC 20229– 
1177, at 202–325–0265. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: CBP 
invites the general public and affected 
Federal agencies to submit written 
comments and suggestions on proposed 
and/or continuing information 
collection requests pursuant to the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (Pub. L. 104– 
13). Your comments should address one 
of the following four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency/component, 
including whether the information will 
have practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agencies/components estimate of the 
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burden of the proposed collection of 
information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collections of information on those who 
are to respond, including the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
techniques or other forms of 
information. 

Title: Passenger List/Crew List. 
OMB Number: 1651–0103. 
Form Number: CBP Form I–418. 
Abstract: CBP Form I–418 is 

prescribed by the Department of 
Homeland Security, Customs and 
Border Protection (CBP), for use by 
masters, owners, or agents of vessels in 
complying with Sections 231 and 251 of 
the Immigration and Nationality Act 
(INA). This form is filled out upon 
arrival of any person by commercial 
vessel at any port within the United 
States from any place outside the United 
States. The master or commanding 
officer of the vessel is responsible for 
providing CBP officers at the port of 
arrival with lists or manifests of the 
persons on board such conveyances. 
CBP is working to allow for electronic 
submission of the information on CBP 
Form I–418. This form is provided for 
in 8 CFR 251.1, 251.3, and 251.4. A 
copy of CBP Form I–418 can be found 
at http://forms.cbp.gov/pdf/ 
CBP_Form_I418.pdf. 

Current Actions: This submission is 
being made to extend the expiration 
date with a change to the burden hours 
resulting from revised estimates of the 
number of forms filed, and from a pilot 
that is being conducted to eliminate the 
paper I–418. There is no change to 
information collected on CBP Form 
I–418. 

Type of Review: Extension (with 
change). 

Affected Public: Businesses. 
Estimated Number of Respondents: 

96,000. 
Estimated Time per Respondent: 1 

hour. 
Estimated Total Annual Hours: 

96,000. 

Dated: July 29, 2013. 

Tracey Denning, 
Agency Clearance Officer, U.S. Customs and 
Border Protection. 
[FR Doc. 2013–18603 Filed 8–1–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9111–14–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND 
URBAN DEVELOPMENT 

[Docket No. FR–5696–N–04] 

Additional Waivers and Alternative 
Requirements for Hurricane Sandy 
Grantees in Receipt of Community 
Development Block Grant Disaster 
Recovery Funds 

AGENCY: Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Community Planning and 
Development, HUD. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Previously, the Department 
allocated $5.4 billion of Community 
Development Block Grant disaster 
recovery (CDBG–DR) funds 
appropriated by the Disaster Relief 
Appropriations Act, 2013 for the 
purpose of assisting recovery in the 
most impacted and distressed areas 
declared a major disaster due to 
Hurricane Sandy (see 78 FR 14329, 
published in the Federal Register on 
March 5, 2013). This notice provides 
additional waivers and alternative 
requirements. 

DATES: This notice is effective: August 6, 
2013. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Stan 
Gimont, Director, Office of Block Grant 
Assistance, Department of Housing and 
Urban Development, 451 7th Street SW., 
Room 7286, Washington, DC 20410, 
telephone number 202–708–3587. 
Persons with hearing or speech 
impairments may access this number 
via TTY by calling the Federal Relay 
Service at 800–877–8339. Facsimile 
inquiries may be sent to Mr. Gimont at 
202–401–2044. (Except for the ‘‘800’’ 
number, these telephone numbers are 
not toll-free.) Email inquiries may be 
sent to disaster_recovery@hud.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Table of Contents 

I. Background 
II. Applicable Rules, Statutes, Waivers, and 

Alternative Requirements 
III. Catalog of Federal Domestic Assistance 
IV. Finding of No Significant Impact 

I. Background 

The Disaster Relief Appropriations 
Act, 2013 (Pub. L. 113–2, approved 
January 29, 2013) (Appropriations Act) 
makes available $16 billion in 
Community Development Block Grant 
(CDBG) funds for necessary expenses 
related to disaster relief, long-term 
recovery, restoration of infrastructure 
and housing, and economic 
revitalization in the most impacted and 
distressed areas resulting from a major 
disaster declared pursuant to the Robert 

T. Stafford Disaster Relief and 
Emergency Assistance Act of 1974 (42 
U.S.C. 5121 et seq.) (Stafford Act), due 
to Hurricane Sandy and other eligible 
events in calendar years 2011, 2012, and 
2013. 

On March 1, 2013, the President 
issued a sequestration order pursuant to 
section 251A of the Balanced Budget 
and Emergency Deficit Control Act, as 
amended (2 U.S.C. 901a), and reduced 
funding for CDBG disaster recovery 
(CDBG–DR) grants under the 
Appropriations Act to $15.18 billion. In 
a Federal Register notice published 
March 5, 2013 (78 FR 14329), the 
Department allocated $5.4 billion after 
analyzing the impacts of Hurricane 
Sandy and identifying unmet needs. A 
subsequent notice, providing additional 
guidance, waivers, and alternative 
requirements for Hurricane Sandy 
grantees was published by the 
Department on April 19, 2013 (78 FR 
23578). This notice provides additional 
waivers and alternative requirements to 
several Hurricane Sandy grantees—the 
State of New York and the State of New 
Jersey. 

II. Applicable Rules, Statutes, Waivers, 
and Alternative Requirements 

The Appropriations Act authorizes 
the Secretary to waive, or specify 
alternative requirements for any 
provision of any statute or regulation 
that the Secretary administers in 
connection with the obligation by the 
Secretary or the use by the recipient of 
these funds (except for requirements 
related to fair housing, 
nondiscrimination, labor standards, and 
the environment). Waivers and 
alternative requirements are based upon 
a determination by the Secretary that 
good cause exists and that the waiver or 
alternative requirement is not 
inconsistent with the overall purposes 
of Title I of the Housing and Community 
Development Act of 1974 (42 U.S.C. 
5301 et seq.) (HCD Act). Regulatory 
waiver authority is also provided by 24 
CFR 5.110, 91.600, and 570.5. 

This section provides additional 
waivers and alternative requirements to 
several Hurricane Sandy grantees. For 
each waiver and alternative requirement 
described in this notice, the Secretary 
has determined that good cause exists 
and the action is not inconsistent with 
the overall purpose of the HCD Act. 
Grantees may request additional waivers 
and alternative requirements from the 
Department as needed to address 
specific needs related to their recovery 
activities. Under the requirements of the 
Appropriations Act, regulatory waivers 
must be published in the Federal 
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