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workshop in Rotterdam developed new 
diagnostic criteria, the Rotterdam 
Criteria. 

The 2012 NIH Evidence-based 
Methodology Workshop on PCOS will 
seek to clarify: 

• Benefits and drawbacks of using the 
Rotterdam Criteria 

• The condition’s causes, predictors, 
and long-term consequences 

• Optimal prevention and treatment 
strategies. 

The NIH workshop is sponsored by 
the Office of Disease Prevention and the 
Eunice Kennedy Shriver National 
Institute of Child Health and Human 
Development. A multidisciplinary 
steering committee developed the 
workshop agenda. The NIH Library 
created an extensive, descriptive 
bibliography on PCOS to facilitate 
workshop discussion. During the 21⁄2- 
day workshop, invited experts will 
discuss the body of evidence and 
attendees will have opportunities to 
provide comments during open 
discussion periods. After weighing the 
evidence, an unbiased, independent 
panel will prepare a report that 
summarizes the workshop and identifies 
future research priorities. 

Advance information about the 
workshop and workshop registration 
materials may be obtained by calling 
888–644–2667, or by sending email to 
prevention@mail.nih.gov. Registration 
and workshop information are also 
available on the NIH Office of Disease 
Prevention Web site at http:// 
prevention.nih.gov. 

Please Note: As part of the measures to 
ensure the safety of NIH employees and 
property, all visitors must be prepared to 
show a photo ID upon request. Visitors may 
be required to pass through a metal detector 
and have bags, backpacks, or purses 
inspected or x-rayed as they enter the NIH 
campus. For more information about the 
security measures at NIH, please visit the 
Web site at http://www.nih.gov/about/ 
visitorsecurity.htm. 

Dated: September 24, 2012. 
Francis S. Collins, 
Director, National Institutes of Health. 
[FR Doc. 2012–23965 Filed 9–27–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4140–01–P 

SUBSTANCE ABUSE AND MENTAL 
HEALTH SERVICES ADMINISTRATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request 

The Substance Abuse and Mental 
Health Services Administration 
(SAMHSA) will publish periodic 
summaries of proposed projects. To 
request more information on the 
proposed projects or to obtain a copy of 
the information collection plans, call 
the SAMHSA Reports Clearance Officer 
on (240) 276–1243. 

Comments are invited on: (a) Whether 
the proposed collections of information 
are necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of the burden of the proposed collection 
of information; (c) ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Proposed Project: Site Visits With 
Grantees Integrating HIV Primary Care, 
Substance Abuse, and Behavioral 
Health Services—NEW 

The Substance Abuse and Mental 
Health Services Administration 
(SAMSHA) is requesting approval to 
conduct in-person Site Visit Interviews 
with Minority AIDS Initiative—Targeted 
Capacity Expansion (MAI–TCE) 
Grantees Integrating HIV Primary Care, 
Substance Abuse, and Behavioral Health 
Services. This is a new project request 
targeting the collection of programmatic 
level data (e.g., services provision, 
program administration, consumer 
involvement, evaluation planning, 
organizational capacity) through one-on- 
one and group interviews and site 
assessment surveys with grantee 
personnel. 

The goals of the MAI–TCE project are 
to facilitate the development and 

expansion of culturally competent and 
effective integrated behavioral health 
and primary care, which include HIV 
services and medical treatment within 
11 of the 12 Metropolitan Statistical 
Areas (MSAs) and Metropolitan 
Divisions (MDs) most heavily impacted 
by HIV/AIDS. The program also 
supports the integration of behavioral 
health services (i.e., prevention, 
treatment, and substance abuse) into the 
CDC’s Enhanced Comprehensive HIV 
Prevention Plans (ECHPP). Interviews 
conducted with MAI–TCE grantees 
during site visits are an integral part of 
efforts to evaluate: (1) The effectiveness 
of program implementation across the 
grantee sites; (2) grantee efforts to 
integrate behavioral health, substance 
abuse and HIV care; (3) the variety of 
program models in use across the 
grantee sites; and, (4) grantee efforts to 
engage and successfully reach their 
target populations. 

SAMHSA will conduct a total of two 
in-person site visits with each of the 11 
MAI–TCE program grantees, with 
surveys being administered prior to 
each site visit. 

SAMHSA will conduct interviews 
with grantee staff who will provide 
information on their program’s 
integration of primary care and 
behavioral health services. While 
participating in the evaluation is a 
condition of the grantees’ funding, 
participating in the interview and 
survey process is voluntary. Both 
instruments are designed to collect 
information about: Specific program 
components; HIV testing integration 
challenges, successes, and lessons 
learned; HIV care and evidence-based 
behavioral health services for their 
specific populations of focus; and 
engaging consumers in the Behavioral 
Health and Primary Care Network 
Committee and other aspects of the 
project, including how cultural 
competence is operationalized. 

Below is the table of the estimated 
total burden hours: 

EXHIBIT 1—ESTIMATE OF REPORTING BURDEN: ONE SITE VISIT ROUND 

Data collection tool Number of 
respondents 

Responses 
per 

respondent 

Hour per 
response 

Total burden 
hours 

Interview Guide ............................................................................................ 132 1 2 .5 330 
Assessment Form ........................................................................................ 55 1 .3 18 .3 

Total ...................................................................................................... * 132 2 2 .8 348 .3 

* Note: The 55 respondents identified for the self-assessment are included in the 132 overall participants listed for the site visit protocol. 
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Send comments to Summer King, 
SAMHSA Reports Clearance Officer, 
Room 2–1027, One Choke Cherry Road, 
Rockville, MD 20857 or email a copy to 
summer.king@samhsa.hhs.gov. Written 
comments should be received within 60 
days of this notice. 

Summer King, 
Statistician. 
[FR Doc. 2012–23875 Filed 9–27–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4162–20–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

[Docket No. DHS–2012–0064] 

Homeland Security Advisory Council 

AGENCY: The Office of Policy, DHS. 
ACTION: Notice of open teleconference 
federal advisory committee meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Homeland Security 
Advisory Council (HSAC) will meet via 
teleconference for the purpose of 
reviewing and deliberating on 
recommendations by the HSAC’s Cyber 
Skills Task Force. 
DATES: The HSAC conference call will 
take place from 4 p.m. to 5 p.m. EDT on 
Monday, October 1, 2012. Please be 
advised that the meeting is scheduled 
for one hour and may end early if all 
business is completed before 5 p.m. 
EDT. 

ADDRESSES: The HSAC meeting will be 
held via teleconference. Members of the 
public interested in participating in this 
teleconference meeting may do so by 
following the process outlined below 
(see ‘‘Public Participation’’). 

Written comments must be submitted 
and received by September, 30, 2012. 
Comments must be identified by Docket 
No. DHS–2012–0064 and may be 
submitted by one of the following 
methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Email: HSAC@dhs.gov. Include 
docket number in the subject line of the 
message. 

• Fax: (202) 282–9207. 
• Mail: Homeland Security Advisory 

Council, Department of Homeland 
Security, Mailstop 0445, 245 Murray 
Lane SW., Washington, DC 20528. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the words ‘‘Department of 
Homeland Security’’ and DHS–2012– 
0064, the docket number for this action. 
Comments received will be posted 
without alteration at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided. 

Docket: For access to the docket to 
read comments received by the DHS 
Homeland Security Advisory Council, 
go to http://www.regulations.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Mike Miron at hsac@dhs.gov or 202– 
447–3135. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Notice of 
this meeting is given under the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, 5 U.S.C. App. 
The HSAC provides organizationally 
independent, strategic, timely, specific, 
and actionable advice to the Secretary 
and senior leadership on matters related 
to homeland security. The HSAC will 
meet to review and deliberate on the 
Cyber Skills Task Force report of 
findings and recommendations. 

Public Participation: Members of the 
public will be in listen-only mode. The 
public may register to participate in this 
HSAC teleconference via the following 
procedures. Each individual must 
provide his or her full legal name and 
email address no later than 5 p.m. EDT 
on September 30, 2012, to a staff 
member of the HSAC via email at 
HSAC@dhs.gov or via phone at (202) 
447–3135. HSAC conference call details 
and the Cyber Skills Task Force report 
will be provided to interested members 
of the public at the time they register. 

The Federal Advisory Committee Act 
requires that notices of meetings of 
advisory committees be announced in 
the Federal Register 15 days prior to the 
meeting date. This notice of the 
teleconference meeting of the HSAC is 
published in the Federal Register with 
less than 15 days’ due to the complexity 
of the issue, the task force was not able 
to complete its report within this 
aggressive time line in time for deliver 
to the HSAC at its September 24–25 
meeting. Waiting for the full 15 day 
notice period to conduct the 
teleconference will delay the discussion 
of the report to a period of time that will 
prevent the Secretary from meeting with 
the HSAC to review the report due to 
her travel schedule. In order to not 
delay receipt of the recommendations 
from the HSAC this teleconference is 
being announced with less than 15 days’ 
notice. Since this is a meeting by 
teleconference, members of the public 
do to not have to travel to attend, and 
the task force report is available to the 
public prior to the meeting for review 
and comment by members of the public 
in accordance with procedures provided 
above. 

Information on Services for 
Individuals with Disabilities: For 
information on facilities or services for 
individuals with disabilities, or to 
request special assistance during the 

teleconference, contact Mike Miron 
(202) 447–3135. 

Becca Sharp, 
Executive Director, Homeland Security 
Advisory Council, DHS. 
[FR Doc. 2012–23870 Filed 9–27–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–9M–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND 
URBAN DEVELOPMENT 

[Docket No. FR–5601–N–38] 

Federal Property Suitable as Facilities 
To Assist the Homeless 

AGENCY: Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Community Planning and 
Development, HUD. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This Notice identifies 
unutilized, underutilized, excess, and 
surplus Federal property reviewed by 
HUD for suitability for use to assist the 
homeless. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Juanita Perry, Department of Housing 
and Urban Development, 451 Seventh 
Street SW., Room 7266, Washington, DC 
20410; telephone (202) 402–3970; TTY 
number for the hearing- and speech- 
impaired (202) 708–2565 (these 
telephone numbers are not toll-free), or 
call the toll-free Title V information line 
at 800–927–7588. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with 24 CFR part 581 and 
section 501 of the Stewart B. McKinney 
Homeless Assistance Act (42 U.S.C. 
11411), as amended, HUD is publishing 
this Notice to identify Federal buildings 
and other real property that HUD has 
reviewed for suitability for use to assist 
the homeless. The properties were 
reviewed using information provided to 
HUD by Federal landholding agencies 
regarding unutilized and underutilized 
buildings and real property controlled 
by such agencies or by GSA regarding 
its inventory of excess or surplus 
Federal property. This Notice is also 
published in order to comply with the 
December 12, 1988 Court Order in 
National Coalition for the Homeless v. 
Veterans Administration, No. 88–2503– 
OG (D.D.C.). 

Properties reviewed are listed in this 
Notice according to the following 
categories: Suitable/available, suitable/ 
unavailable, suitable/to be excess, and 
unsuitable. The properties listed in the 
three suitable categories have been 
reviewed by the landholding agencies, 
and each agency has transmitted to 
HUD: (1) Its intention to make the 
property available for use to assist the 
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