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Since the need for relief is expected to 
vary substantially from case to case, so 
will the required information collection. 

Estimate of Burden: Public reporting 
for this collection of information is 
estimated to average 2,000 hours per 
response. 

Respondents: Not-for-profit 
institutions and other businesses. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 1. 
Estimated Number of Responses per 

Respondent: 1. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden on 

Respondents: 2,000 hours. 
Copies of this information collection 

can be obtained from MaryPat Daskal, 
Program Development and Regulatory 
Analysis at (202) 720–7853. Fax: (202) 
720–8435. 

All responses to this notice will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for OMB approval. All comments will 
also become a matter of public record. 

Dated: May 11, 2012. 
Jonathan Adelstein, 
Administrator, Rural Utilities Service. 
[FR Doc. 2012–12549 Filed 5–22–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Rural Utilities Service 

Information Collection Activity; 
Comment Request 

AGENCY: Rural Utilities Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. chapter 35, as amended), the 
United States Department of 
Agriculture’s (USDA) Rural Utilities 
Service (RUS) comments on this 
information collection for which the 
Agency intends to request approval 
from the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB). 
DATES: Comments on this notice must be 
received by July 23, 2012. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michele Brooks, Director, Program 
Development and Regulatory Analysis, 
USDA Rural Development, 1400 
Independence Ave. SW., STOP 1522, 
Room 5162 South Building, 
Washington, DC 20250–1522. 
Telephone: (202) 690–1078. Fax: (202) 
720–8435. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Office 
of Management and Budget’s (OMB) 
regulation (5 CFR part 1320) 
implementing provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (Pub. 
L. 104–13) requires that interested 

members of the public and affected 
agencies have an opportunity to 
comment on information collection and 
recordkeeping activities (see 5 CFR 
1320.8(d)). This notice identifies an 
information collection that RUS is 
submitting to OMB as a revision to an 
existing collection. Comments are 
invited on: (a) Whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
Agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on those who are to respond, including 
through the use of appropriate 
automated, electronic, mechanical, or 
other technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology. Comments may be sent to: 
Michele Brooks, Director, Program 
Development and Regulatory Analysis, 
Rural Utilities Service, U.S. Department 
of Agriculture, STOP 1522, Room 5162, 
1400 Independence Ave. SW., 
Washington, DC 20250–1522. Fax: (202) 
720–8435. 

Title: 7 CFR 1773, Policy on Audits of 
RUS Borrowers. 

OMB Control Number: 0572–0095. 
Type of Request: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Abstract: The Rural Utilities Service 

relies on the information provided by 
the borrowers in their financial 
statements to make lending decisions as 
to borrowers’ credit worthiness and to 
assure that loan funds are approved, 
advanced and disbursed for proper RE 
Act purposes. These financial 
statements are audited by a certified 
public accountant to provide 
independent assurance that the data 
being reported are properly measured 
and fairly presented. 

Estimate of Burden: Public reporting 
burden for this collection of information 
is estimated to average 7.38 hours per 
response. 

Respondents: Business or other for- 
profit, Not-for-profit institutions. 

Estimated Number of Respondents 
and Recordkeepers: 1,402. 

Estimated Number of Responses per 
Respondent: 1.35 

Estimated Total Annual Burden on 
Respondents: 13,927 hours. 

Copies of this information collection 
can be obtained from MaryPat Daskal, 
Program Development and Regulatory 

Analysis, at (202) 720–7853, Fax: (202) 
720–8435. 

All responses to this notice will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for OMB approval. All comments will 
also become a matter of public record. 

Dated: May 11, 2012. 
Jonathan Adelstein, 
Administrator, Rural Utilities Service. 
[FR Doc. 2012–12556 Filed 5–22–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Rural Utilities Service 

Information Collection Activity; 
Comment Request 

AGENCY: Rural Utilities Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44 
U.S.C. chapter 35, as amended), the 
United States Department of 
Agriculture’s (USDA) Rural Utilities 
Service (RUS) comments on this 
information collection for which the 
Agency intends to request approval 
from the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB). 
DATES: Comments on this notice must be 
received by July 23, 2012. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michele Brooks, Director, Program 
Development and Regulatory Analysis, 
USDA Rural Development, 1400 
Independence Ave. SW., STOP 1522, 
Room 5162 South Building, 
Washington, DC 20250–1522. 
Telephone: (202) 690–1078. Fax: (202) 
720–8435. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Office 
of Management and Budget’s (OMB) 
regulation (5 CFR part 1320) 
implementing provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (Pub. 
L. 104–13) requires that interested 
members of the public and affected 
agencies have an opportunity to 
comment on information collection and 
recordkeeping activities (see 5 CFR 
1320.8(d)). This notice identifies an 
information collection that RUS is 
submitting to OMB as a revision to an 
existing collection. Comments are 
invited on: (a) Whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
Agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information 
including the validity of the 
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methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on those who are to respond, including 
through the use of appropriate 
automated, electronic, mechanical, or 
other technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology. Comments may be sent to: 
Michele Brooks, Director, Program 
Development and Regulatory Analysis, 
Rural Utilities Service, U.S. Department 
of Agriculture, STOP 1522, Room 5162, 
1400 Independence Ave. SW., 
Washington, DC 20250–1522. Fax: (202) 
720–8435. 

Title: 7 CFR Part 1786, Prepayment of 
Rural Utilities Service Guaranteed and 
Insured Loans to Electric and Telephone 
Borrowers. 

OMB Control Number: 0572–0088. 
Type of Request: Extension of a 

currently approved collection. 
Abstract: The Rural Utilities Service 

relies on the information provided by 
the borrowers in their financial 
statements to make lending decisions as 
to borrowers’ credit worthiness and to 
assure that loan funds are approved, 
advanced and disbursed for proper RE 
Act purposes. These financial 
statements are audited by a certified 
public accountant to provide 
independent assurance that the data 
being reported are properly measured 
and fairly presented. 

Estimate of Burden: Public reporting 
burden for this collection of information 
is estimated to average 3.20 hours per 
response. 

Respondents: Business or other for- 
profit, Not-for-profit institutions. 

Estimated Number of Respondents 
and Recordkeepers: 5. 

Estimated Number of Responses per 
Respondent: 1.00. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden on 
Respondents: 16 hours. 

Copies of this information collection 
can be obtained from MaryPat Daskal, 
Program Development and Regulatory 
Analysis, at (202) 720–7853, Fax: (202) 
720–8435. 

All responses to this notice will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for OMB approval. All comments will 
also become a matter of public record. 

Dated: May 11, 2012. 
Jonathan Adelstein, 
Administrator, Rural Utilities Service. 
[FR Doc. 2012–12558 Filed 5–22–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Agenda and Notice of Public Meeting 
of the Maryland Advisory Committee 

Notice is hereby given, pursuant to 
the provisions of the rules and 
regulations of the U.S. Commission on 
Civil Rights (Commission), and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) that a planning and briefing 
meeting of the Maryland Advisory 
Committee to the Commission will 
convene at 9:30 a.m. (EDT) on Tuesday, 
June 5, 2012. The meeting will be held 
at the Legislative Services Building, 
Joint Hearing Room, 90 State Circle, 
Annapolis, MD 21401. The purpose of 
the briefing meeting is to gather 
information on the racial disparities in 
the incarceration rates in Maryland 
prisons. The purpose of the planning 
meeting is to discuss the Committee’s 
next steps. 

Members of the public are entitled to 
submit written comments. The 
comments must be received in the 
regional office by Thursday, July 5, 
2012. Comments may be mailed to the 
Eastern Regional Office, U.S. 
Commission on Civil Rights, 624 9th 
Street NW., Suite 740, Washington, DC 
20425, faxed to (202) 376–7548, or 
emailed to ero@usccr.gov. 

Persons needing accessibility services 
should contact the Eastern Regional 
Office at least ten (10) working days 
before the scheduled date of the 
meeting. 

Records generated from this meeting 
may be inspected and reproduced at the 
Eastern Regional Office, as they become 
available, both before and after the 
meeting. Persons interested in the work 
of this advisory committee are advised 
to go to the Commission’s Web site, 
www.usccr.gov, or to contact the Eastern 
Regional Office at the above email or 
street address. 

The meeting will be conducted 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the Commission and 
FACA. 

Dated in Washington, DC, May 18, 2012. 

Peter Minarik, 
Acting Chief, Regional Programs 
Coordination Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2012–12498 Filed 5–22–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6335–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Foreign-Trade Zones Board 

[Dockets 60, 61 and 62–2011] 

Foreign-Trade Zones 140 and 78, 
Applications for Subzone Authority, 
Dow Corning Corporation, Hemlock 
Semiconductor Corporation, and 
Hemlock Semiconductor, L.L.C.; 
Reopening of Comment Periods 

The comment periods for the 
applications for subzone authority at the 
Dow Corning Corporation facility in 
Midland, Michigan (76 FR 63282– 
63283, 10/12/2011), at the Hemlock 
Semiconductor Corporation facility in 
Hemlock, Michigan (76 FR 63282, 10/ 
12/2011) and at the Hemlock 
Semiconductor, L.L.C. facility in 
Clarksville, Tennessee (76 FR 63281– 
63282, 10/12/2011) are being reopened. 
Additional information containing new 
factual information on which there has 
not been a chance for public comment 
was submitted on behalf of the 
companies cited above. The comment 
periods for the cases referenced above 
are being reopened to June 22, 2012, to 
allow interested parties time in which to 
comment. Rebuttal comments may be 
submitted during the subsequent 15-day 
period, until June 7, 2012. Submissions 
shall be addressed to the Board’s 
Executive Secretary at: Foreign-Trade 
Zones Board, U.S. Department of 
Commerce, Room 2111, 1401 
Constitution Ave. NW., Washington, DC 
20230. 

For further information, contact 
Elizabeth Whiteman at 
Elizabeth.Whiteman@trade.gov or (202) 
482–0473. 

Dated: May 17, 2012. 
Elizabeth Whiteman, 
Acting Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2012–12557 Filed 5–22–12; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Bureau of Industry and Security 

President’s Export Council; 
Subcommittee on Export 
Administration; Notice of Open 
Meeting 

The President’s Export Council 
Subcommittee on Export 
Administration (PECSEA) will meet on 
June 4, 2012, 10:00 a.m., at the U.S. 
Department of Commerce, Herbert C. 
Hoover Building, Room 4830, 14th 
Street between Pennsylvania and 
Constitution Avenues NW., Washington, 
DC. The PECSEA provides advice on 
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