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DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Motor Carrier Safety 
Administration 

[FMCSA Docket No. FMCSA–2011–0193] 

Qualification of Drivers; Exemption 
Applications; Diabetes Mellitus 

AGENCY: Federal Motor Carrier Safety 
Administration (FMCSA), DOT. 
ACTION: Notice of final disposition. 

SUMMARY: FMCSA announces its 
decision to exempt twenty-two 
individuals from its rule prohibiting 
persons with insulin-treated diabetes 
mellitus (ITDM) from operating 
commercial motor vehicles (CMVs) in 
interstate commerce. The exemptions 
will enable these individuals to operate 
CMVs in interstate commerce. 
DATES: The exemptions are effective 
November 9, 2011. The exemptions 
expire on November 11, 2013. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Elaine M. Papp, Chief, Medical 
Programs Division, (202) 366–4001, 
fmcsamedical@dot.gov, FMCSA, Room 
W64–224, Department of 
Transportation, 1200 New Jersey 
Avenue SE., Washington, DC 20590– 
0001. Office hours are from 8:30 a.m. to 
5 p.m., Monday through Friday, except 
Federal holidays. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Electronic Access 
You may see all the comments online 

through the Federal Document 
Management System (FDMS) at: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. 

Docket: For access to the docket to 
read background documents or 
comments, go to http:// 
www.regulations.gov and/or Room 
W12–140 on the ground level of the 
West Building, 1200 New Jersey Avenue 
SE., Washington, DC, between 9 a.m. 
and 5 p.m., Monday through Friday, 
except Federal holidays. 

Privacy Act: Anyone may search the 
electronic form of all comments 
received into any of DOT’s dockets by 
the name of the individual submitting 
the comment (or of the person signing 
the comment, if submitted on behalf of 
an association, business, labor union, or 
other entity). You may review DOT’s 
Privacy Act Statement for the Federal 
Docket Management System (FDMS) 
published in the Federal Register on 
January 17, 2008 (73 FR 3316), or you 
may visit http://edocket.access.gpo.gov/ 
2008/pdf/E8–785.pdf. 

Background 
On September 7, 2011, FMCSA 

published a notice of receipt of Federal 

diabetes exemption applications from 
twenty-two individuals and requested 
comments from the public (76 FR 
55460). The public comment period 
closed on October 7, 2011 and no 
comments were received. 

FMCSA has evaluated the eligibility 
of the twenty-two applicants and 
determined that granting the 
exemptions to these individuals would 
achieve a level of safety equivalent to or 
greater than the level that would be 
achieved by complying with the current 
regulation 49 CFR 391.41(b)(3). 

Diabetes Mellitus and Driving 
Experience of the Applicants 

The Agency established the current 
standard for diabetes in 1970 because 
several risk studies indicated that 
drivers with diabetes had a higher rate 
of crash involvement than the general 
population. The diabetes rule provides 
that ‘‘A person is physically qualified to 
drive a commercial motor vehicle if that 
person has no established medical 
history or clinical diagnosis of diabetes 
mellitus currently requiring insulin for 
control’’ (49 CFR 391.41(b)(3)). 

FMCSA established its diabetes 
exemption program, based on the 
Agency’s July 2000 study entitled ‘‘A 
Report to Congress on the Feasibility of 
a Program to Qualify Individuals with 
Insulin-Treated Diabetes Mellitus to 
Operate in Interstate Commerce as 
Directed by the Transportation Act for 
the 21st Century.’’ The report concluded 
that a safe and practicable protocol to 
allow some drivers with ITDM to 
operate CMVs is feasible. 

The September 3, 2003 (68 FR 52441) 
Federal Register notice in conjunction 
with the November 8, 2005 (70 FR 
67777) Federal Register notice provides 
the current protocol for allowing such 
drivers to operate CMVs in interstate 
commerce. 

These twenty-two applicants have 
had ITDM over a range of 1 to 32 years. 
These applicants report no severe 
hypoglycemic reactions resulting in loss 
of consciousness or seizure, requiring 
the assistance of another person, or 
resulting in impaired cognitive function 
that occurred without warning 
symptoms, in the past 12 months and no 
recurrent (2 or more) severe 
hypoglycemic episodes in the past 5 
years. In each case, an endocrinologist 
verified that the driver has 
demonstrated a willingness to properly 
monitor and manage his/her diabetes 
mellitus, received education related to 
diabetes management, and is on a stable 
insulin regimen. These drivers report no 
other disqualifying conditions, 
including diabetes-related 

complications. Each meets the vision 
standard at 49 CFR 391.41(b)(10). 

The qualifications and medical 
condition of each applicant were stated 
and discussed in detail in the 
September 7, 2011, Federal Register 
notice and they will not be repeated in 
this notice. 

Discussion of Comment 
FMCSA did not receive any 

comments in this proceeding. 

Basis for Exemption Determination 
Under 49 U.S.C. 31136(e) and 31315, 

FMCSA may grant an exemption from 
the diabetes standard in 49 CFR 
391.41(b)(3) if the exemption is likely to 
achieve an equivalent or greater level of 
safety than would be achieved without 
the exemption. The exemption allows 
the applicants to operate CMVs in 
interstate commerce. 

To evaluate the effect of these 
exemptions on safety, FMCSA 
considered medical reports about the 
applicants’ ITDM and vision, and 
reviewed the treating endocrinologists’ 
medical opinion related to the ability of 
the driver to safely operate a CMV while 
using insulin. 

Consequently, FMCSA finds that in 
each case exempting these applicants 
from the diabetes standard in 49 CFR 
391.41(b)(3) is likely to achieve a level 
of safety equal to that existing without 
the exemption. 

Conditions and Requirements 
The terms and conditions of the 

exemption will be provided to the 
applicants in the exemption document 
and they include the following: (1) That 
each individual submit a quarterly 
monitoring checklist completed by the 
treating endocrinologist as well as an 
annual checklist with a comprehensive 
medical evaluation; (2) that each 
individual reports within 2 business 
days of occurrence, all episodes of 
severe hypoglycemia, significant 
complications, or inability to manage 
diabetes; also, any involvement in an 
accident or any other adverse event in 
a CMV or personal vehicle, whether or 
not it is related to an episode of 
hypoglycemia; (3) that each individual 
provide a copy of the ophthalmologist’s 
or optometrist’s report to the medical 
examiner at the time of the annual 
medical examination; and (4) that each 
individual provide a copy of the annual 
medical certification to the employer for 
retention in the driver’s qualification 
file, or keep a copy in his/her driver’s 
qualification file if he/she is self- 
employed. The driver must also have a 
copy of the certification when driving, 
for presentation to a duly authorized 
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Federal, State, or local enforcement 
official. 

Conclusion 
Based upon its evaluation of the 

twenty-two exemption applications, 
FMCSA exempts, Johnathan A. Akins, 
Robert G. Bellows, Phillip J. Blake, Mark 
A. Blanton, Howard T. Cash, Heath J. 
Chesser, Kevin F. Connacher, Daryl A. 
Daniels, Carl W. Frentz, Jr., Carie L. 
Frisby, David A. Gray, Dean M. Keeven, 
David L. Killen, Christopher A. 
LaBudde, Brian A. Mankowski, Jimmie 
L. Parrish, Robert L. Scheetz, John R. 
Sheaffer, Benjamin D. Skinner, Brian L. 
Vanlerberg, Robert E. Welling and Keith 
M. Weymouth from the ITDM standard 
in 49 CFR 391.41(b)(3), subject to the 
conditions listed under ‘‘Conditions and 
Requirements’’ above. 

In accordance with 49 U.S.C. 31136(e) 
and 31315 each exemption will be valid 
for two years unless revoked earlier by 
FMCSA. The exemption will be revoked 
if: (1) 

The person fails to comply with the 
terms and conditions of the exemption; 
(2) the exemption has resulted in a 
lower level of safety than was 
maintained before it was granted; or (3) 
continuation of the exemption would 
not be consistent with the goals and 
objectives of 49 U.S.C. 31136(e) and 
31315. If the exemption is still effective 
at the end of the 2-year period, the 
person may apply to FMCSA for a 
renewal under procedures in effect at 
that time. 

Issued on: October 28, 2011. 
Larry W. Minor, 
Associate Administrator for Policy. 
[FR Doc. 2011–29042 Filed 11–8–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–EX–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

National Highway Traffic Safety 
Administration 

[Docket No. DOT–NHTSA–2011–0158, 
Notice 1] 

Notice of Receipt of Petition for 
Decision That Nonconforming 2002 
Jaguar XJ8 Passenger Cars 
Manufactured for Sale in the Kuwaiti 
Market Are Eligible for Importation 

AGENCY: National Highway Traffic 
Safety Administration, DOT. 
ACTION: Notice of receipt of petition. 

SUMMARY: This document announces 
receipt by the National Highway Traffic 
Safety Administration (NHTSA) of a 
petition for a decision that 2002 Jaguar 
XJ8 passenger cars manufactured for 
sale in the Kuwaiti market 

(nonconforming 2002 Kuwaiti Jaguar 
XJ8 passenger cars) that were not 
originally manufactured to comply with 
all applicable Federal Motor Vehicle 
Safety Standards (FMVSS), are eligible 
for importation into the United States 
because they are substantially similar to 
vehicles that were originally 
manufactured for sale in the United 
States and that were certified by their 
manufacturer as complying with the 
safety standards (the U.S.-certified 
version of the 2002 Jaguar XJ8 passenger 
cars) and they are capable of being 
readily altered to conform to the 
standards. 

DATE: The closing date for comments on 
the petition is December 9, 2011. 
ADDRESSES: Comments should refer to 
the docket and notice numbers above 
and be submitted by any of the 
following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: Go to 
http://www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
online instructions for submitting 
comments. 

• Mail: Docket Management Facility: 
U.S. Department of Transportation, 1200 
New Jersey Avenue SE., West Building 
Ground Floor, Room W12–140, 
Washington, DC 20590–0001. 

• Hand Delivery or Courier: West 
Building Ground Floor, Room W12–140, 
1200 New Jersey Avenue SE., between 
9 a.m. and 5 p.m. ET, Monday through 
Friday, except Federal holidays. 

• Fax: (202) 493–2251. 
Instructions: Comments must be 

written in the English language, and be 
no greater than 15 pages in length, 
although there is no limit to the length 
of necessary attachments to the 
comments. If comments are submitted 
in hard copy form, please ensure that 
two copies are provided. If you wish to 
receive confirmation that your 
comments were received, please enclose 
a stamped, self-addressed postcard with 
the comments. Note that all comments 
received will be posted without change 
to http://www.regulations.gov, including 
any personal information provided. 
Please see the Privacy Act heading 
below. 

Privacy Act: Anyone is able to search 
the electronic form of all comments 
received into any of our dockets by the 
name of the individual submitting the 
comment (or signing the comment, if 
submitted on behalf of an association, 
business, labor union, etc.). You may 
review DOT’s complete Privacy Act 
Statement in the Federal Register 
published on April 11, 2000 (65 FR 
19477–78). 

How to Read Comments submitted to 
the Docket: You may read the comments 
received by Docket Management at the 

address and times given above. You may 
also view the documents from the 
Internet at http://www.regulations.gov. 
Follow the online instructions for 
accessing the dockets. The docket ID 
number and title of this notice are 
shown at the heading of this document 
notice. Please note that even after the 
comment closing date, we will continue 
to file relevant information in the 
Docket as it becomes available. Further, 
some people may submit late comments. 
Accordingly, we recommend that you 
periodically search the Docket for new 
material. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
George Stevens, Office of Vehicle Safety 
Compliance, NHTSA (202) 366–8035). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

Under 49 U.S.C. 30141(a)(1)(A), a 
motor vehicle that was not originally 
manufactured to conform to all 
applicable FMVSS shall be refused 
admission into the United States unless 
NHTSA has decided that the motor 
vehicle is substantially similar to a 
motor vehicle originally manufactured 
for importation into and sale in the 
United States, certified under 49 U.S.C. 
30115, and of the same model year as 
the model of the motor vehicle to be 
compared, and is capable of being 
readily altered to conform to all 
applicable FMVSS. 

Petitions for eligibility decisions may 
be submitted by either manufacturers or 
importers who have registered with 
NHTSA pursuant to 49 CFR Part 592. As 
specified in 49 CFR 593.7, NHTSA 
publishes notice in the Federal Register 
of each petition that it receives, and 
affords interested persons an 
opportunity to comment on the petition. 
At the close of the comment period, 
NHTSA decides, on the basis of the 
petition and any comments that it has 
received, whether the vehicle is eligible 
for importation. The agency then 
publishes this decision in the Federal 
Register. 

J.K. Technologies, LLC (‘‘JK’’), of 
Baltimore, Maryland (Registered 
Importer 90–006) has petitioned NHTSA 
to decide whether nonconforming 2002 
Kuwaiti Jaguar XJ8 passenger cars are 
eligible for importation into the United 
States. The vehicles which JK believes 
are substantially similar are 2002 Jaguar 
XJ8 passenger cars that were 
manufactured for sale in the United 
States and certified by their 
manufacturer as conforming to all 
applicable FMVSS. 

The petitioner claims that it compared 
non-U.S. certified 2002 Kuwaiti Jaguar 
XJ8 passenger cars to their U.S.-certified 
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