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• FAX: (202) 514–1009. Send your 
comments to the attention of Caroline A. 
Smith. 

• Mail: Caroline A. Smith, Office of 
Information Policy, U.S. Department of 
Justice, 1425 New York Ave, Suite 
11050, Washington, DC 20530–0001. 

To ensure proper handling, please 
reference OAG Docket No. 140 on your 
correspondence. See SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION for further instructions for 
submitting comments. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Caroline Smith ((202) 514–3642). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Posting of Public Comments 

Please note that all comments 
received are considered part of the 
public record and made available for 
public inspection online at http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Such information 
includes personal identifying 
information (such as your name and 
address) voluntarily submitted by the 
commenter. 

You are not required to submit 
personal identifying information in 
order to comment on this rule. 
Nevertheless, if you want to submit 
personal identifying information (such 
as your name and address) as part of 
your comment, but do not want it to be 
posted online, you must include the 
phrase ‘‘PERSONAL IDENTIFYING 
INFORMATION’’ in the first paragraph 
of your comment. You also must locate 
all the personal identifying information 
you do not want posted online in the 
first paragraph of your comment and 
identify what information you want 
redacted. 

If you want to submit confidential 
business information as part of your 
comment but do not want it to be posted 
online, you must include the phrase 
‘‘CONFIDENTIAL BUSINESS 
INFORMATION’’ in the first paragraph 

of your comment. You also must 
prominently identify confidential 
business information to be redacted 
within the comment. If a comment has 
so much confidential business 
information that it cannot be effectively 
redacted, all or part of that comment 
may not be posted on http:// 
www.regulations.gov. 

Personal identifying information and 
confidential business information 
identified and located as set forth above 
will be placed in the agency’s public 
docket file, but not posted online. If you 
wish to inspect the agency’s public 
docket file in person by appointment, 
please see the paragraph above entitled 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT. 

Discussion 

On March 21, 2011, the Department of 
Justice published a proposed rule 
revising its existing regulations under 
the FOIA. (See 76 FR 15236.) The rule 
proposed to amend the Department’s 
regulations under the Freedom of 
Information Act (FOIA). The regulations 
will be revised to update and streamline 
the language of several procedural 
provisions, and to incorporate certain of 
the changes brought about by the 
amendments to the FOIA under the 
OPEN Government Act of 2007. 
Additionally, the regulations will be 
updated to reflect developments in the 
case law and to include current cost 
figures to be used in calculating and 
charging fees. 

The Department received a number of 
comments while the comment period on 
the proposed rule was open, but has 
decided to reopen the comment period 
in order to ensure that it receives, 
reviews, and considers as wide a range 
of comments as possible. Accordingly, 
the Department is reopening the 
comment period and will accept 
comments for an additional 30 days 

after publication of this notice of 
proposed rulemaking. 

Dated: September 12, 2011. 
Eric H. Holder, Jr., 
Attorney General. 
[FR Doc. 2011–23903 Filed 9–16–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4110–BE–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Maritime Administration 

46 CFR Parts 381 and 382 

[Docket No. MARAD 2011–0121] 

Retrospective Review Under E.O. 
13563: Cargo Preference 

AGENCY: Maritime Administration, 
Department of Transportation. 
ACTION: Notice of public meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Department of 
Transportation (Department or DOT) has 
been engaged for several years in an 
interagency discussion of its existing 
Cargo Preference regulations. In 
accordance with Executive Order 13563, 
‘‘Improving Regulation and Regulatory 
Review,’’ the Maritime Administration 
(MarAd) is evaluating the rules’ 
continued validity and whether they 
effectively address current issues. As 
part of this review, MarAd invites the 
public to participate in a comment 
process designed to help it provide for 
a more easily administered system of 
regulations to benefit shippers and 
shipper agencies in meeting cargo 
preference requirements pursuant to the 
Merchant Marine Act, 1936, as amended 
(the Act) and Maritime Administration 
implementing regulations. 
DATES: The public meeting will be held 
from 1 to 4 p.m. on October 3, 2011. 
Other important dates: 

Deadline to register to attend the public meeting in person [See also Registration] .................................................... September 23, 2011. 
Deadline to register to speak in person, speak by calling in, or to listen only by phone [See also Registration] ........ September 23, 2011. 
Agenda released on regs.dot.gov and MarAd Web site ................................................................................................ September 28, 2011. 
Call-in and Listen-only info distributed to registrants ..................................................................................................... September 28, 2011. 
Deadline to submit any digital presentation materials ................................................................................................... September 28, 2011. 
Public Meeting ................................................................................................................................................................ October 3, 2011— 

1 p.m.–4 p.m. 

ADDRESSES: The public meeting will be 
held in the DOT Conference Center 
rooms 8–10, located on the ground floor 
of 1200 New Jersey Avenue, SE., 
Washington, DC 20590. The conference 
rooms will be open at noon to 
accommodate early arrivals. Overflow 
seating will be available in the adjacent 
conference room 6. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Christine S. Gurland, Assistant Chief 
Counsel for Legislation and Regulations, 
Office of the Chief Counsel, Mar 225, 
Maritime Administration, 1200 New 
Jersey Avenue, Washington, DC 20590; 
(202) 366–5157; e-mail: 
Christine.Gurland@dot.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

On January 18, 2011, President 
Obama issued Executive Order 13563, 
which outlined a plan to improve 
regulation and regulatory review (76 FR 
3821, 1/21/11). Executive Order 13563 
reaffirms and builds upon governing 
principles of contemporary regulatory 
review, including Executive Order 
12866, ‘‘Regulatory Planning and 
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Review,’’ (58 FR 51735, 10/4/1993), by 
requiring Federal agencies to design 
cost-effective, evidence-based 
regulations that are compatible with 
economic growth, job creation, and 
competitiveness. The President’s plan 
recognizes that these principles should 
not only guide the Federal government’s 
approach to new regulations, but to 
existing ones as well. To that end, 
Executive Order 13563 requires agencies 
to review existing significant rules to 
determine if they are outmoded, 
ineffective, insufficient, or excessively 
burdensome. 

Accordingly, the Maritime 
Administration is soliciting public 
comment concerning amendment of its 
cargo preference regulations governing 
the carriage of imports and exports, 
other than those shipped by the 
Department of Defense. MarAd is 
considering updating and clarifying its 
regulations at 46 CFR parts 381 and 382, 
and establishing procedures to ensure 
compliance with the cargo preference 
statutes and regulations in a new part 
383. Part 381 implements the 
requirements of Section 901 of the 
Merchant Marine Act, 1936, as amended 
(46 U.S.C. sections 55304 through 
55317) (the Act). The Act requires that 
a specified percentage of ocean-going 
cargo generated by Government 
programs be transported in U.S.-flag, 
privately owned, commercial vessels. 
The Act also authorizes the Maritime 
Administration to issue regulations 
governing the administration of these 
cargo preference requirements. MarAd 
is considering amending existing 
regulations in order to provide for a 
more easily administered system of 
regulations to benefit shippers and 
shipper agencies in meeting statutory 
requirements. 

As Executive Order 13563 reaffirms, 
the regulatory process must be 
transparent and provide opportunities 
for public participation. MarAd 
particularly believes that the review of 
its cargo preference regulations will be 
more meaningful if it involves input 
from those affected by those regulations. 

Public Meeting Procedures 
1. The public meeting will be 

broadcast live via Web streaming and a 
listen-only telephone line. The public 
may access the live Web streaming by a 
link from http://www.marad.dot.gov. 
Listen-only telephone line participants 
must register in order to obtain the 
telephone number. 

2. Members of the public are invited 
to make comments in person at the 
venue, through a call-in number, or by 
entry in the Maritime Administration 
docket. When registering to speak in 

person or by telephone, please estimate 
the amount of time that you would like 
to use for your presentation; final times 
will be allotted to participants based on 
the time available and the issues raised. 

3. Those who wish to speak during 
the meeting are requested to advise, at 
the time of registration, what topic or 
topics they would like to comment on; 
amplifying information will be welcome 
but is not required. For example, 
comments may focus on, but are not 
limited to, the following topics: 
Implementation of the National export 
policy; Transparency of program 
transactions; Ease and flexibility of use; 
Market competition; Government cost 
control; Stability of the investment 
environment; Enhancement of the 
Nation’s sealift capability; and Program 
enforcement mechanisms. 

4. Any digital presentation materials 
for the meeting should be submitted to 
Thelma Goldring no later than 
September 28, 2011. [See Registration 
section for contact information.] 

5. We hope to be able to accommodate 
everyone who would like to speak at the 
meeting, but if there are more interested 
participants than time available, we will 
limit participants in order of date and 
time of registration. If available, time 
will be allotted to those attending the 
meeting in person to speak, even if they 
had not previously registered to speak. 
For those who wish to make comments, 
but for whom there is not time available 
or who do not wish to speak, it will be 
possible to post comments to the public 
docket. [See also Maritime 
Administration Docket section.] 

6. In-person attendees are encouraged 
to arrive at least 30 minutes prior to the 
meeting for processing through building 
security. All in-person attendees must 
enter through the New Jersey Avenue 
entrance (West Building—at the corner 
of New Jersey Avenue and M Street, SE). 
Anyone exiting the building for any 
reason will be required to re-enter 
through the security checkpoint at the 
New Jersey Avenue entrance. 

7. Due to security requirements, all in- 
person attendees must bring a 
Government issued form of 
identification (e.g. driver’s license) to 
ensure access to the building. In-person 
attendees who have Federal government 
identification are required to register to 
attend due to space constraints. 
Government issued photo identification 
is required and Foreign National in- 
person attendees must bring their 
passports with them. To facilitate 
security screening, all in-person 
attendees are encouraged to limit bags 
and other items (e.g. mobile phones, 
laptops, cameras, etc.) they bring into 
the building. 

8. Due to space limitations no outside 
videotaping will be allowed. 

9. DOT/MarAd is not able to offer 
visitor parking; we suggest that 
attendees consider using alternative 
means of transportation to the building. 
DOT Headquarters/MarAd is served by 
Metrorail (Navy Yard station), Metrobus, 
DC Circulator, and taxi service. There 
are a number of private parking lots near 
the DOT building, but MarAd cannot 
guarantee the availability of parking 
spaces. 

10. For information on facilities or 
services for persons with disabilities, or 
to request special assistance at the 
meeting, contact Thelma Goldring, 
Office Manager, Office of the Chief 
Counsel, Mar 220, Maritime 
Administration, 1200 New Jersey 
Avenue, SE., Washington, DC 20590; 
(202) 366–5186; 
Thelma.Goldring@dot.gov as soon as 
possible. 

11. We will post the public meeting 
agenda to the docket at http:// 
regs.dot.gov and on our Web site at 
http://www.marad.dot.gov by 
September 28, 2011. 

12. MarAd’s Chief Counsel will 
preside over the public meeting. Senior 
MarAd officials will also attend this 
meeting as part of a panel with the Chief 
Counsel to receive comments from the 
public. During the meeting, we may ask 
questions that will clarify statements or 
gather more information or data to help 
us understand the issues raised by 
commenters. 

13. The meeting is designed to solicit 
public views and gather additional 
information for our regulatory review. 
Therefore, the meeting will be 
conducted in an informal and non- 
adversarial manner. 

14. A transcript of the public meeting 
will be available via our Web site at 
http://www.marad.dot.gov and posted to 
the docket at http://regs.dot.gov. 

Registration 
All in-person attendees, whether or 

not they are planning to provide their 
views to the panel, must register with 
Thelma Goldring, Office Manager, 
Office of the Chief Counsel, Mar 220, 
Maritime Administration, 1200 New 
Jersey Avenue, SE., Washington, DC 
20590; (202) 366–5186; 
Thelma.Goldring@dot.gov no later than 
September 23, 2011. Any person 
wishing to present an oral statement via 
telephone, or any person who would 
like to listen to the meeting over a 
listen-only telephone line must also 
register with Thelma Goldring by 
September 23, 2011. Call-in and listen- 
only telephone numbers will be 
distributed to registered participants on 
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September 28, 2011. Foreign National 
registrants must provide full name, title, 
country of citizenship, date of birth, 
passport number, and passport 
expiration date when registering. 

Because seating space is limited, we 
may have to limit the number of 
attendees in order of date and time of 
registration. 

Maritime Administration Docket 

In order to provide the public with 
alternative means of providing feedback 
to MarAd in ways that may better suit 
their needs, we have provided a docket 
at http://regs.dot.gov to allow for 
submissions to MarAd in a less formal 
manner. The MarAd Docket provides 
members of the public who do not wish 
to make a presentation, cannot make a 
presentation, or who wish to add other 
comments, an opportunity to submit 
their ideas about our Cargo Preference 
regulatory review. 

To ensure that comments are most 
useful in informing our deliberation and 
decision process, you should include 
the docket number (MARAD 2001– 
0121), the citation to the regulation on 
which you are commenting (e.g., 46 CFR 
381.5), a description of any concerns 
regarding the regulation, and any 
supporting information that would 
assist MarAd in making a decision. To 
go directly to the Web site use the 
following link: http://regs.dot.gov. 

Follow-Up Action by MarAd 

Comments received during our review 
will provide meaningful and significant 
information for senior MarAd officials 
assessing the cargo preference 
regulatory process. The recorded 
webcast video will remain available 
following the meeting via a link from 
our Web site at http:// 
www.marad.dot.gov. 

Privacy Act Statement 

Anyone is able to search all comments 
entered into any of our dockets by the 
name of the individual submitting the 
comment (or signing the comment, if 
submitted on behalf of an association, 
business, labor union, etc.). You may 
review DOT’s complete Privacy Act 
Statement in the Federal Register 
published on April 11, 2000 (65 FR 
19476, 04/11/2011) or at http:// 
www.dot.gov/privacy.html. 

Authority: 5 U.S.C. 610; E.O., 13563, 76 
FR 3821, Jan. 21, 2011; E.O. 12866, 58 FR 
51735, Oct. 4, 1993. 

Issued on September 16, 2011 in 
Washington, DC. 

By Order of the Maritime Administrator 
Maritime Subsidy Board. 

Dated: September 14, 2011. 
Julie Agarwal, 
Secretary, Maritime Administration. 
[FR Doc. 2011–23983 Filed 9–16–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4910–81–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Fish and Wildlife Service 

50 CFR Part 17 

[Docket No. FWS–R3–ES–2011–0029; 
92220–1113–000; ABC Code: C6] 

RIN 1018–AX57 

Endangered and Threatened Wildlife 
and Plants; Revising the List of 
Endangered and Threatened Wildlife 
for the Gray Wolf (Canis lupus) in the 
Eastern United States 

AGENCY: Fish and Wildlife Service, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Proposed rule; supplementary 
materials. 

SUMMARY: On May 5, 2011, we, the U.S. 
Fish and Wildlife Service, published a 
proposed rule to reevaluate the listing of 
the Minnesota population of gray 
wolves (Canis lupus) under the 
Endangered Species Act of 1973, as 
amended, and revise the listing to 
conform to current statutory and policy 
requirements. On August 26, 2011, we 
announced the reopening of the 
comment period for our May 5, 2011, 
proposed rule to provide for public 
review and comment of additional 
information regarding our recognition of 
C. lycaon as a separate species. We are 
publishing this notice to inform the 
public that supplementary materials are 
electronically available at http:// 
www.regulations.gov. 

DATES: The comment period closes on 
close of business September 26, 2011. 
Any comments that we receive after the 
closing date may not be considered in 
the final decision on this action. 
ADDRESSES: 

Document availability: See 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION for 
information on how to access the 
supplementary materials. 

Comment submission: You may 
submit comments by one of the 
following methods: 

Electronically: Go to the Federal 
eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. In the Enter 
Keyword or ID box, enter FWS–R3–ES– 
2011–0029, which is the docket number 
for this rulemaking. Then, in the Search 
panel at the top of the screen, under the 
Document Type heading, click on the 

Proposed Rules link to locate this 
document. You may submit a comment 
by clicking on ‘‘Submit a Comment.’’ 

By hard copy: Submit by U.S. mail or 
hand-delivery to: Public Comments 
Processing, Attn: FWS–R3–ES–2011– 
0029, Division of Policy and Directives 
Management, U.S. Fish and Wildlife 
Service, 4401 N. Fairfax Drive, MS 
2042–PDM, Arlington, VA 22203. 

We will post all comments on 
http://www.regulations.gov. This 
generally means that we will post any 
personal information you provide us 
(see the Public Comments Solicited 
section below for more information). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Laura Ragan, 612–713–5350. Direct all 
questions or requests for additional 
information to: Gray Wolf Questions, 
U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, 
Ecological Services, 5600 American 
Blvd. West, Suite 990, Bloomington, MN 
55437–1458. Additional information is 
also available on our Web site at 
http://www.fws.gov/midwest/wolf. 
Individuals who are hearing-impaired or 
speech-impaired may call the Federal 
Relay Service at 1–800–877–8337 for 
TTY assistance. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

In the August 26, 2011, Federal 
Register (76 FR 53379), we announced 
the reopening of the comment period for 
our May 5, 2011, proposed rule (76 FR 
26086) to provide for public review and 
comment of additional information 
regarding our recognition of the eastern 
wolf, Canis lycaon, as a separate 
species, including, in particular, a 
manuscript prepared by Service 
employees that is currently undergoing 
review for publication (Chambers et al., 
in prep.). In recognition of intellectual 
property right laws, the manuscript 
made available on August 26 provided 
readers with references to the sources of 
nine copyrighted figures, but did not 
include the figures themselves. We have 
since obtained approval to include the 
nine copyrighted figures in the 
manuscript made available for public 
review. On September 7, 2011, we 
posted the manuscript with the nine 
copyrighted figures at http:// 
www.regulations.gov at Docket No. 
FWS–R3–ES–2011–0029 to replace the 
version made available on August 26. 

Public Comments Solicited 

We intend that any final action 
resulting from this proposal will be as 
accurate and as effective as possible. 
Therefore, we hereby request data, 
comments, new information, or 
suggestions from the public, other 
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