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(a) Any needed revisions to the 
statement of support and commitment 
included in the full application for each 
of the required SS/HS partners 
(described in the letters of commitment 
submitted with the full application) to 
implement the project. 

(b) A roster of the core management 
team (as defined in this notice) that 
clearly defines how each member of the 
team will support the SS/HS project 
director in the day-to-day management 
of the project. 

(c) Any needed revisions to the 
process for involving multiple and 
diverse sectors of the community in the 
implementation and continuous 
improvement of the project. 

(d) A logic model that identifies needs 
or gaps and connects those needs or 
gaps with corresponding project goals, 
objectives, activities, partners’ roles, 
outcomes, and outcome measures for 
each of the SS/HS elements. 

(e) A description of the procedures to 
be used for referral, treatment, and 
follow-up for children and adolescents 
in need of mental health services and an 
assurance that the local public mental 
health authority will provide 
administrative control or oversight of 
the delivery of mental health services. 

TRAC (Transformation Accountability 
System) means the system the 
Department of Health and Human 
Services, Substance Abuse and Mental 
Health Services Administration 
(SAMHSA), Center for Mental Health 
Services (CMHS) uses to collect 
Government Performance and Results 
Act performance measure data for the 
SS/HS program. 

Final Priorities, Requirements, and 
Definitions 

We will announce the final priorities, 
requirements, and definitions in a 
notice in the Federal Register. We will 
determine the final priorities, 
requirements, and definitions after 
considering responses to this notice and 
other information available to the 
Department. This notice does not 
preclude us from proposing additional 
priorities, requirements, definitions, or 
selection criteria, subject to meeting 
applicable rulemaking requirements. 

Note: This notice does not solicit 
applications. In any year in which we choose 
to use one or more of these priorities, 
requirements, and definitions, we invite 
applications through a notice in the Federal 
Register. 

Executive Order 12866: This notice 
has been reviewed in accordance with 
Executive Order 12866. Under the terms 
of the order, we have assessed the 
potential costs and benefits of this 
proposed regulatory action. 

The potential costs associated with 
this proposed regulatory action are 
those resulting from statutory 
requirements and those we have 
determined as necessary for 
administering this program effectively 
and efficiently. 

In assessing the potential costs and 
benefits—both quantitative and 
qualitative—of this proposed regulatory 
action, we have determined that the 
benefits of the proposed priorities, 
requirements, and definitions justify the 
costs. 

We have determined, also, that this 
proposed regulatory action does not 
unduly interfere with State, local, and 
Tribal governments in the exercise of 
their governmental functions. 

Discussion of Costs and Benefits: The 
Secretary believes that the costs 
imposed on an applicant by the 
proposed priorities, requirements, and 
definitions would be related to 
preparing an application, including but 
not limited to staff time, copying, and 
mailing or delivery and are minimal for 
the pre-application. Additional costs 
may be incurred by those applicants 
invited to submit a full application but 
the benefits of these proposed priorities, 
requirements, and definitions are 
significant Federal assistance to fund 
the implementation and enhancement of 
prevention and intervention activities, 
curricula, programs, and services would 
outweigh any costs incurred by the 
applicant. Additionally, the required 
SS/HS partners should bring 
intellectual, human, and financial 
resources to the grant application 
process, thereby reducing or eliminating 
costs the applicant may incur. 

Intergovernmental Review: This 
program is subject to Executive Order 
12372 and the regulations in 34 CFR 
part 79. One of the objectives of the 
Executive order is to foster an 
intergovernmental partnership and a 
strengthened federalism. The Executive 
order relies on processes developed by 
State and local governments for 
coordination and review of proposed 
Federal financial assistance. 

This document provides early 
notification of our specific plans and 
actions for this program. 

Accessible Format: Individuals with 
disabilities can obtain this document in 
an accessible format (e.g., braille, large 
print, audiotape, or computer diskette) 
on request to the program contact 
person listed under FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT. 

Electronic Access to This Document: 
You can view this document, as well as 
all other documents of this Department 
published in the Federal Register, in 
text or Adobe Portable Document 

Format (PDF) on the Internet at the 
following site: http://www.ed.gov/news/ 
fedregister. To use PDF you must have 
Adobe Acrobat Reader, which is 
available free at this site. 

Note: The official version of this document 
is the document published in the Federal 
Register. Free Internet access to the official 
edition of the Federal Register and the Code 
of Federal Regulations is available on GPO 
Access at: http://www.gpoaccess.gov/nara/ 
index.html. 

Dated: February 14, 2011. 
Kevin Jennings, 
Assistant Deputy Secretary for Safe and Drug- 
Free Schools. 
[FR Doc. 2011–3788 Filed 2–17–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Environmental Management Site- 
Specific Advisory Board, Oak Ridge 
Reservation 

AGENCY: Department of Energy. 
ACTION: Notice of Open Meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces a 
meeting of the Environmental 
Management Site-Specific Advisory 
Board (EM SSAB), Oak Ridge 
Reservation. The Federal Advisory 
Committee Act (Pub. L. 92–463, 86 Stat. 
770) requires that public notice of this 
meeting be announced in the Federal 
Register. 

DATES: Wednesday, March 9, 2011, 
6 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: DOE Information Center, 
475 Oak Ridge Turnpike, Oak Ridge, 
Tennessee 37830. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Patricia J. Halsey, Federal Coordinator, 
Department of Energy Oak Ridge 
Operations Office, P.O. Box 2001, EM– 
90, Oak Ridge, TN 37831. Phone (865) 
576–4025; Fax (865) 576–2347 or e-mail: 
halseypj@oro.doe.gov or check the Web 
site at http://www.oakridge.doe.gov/em/ 
ssab. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Purpose of the Board: The purpose of 
the Board is to make recommendations 
to DOE–EM and site management in the 
areas of environmental restoration, 
waste management, and related 
activities. 

Tentative Agenda: The main meeting 
presentation will be on the results of the 
Study to Re-examine Options for 
Downblending Uranium-233 in Building 
3019 at Oak Ridge National Laboratory. 

Public Participation: The EM SSAB, 
Oak Ridge, welcomes the attendance of 
the public at its advisory committee 
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meetings and will make every effort to 
accommodate persons with physical 
disabilities or special needs. If you 
require special accommodations due to 
a disability, please contact Patricia J. 
Halsey at least seven days in advance of 
the meeting at the phone number listed 
above. Written statements may be filed 
with the Board either before or after the 
meeting. Individuals who wish to make 
oral statements pertaining to the agenda 
item should contact Patricia J. Halsey at 
the address or telephone number listed 
above. Requests must be received five 
days prior to the meeting and reasonable 
provision will be made to include the 
presentation in the agenda. The Deputy 
Designated Federal Officer is 
empowered to conduct the meeting in a 
fashion that will facilitate the orderly 
conduct of business. Individuals 
wishing to make public comments will 
be provided a maximum of five minutes 
to present their comments. 

Minutes: Minutes will be available by 
writing or calling Patricia J. Halsey at 
the address and phone number listed 
above. Minutes will also be available at 
the following Web site: http:// 
www.oakridge.doe.gov/em/ssab/ 
minutes.htm. 

Issued at Washington, DC, on February 14, 
2011. 
LaTanya Butler, 
Acting Deputy Committee Management 
Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2011–3702 Filed 2–17–11; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP11–72–000] 

Sabine Pass Liquefaction, LLC and 
Sabine Pass LNG, L.P.; Notice of 
Application 

Take notice that on January 31, 2011, 
Sabine Pass Liquefaction, LLC and 
Sabine Pass LNG, L.P. (collectively, 
Sabine Pass), 700 Milam Street, Suite 
800, Houston, Texas 77002, filed in 
Docket No. CP11–72–000, an 
application, pursuant to section 3(a) of 
the Natural Gas Act (NGA), as amended, 
and part 153 of the Commission’s 
Regulations, to site, construct, and 
operate liquefaction and export facilities 
(Liquefaction Project) at the existing 
Sabine Pass LNG Terminal, located in 
Cameron Parish, Louisiana. The 
Liquefaction Project will provide the 
capability to liquefy domestic natural 
gas supplies for export of approximately 
16 million metric tonnes of liquefied 
natural gas (LNG) per annum, all as 

more fully set forth in the application 
which is on file with the Commission 
and open to public inspection. 

Any questions regarding this 
application should be directed to 
Patricia Outtrim, Sabine Pass LNG, L.P., 
700 Milam Street, Suite 800, Houston, 
Texas 77002, or call (713) 375–5212, or 
by e-mail pat.outtrim@cheniere.com. Or 
contact Lisa M. Tonery, Fulbright & 
Jaworski L.L.P., 666 Fifth Avenue, New 
York, NY 10103, or call (212)318–3009, 
or by e-mail ltonery@fulbright.com. 

Pursuant to section 157.9 of the 
Commission’s rules, 18 CFR 157.9, 
within 90 days of this Notice the 
Commission staff will either: Complete 
its environmental assessment (EA) and 
place it into the Commission’s public 
record (eLibrary) for this proceeding; or 
issue a Notice of Schedule for 
Environmental Review. If a Notice of 
Schedule for Environmental Review is 
issued, it will indicate, among other 
milestones, the anticipated date for the 
Commission staff’s issuance of the final 
environmental impact statement (FEIS) 
or EA for this proposal. The filing of the 
EA in the Commission’s public record 
for this proceeding or the issuance of a 
Notice of Schedule for Environmental 
Review will serve to notify Federal and 
State agencies of the timing for the 
completion of all necessary reviews, and 
the subsequent need to complete all 
Federal authorizations within 90 days of 
the date of issuance of the Commission 
staff’s FEIS or EA. 

On August 4, 2010, the Commission 
staff granted Sabine Pass’ request to 
utilize the Pre-Filing Process and 
assigned Docket No. PF10–24 to staff 
activities involved with Sabine Pass’ 
Liquefaction Project. Now, as of the 
filing of the application on January 31, 
2011, the Pre-Filing Process for this 
project has ended. From this time 
forward, this proceeding will be 
conducted in Docket No. CP11–72–000, 
as noted in the caption of this Notice. 

There are two ways to become 
involved in the Commission’s review of 
this project. First, any person wishing to 
obtain legal status by becoming a party 
to the proceedings for this project 
should, on or before the comment date 
stated below, file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street, NE., Washington, DC 20426, 
a motion to intervene in accordance 
with the requirements of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.214 or 385.211) 
and the Regulations under the NGA (18 
CFR 157.10). A person obtaining party 
status will be placed on the service list 
maintained by the Secretary of the 
Commission and will receive copies of 
all documents filed by the applicant and 

by all other parties. A party must submit 
an original and 7 copies of filings made 
with the Commission and must mail a 
copy to the applicant and to every other 
party in the proceeding. Only parties to 
the proceeding can ask for court review 
of Commission orders in the proceeding. 

However, a person does not have to 
intervene in order to have comments 
considered. The second way to 
participate is by filing with the 
Secretary of the Commission, as soon as 
possible, an original and two copies of 
comments in support of or in opposition 
to this project. The Commission will 
consider these comments in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but the filing of a comment alone 
will not serve to make the filer a party 
to the proceeding. The Commission’s 
rules require that persons filing 
comments in opposition to the project 
provide copies of their protests only to 
the party or parties directly involved in 
the protest. 

Persons who wish to comment only 
on the environmental review of this 
project should submit an original and 
two copies of their comments to the 
Secretary of the Commission. 
Environmental commentors will be 
placed on the Commission’s 
environmental mailing list, will receive 
copies of the environmental documents, 
and will be notified of meetings 
associated with the Commission’s 
environmental review process. 
Environmental commentors will not be 
required to serve copies of filed 
documents on all other parties. 
However, the non-party commentors 
will not receive copies of all documents 
filed by other parties or issued by the 
Commission (except for the mailing of 
environmental documents issued by the 
Commission) and will not have the right 
to seek court review of the 
Commission’s final order. 

The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings of comments, protests 
and interventions in lieu of paper using 
the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 7 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. This filing is accessible on-line 
at http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
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