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• Update on Clearinghouse Project 
III. State Advisory Committee Issues 

• Kentucky SAC 
• Maryland SAC 
• Vermont SAC 
• Wisconsin SAC 
• Update on Status of Remaining 

SACs to Recharter 
IV. Management & Operations 

• Expiration of Commissioner Terms 
V. Approval of Minutes of October 8 

Meeting 
VI. Adjourn 
CONTACT PERSON FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION: Lenore Ostrowsky, Acting 
Chief, Public Affairs Unit (202) 376– 
8591. TDD: (202) 376–8116. 

Persons with a disability requiring 
special services, such as an interpreter 
for the hearing impaired, should contact 
Pamela Dunston at least seven days 
prior to the meeting at 202–376–8105. 
TDD: (202) 376–8116. 

Dated: November 17, 2010. 
David Blackwood, 
General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2010–29347 Filed 11–17–10; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE 6335–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for clearance the 
following proposal for collection of 
information under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (44 U.S.C. 
chapter 35). 

Agency: National 
Telecommunications and Information 
Administration (NTIA). 

Title: NTIA Broadband Technology 
Opportunities Program Post-Award 
Quarterly and Annual Performance 
Progress Reports. 

OMB Control Number: 0660–0037. 
Form Number(s): None. 
Type of Request: Regular submission 

(revision and extension of a currently 
approved information collection). 

Burden Hours: 

Infrastructure and Comprehensive 
Community Infrastructure Reports 
(Quarterly and Annually) 

Number of Respondents: 123. 
Estimated Number of Responses per 

Respondent: 5. 
Estimated Number of Responses: 615. 
Average Burden Hours per Response: 

4.80. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden 

Hours: 2,952. 

Public Computer Center Reports 
(Quarterly and Annually) 

Number of Respondents: 65. 
Estimated Number of Responses per 

Respondent: 5. 
Estimated Number of Responses: 325. 
Average Burden Hours per Response: 

4.1. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden 

Hours: 1,333. 

Sustainable Broadband Adoption 
Application Reports (Quarterly and 
Annually) 

Number of Respondents: 45. 
Estimated Number of Responses per 

Respondent: 5. 
Estimated Number of Responses: 225. 
Average Burden Hours per Response: 

3.78. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden 

Hours: 851. 
Need and Uses: NTIA collects 

performance progress information 
specific to Infrastructure and 
Comprehensive Community 
Infrastructure, Public Computer Center, 
and Sustainable Broadband Adoption 
BTOP grant recipients in order to 
effectively monitor, manage and 
evaluate individual projects and the 
overall success of the program in 
achieving statutory goals and objectives. 
Quarterly performance progress reports 
ask a series of questions that broadly 
address project progress and monitoring 
needs of program personnel by 
obtaining actual information on 
quarterly and cumulative project and 
milestone progress, and potential 
project barriers, if any. Annual 
performance progress reports ask a 
series of questions that broadly address 
BTOP programmatic objectives and 
outcomes, program compliance 
requirements, and the information 
needs of external audiences, such as 
OMB. 

Affected Public: Businesses or other 
for-profit organizations; not-for-profit 
institutions; and State, local, or Tribal 
government organizations. 

Frequency: Quarterly and annually. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Required to 

retain benefits. 
OMB Desk Officer: Nicholas Fraser, 

(202) 395–5887. 
Copies of the above information 

collection proposal can be obtained by 
calling or writing Diana Hynek, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance 
Officer, (202) 482–0266, Department of 
Commerce, Room 6616, 14th and 
Constitution Avenue, NW., Washington, 
DC 20230 (or via the Internet at 
dHynek@doc.gov). 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 

information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to Nicholas Fraser, OMB Desk 
Officer, FAX number (202) 395–5806, or 
via the Internet at Nicholas_A_Fraser@
omb.eop.gov. 

Dated: November 15, 2010. 
Gwellnar Banks, 
Management Analyst, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–29157 Filed 11–18–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–60–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

The Department of Commerce will 
submit to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for clearance the 
following proposal for collection of 
information under the provisions of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (44 U.S.C. 
Chapter 35). 

Agency: National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA). 

Title: Southwest Region Vessel 
Monitoring System and Pre-Trip 
Reporting Requirements. 

OMB Control Number: 0648–0498. 
Form Number(s): NA. 
Type of Request: Regular submission 

(renewal of an existing information 
collection). 

Number of Respondents: 5. 
Average Hours per Response: Vessel 

monitoring system (VMS) installation, 4 
hours; VMS annual maintenance, 2 
hours; pre-trip notification, 5 minutes. 

Burden Hours: 17. 
Needs and Uses: This submission is 

for renewal of an existing information 
collection. Owners of vessels that fish 
out of West Coast ports for highly 
migratory species (HMS) such as tuna, 
billfish, and sharks are required to 
submit information in regards to their 
planned fishing activities. The 
information will enable the various 
local, national, and regional entities to 
effectively manage and enforce fisheries 
targeting transboundary HMS stocks as 
part of the Fishery Management Plan 
(FMP) for U.S. West Coast Fisheries for 
HMS (developed under the authority of 
the Magnuson-Stevens Fishery 
Conservation and Management Act). 
This information collection addresses 
vessel monitoring systems (VMS) 
requirements and observer pre-trip 
notifications. The information is 
pertinent for the basic monitoring of the 
fishery and to obtain information 
needed by, among other agencies, 
National Marine Fisheries Service 
(NMFS), the United States (U.S.) Coast 
Guard, the Pacific Fishery Management 
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Council, and the Interamerican Tropical 
Tuna Commission to monitor the 
activities of the participating vessels 
and the performance of the fisheries. 
Knowing near real-time VMS position 
information for U.S. West Coast-based 
HMS fishing vessels enables effective 
monitoring of vessel activity for 
enforcement and assessment purposes. 
VMS units also provide confirmation of 
reported vessel fishing activity locations 
and can help in validation of logbook 
records accuracy. The requirements also 
generate information for evaluating the 
magnitude and distribution of impacts 
from any changes in regulations that 
might occur in the future. Observer pre- 
trip notifications allow for the timely 
placement of at-sea observers onboard 
vessels at the discretion of the NMFS to 
collect information on, among other 
things, bycatch and protected species 
interactions. 

Affected Public: Business or other for- 
profit organizations. 

Frequency: Annually and on occasion. 
Respondent’s Obligation: Mandatory. 
OMB Desk Officer: OIRA_

Submission@omb.eop.gov. 
Copies of the above information 

collection proposal can be obtained by 
calling or writing Diana Hynek, 
Departmental Paperwork Clearance 
Officer, (202) 482–0266, Department of 
Commerce, Room 6616, 14th and 
Constitution Avenue, NW., Washington, 
DC 20230 (or via the Internet at 
dHynek@doc.gov). 

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to OIRA_Submission@
omb.eop.gov. 

Dated: November 15, 2010. 
Gwellnar Banks, 
Management Analyst, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–29184 Filed 11–18–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

Proposed Information Collection; 
Comment Request; Reporting of Sea 
Turtle Entanglement in Fishing Gear or 
Marine Debris 

AGENCY: National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration, 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of 
Commerce, as part of its continuing 

effort to reduce paperwork and 
respondent burden, invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
take this opportunity to comment on 
proposed and/or continuing information 
collections, as required by the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Written comments must be 
submitted on or before January 18, 2011. 
ADDRESSES: Direct all written comments 
to Diana Hynek, Departmental 
Paperwork Clearance Officer, 
Department of Commerce, Room 6616, 
14th and Constitution Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC 20230 (or via the 
Internet at dHynek@doc.gov). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
copies of the information collection 
instrument and instructions should be 
directed to Kate Sampson, (978) 282– 
8470 or kate.sampson@noaa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Abstract 
This notice is for renewal of a 

currently approved collection. 
This collection of information 

involves sea turtles becoming 
accidentally entangled in active or 
discarded fixed fishing gear or marine 
debris. These entanglements may 
prevent the recovery of endangered and 
threatened sea turtle populations. The 
National Marine Fisheries Service 
(NMFS) Northeast Region (Maine to 
Virginia) has established the Sea Turtle 
Disentanglement Network to promote 
reporting and increase successful 
disentanglement of sea turtles. This 
Network is made up of sea turtle 
stranding network organizations, as well 
as federal, state, and municipal 
agencies. NMFS relies on the Network 
and opportunistic reports from 
fishermen and recreational boaters for 
information about entangled turtles. The 
information provided will help NMFS 
better assess the threat of sea turtle 
entanglement in vertical lines from 
fixed gear fisheries (lobster, whelk/ 
conch, crab, fish trap, gill net), 
discarded gear and marine debris. 

II. Method of Collection 
Reports are made by telephone, fax, 

standard mail or e-mail. 

III. Data 
OMB Control Number: 0648–0496. 
Form Number: None. 
Type of Review: Regular submission 

(renewal of a currently approved 
collection). 

Affected Public: Business or other for 
profit organizations, individuals or 
households, not-for-profit institutions, 
federal government, and state, local or 
tribal government. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
45. 

Estimated Time Per Response: 1 hour. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden 

Hours: 45. 
Estimated Total Annual Cost to 

Public: $675. 

IV. Request for Comments 
Comments are invited on: (a) Whether 

the proposed collection of information 
is necessary for the proper performance 
of the functions of the agency, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden 
(including hours and cost) of the 
proposed collection of information; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on respondents, including through the 
use of automated collection techniques 
or other forms of information 
technology. 

Comments submitted in response to 
this notice will be summarized and/or 
included in the request for OMB 
approval of this information collection; 
they also will become a matter of public 
record. 

Dated: November 16, 2010. 
Gwellnar Banks, 
Management Analyst, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2010–29225 Filed 11–18–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

[A–351–503, C–351–504, A–122–503, A–570– 
502] 

Certain Iron Construction Castings 
From Brazil, Canada, and the People’s 
Republic of China: Continuation of 
Antidumping and Countervailing Duty 
Orders 

AGENCY: Import Administration, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 
SUMMARY: As a result of the 
determinations by the Department of 
Commerce (‘‘the Department’’) that 
revocation of the antidumping duty 
(‘‘AD’’) orders on certain iron 
construction castings (‘‘castings’’) from 
Brazil, Canada, and the People’s 
Republic of China (‘‘PRC’’) would likely 
lead to continuation or recurrence of 
dumping, that revocation of the 
countervailing duty (‘‘CVD’’) order on 
castings from Brazil would likely lead to 
continuation or recurrence of a 
countervailable subsidy, and the 
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