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(b) During the summer months, the 
Kenai LNG Facility’s base level of 
demand will ensure that production 
from natural gas wells are not curtailed 
or shut-in, thereby protecting reserves 
and well deliverability to serve utility 
demand during the colder months. 

Third, the Applicants maintain that in 
the longer term, the maintenance of the 
Kenai LNG Facility creates options for 
future uses that would enhance natural 
gas supplies for local consumption, 
including possible retrofitting of the 
facility to provide regasification 
capacity so that it could function as a 
storage facility; conversion into an 
import and LNG regasification terminal; 
and use of the existing terminal for 
exports to support the economic 
viability of a ‘‘bullet line’’ from Alaska’s 
North Slope. 

Fourth, the Applicants submit that a 
number of studies of natural gas 
reserves support the conclusion that 
there are sufficient supplies to satisfy 
local demand and the proposed export 
authorization. 

Fifth, with the recent execution of two 
natural gas supply contracts with local 
utilities, the Applicants maintain that 
virtually all of the local utilities’ 
projected gas needs through the term of 
the requested authorization will be 
satisfied; and Applicants, as suppliers to 
these utilities, will take their supply 
obligations into account in determining 
the extent to which to use their 
requested export authorization. 

Sixth, the Applicants contend that the 
Kenai LNG Facility provides local 
economic benefits, including as an 
employer and as a source of royalties 
and taxes for the State of Alaska and the 
Kenai Peninsula Borough. 

Request for Expedited Action 

Applicants request that FE act upon 
their application as expeditiously as 
possible, preferably within 90 days. 

Environmental Impact 

Applicants state that approval of the 
requested export authorization is not a 
major Federal action significantly 
affecting the quality of the human 
environment within the meaning of the 
National Environmental Policy Act of 
1969, 42 U.S.C. 4321 et seq., and no 
environmental impact statement or 
environmental assessment is required. 
Applicants state that the proposed 
export of LNG would not require any 
changes to the Kenai LNG Facility. 
Applicants state that the LNG 
manufacturing and storage facilities that 
will be utilized during the blanket 
authorization already exist and have 
been operated safely without major 

disruption of supply or accident from 
their startup in 1969. 

DOE/FE Evaluation 
This export application will be 

reviewed pursuant to section 3 of the 
NGA, as amended, and the authority 
contained in DOE Delegation Order No. 
00–002.00I (Nov. 10, 2009) and DOE 
Redelegation Order No. 00–002.04D 
(Nov. 6, 2007). In reviewing this LNG 
export application, DOE will consider 
domestic need for the gas, as well as any 
other issues determined to be 
appropriate, including whether the 
arrangement is consistent with DOE’s 
policy of promoting competition in the 
marketplace by allowing commercial 
parties to freely negotiate their own 
trade arrangements. Parties that may 
oppose this application should 
comment in their responses on these 
issues. 

The National Environmental Policy 
Act (NEPA), 42 U.S.C. 4321 et seq., 
requires DOE to give appropriate 
consideration to the environmental 
effects of its proposed decisions. No 
final decision will be issued in this 
proceeding until DOE has met its NEPA 
responsibilities. 

Public Comment Procedures 
In response to this notice, any person 

may file a protest, motion to intervene, 
or notice of intervention and written 
comments, as provided in DOE’s 
regulations at 10 CFR 590.301, et seq. 
Any person wishing to become a party 
to the proceeding and to have their 
written comments considered as a basis 
for any decision on the application must 
file a motion to intervene or notice of 
intervention, as applicable. The filing of 
a protest with respect to the application 
will not serve to make the protestant a 
party to the proceeding, although 
protests and comments received from 
persons who are not parties will be 
considered in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken on the 
application. All protests, motions to 
intervene, notices of intervention, and 
written comments must meet the 
requirements specified by the 
regulations in 10 CFR part 590. Protests, 
motions to intervene, notices of 
intervention, requests for additional 
procedures, and written comments shall 
be filed with the Office of Oil and Gas 
Global Security and Supply at the 
address listed above. 

A decisional record on the application 
will be developed through responses to 
this notice by parties, including the 
parties’ written comments and replies 
thereto. Additional procedures will be 
used as necessary to achieve a complete 
understanding of the facts and issues. A 

party seeking intervention may request 
that additional procedures be provided, 
such as additional written comments, an 
oral presentation, a conference, or trial- 
type hearing. Any request to file 
additional written comments should 
explain why they are necessary. Any 
request for an oral presentation should 
identify the substantial question of fact, 
law, or policy at issue, show that it is 
material and relevant to a decision in 
the proceeding, and demonstrate why 
an oral presentation is needed. Any 
request for a conference should 
demonstrate why the conference would 
materially advance the proceeding. Any 
request for a trial-type hearing must 
show that there are factual issues 
genuinely in dispute that are relevant 
and material to a decision and that a 
trial-type hearing is necessary for a full 
and true disclosure of the facts. 

If an additional procedure is 
scheduled, notice will be provided to all 
parties. If no party requests additional 
procedures, a final Opinion and Order 
may be issued based on the official 
record, including the application and 
responses filed by parties pursuant to 
this notice, in accordance with 10 CFR 
590.316. 

The application filed by Applicants is 
available for inspection and copying in 
the Office of Oil and Gas Global 
Security and Supply docket room, 3E– 
042, 1000 Independence Avenue, SW., 
Washington, DC 20585. The docket 
room is open between the hours of 8 
a.m. and 4:30 p.m., Monday through 
Friday, except Federal holidays. The 
application is also available 
electronically by going to the following 
Web address: http://www.fe.doe.gov/ 
programs/gasregulation/index.html. 

Issued in Washington, DC on June 28, 
2010. 
John A. Anderson, 
Manager, Natural Gas Regulatory Activities, 
Office of Oil and Gas Global Security and 
Supply, Office of Fossil Energy. 
[FR Doc. 2010–16042 Filed 6–30–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6450–01–P 

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE 
CORPORATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection 
Renewal; Comment Request 

AGENCY: Federal Deposit Insurance 
Corporation (FDIC). 
ACTION: Notice and request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The FDIC, as part of its 
continuing effort to reduce paperwork 
and respondent burden, invites the 
general public and other federal 
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agencies to take this opportunity to 
comment on a continuing information 
collection, as required by the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 
chapter 35). Currently, the FDIC is 
soliciting comments concerning the 
collection of information titled: Asset 
Securitization (3064–0137). 
DATES: Comments must be submitted on 
or before August 30, 2010. 
ADDRESSES: Interested parties are 
invited to submit written comments. All 
comments should refer to the name and 
number of the collection. Comments 
may be submitted by any of the 
following methods: 

• http://www.FDIC.gov/regulations/ 
laws/federal/notices.html. 

• E-mail: comments@fdic.gov. 
• Mail: Gary A. Kuiper (202–898– 

3877), Federal Deposit Insurance 
Corporation, 550 17th Street, NW., F– 
1072, Washington, DC 20429. 

• Hand Delivery: Comments may be 
hand-delivered to the guard station at 
the rear of the 550 17th Street Building 
(located on F Street), on business days 
between 7 a.m. and 5 p.m. 

A copy of the comments may also be 
submitted to the OMB Desk Officer for 
the FDIC, Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Washington, 
DC 20503. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Gary 
A. Kuiper (address above). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The FDIC 
is proposing to renew, without change, 
the following information collection. 

Title: Interagency Guidance on Asset 
Securitization Activities. 

OMB Number: 3064–0137. 
Form Number: None. 
Frequency of Response: On occasion. 
Affected Public: Insured state 

nonmember banks involved in asset 
securitization activities. 

Estimated Number of Responses: 20. 
Estimated Time per Response: 7.45 

hours. 
Total Annual Burden: 149 hours. 
General Description of Collection: The 

collection applies to institutions 
engaged in asset securitization and 
consists of a written asset securitization 
policy, the documentation of fair value 
of retained interests, and a management 
information system to monitor 
securitization activities. Bank 
management uses this information as 
the basis for the safe and sound 
operation of their asset securitization 
activities and to ensure that they 
minimize operational risk in these 
activities. The FDIC uses the 
information to evaluate the quality of a 
bank’s risk management practices. The 

FDIC also uses the information to assist 
banks lacking proper internal 
supervision of their asset securitization 
activities with the implementation of 
corrective action to ensure that the 
activities are conducted in a safe and 
sound manner. 

Request for Comment 
Comments are invited on: (a) Whether 

this collection of information is 
necessary for the proper performance of 
the FDIC’s functions, including whether 
the information has practical utility; (b) 
the accuracy of the estimate of the 
burden of the information collection, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (c) 
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the information collection on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

At the end of the comment period, the 
comments and recommendations 
received will be analyzed to determine 
the extent to which the collection 
should be modified prior to submission 
to OMB for review and approval. 
Comments submitted in response to this 
notice also will be summarized or 
included in the FDIC’s request to OMB 
for renewal of this collection. All 
comments will become a matter of 
public record. 

Dated at Washington, DC, this 28th day of 
June, 2010. 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 
Valerie J. Best, 
Assistant Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2010–16030 Filed 6–30–10; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

FEDERAL MINE SAFETY AND HEALTH 
REVIEW COMMISSION 

Sunshine Act Notice 

June 21, 2010. 

TIME AND DATE: 10 a.m., Thursday, July 
1, 2010. 
PLACE: The Richard V. Backley Hearing 
Room, 9th Floor, 601 New Jersey 
Avenue, NW., Washington, DC. 
STATUS: Open. 
MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED: The 
Commission will consider and act upon 
the following in open session: Secretary 
of Labor v. Wolf Run Mining Company, 
Docket Nos. WEVA 2006–853, et al. 
(Issues include whether the 
administrative law judge erred in ruling 
on alleged violations of the regulatory 
standard requiring the use of lightning 
arresters in certain situations.) 

Any person attending this meeting 
who requires special accessibility 
features and/or auxiliary aids, such as 
sign language interpreters, must inform 
the Commission in advance of those 
needs. Subject to 29 CFR 2706.150(a)(3) 
and 2706.160(d). 
CONTACT PERSON FOR MORE INFO: Jean 
Ellen (202) 434–9950/(202) 708–9300 
for TDD Relay/1–800–877–8339 for toll 
free. 

Jean H. Ellen, 
Chief Docket Clerk. 
[FR Doc. 2010–16123 Filed 6–29–10; 11:15 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Announcement of Board 
Approval Under Delegated Authority 
and Submission to OMB 

SUMMARY: Background. Notice is hereby 
given of the final approval of a proposed 
information collection by the Board of 
Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System (Board) under OMB delegated 
authority, as per 5 CFR 1320.16 (OMB 
Regulations on Controlling Paperwork 
Burdens on the Public). Board-approved 
collections of information are 
incorporated into the official OMB 
inventory of currently approved 
collections of information. Copies of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act Submission, 
supporting statements and approved 
collection of information instrument(s) 
are placed into OMB’s public docket 
files. The Federal Reserve may not 
conduct or sponsor, and the respondent 
is not required to respond to, an 
information collection that has been 
extended, revised, or implemented on or 
after October 1, 1995, unless it displays 
a currently valid OMB control number. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Federal Reserve Board Clearance 
Officer—Michelle Shore—Division of 
Research and Statistics, Board of 
Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, Washington, DC 20551 (202– 
452–3829). 

OMB Desk Officer—Shagufta 
Ahmed—Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Office of 
Management and Budget, New 
Executive Office Building, Room 10235, 
Washington, DC 20503. 

Report title: Reporting and Disclosure 
Requirements Associated with the 
Policy on Payments System Risk. 

Agency form number: FR 4102. 
OMB control number: 7100–0315. 
Frequency: Biennial. 
Reporters: Payment and securities 

settlement systems. 
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