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NAAQS, if appropriate, based on the 
revised air quality criteria. 

Carbon monoxide (CO) is one of six 
‘‘criteria’’ pollutants for which EPA has 
established NAAQS. Periodically, EPA 
reviews the scientific basis for these 
standards by preparing an Integrated 
Science Assessment (ISA) (formerly 
called an Air Quality Criteria 
Document). The ISA and supplementary 
annexes, in conjunction with additional 
technical and policy assessments, 
provide the scientific basis for EPA 
decisions on the adequacy of the current 
NAAQS and the appropriateness of 
possible alternative standards. The 
Clean Air Scientific Advisory 
Committee (CASAC), an independent 
science advisory committee whose 
review and advisory functions are 
mandated by Section 109(d)(2) of the 
Clean Air Act, is charged (among other 
things) with independent scientific 
review of EPA’s air quality criteria. 

On September 13, 2007 (72 FR 52369), 
EPA formally initiated its current 
review of the air quality criteria for CO, 
requesting the submission of recent 
scientific information on specified 
topics. A workshop was held on January 
28–29, 2008 (73 FR 2490) to discuss 
policy-relevant science to inform EPA’s 
planning for the CO NAAQS review. In 
March 2008, a draft of EPA’s ‘‘Plan for 
Review of the National Ambient Air 
Quality Standards for Carbon 
Monoxide’’ (EPA–452/D–08–001) was 
made available for public comment and 
was discussed by the CASAC via a 
publicly accessible teleconference 
consultation on April 8, 2008 (73 FR 
12998). EPA finalized the plan and 
made it available in August 2008 (EPA/ 
452/R–08/005; http://www.epa.gov/ttn/ 
naaqs/standards/co/s_co_cr_pd.html). 
In November 2008, EPA held an 
authors’ teleconference to discuss, with 
invited scientific experts, preliminary 
draft materials prepared during the 
ongoing development of the CO ISA and 
its supplementary annexes. 

The First External Review Draft ISA 
for CO (EPA/600/R–09/019; http:// 
cfpub.epa.gov/ncea/cfm/ 
recordisplay.cfm?deid=203935) was 
released for public comment and 
CASAC review on March 12, 2009 (74 
FR 10734). This document was 
reviewed by the CASAC review panel 
and discussed at a public meeting held 
May 12–13, 2009 (74 FR 15265). The 
CASAC held a follow-up public 
teleconference on June 17, 2009 (74 FR 
25530) to review and approve the 
CASAC CO Review Panel’s draft letter 
providing comments to EPA on the First 
External Review Draft ISA for CO. 
Following the teleconference, CASAC 
sent a final letter report to EPA on June 

24, 2009 (http://yosemite.epa.gov/sab/ 
sabproduct.nsf/4620a620d0120f
93852572410080d786/
6E648129288BF930852575D
F0070A528/$File/EPA-CASAC-09-011- 
unsigned.pdf). 

The Second External Review Draft 
ISA for CO (EPA/600/R–09/019B;  
http://cfpub.epa.gov/ncea/cfm/
recordisplay.cfm?deid=213229), which 
took into consideration comments by 
CASAC and the public on the First 
External Review Draft, was released for 
public comment and CASAC review on 
September 23, 2009 (74 FR 48536). This 
document was reviewed by the CASAC 
review panel and discussed at a public 
meeting held November 16–17, 2009 (74 
FR 54042). The CASAC held a follow- 
up public teleconference on December 
22, 2009 to review and approve the 
CASAC CO Review Panel’s draft letter 
providing comments to EPA on the 
Second External Review Draft ISA for 
CO. The final letter report can be 
obtained from the CASAC Web site 
(http://yosemite.epa.gov/sab/ 
sabpeople.nsf/WebCommittees/CASAC). 
EPA has considered comments by 
CASAC and by the public in preparing 
this final ISA. 

Dated: January 13, 2010. 
Rebecca Clark, 
Acting Director, National Center for 
Environmental Assessment. 
[FR Doc. 2010–1359 Filed 1–28–10; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: The EPA Science Advisory 
Board (SAB) Staff Office announces two 
public teleconferences of the Chartered 
Science Advisory Board to discuss 
EPA’s requested research budget for 
Fiscal Year 2011. 
DATES: The teleconference dates are 
February 19, 2010 from 1 p.m. to 4 p.m. 
(Eastern Time) and February 24, 2010 
from 12:30 p.m. to 3:30 p.m. (Eastern 
Time). 
ADDRESSES: The teleconferences will be 
conducted by telephone only. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Any 
member of the public wishing to obtain 
general information concerning this 

public teleconference should contact Dr. 
Angela Nugent, Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO), EPA Science Advisory 
Board (1400F), 1200 Pennsylvania Ave., 
NW., Washington, DC 20460; via 
telephone/voice mail: (202) 343–9981; 
fax: (202) 233–0643; or e-mail at 
nugent.angela@epa.gov. General 
information concerning the EPA Science 
Advisory Board can be found on the 
SAB Web site at http://www.epa.gov/ 
sab. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The SAB 
was established by 42 U.S.C. 4365 to 
provide independent scientific and 
technical advice to the Administrator on 
the technical basis for Agency positions 
and regulations. The SAB is a Federal 
advisory committee chartered under the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA), as amended, 5 U.S.C., App 2. 
The SAB will comply with the 
provisions of FACA and all appropriate 
SAB Staff Office procedural policies. 
Pursuant to the Federal Advisory 
Committee Act, Public Law 92–463, 
notice is hereby given that the chartered 
SAB will hold two public 
teleconferences to discuss the 
President’s requested Fiscal Year 2011 
Budget to support EPA research needs. 

Background: The chartered SAB 
conducts a review of the EPA research 
budget annually and provides written 
comments to the EPA Administrator and 
to Congress, if requested, on the 
adequacy of EPA’s requested research 
budget. At the teleconferences, the 
chartered SAB will receive briefings on 
the requested research budget for Fiscal 
Year 2011 and develop major comments 
on the budget, in light of EPA’s research 
needs. Previous SAB budget advisories 
are on the SAB Web site at http:// 
www.epa.gov/sab. 

Availability of Meeting Materials: The 
agendas and other materials in support 
of the teleconferences will be placed on 
the SAB Web site at http:// 
www.epa.gov/sab in advance. 

Procedures for Providing Public Input: 
Interested members of the public may 
submit relevant written or oral 
information for the SAB to consider on 
the topics included in this advisory 
activity. Oral Statements: In general, 
individuals or groups requesting an oral 
presentation at a public teleconference 
will be limited to three minutes per 
speaker, with no more than a total of 
one-half hour for all speakers. Interested 
parties should contact Dr. Nugent, DFO, 
in writing (preferably via e-mail) at the 
contact information noted above for the 
February 19, 2010 teleconference by 
February 16, 2010 to be placed on a list 
of public speakers for the 
teleconference. Interested parties should 
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contact Dr. Nugent, for the February 24, 
2010 teleconference by February 23, 
2010 to be placed on the list of public 
speakers for the February 24, 2010 
teleconference. Written Statements: 
Written statements for the February 19, 
2010 teleconference should be received 
in the SAB Staff Office by February 16, 
2010 and written statements for the 
February 24, 2010 teleconference should 
be received in the SAB Staff Office by 
February 23, 2010 so that the 
information may be made available to 
the chartered SAB members for their 
consideration and placed on the SAB 
Web site for public information. Written 
statements should be supplied to the 
DFO in the following formats: one hard 
copy with original signature, and one 
electronic copy via e-mail (acceptable 
file format: Adobe Acrobat PDF, 
WordPerfect, MS Word, MS PowerPoint, 
or Rich Text files in IBM–PC/Windows 
98/2000/XP format). Submitters are 
asked to provide versions of each 
document submitted with and without 
signatures, because the SAB Staff Office 
does not publish documents with 
signatures on its Web sites. 

Accessibility: For information on 
access or services for individuals with 
disabilities, please contact Dr. Angela 
Nugent at (202) 343–9981, or 
nugent.angela@epa.gov. To request 
accommodation of a disability, please 
contact Dr. Nugent, preferably at least 
10 days prior to the meeting, to give 
EPA as much time as possible to process 
your request. 

Dated: January 25, 2010. 

Anthony Maciorowski, 
Deputy Director, EPA Science Advisory Board 
Staff Office. 
[FR Doc. 2010–1942 Filed 1–28–10; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: In accordance with section 
6(f)(1) of the Federal Insecticide, 
Fungicide, and Rodenticide Act 
(FIFRA), as amended, EPA is issuing a 
notice of receipt of a request for an 
amendment by a registrant to delete a 
use in a pesticide registration. Section 
6(f)(1) of FIFRA provides that a 
registrant of a pesticide product may at 
any time request that any of its pesticide 
registrations be amended to delete one 
or more uses. FIFRA further provides 
that, before acting on the request, EPA 
must publish a notice of receipt of any 
request in the Federal Register. 
DATES: The deletion is effective,July 28, 
2010 unless the Agency receives a 
written withdrawal request on or before 
July 28, 2010. The Agency will consider 
a withdrawal request postmarked no 
later than July 28, 2010. 

Users of this product who desire 
continued use on the crop being deleted 
should contact the applicable registrant 
on or before July 28, 2010. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your withdrawal 
request, identified by docket 
identification (ID) number EPA–HQ– 
OPP–2010–0029, by one of the 
following methods: 

• Mail: Office of Pesticide Programs 
(OPP) Regulatory Public Docket (7502P), 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave., NW., Washington, 
DC 20460–0001. 

• Delivery: OPP Regulatory Public 
Docket (7502P), Environmental 
Protection Agency, Rm. S–4400, One 
Potomac Yard (South Bldg.), 2777 S. 
Crystal Dr., Arlington, VA. Deliveries 
are only accepted during the Docket 
Facility’s normal hours of operation 
(8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m., Monday through 
Friday, excluding legal holidays). 

Special arrangements should be made 
for deliveries of boxed information. The 
Docket Facility telephone number is 
(703) 305–5805. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jeannine Kausch, Biopesticides and 
Pollution Prevention Division (7511P), 
Office of Pesticide Programs, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave., NW., Washington, 
DC 20460–0001; telephone number: 
(703) 347–8920; e-mail address: 
kausch.jeannine@epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this Action Apply to Me? 

This action is directed to the public 
in general. Although this action may be 
of particular interest to persons who 
produce or use pesticides, the Agency 
has not attempted to describe all the 
specific entities that may be affected by 
this action. If you have any questions 
regarding the information in this notice, 
consult the person listed under FOR 
FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT. 

B. How Can I Get Copies of this 
Document and Other Related 
Information? 

EPA has established a docket for this 
action under docket ID number EPA– 
HQ–OPP–2010–0029. Publicly available 
docket materials are available either in 
the electronic docket at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, or, if only 
available in hard copy, at the Office of 
Pesticide Programs (OPP) Regulatory 
Public Docket in Rm. S–4400, One 
Potomac Yard (South Bldg.), 2777 S. 
Crystal Dr., Arlington, VA. The hours of 
operation of this Docket Facility are 
from 8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. The Docket Facility telephone 
number is (703) 305–5805. 

II. What Action is the Agency Taking? 

This notice announces receipt by the 
Agency of an application from a 
registrant to delete a use in a pesticide 
registration. This registration is listed in 
Table 1 of this unit by registration 
number, product name, active 
ingredient, and specific use deleted: 

TABLE 1.—REQUEST FOR AN AMENDMENT TO DELETE A USE IN A PESTICIDE REGISTRATION 

EPA Registration No. Product Name Active Ingredient Delete from Label 

82074–1 Mycotrol® ES Beauveria bassiana Strain GHA Tomato 

Users of this product who desire 
continued use on the crop being deleted 
should contact the applicable registrant 

before July 28, 2010 to discuss 
withdrawal of the application for 
amendment. This 180–day period will 

also permit interested members of the 
public to intercede with the registrant 

VerDate Nov<24>2008 16:49 Jan 28, 2010 Jkt 220001 PO 00000 Frm 00049 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\29JAN1.SGM 29JAN1jle
nt

in
i o

n 
D

S
K

J8
S

O
Y

B
1P

R
O

D
 w

ith
 N

O
T

IC
E

S


		Superintendent of Documents
	2010-08-26T12:02:33-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




