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District Court for the Western District of 
North Carolina. 

In this proceeding, the United States 
filed claims pursuant to the Clean Water 
Act, 33 U.S.C. 1251–1387, for civil 
penalties and injunctive relief resulting 
from four discharges of oil from 
pipelines owned and/or operated by the 
Defendant in the States of Georgia, 
North Carolina, and Virginia, during the 
period January 2000 to November 2006. 
The Consent Decree also resolves a 
claim that Defendant failed to prepare 
and implement a Spill Prevention, 
Control, and Countermeasure Plan for a 
Virginia facility, as required by 40 CFR 
112.3. Pursuant to the Consent Decree, 
Defendant agrees to pay civil penalties 
of $715,000 plus interest to the United 
States, and $10,000 plus interest to the 
State of North Carolina. Defendant also 
agrees to perform work on its pipeline 
system to address the causes of the 
spills. 

The Department of Justice will 
receive, for a period of thirty (30) days 
from the date of this publication, 
comments relating to the Consent 
Decree. Comments should be addressed 
to the Assistant Attorney General, 
Environment and Natural Resources 
Division, and either e-mailed to 
pubcomment-ees.enrd@usdoj.gov, or 
mailed to: P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611, and should refer to: U.S. v. 
Plantation Pipeline Company, DJ. Ref. 
90–5–1–1–08337. The Consent Decree 
may be examined at: U.S. EPA Region 
III, Office of Regional Counsel, 1650 
Arch Street, Philadelphia, PA 19103– 
2029, c/o Natalie Katz, Esq.; at U.S. EPA 
Region IV, Office of Regional Counsel, 
61 Forsyth Street, SW., Atlanta, GA 
30303–8960, c/o Joan Redleaf Durbin, 
Esq.; and at the United States Attorney’s 
Office for the Western District of North 
Carolina, 227 West Trade Street, 
Charlotte, NC 28202, c/o Sid Alexander, 
Esq. 

During the public comment period, 
the Consent Decree may also be 
examined at the following Department 
of Justice Web site: http:// 
www.usdoj.gov/enrd/ 
Consent_Decrees.html. A copy of the 
Consent Decree may also be obtained by 
mail from the Consent Decree Library, 
P.O. Box 7611, U.S. Department of 
Justice, Washington, DC 20044–7611, or 
by faxing or e-mailing a request to Tonia 
Fleetwood (tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov), 
fax no. (202) 514–0097, phone 
confirmation number (202) 514–1547. In 
requesting a copy from the Consent 
Decree Library, please enclose a check 
in the amount of $7.75 (25 cents per 
page reproduction cost) payable to the 
U.S. Treasury or, if by e-mail or fax, 

forward a check in that amount to the 
Consent Decree Library at the stated 
address. 

Robert Brook, 
Assistant Chief, Environmental Enforcement 
Section, Environment and Natural Resources 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E8–27720 Filed 11–20–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Alliance for Sustainable 
Air Transportation, Inc. 

Notice is hereby given that, on 
October 17, 2008, pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the National Cooperative 
Research and Production Act of 1993, 
15 U.S.C. 4301 et seq. (‘‘the Act’’) 
Alliance for Sustainable Air 
Transportation, Inc. (‘‘ASAT’’) has filed 
written notifications simultaneously 
with the Attorney General and the 
Federal Trade Commission disclosing 
changes in its membership. The 
notifications were filed for the purpose 
of extending the Act’s provisions 
limiting the recovery of antitrust 
plaintiffs to actual damages under 
specified circumstances. Specifically, 
State of California, Department of 
Transportation, Division of Aeronautics, 
Sacramento, CA has been added as a 
party to this venture. 

No other changes have been made in 
either the membership or planned 
activity of the group research project. 
Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and ASAT 
intends to file additional written 
notifications disclosing all changes in 
membership. 

On July 25, 2008, ASAT filed its 
original notification pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the Act. The Department of 
Justice published a notice in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on August 25, 2008 (73 FR 50055). 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E8–27510 Filed 11–20–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–11–M 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Cooperative Research 
Group on Clean Diesel V 

Notice is hereby given that, on 
October 27, 2008, pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the National Cooperative 
Research and Production Act of 1993, 
15 U.S.C. 4301 et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), 
Southwest Research Institute— 
Cooperative Research Group on Clean 
Diesel V (‘‘Clean Diesel V’’) has filed 
written notifications simultaneously 
with the Attorney General and the 
Federal Trade Commission disclosing 
changes in its membership. The 
notifications were filed for the purpose 
of extending the Act’s provisions 
limiting the recovery of antitrust 
plaintiffs to actual damages under 
specified circumstances. Specifically, 
PSA Peugeot Citroen, La Garenne- 
Colombes, FRANCE, has been added as 
a party to this venture. 

No other changes have been made in 
either the membership or planned 
activity of the group research project. 
Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and Clean Diesel 
V intends to file additional written 
notifications disclosing all changes in 
membership. 

On January 10, 2008, Clean Diesel V 
filed its original notification pursuant to 
Section 6(a) of the Act. The Department 
of Justice published a notice in the 
Federal Register pursuant to Section 
6(b) of the Act on February 25, 2008, (73 
FR 10064). The last notification was 
filed with the Department on August 26, 
2008 and published in the Federal 
Register on September 29, 2008, (73 FR 
56610) 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E8–27511 Filed 11–20–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–11–M 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Information Card 
Foundation 

Notice is hereby given that, on 
October 20, 2008, pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the National Cooperative 
Research and Production Act of 1993, 
15 U.S.C. 4301 et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), 
Information Card Foundation has filed 
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written notifications simultaneously 
with the Attorney General and the 
Federal Trade Commission disclosing 
changes in its membership. The 
notifications were filed for the purpose 
of extending the Act’s provisions 
limiting the recovery of antitrust 
plaintiffs to actual damages under 
specified circumstances. Specifically, 
Microsoft, Redmond, WA; WSO2, 
Mountain View, CA; Novell, Waltham, 
MA; CORISECIO, Darmstadt, 
GERMANY; Figlo, Capell a/d Yssel, 
THE NETHERLANDS; Crypto-Pro, 
Moscow, RUSSIA; Eduserv, Bath, 
UNITED KINGDOM; Oracle, Sunnyvale, 
CA; ETRI, Seoul, REPUBLIC OF 
KOREA; Arcot Systems, Sunnyvale, CA; 
Anders Rundgren, Almunge, SWEDEN; 
Deutsche Telekom, Berlin, GERMANY; 
Christopher Reynolds (individual 
member), Wayland, MA; Intel, 
Hillsboro, OR and Steve Holcombe 
(individual member), Stillwater, OK 
have been added as parties to this 
venture. 

No other changes have been made in 
either the membership or planned 
activity of the group research project. 
Membership in this group research 
project remains open, and Information 
Card Foundation intends to file 
additional written notifications 
disclosing all changes in membership. 

On June 2, 2008, Information Card 
Foundation filed its original notification 
pursuant to Section 6(a) of the Act. The 
Department of Justice published a notice 
in the Federal Register pursuant to 
Section 6(b) of the Act on July 16, 2008 
(73 FR 40883). 

The last notification was filed with 
the Department on August 18, 2008. A 
notice was published in the Federal 
Register pursuant to Section 6(b) of the 
Act on September 18, 2008 (73 FR 
54169). 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E8–27512 Filed 11–20–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–11–M 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Nano Valley Consortium 

Notice is hereby given that, on 
October 27, 2008, pursuant to Section 
6(a) of the National Cooperative 
Research and Production Act of 1993, 
15 U.S.C. 4301 et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), Nano 
Valley Consortium (‘‘NVC’’) has filed 
written notifications simultaneously 

with the Attorney General and the 
Federal Trade Commission disclosing 
(1) the identities of the parties to the 
venture and (2) the nature and 
objectives of the venture. The 
notifications were filed for the purpose 
of invoking the Act’s provisions limiting 
the recovery of antitrust plaintiffs to 
actual damages under specified 
circumstances. 

Pursuant to Section 6(b) of the Act, 
the identities of the parties to the 
venture are: National Nanotechnology 
Manufacturing Center (‘‘NNMC’’) , Inc., 
Swainsboro, GA; Nantero, Inc., Woburn, 
MA; Phoenix Solutions Co., 
Minneapolis, MN; J. Jireh Corp., Payson, 
AZ; Altairnano, Inc., Reno, NV; General 
Dynamics, Ordnance and Tactical 
Systems, LeGardeur, Quebec, Canada; 
Georgia Southern University, 
Statesboro, GA; PPG Industries, Inc., 
Allison Park, PA; and Fujifilm Dimatix, 
Inc., Santa Clara, CA. The general area 
of NVC’s planned activity is 
development of nanotechnology enabled 
materials and devices for military and 
non-military usage. 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Deputy Director of Operations, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E8–27508 Filed 11–20–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–11–M 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Executive Office for Immigration 
Review 

[OMB Number 1125–0001] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comments Requested 

ACTION: 30-Day notice of information 
collection under review: Application for 
Cancellation of Removal (42A) for 
Certain Permanent Residents; (42B) and 
Adjustment of Status for Certain 
Nonpermanent Residents. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Executive Office for Immigration 
Review (EOIR) has submitted the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. The proposed 
information collection is published to 
obtain comments from the public and 
affected agencies. This proposed 
information collection was previously 
published in the Federal Register 
Volume 73, Number 179, page 53282, on 
September 15, 2008, allowing for a 60- 
day comment period. 

The purpose of this notice is to allow 
for an additional 30 days for public 
comment until December 22, 2008. This 
process is conducted in accordance with 
5 CFR 1320.10. 

Written comments and/or suggestions 
regarding the items contained in this 
notice, especially the estimated public 
burden and associated response time, 
should be directed to the Office of 
Management and Budget, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attention: Department of Justice Desk 
Officer, Washington, DC 20530. 
Additionally, comments also may be 
submitted to OMB via facsimile to (202) 
395–5806. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
concerning the proposed collection of 
information are encouraged. Your 
comments should address one or more 
of the following four points: 

—Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

—Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Revision of a Currently Approved 
Collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Application for Cancellation of Removal 
(42A) for Certain Permanent Residents; 
(42B) and Adjustment of Status for 
Certain Nonpermanent Residents. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department of Justice sponsoring the 
collection: Form Number: EOIR–42A, 
EOIR–42B. Executive Office for 
Immigration Review, United States 
Department of Justice. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Individual aliens 
determined to be removable from the 
United States. Other: None. Abstract: 
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