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hazardous waste program as an 
immediate final rule. The EPA did not 
make a proposal prior to the immediate 
final rule because we believe these 
actions are not controversial and do not 
expect comments that oppose them. We 
have explained the reasons for this 
codification and incorporation by 
reference in the preamble to the 
immediate final rule. Unless we get 
written comments which oppose this 
incorporation by reference during the 
comment period, the immediate final 
rule will become effective on the date it 
establishes, and we will not take further 
action on this proposal. If we get 
comments that oppose these actions, we 
will withdraw the immediate final rule 
and it will not take effect. We will then 
respond to public comments in a later 
final rule based on this proposal. You 
may not have another opportunity for 
comment. If you want to comment on 
this action, you must do so at this time. 
DATES: Send written comments by 
November 28, 2008. 
ADDRESSES: Send written comments to 
Alima Patterson, Region 6 Regional 
Authorization Coordinator, State/Tribal 
Oversight Section (6PD–O), Multimedia 
Planning and Permitting Division, EPA 
Region 6, 1445 Ross Avenue, Dallas, 
Texas 75202–2733, Phone number: (214) 
665–8533. You may also submit 
comments electronically or through 
hand delivery/courier; please follow the 
detailed instructions in the ADDRESSES 
section of the immediate final rule 
which is located in the Rules section of 
this Federal Register. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Alima Patterson, (214) 665–8533. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: For 
additional information, please see the 
immediate final rule published in the 
‘‘Rules and Regulations’’ section of this 
Federal Register. 

Dated: September 17, 2008. 
Richard E. Greene, 
Regional Administrator, Region 6. 
[FR Doc. E8–25535 Filed 10–27–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

47 CFR Part 73 

[DA 08–2235; MB Docket No. 08–208; RM– 
11495] 

Television Broadcasting Services; Fort 
Wayne, IN 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Proposed rule. 

SUMMARY: The Commission requests 
comments on a channel substitution 
proposed by WISE–TV License, LLC 
(‘‘WISE’’), the licensee of WISE–DT, 
post-transition DTV channel 19, Fort 
Wayne, Indiana. WISE requests the 
substitution of DTV channel 18 for post- 
transition DTV channel 19 at Fort 
Wayne. 
DATES: Comments must be filed on or 
before November 28, 2008, and reply 
comments on or before December 12, 
2008. 
ADDRESSES: Federal Communications 
Commission, Office of the Secretary, 
445 12th Street, SW., Washington, DC 
20554. In addition to filing comments 
with the FCC, interested parties should 
serve petitioner as follows: WISE–TV 
License, LLC, Attn: Jerry Giesler, 3401 
Butler Road, Fort Wayne, IN 46808. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Adrienne Y. Denysyk, 
adrienne.denysyk@fcc.gov, Media 
Bureau, (202) 418–1600. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a 
synopsis of the Commission’s Notice of 
Proposed Rule Making, MB Docket No. 
08–208, adopted October 1, 2008, and 
released October 6, 2008. The full text 
of this document is available for public 
inspection and copying during normal 
business hours in the FCC’s Reference 
Information Center at Portals II, CY– 
A257, 445 12th Street, SW., 
Washington, DC 20554. This document 
will also be available via ECFS (http:// 
www.fcc.gov/cgb/ecfs/). (Documents 
will be available electronically in ASCII, 
Word 97, and/or Adobe Acrobat.) This 
document may be purchased from the 
Commission’s duplicating contractor, 
Best Copy and Printing, Inc., 445 12th 
Street, SW., Room CY–B402, 
Washington, DC 20554, telephone 1– 
800–478–3160 or via e-mail http:// 
www.BCPIWEB.com. To request this 
document in accessible formats 
(computer diskettes, large print, audio 
recording, and Braille), send an e-mail 
to fcc504@fcc.gov or call the 
Commission’s Consumer and 
Governmental Affairs Bureau at (202) 
418–0530 (voice), (202) 418–0432 
(TTY). This document does not contain 
proposed information collection 
requirements subject to the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995, Public Law 104– 
13. In addition, therefore, it does not 
contain any proposed information 
collection burden ‘‘for small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 
employees,’’ pursuant to the Small 
Business Paperwork Relief Act of 2002, 
Public Law 107–198, see 44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(4). 

Provisions of the Regulatory 
Flexibility Act of 1980 do not apply to 

this proceeding. Members of the public 
should note that from the time a Notice 
of Proposed Rule Making is issued until 
the matter is no longer subject to 
Commission consideration or court 
review, all ex parte contacts are 
prohibited in Commission proceedings, 
such as this one, which involve channel 
allotments. See 47 CFR 1.1204(b) for 
rules governing permissible ex parte 
contacts. 

For information regarding proper 
filing procedures for comments, see 47 
CFR 1.415 and 1.420. 

List of Subjects in 47 CFR Part 73 

Television, Television broadcasting. 
For the reasons discussed in the 

preamble, the Federal Communications 
Commission proposes to amend 47 CFR 
Part 73 as follows: 

PART 73—RADIO BROADCAST 
SERVICES 

1. The authority citation for part 73 
continues to read as follows: 

Authority: 47 U.S.C. 154, 303, 334, 336. 

§ 73.622 [Amended] 

2. Section 73.622(i), the Post- 
Transition Table of DTV Allotments 
under Indiana, is amended by adding 
DTV channel 18 and removing DTV 
channel 19 at Fort Wayne. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Clay C. Pendarvis, 
Associate Chief, Video Division, Media 
Bureau. 
[FR Doc. E8–25724 Filed 10–27–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS 
COMMISSION 

47 CFR Part 73 

[DA 08–2234; MB Docket No. 08–209; RM– 
11496] 

Television Broadcasting Services; 
Superior, NE 

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission. 
ACTION: Proposed rule. 

SUMMARY: The Commission requests 
comments on a channel substitution 
proposed by Colins Broadcasting 
Corporation (‘‘Colins’’), the permittee of 
KSNB–DT, post-transition DTV channel 
34, Superior, Nebraska. Colins requests 
the substitution of DTV channel 4 for 
post-transition DTV channel 34 at 
Superior. 

DATES: Comments must be filed on or 
before November 28, 2008, and reply 
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comments on or before December 12, 
2008. 
ADDRESSES: Federal Communications 
Commission, Office of the Secretary, 
445 12th Street, SW., Washington, DC 
20554. In addition to filing comments 
with the FCC, interested parties should 
serve counsel for petitioner as follows: 
Michael D. Basile, Esq., Dow Lohnes 
PLLC, 1200 New Hampshire Avenue, 
NW., Suite 800, Washington, DC 20036– 
6802. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Joyce L. Bernstein, 
joyce.bernstein@fcc.gov, Media Bureau, 
(202) 418–1600. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: This is a 
synopsis of the Commission’s Notice of 
Proposed Rule Making, MB Docket No. 
08–209, adopted October 1, 2008, and 
released October 6, 2008. The full text 
of this document is available for public 
inspection and copying during normal 
business hours in the FCC’s Reference 
Information Center at Portals II, CY– 
A257, 445 12th Street, SW., 
Washington, DC 20554. This document 
will also be available via ECFS (http:// 
www.fcc.gov/cgb/ecfs/). (Documents 
will be available electronically in ASCII, 
Word 97, and/or Adobe Acrobat.) This 
document may be purchased from the 
Commission’s duplicating contractor, 
Best Copy and Printing, Inc., 445 12th 
Street, SW., Room CY–B402, 
Washington, DC 20554, telephone 1– 
800–478–3160 or via e-mail http:// 
www.BCPIWEB.com. To request this 
document in accessible formats 
(computer diskettes, large print, audio 
recording, and Braille), send an e-mail 
to fcc504@fcc.gov or call the 
Commission’s Consumer and 
Governmental Affairs Bureau at (202) 
418–0530 (voice), (202) 418–0432 
(TTY). This document does not contain 
proposed information collection 
requirements subject to the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995, Public Law 104– 
13. In addition, therefore, it does not 
contain any proposed information 
collection burden ‘‘for small business 
concerns with fewer than 25 
employees,’’ pursuant to the Small 
Business Paperwork Relief Act of 2002, 
Public Law 107–198, see 44 U.S.C. 
3506(c)(4). 

Provisions of the Regulatory 
Flexibility Act of 1980 do not apply to 
this proceeding. Members of the public 
should note that from the time a Notice 
of Proposed Rule Making is issued until 
the matter is no longer subject to 
Commission consideration or court 
review, all ex parte contacts are 
prohibited in Commission proceedings, 
such as this one, which involve channel 
allotments. See 47 CFR 1.1204(b) for 

rules governing permissible ex parte 
contacts. 

For information regarding proper 
filing procedures for comments, see 47 
CFR 1.415 and 1.420. 

List of Subjects in 47 CFR Part 73 

Television, Television broadcasting. 
For the reasons discussed in the 

preamble, the Federal Communications 
Commission proposes to amend 47 CFR 
Part 73 as follows: 

PART 73—RADIO BROADCAST 
SERVICES 

1. The authority citation for part 73 
continues to read as follows: 

Authority: 47 U.S.C. 154, 303, 334, 336. 

§ 73.622 [Amended] 

2. Section 73.622(i), the Post- 
Transition Table of DTV Allotments 
under Nebraska, is amended by adding 
DTV channel 4 and removing DTV 
channel 34 at Superior. 
Federal Communications Commission. 
Clay C. Pendarvis, 
Associate Chief, Video Division, Media 
Bureau. 
[FR Doc. E8–25725 Filed 10–27–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6712–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 

Fish and Wildlife Service 

50 CFR Part 17 

[FWS–R8–ES–2008–0086; 92210–5008– 
3922–10–B2] 

Endangered and Threatened Wildlife 
and Plants; 90-Day Finding on a 
Petition To List the Dusky Tree Vole 
(Arborimus longicaudus silvicola) as 
Threatened or Endangered 

AGENCY: Fish and Wildlife Service, 
Interior. 
ACTION: Notice of 90-day petition 
finding and initiation of status review. 

SUMMARY: We, the U.S. Fish and 
Wildlife Service (Service), announce a 
90-day finding on a petition to list the 
dusky tree vole (Arborimus longicaudus 
silvicola) in all of its range as threatened 
or endangered under the Endangered 
Species Act of 1973, as amended (Act). 
The petitioners also requested the 
Service to list either the north Oregon 
coast population of the red tree vole (A. 
longicaudus) as a Distinct Population 
Segment (DPS) or the red tree vole 
throughout all of its range because it is 
threatened or endangered in a 
significant portion of its range, if we 

determined that the subspecies, A. l. 
silvicola, was not a valid taxon. 

We find that the petition presents 
substantial scientific or commercial 
information indicating that listing the 
dusky tree vole as a subspecies may be 
warranted. Therefore, with the 
publication of this notice we are 
initiating a status review of the species, 
including the evaluation of the north 
Oregon coast population of red tree vole 
and the red tree vole throughout its 
range, and we will issue a 12-month 
finding on our determination as to 
whether the petitioned action is 
warranted. To ensure that the status 
review is comprehensive, we are 
soliciting scientific and commercial data 
and other information regarding this 
species. We will make a determination 
on critical habitat for this species if, and 
when, we initiate a listing action. 
DATES: To allow us adequate time to 
conduct this review, we request that 
information you submit be received by 
us on or before December 29, 2008. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit 
information by one of the following 
methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• U.S. mail or hand-delivery: Public 
Comments Processing, Attn: FWS–R8– 
ES–2008–0086; Division of Policy and 
Directives Management; U.S. Fish and 
Wildlife Service; 4401 N. Fairfax Drive, 
Suite 222; Arlington, VA 22203. 

We will not accept e-mail or faxes. We 
will post all information received on 
http://www.regulations.gov. This 
generally means that we will post any 
personal information you provide us 
(see the Information Solicited section 
below for more details). 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Paul 
Henson, Project Leader, Oregon Fish 
and Wildlife Office, 2600 SE 98th 
Avenue, Portland, OR 97266; by 
telephone (503) 231–6179; or by 
facsimile (503) 231–6195. Persons who 
use a telecommunications device for the 
deaf (TTD) may call the Federal 
Information Relay Service (FIRS) at 
800–877–8339. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Information Solicited 

When we make a finding that a 
petition presents substantial 
information indicating that listing a 
species may be warranted, we are 
required to promptly commence a 
review of the status of the species. To 
ensure that the status review is 
complete and based on the best 
available scientific and commercial 
information, we are soliciting 
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