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The Respondent’s answer, motions to 
intervene, and protests must be served 
on the Complainants. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on March 3, 2008. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E8–3118 Filed 2–19–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–8530–6 ] 

Proposed Administrative Settlement 
Agreement Under Sections 104, 107 
and Section 122 of the Comprehensive 
Environmental Response, 
Compensation, and Liability Act for the 
Fair Lawn Well Field Superfund Site, 
Located in Fair Lawn, Bergen County, 
NJ 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency. 
ACTION: Notice of proposed 
administrative settlement and 
opportunity for public comment. 

SUMMARY: The United States 
Environmental Protection Agency 
(‘‘EPA’’) is proposing to enter into an 
administrative settlement agreement 
(‘‘Settlement Agreement’’) with Eastman 
Kodak Company, Fisher Scientific 
Company, LLC and Sandvik, Inc. 
(‘‘Respondents’’) pursuant to Sections 
104, 107 and 122 of the Comprehensive 
Environmental Response, 
Compensation, and Liability Act 
(‘‘CERCLA’’), 42 U.S.C. 9604, 9607 and 
9622. The Settlement Agreement 
provides for Respondents’ payment of 

certain past costs and performance of 
the remedial investigation and 
feasibility study (‘‘RI/FS’’) for the Fair 
Lawn Well Field Superfund Site located 
within the Borough of Fair Lawn, 
Bergen County, New Jersey (‘‘Site’’). 

In accordance with Section 122(i) of 
CERCLA, 42 U.S.C. 9622(i), this notice 
is being published to inform the public 
of the proposed Settlement Agreement 
and of the opportunity to comment. For 
thirty (30) days following the date of 
publication of this notice, EPA will 
receive written comments relating to the 
proposed Settlement Agreement. EPA 
will consider all comments received and 
may modify or withdraw its consent to 
the settlement if comments received 
disclose facts or considerations that 
indicate that the proposed settlement is 
inappropriate, improper or inadequate. 
EPA’s response to any comments 
received will be available for public 
inspection at EPA Region 2, 290 
Broadway, 17th Floor, New York, New 
York 10007–1866. 

DATES: Comments must be provided by 
March 21, 2008. 

ADDRESSES: Comments should reference 
the Fair Lawn Well Field Superfund 
Site, EPA Docket No. CERCLA–02– 
2008–2003, and should be sent to the 
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, 
Office of Regional Counsel, New Jersey 
Superfund Branch, 290 Broadway, 17th 
Floor, New York, NY 10007. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Damaris Urdaz Cristiano, Assistant 
Regional Counsel, New Jersey 
Superfund Branch, Office of Regional 
Counsel, U.S. Environmental Protection 
Agency, 17th Floor, 290 Broadway, New 
York, New York 10007–1866. 
Telephone: 212–637–3140. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: A copy of 
the proposed administrative settlement, 
as well as background information 
relating to the settlement, may be 
obtained from Damaris Urdaz Cristiano, 
Assistant Regional Counsel, New Jersey 
Superfund Branch, Office of Regional 
Counsel, U.S. Environmental Protection 
Agency, 17th Floor, 290 Broadway, New 
York, New York 10007–1866. 
Telephone: 212–637–3140. 

Dated: January 24, 2008. 

George Pavlou, 
Director, Emergency and Remedial Response 
Division. 
[FR Doc. E8–3116 Filed 2–19–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPP–2007–1160; FRL–8348–7] 

Ammonium Thiosulfate; Reregistration 
Eligibility Decision; Notice of 
Availability 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces the 
availability of EPA’s Reregistration 
Eligibility Decision (RED) for the 
pesticide ammonium thiosulfate, and 
opens a public comment period on this 
document, related risk assessments, and 
other support documents. EPA has 
reviewed the pesticide ammonium 
thiosulfate through a modified, 
streamlined version of the public 
participation process that the Agency 
uses to involve the public in developing 
pesticide reregistration and tolerance 
reassessment decisions. Through these 
programs, EPA is ensuring that all 
pesticides meet current health and 
safety standards. 
DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before April 21, 2008. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2007–1160, by 
one of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the on-line 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Office of Pesticide Programs 
(OPP) Regulatory Public Docket (7502P), 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave., NW., Washington, 
DC 20460–0001. 

• Delivery: OPP Regulatory Public 
Docket (7502P), Environmental 
Protection Agency, Rm. S–4400, One 
Potomac Yard (South Bldg.), 2777 S. 
Crystal Dr., Arlington, VA. Deliveries 
are only accepted during the Docket’s 
normal hours of operation (8:30 a.m. to 
4 p.m., Monday through Friday, 
excluding legal holidays). Special 
arrangements should be made for 
deliveries of boxed information. The 
Docket Facility telephone number is 
(703) 305–5805. 

Instructions: Direct your comments to 
docket ID number EPA–HQ–OPP–2007– 
1160. EPA’s policy is that all comments 
received will be included in the docket 
without change and may be made 
available on-line at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided, unless 
the comment includes information 
claimed to be Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
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Do not submit information that you 
consider to be CBI or otherwise 
protected through regulations.gov or e- 
mail. The regulations.gov website is an 
‘‘anonymous access’’ system, which 
means EPA will not know your identity 
or contact information unless you 
provide it in the body of your comment. 
If you send an e-mail comment directly 
to EPA without going through 
regulations.gov, your e-mail address 
will be automatically captured and 
included as part of the comment that is 
placed in the docket and made available 
on the Internet. If you submit an 
electronic comment, EPA recommends 
that you include your name and other 
contact information in the body of your 
comment and with any disk or CD-ROM 
you submit. If EPA cannot read your 
comment due to technical difficulties 
and cannot contact you for clarification, 
EPA may not be able to consider your 
comment. Electronic files should avoid 
the use of special characters, any form 
of encryption, and be free of any defects 
or viruses. 

Docket: All documents in the docket 
are listed in the docket index available 
in regulations.gov. To access the 
electronic docket, go to http:// 
www.regulations.gov, select ‘‘Advanced 
Search,’’ then ‘‘Docket Search.’’ Insert 
the docket ID number where indicated 
and select the ‘‘Submit’’ button. Follow 
the instructions on the regulations.gov 
website to view the docket index or 
access available documents. Although 
listed in the index, some information is 
not publicly available, e.g., CBI or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Certain other 
material, such as copyrighted material, 
is not placed on the Internet and will be 
publicly available only in hard copy 
form. Publicly available docket 
materials are available either in the 
electronic docket at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, or, if only 
available in hard copy, at the OPP 
Regulatory Public Docket in Rm. S– 
4400, One Potomac Yard (South Bldg.), 
2777 S. Crystal Dr., Arlington, VA. The 
hours of operation of this Docket 
Facility are from 8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. The Docket Facility telephone 
number is (703) 305–5805. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Tom 
Myers, Special Review and 
Reregistration Division (7508P), Office 
of Pesticide Programs, Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave., NW., Washington, DC 20460– 
0001; telephone number: (703) 308- 
8589; fax number: (703) 308-7070; e- 
mail address: myers.tom@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this Action Apply to Me? 

This action is directed to the public 
in general, and may be of interest to a 
wide range of stakeholders including 
environmental, human health, and 
agricultural advocates; the chemical 
industry; pesticide users; and members 
of the public interested in the sale, 
distribution, or use of pesticides. Since 
others also may be interested, the 
Agency has not attempted to describe all 
the specific entities that may be affected 
by this action. If you have any questions 
regarding the applicability of this action 
to a particular entity, consult the person 
listed under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

B. What Should I Consider as I Prepare 
My Comments for EPA? 

1. Submitting CBI. Do not submit this 
information to EPA through 
regulations.gov or e-mail. Clearly mark 
the part or all of the information that 
you claim to be CBI. For CBI 
information in a disk or CD-ROM that 
you mail to EPA, mark the outside of the 
disk or CD-ROM as CBI and then 
identify electronically within the disk or 
CD-ROM the specific information that is 
claimed as CBI. In addition to one 
complete version of the comment that 
includes information claimed as CBI, a 
copy of the comment that does not 
contain the information claimed as CBI 
must be submitted for inclusion in the 
public docket. Information so marked 
will not be disclosed except in 
accordance with procedures set forth in 
40 CFR part 2. 

2. Tips for preparing your comments. 
When submitting comments, remember 
to: 

i. Identify the document by docket ID 
number and other identifying 
information (subject heading, Federal 
Register date and page number). 

ii. Follow directions. The Agency may 
ask you to respond to specific questions 
or organize comments by referencing a 
Code of Federal Regulations (CFR) part 
or section number. 

iii. Explain why you agree or disagree; 
suggest alternatives and substitute 
language for your requested changes. 

iv. Describe any assumptions and 
provide any technical information and/ 
or data that you used. 

v. If you estimate potential costs or 
burdens, explain how you arrived at 
your estimate in sufficient detail to 
allow for it to be reproduced. 

vi. Provide specific examples to 
illustrate your concerns and suggest 
alternatives. 

vii. Explain your views as clearly as 
possible, avoiding the use of profanity 
or personal threats. 

viii. Make sure to submit your 
comments by the comment period 
deadline identified. 

II. Background 

A. What Action is the Agency Taking? 

Under section 4 of the Federal 
Insecticide, Fungicide, and Rodenticide 
Act (FIFRA), EPA is reevaluating 
existing pesticides to ensure that they 
meet current scientific and regulatory 
standards. Using a modified, 
streamlined version of its public 
participation process, EPA has 
completed a RED for the pesticide, 
ammonium thiosulfate under section 
4(g)(2)(A) of FIFRA. Ammonium 
thiosulfate is an inorganic thiosulfate 
herbicide used to kill oxalis and spurge 
weeds on lawns in the western United 
States. There is one registered 
ammonium thiosulfate product 
registered in the U.S. Two other 
pesticides are included in the inorganic 
thiosulfate case: Potassium thiosulfate 
and calcium thiosulfate. There are 
currently no active potassium 
thiosulfate or calcium thiosulfate 
products registered in the US. EPA has 
determined that the database to support 
reregistration is substantially complete 
and the products containing ammonium 
thiosulfate will be eligible for 
reregistration, provided label language 
outlined in the RED is incorporated onto 
ammonium thiosulfate labels. Upon 
submission of any required product 
specific data under section 4(g)(2)(B) of 
FIFRA and any necessary changes to the 
registration and labeling (either to 
address any concerns identified in the 
RED or as a result of product specific 
data), EPA will make a final 
reregistration decision under section 
4(g)(2)(C) of FIFRA for products 
containing ammonium thiosulfate. 

EPA is applying the principles of 
public participation to all pesticides 
undergoing reregistration and tolerance 
reassessment. The Agency’s Pesticide 
Tolerance Reassessment and 
Reregistration; Public Participation 
Process, published in the Federal 
Register on May 14, 2004, (69 FR 26819) 
(FRL–7357–9) explains that in 
conducting these programs, the Agency 
is tailoring its public participation 
process to be commensurate with the 
level of risk, extent of use, complexity 
of issues, and degree of public concern 
associated with each pesticide. EPA can 
expeditiously reach decisions for 
pesticides like ammonium thiosulfate, 
which pose few risk concerns, have low 
use, affect few stakeholders, and require 
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little risk mitigation. Once EPA assesses 
uses and risks for such pesticides, the 
Agency may go directly to a decision 
and prepare a document summarizing 
its findings, such as the ammonium 
thiosulfate RED. 

The reregistration program is being 
conducted under congressionally 
mandated timeframes, and EPA 
recognizes the need both to make timely 
decisions and to involve the public in 
finding ways to effectively mitigate 
pesticide risks. Ammonium thiosulfate, 
however, poses no risks that require 
mitigation. The Agency therefore is 
issuing the ammonium thiosulfate RED, 
its risk assessments, and related support 
materials simultaneously for public 
comment. The comment period is 
intended to provide an opportunity for 
public input and a mechanism for 
initiating any necessary amendments to 
the RED. All comments should be 
submitted using the methods in 
ADDRESSES, and must be received by 
EPA on or before the closing date. These 
comments will become part of the 
Agency Docket for ammonium 
thiosulfate. Comments received after the 
close of the comment period will be 
marked ‘‘late.’’ EPA is not required to 
consider these late comments. 

EPA will carefully consider all 
comments received by the closing date 
and will provide a Response to 
Comments Memorandum in the Docket 
and regulations.gov. If any comment 
significantly affects the document, EPA 
also will publish an amendment to the 
RED in the Federal Register. In the 
absence of substantive comments 
requiring changes, the ammonium 
thiosulfate RED will be implemented as 
it is now presented. 

B. What is the Agency’s Authority for 
Taking this Action? 

Section 4(g)(2) of FIFRA, as amended, 
directs that, after submission of all data 
concerning a pesticide active ingredient, 
‘‘the Administrator shall determine 
whether pesticides containing such 
active ingredient are eligible for 
reregistration,’’ before calling in product 
specific data on individual end-use 
products and either reregistering 
products or taking other ‘‘appropriate 
regulatory action.’’ 

List of Subjects 

Environmental protection, Pesticides 
and pests. 

Dated: January 30, 2008. 
Steven Bradbury,
Director, Special Review and Reregistration 
Division, Office of Pesticide Programs. 
[FR Doc. E8–2785 Filed 2–19–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6560–50–S 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2008–0087; FRL–8352–9] 

Certain New Chemicals; Receipt and 
Status Information 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: Section 5 of the Toxic 
Substances Control Act (TSCA) requires 
any person who intends to manufacture 
(defined by statute to include import) a 
new chemical (i.e., a chemical not on 
the TSCA Inventory) to notify EPA and 
comply with the statutory provisions 
pertaining to the manufacture of new 
chemicals. Under sections 5(d)(2) and 
5(d)(3) of TSCA, EPA is required to 
publish a notice of receipt of a 
premanufacture notice (PMN) or an 
application for a test marketing 
exemption (TME), and to publish 
periodic status reports on the chemicals 
under review and the receipt of notices 
of commencement to manufacture those 
chemicals. This status report, which 
covers the period from December 1, 
2007 thru December 31, 2007 consists of 
the PMNs pending or expired, and the 
notices of commencement to 
manufacture a new chemical that the 
Agency has received under TSCA 
section 5 during this time period. 
DATES: Comments identified by the 
specific PMN number or TME number, 
must be received on or before March 21, 
2008. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2007–0087, by 
one of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the on-line 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Document Control Office 
(7407M), Office of Pollution Prevention 
and Toxics (OPPT), Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave., NW., Washington, DC 20460– 
0001. 

• Hand Delivery: OPPT Document 
Control Office (DCO), EPA East Bldg., 
Rm. 6428, 1201 Constitution Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC. Attention: Docket ID 
Number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2007–0087. 
The DCO is open from 8 a.m. to 4 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, excluding legal 

holidays. The telephone number for the 
DCO is (202) 564–8930. Such deliveries 
are only accepted during the DCO’s 
normal hours of operation, and special 
arrangements should be made for 
deliveries of boxed information. 

Instructions: Direct your comments to 
docket ID number EPA–HQ–OPPT– 
2007–0087. EPA’s policy is that all 
comments received will be included in 
the docket without change and may be 
made available on-line at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided, unless 
the comment includes information 
claimed to be Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
Do not submit information that you 
consider to be CBI or otherwise 
protected through regulations.gov or e- 
mail. The regulations.gov website is an 
‘‘anonymous access’’ system, which 
means EPA will not know your identity 
or contact information unless you 
provide it in the body of your comment. 
If you send an e-mail comment directly 
to EPA without going through 
regulations.gov, your e-mail address 
will be automatically captured and 
included as part of the comment that is 
placed in the docket and made available 
on the Internet. If you submit an 
electronic comment, EPA recommends 
that you include your name and other 
contact information in the body of your 
comment and with any disk or CD-ROM 
you submit. If EPA cannot read your 
comment due to technical difficulties 
and cannot contact you for clarification, 
EPA may not be able to consider your 
comment. Electronic files should avoid 
the use of special characters, any form 
of encryption, and be free of any defects 
or viruses. For additional information 
about EPA’s public docket, visit the EPA 
Docket Center homepage at http:// 
www.epa.gov/epahome/dockets.htm. 

Docket: All documents in the docket 
are listed in the docket index available 
in regulations.gov. To access the 
electronic docket, go to http:// 
www.regulations.gov, select ‘‘Advanced 
Search,’’ then ‘‘Docket Search.’’ Insert 
the docket ID number where indicated 
and select the ‘‘Submit’’ button. Follow 
the instructions on the regulations.gov 
website to view the docket index or 
access available documents. Although 
listed in the index, some information is 
not publicly available, e.g., CBI or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Certain other 
material, such as copyrighted material, 
will be publicly available only in hard 
copy. Publicly available docket 
materials are available electronically at 
http://www.regulations.gov, or, if only 
available in hard copy, at the OPPT 
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