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www.regulations.gov, select ‘‘Advanced 
Search,’’ then ‘‘Docket Search.’’ Insert 
the docket ID number where indicated 
and select the ‘‘Submit’’ button. Follow 
the instructions on the regulations.gov 
website to view the docket index or 
access available documents. Although 
listed in the index, some information is 
not publicly available, e.g., Confidential 
Business Information (CBI) or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Certain other 
material, such as copyrighted material, 
will be publicly available only in hard 
copy. Publicly available docket 
materials are available electronically at 
http://www.regulations.gov, or, if only 
available in hard copy, at the OPPT 
Docket. The OPPT Docket is located in 
the EPA Docket Center (EPA/DC) at Rm. 
3334, EPA West Bldg., 1301 
Constitution Ave., NW., Washington, 
DC. The EPA/DC Public Reading Room 
hours of operation are 8:30 a.m. to 4:30 
p.m., Monday through Friday, excluding 
Federal holidays. The telephone number 
of the EPA/DC Public Reading Room is 
(202) 566–1744, and the telephone 
number for the OPPT Docket is (202) 
566–0280. Docket visitors are required 
to show photographic identification, 
pass through a metal detector, and sign 
the EPA visitor log. All visitor bags are 
processed through an X-ray machine 
and subject to search. Visitors will be 
provided an EPA/DC badge that must be 
visible at all times in the building and 
returned upon departure. 

2. Electronic access. You may access 
this Federal Register document 
electronically through the EPA Internet 
under the ‘‘Federal Register’’ listings at 
http://www.epa.gov/fedrgstr/. You may 
also access this document at the Office 
of Pollution Prevention and Toxics Lead 
Home Page at http://www.epa.gov/lead/ 
new.htm. 

II. Background 

Under the Congressional mandate 
stated in section 405(b) of Title X, The 
Residential Lead-Based Paint Hazard 
Reduction Act of 1992, EPA has 
established the NLLAP. The program 
has been established by EPA in order to 
assure the public that analytical 
laboratories recognized by the EPA 
NLLAP have demonstrated they are 
capable of analyzing for lead in paint 
chip, dust, and/or soil samples. A list of 
EPA recognized lead laboratories is 
updated on a periodic basis and is 
available from the National Lead 
Information Center Clearinghouse upon 
request (1–800–424–LEAD) or at the 
Office of Pollution Prevention and 
Toxics Lead Home Page at http:// 
www.epa.gov/lead/pubs/nllap.htm. 

The Agency is announcing changes to 
NLLAP to encourage the recognition of 
all lead testing service providers (e.g., 
FSMOs) and to bring the NLLAP into 
compliance with current consensus 
standards (e.g., American Society for 
Testing and Materials (ASTM), 
American National Standards Institute 
(ANSI), and International Organization 
for Standardization (ISO)). This may, in 
turn, increase lead testing options, 
reduce costs, and save time for those 
who purchase analytical services related 
to lead hazard identification and 
control. 

III. What Action is the Agency Taking? 

The Agency made these revisions to 
the NLLAP to provide a vehicle and 
remove barriers so that all types of lead 
testing service providers could 
participate in the NLLAP. These 
changes also provide the tools for 
smaller lead testing organizations to 
obtain NLLAP recognition. Also these 
revisions are making the NLLAP more 
efficient and cost-effective while 
maintaining the high standard of 
quality, science and technology 
necessary to ensure public health 
protection in supporting EPA and U.S. 
Department of Housing and Urban 
Development (HUD) lead regulations. 

List of Subjects 

Environmental protection, Lead 
testing accreditation, National Lead 
Laboratory Accreditation Program 
(NLLAP), Laboratory Quality System 
Requirements (LQSR). 

Dated: January 16, 2008. 
James B. Gulliford, 
Assistant Administrator, Office of Prevention, 
Pesticides and Toxic Substances. 
[FR Doc. E8–1110 Filed 1–22–08; 8:45 am] 
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ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
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ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces that 
pesticide related information submitted 
to EPA’s Office of Pesticide Programs 
(OPP) pursuant to the Federal 
Insecticide, Fungicide, and Rodenticide 
Act (FIFRA) and the Federal Food, Drug, 
and Cosmetic Act (FFDCA), including 
information that may have been claimed 
as Confidential Business Information 

(CBI) by the submitter, will be 
transferred to Project Performance 
Corporation in accordance with 40 CFR 
2.307(h)(3) and 2.308(i)(2). Project 
Performance Corporation has been 
awarded a contract to perform work for 
OPP, and access to this information will 
enable Project Performance Corporation 
to fulfill the obligations of the contract. 
DATES: Project Performance Corporation 
will be given access to this information 
on or before January 28, 2008. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Felicia Croom, Information Technology 
and Resources Management Division 
(7502P), Office of Pesticide Programs, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave., NW., Washington, 
DC 20460–0001; telephone number: 
(703) 305–0786; e-mail address: 
croom.felicia@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this Action Apply to Me? 
This action applies to the public in 

general. As such, the Agency has not 
attempted to describe all the specific 
entities that may be affected by this 
action. If you have any questions 
regarding the applicability of this action 
to a particular entity, consult the person 
listed under FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT. 

B. How Can I Get Copies of this 
Document and Other Related 
Information? 

1. Docket. EPA has established a 
docket for this action under docket 
identification (ID) number EPA–HQ– 
OPP–2007–0038. Publicly available 
docket materials are available either in 
the electronic docket at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, or, if only 
available in hard copy, at the Office of 
Pesticide Programs (OPP) Regulatory 
Public Docket in Rm. S–4400, One 
Potomac Yard (South Bldg.), 2777 S. 
Crystal Dr., Arlington, VA. The hours of 
operation of this Docket Facility are 
from 8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. The Docket Facility telephone 
number is (703) 305–5805. 

2. Electronic access. You may access 
this Federal Register document 
electronically through the EPA Internet 
under the ‘‘Federal Register’’ listings at 
http://www.epa.gov/fedrgstr. 

II. Contractor Requirements 
Under Contract No. EP–W–05–023 

Task Order 36, this contract shall 
provide enterprise architecture support 
to the Enterprise Architect for the 
Information Technology and Resources 
Management Division. The contractor 
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requires access to processes and 
procedures that may contain FIFRA and 
CBI related data. 

This contract involves no 
subcontractors. 

The OPP has determined that the 
contract described in this document 
involves work that is being conducted 
in connection with FIFRA, in that 
pesticide chemicals will be the subject 
of certain evaluations to be made under 
this contract. These evaluations may be 
used in subsequent regulatory decisions 
under FIFRA. 

Some of this information may be 
entitled to confidential treatment. The 
information has been submitted to EPA 
under sections 3, 4, 6, and 7 of FIFRA 
and under sections 408 and 409 of 
FFDCA. 

In accordance with the requirements 
of 40 CFR 2.307(h)(3), the contract with 
Project Performance Corporation, 
prohibits use of the information for any 
purpose not specified in this contract; 
prohibits disclosure of the information 
to a third party without prior written 
approval from the Agency; and requires 
that each official and employee of the 
contractor sign an agreement to protect 
the information from unauthorized 
release and to handle it in accordance 
with the FIFRA Information Security 
Manual. In addition, Project 
Performance Corporation is required to 
submit for EPA approval a security plan 
under which any CBI will be secured 
and protected against unauthorized 
release or compromise. No information 
will be provided to Project Performance 
Corporation until the requirements in 
this document have been fully satisfied. 
Records of information provided to 
Project Performance Corporation will be 
maintained by EPA Project Officers for 
this contract. All information supplied 
to Project Performance Corporation by 
EPA for use in connection with this 
contract will be returned to EPA when 
Project Performance Corporation has 
completed its work. 

List of Subjects 

Environmental protection, Business 
and industry, Government contracts, 
Government property, Security 
measures. 

Dated: January 10, 2008. 

Oscar Morales, 
Acting Director, Office of Pesticide Programs. 

[FR Doc. E8–809 Filed 1–22–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–S 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPP–2007–1165; FRL–8346–2] 

Chlorantraniliprole; Receipt of 
Application for Emergency Exemption, 
Solicitation of Public Comment 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: EPA has received a specific 
exemption request from the Louisiana 
Department of Agriculture and Forestry 
to use the pesticide chlorantraniliprole 
(CAS No. 500008–45–7) to treat up to 
160,000 acres of rice to control rice 
water weevil. 

The applicant proposes the use of a 
new chemical which has not been 
registered by EPA. EPA is soliciting 
public comment before making the 
decision whether or not to grant the 
exemption. 

DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before February 7, 2008. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2007–1165, by 
one of the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the on-line 
instructions for submitting comments. 

• Mail: Office of Pesticide Programs 
(OPP) Regulatory Public Docket (7502P), 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave., NW., Washington, 
DC 20460–0001. 

• Delivery: OPP Regulatory Public 
Docket (7502P), Environmental 
Protection Agency, Rm. S–4400, One 
Potomac Yard (South Bldg.), 2777 S. 
Crystal Dr., Arlington, VA. Deliveries 
are only accepted during the Docket’s 
normal hours of operation (8:30 a.m. to 
4 p.m., Monday through Friday, 
excluding legal holidays). Special 
arrangements should be made for 
deliveries of boxed information. The 
Docket Facility telephone number is 
(703) 305–5805. 

Instructions: Direct your comments to 
docket ID number EPA–HQ–OPP–2007– 
1165. EPA’s policy is that all comments 
received will be included in the docket 
without change and may be made 
available on-line at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided, unless 
the comment includes information 
claimed to be Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
Do not submit information that you 
consider to be CBI or otherwise 
protected through regulations.gov or e- 
mail. The regulations.gov website is an 

‘‘anonymous access’’ system, which 
means EPA will not know your identity 
or contact information unless you 
provide it in the body of your comment. 
If you send an e-mail comment directly 
to EPA without going through 
regulations.gov, your e-mail address 
will be automatically captured and 
included as part of the comment that is 
placed in the docket and made available 
on the Internet. If you submit an 
electronic comment, EPA recommends 
that you include your name and other 
contact information in the body of your 
comment and with any disk or CD-ROM 
you submit. If EPA cannot read your 
comment due to technical difficulties 
and cannot contact you for clarification, 
EPA may not be able to consider your 
comment. Electronic files should avoid 
the use of special characters, any form 
of encryption, and be free of any defects 
or viruses. 

Docket: All documents in the docket 
are listed in the docket index available 
in regulations.gov. To access the 
electronic docket, go to http:// 
www.regulations.gov, select ‘‘Advanced 
Search,’’ then ‘‘Docket Search.’’ Insert 
the docket ID number where indicated 
and select the ‘‘Submit’’ button. Follow 
the instructions on the regulations.gov 
website to view the docket index or 
access available documents. Although 
listed in the index, some information is 
not publicly available, e.g., CBI or other 
information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Certain other 
material, such as copyrighted material, 
is not placed on the Internet and will be 
publicly available only in hard copy 
form. Publicly available docket 
materials are available either in the 
electronic docket at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, or, if only 
available in hard copy, at the OPP 
Regulatory Public Docket in Rm. S– 
4400, One Potomac Yard (South Bldg.), 
2777 S. Crystal Dr., Arlington, VA. The 
hours of operation of this Docket 
Facility are from 8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. The Docket Facility telephone 
number is (703) 305–5805. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Marcel Howard, Registration Division 
(7505P), Office of Pesticide Programs, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave., NW., Washington, 
DC 20460–0001; telephone number: 
(703) 305–6784; fax number: (703) 605– 
0781; e-mail address: 
howard.marcel@epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
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