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DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Food and Nutrition Service 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request Form FNS–648, WIC 
Local Agency Directory Report 

AGENCY: Food and Nutrition Service, 
USDA. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, this 
notice announces the Food and 
Nutrition Service’s (FNS) intention to 
request an extension for a currently 
approved information collection, the 
WIC Local Agency Directory Report. 
DATES: Comments on this notice must be 
received by December 3, 2007. 
ADDRESSES: Comments are invited on: 
(a) Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of the burden of the proposed collection 
of information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 
(c) ways to enhance the quality, utility 
and clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on those who are to respond, including 
through the use of appropriate 
automated, electronic, mechanical, or 
other technological collection 
techniques or other forms of information 
technology. 

Comments may be sent to: Patricia N. 
Daniels, Director, Supplemental Food 
Programs Division, Food and Nutrition 
Service, U.S. Department of Agriculture, 
3101 Park Center Drive, Room 520, 
Alexandria, VA 22302. 

All responses to this notice will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for OMB approval, and will become a 
matter of public record. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
copies of the information collection 
form and instructions should be 
directed to: Patricia N. Daniels, (703) 
305–2749. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title: WIC Local Agency Directory. 
OMB Number: 0584–0431. 
Expiration Date: 04/30/2008. 
Type of Request: Revision of a 

Currently Approved Collection Form. 
Abstract: FNS administers the Special 

Supplemental Nutrition Program for 
Women, Infants, and Children (WIC) by 
awarding cash grants to State agencies 
(generally State health departments). 
The State agencies award subgrants to 
local agencies (generally local health 
departments and nonprofit 
organizations) to deliver program 
benefits and services to eligible 
participants. FNS maintains a WIC 
Local Agency Directory which lists the 
names and addresses of all WIC local 
agencies. WIC State and local agencies 
and FNS use the directory to refer 
individuals to the nearest source of WIC 
Program services and to maintain 
continuity of program services to 
migrant and other transient participants. 
It is also used as a mailing list to 
provide local agencies with technical 
assistance manuals and other 
information. State agencies complete the 
WIC Local Agency Directory Report 
Form to inform FNS when a local 
agency is newly established, closed or 
changes its address. This data is needed 
to keep the directory current. Due to the 
increase in the number of WIC State 
Agencies reporting, this revision is an 
adjustment in the number of 
respondents from 88 to 90. 

Estimate of Burden: Public reporting 
burden for this collection of information 
is estimated to average 0.17 hours per 
response, including the time for 
reviewing instructions, searching 
existing data sources, gathering and 
maintaining the data needed, and 
completing and reviewing the collection 
of information. 

Respondents: Directors or 
Administrators of WIC State agencies. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 90 
respondents. 

Estimated Number of Responses per 
Respondent: One. 

Estimated Total Annual Burden on 
Respondents: 15.3 hours. 

Dated: September 21, 2007. 
Roberto Salazar, 
Administrator, Food and Nutrition Service. 
[FR Doc. E7–19555 Filed 10–2–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3410–30–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

Black River Land Exchange; Apache 
National Forest; Apache and Greenlee 
Counties, AZ 

AGENCY: Forest Service, USDA. 
ACTION: Notice of intent to prepare an 
environmental impact statement. 

SUMMARY: The Forest Service, USDA 
will prepare an environmental impact 
statement (EIS) on a proposal to 
exchange 337.74 acres of federal lands 
north of the unincorporated community 
of Greer, Arizona, for 396.35 acres of 
non-federal lands along the West Fork of 
the Black River and the Blue River in 
east-central Arizona. The EIS will 
analyze the proposed change of the 
federal lands described as Tract A and 
Tract B for the non-federal lands 
described as Rancho Alegre, Thompson 
Ranch, and Blue River Ranch parcels. 
The federal and non-federal lands 
proposed for exchange are located in 
Apache and Greenlee Counties, Arizona. 
The affected Forest Service units are the 
Springerville and Alpine Ranger 
Districts of the Apache-Sitgreaves 
National Forests. The exchange would 
occur with First American Title 
Insurance Company, Trustee, under 
Trust 8541, on behalf of Precision 
Components, Inc., Herbert W. Owens. 
Summit Resources, LLC is acting as a 
third-party facilitator for the non-federal 
landowner. Implementation of the 
proposed exchange is scheduled for 
August 2008. The Apache-Sitgreaves 
National Forest Supervisor invites the 
public to submit comments on the 
proposal and suggestions on the scope 
of the proposed exchange. The Forest 
Supervisor also invites the public to 
participate in the environmental 
analysis and decision-making process 
for the proposed exchange of lands. 
DATES: Comments concerning the scope 
of the analysis must be received by 
October 31, 2007. The draft EIS is 
scheduled for availability in February 
2008, and the final EIS is expected to be 
available in June 2008. 
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