
46977 Federal Register / Vol. 72, No. 162 / Wednesday, August 22, 2007 / Notices 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. PR07–14–000] 

Bridgeline Holdings, L.P.; Notice of 
Deferral of Action on Petition for Rate 
Approval 

August 16, 2007. 
On August 2, 2007, Bridgeline 

Holdings, L.P. (Bridgeline) filed a 
motion for a sixty-day deferral of action 
on its Petition for Rate Approval filed 
on June 1, 2007, in the above-docketed 
proceeding. Bridgeline states that it 
intends to acquire by way of merger all 
interest and assets of Bridgeline 
Distribution and Bridgeline Storage on 
or about September 1, 2007. Because of 
these transactions, Bridgeline is 
requesting a sixty-day deferral of action 
on its petition for rate approval filed in 
Docket No. PR07–14–000 until the 
merger of these assets is complete. 
Bridgeline further states that on or about 
September 1, 2007, they will make the 
necessary filings to the Commission to 
facilitate this merger. At that time 
Bridgeline intends to withdraw the 
instant petition for rate approval in the 
above-docketed proceeding. 

Upon consideration, notice is hereby 
given that a sixty-day deferral of action 
on its Petition for Rate Approval is 
granted to and including October 2, 
2007. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E7–16534 Filed 8–21–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. OR07–17–000] 

CCPS Transportation, LLC; Notice of 
Petition for Declaratory Order 

August 15, 2007. 
Take notice that, on August 13, 2007, 

CCPS Transportation, LLC (CCPS), 
pursuant to Rule 207(a)(2) of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.207(a)(2) (2007), 
tendered for filing to the Commission a 
petition to issue a declaratory order 
confirming the proposed capacity 
allocation and rate structure for the 
planned expansion of the Spearhead 
Pipeline, which will increase 
Spearhead’s average annual capacity to 
carry crude petroleum between 
Flanagan, Illinois and Cushing, 

Oklahoma by 65,000 barrels per day. 
Subject to the Commission’s approval of 
this petition, the Spearhead expansion 
is targeted to go into service in the first 
quarter of 2009. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
date as indicated below. Anyone filing 
an intervention or protest must serve a 
copy of that document on the Applicant. 
Anyone filing an intervention or protest 
on or before the intervention or protest 
date need not serve motions to intervene 
or protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible online at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. eastern time, 
August 31, 2007. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E7–16505 Filed 8–21–07; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP07–434–000] 

CenterPoint Energy Gas Transmission 
Company; Notice of Request Under 
Blanket Authorization 

August 15, 2007. 
Take notice that on August 10, 2007, 

CenterPoint Energy Gas Transmission 
Company (CEGT), 1111 Louisiana 
Street, Houston, Texas 77002–5231, 
filed in Docket No. CP07–434–000, a 
prior notice request pursuant to sections 
157.205 and 157.211 of the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission’s 
regulations under the Natural Gas Act 
for authorization to construct, own, and 
operate a delivery point, located in 
Caddo County, Louisiana, all as more 
fully set forth in the application, which 
is on file with the Commission and open 
to public inspection. The filing may also 
be viewed on the Web at http:// 
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. For 
assistance, contact FERC at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Specifically, CEGT proposes to install 
a six-inch tap and a six-inch orifice 
meter skid with six-inch flow control 
regulator on CEGT’s Line N in order to 
serve Calumet Lubricants Company, 
L.P.. CEGT estimates the cost of 
construction to be $208,457. CEGT 
states that the facilities will have the 
capability of delivering up to 10,000 Dth 
per day. 

Any questions regarding the 
application should be directed to 
Lawrence O. Thomas, Director—Rate & 
Regulatory, CenterPoint Energy Gas 
Transmission Company, P.O. Box 
21734, Shreveport, Louisiana 71151, or 
call at (318) 429–2804. 

Any person or the Commission’s Staff 
may, within 60 days after the issuance 
of the instant notice by the Commission, 
file pursuant to Rule 214 of the 
Commission’s Procedural Rules (18 CFR 
385.214) a motion to intervene or notice 
of intervention and, pursuant to section 
157.205 of the Commission’s 
Regulations under the Natural Gas Act 
(NGA) (18 CFR 157.205) a protest to the 
request. If no protest is filed within the 
time allowed therefore, the proposed 
activity shall be deemed to be 
authorized effective the day after the 
time allowed for protest. If a protest is 
filed and not withdrawn within 30 days 
after the time allowed for filing a 
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