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denying all of Data Physics’ export 
privileges for a period of one year from 
the date of entry of this Order. 

C. Data Physics shall perform an audit 
of its internal compliance program 
within 12 months from the date of entry 
of this Order. Said audit shall be in 
substantial compliance with the Export 
management Systems audit module, 
which is available from the BIS Web site 
at http://www.bis.doc.gov/ 
complianceandenforcement/ 
ExportManagementSystems.htm, which 
is incorporated by reference. A copy of 
said audit shall be transmitted to the 
Office of Export Enforcement, 96 North 
Third Street, Suite 250, San Jose, 
California 95112 no later than 13 
months from the date of entry of the 
Order. 

Second, that for a period of five years 
from the date of entry of the Temporary 
Denial Order against Data Physics on 
May 23, 2006, Data Physics Corporation, 
2025 Gateway Place, Suite 260, San 
Jose, CA 95110, its subsidiaries, 
successors or assigns, and, when acting 
for or on behalf of Data Physics, its 
officers, representatives, agents or 
employees (‘‘Denied Person(s)’’) may 
not, directly or indirectly, participate in 
any way in any transaction involving 
any commodity, software, or technology 
(hereinafter collectively referred to as 
‘‘item’’) that is subject to the Regulations 
and that is exported or to be exported 
from the United States to the People’s 
Republic of China (‘‘China’’), or in any 
other activity subject to the Regulations 
that involves China, including, but not 
limited to: 

A. Applying for, obtaining, or using 
any license, License Exception, or 
export control document that involves 
export to China; 

B. Carrying on negotiations 
concerning, or ordering, buying, 
receiving, using, selling, delivering, 
storing, disposing of, forwarding, 
transporting, financing, or otherwise 
servicing in any way, any transaction 
involving any item that is subject to the 
Regulations and that is exported or to be 
exported from the United States to 
China, or in any other activity subject to 
the Regulations that involves China; or 

C. Benefiting in any way from any 
transaction involving any item exported 
or to be exported from the United States 
to China that is subject to the 
Regulations, or in any other activity 
subject to the Regulations that involves 
China. 

Third, that no person may, directly or 
indirectly, do any of the actions 
described below with respect to an item 
that is subject to the Regulations and 
that has been, will be, or is intended to 
be exported or reexported to China: 

A. Export or reexport to or on behalf 
of a Denied Person any item subject to 
the Regulations to China; 

B. Take any action that facilitates the 
acquisition or attempted acquisition by 
a Denied Person of the ownership, 
possession, or control of any item 
subject to the Regulations that has been 
or will be exported from the United 
States to China, including financing or 
other support activities related to a 
transaction whereby a Denied Person 
acquires or attempts to acquire such 
ownership, possession or control; 

C. Take any action to acquire from or 
to facilitate the acquisition or attempted 
acquisition from a denied person of any 
item subject to the Regulations that has 
been exported from the United States to 
China; 

D. Obtain from a Denied Person in the 
United States any item subject to the 
Regulations with knowledge or reason 
to know that the item will be, or is 
intended to be, exported from the 
United States to China; or 

E. Engage in any transaction to service 
any item subject to the Regulations that 
has been or will be exported from the 
United States to China and that is 
owned, possessed or controlled by a 
Denied person, or service any item, of 
whatever origin, that is owned, 
possessed or controlled by a Denied 
Person if such service involves the use 
of any item subject to the Regulations 
that has been or will be exported from 
the United States to China. For purposes 
of this paragraph, servicing means 
installation, maintenance, repair, 
modification or testing. 

F. This Order does not prohibit any 
export, reexport, or other transaction 
subject to the Regulations where the 
only items involved that are subject to 
the Regulations are the foreign- 
produced direct product of U.S.-origin 
technology. 

Fourth, that, after notice and 
opportunity for coment as provided in 
Section 766.23 of the Regulations, any 
person, firm, corporation, or business 
orgnaization related to Data Physics by 
affiliation, ownership, control, or 
postiion of responsibility in the conduct 
of trade or related services may also be 
made subject to the provisions of the 
Order 

Fifth, that the charging letter, 
amended charging letter, the Settlement 
Agreement, and this Order, and the 
record of the cases as defined by Section 
766.20 of the Regulations shall be made 
available to the public. BIS shall notify 
the administrative law judge that case 
06–BIS–21 is withdrawn from 
adjudication. 

Sixth, that this Order shall be served 
on the Denied Person and on BIS, and 

shall be pub lished in the Federal 
Register. 

This Order, which constitutes the 
final agency action in this matter, is 
effective immedicately. 

Entered this 15th day osf May 2007. 
Darryl W. Jackson, 
Assistant Secretary of Commerce for Export 
Enforement. 
[FR Doc. 07–2629 Filed 5–25–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–DT–M 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Bureau of Industry and Security 

Regulations and Procedures Technical 
Advisory Committee; Notice of 
Partially Closed Meeting 

The Regulations and procedures 
Technical Advisory Committee (RPTAC) 
will meet June 12, 2007, 9 a.m., Room 
3884, in the Herbert C. Hoover Building, 
14th Street between Constitution and 
Pennsylvania Avenues, NW., 
Washington, DC. The Committee 
advises the Office of the Assistant 
Secretary for Export Administration on 
implementation of the Export 
Administration Regulations (EAR) and 
provides for continuing review to 
update the EAR as needed. 

Agenda 

Public Session 

1. Opening remarks by the Chairman. 
2. Presentation of papers or comments 

by the Public. 
3. Opening remarks by the Bureau of 

Industry and Security. 
4. Published regulation update. 
5. Automated Export System (AES) 

update. 
6. Working group reports. 

Closed Session 

7. Discussion of matters determined to 
be exempt from the provisions relating 
to public meetings found in 5 U.S.C. 
app. 2 §§ 10(a)(1) and 10(a)(3). 

A limited number of seats will be 
available for the public session. 
Reservations are not accepted. To the 
extent that time permits, members of the 
public may present oral statements to 
the Committee. The public may submit 
written statements at any time before or 
after the meeting. However, to facilitate 
the distribution of public presentation 
materials to the Committee members, 
the Committee suggests that presenters 
forward the public presentation 
materials prior to the meeting to Ms. 
Yvette Springer at 
Yspringer@bis.doc.gov. 

The Assistant Secretary for 
Administration, with the concurrence of 
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1 June 4, 2007, is the next business day after 245 
days from the last day of the anniversary month of 
the order. 

the delegate of the General Counsel, 
formally determined on May 1, 2007, 
pursuant to Section 10(d) of the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, as amended (5 
U.S.C. app. 2 §§ (1)(d)), that the portion 
of the meeting dealing with matters the 
disclosure of which would be likely to 
frustrate significantly implementation of 
an agency action as described in 5 
U.S.C. 552b(c)(9)(B) shall be exempt 
from the provisions relating to public 
meetings found in 5 U.S.C. app. 2 
§§ 10(a)1 and 10(a)(3). The remaining 
portions of the meeting will be open to 
the public. 

For more information, call Yvette 
Springer at (202) 482–2813. 

Dated: May 22, 2007. 
Yvette Springer, 
Committee Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 07–2643 Filed 5–25–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–JT–M 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

[A–401–806] 

Stainless Steel Wire Rod From 
Sweden: Notice of Extension of Time 
Limit for 2005–2006 Administration 
Review 

AGENCY: Import Administration, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 

EFFECTIVE DATE: May 29, 2007. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Brian Smith or Gemal Brangman, AD/ 
CVD Operations, Office 2, Import 
Administration, International Trade 
Administration, U.S. Department of 
Commerce, 14th Street and Constitution 
Avenue, NW., Washington, DC 20230; 
telephone (202) 482–1766 or (202) 482– 
3773, respectively. 

Background 

On October 31, 2006, the Department 
published in the Federal Register a 
notice of initiation of administrative 
review of the antidumping duty order 
on stainless steel wire rod from Sweden, 
covering the period September 1, 2005, 
through August 31, 2006. See Initiation 
of Antidumping and Countervailing 
Duty Administrative Reviews, 71 FR 
63752 (October 31, 2006). The 
preliminary results for this 
administrative review are currently due 
no later than June 4, 2007.1 

Statutory Time Limits 
Section 751(a)(3)(A) of the Tariff Act 

of 1930, as amended (‘‘the Act’’), 
requires the Department of Commerce 
(‘‘Department’’) to issue the preliminary 
results of an administrative review 
within 245 days after the last day of the 
anniversary month of an order for which 
a review is requested and a final 
determination within 120 days after the 
date on which the preliminary results 
are published. If it is not practicable to 
complete the review within the time 
period, section 751(a)(3)(A) of the Act 
allows the Department to extend these 
deadlines to a maximum of 365 days 
and 180 days, respectively. 

Extension of Time Limits for 
Preliminary Results 

The Department requires additional 
time to review and analyze the sales and 
cost information submitted by the 
respondent in this administrative 
review and, if necessary, issue an 
additional supplemental questionnaire. 
Thus, it is not practicable to complete 
this review within the original time 
limit. Therefore, the Department is 
partially extending the time limit for 
completion of the preliminary results by 
90 days to 335 days, in accordance with 
section 751(a)(3)(A) of the Act. The 
preliminary results are now due no later 
than August 31, 2007. The final results 
continue to be due 120 days after 
publication of the preliminary results. 

We are issuing and publishing this 
notice in accordance with sections 
751(a)(1) and 777(i)(1) of the Act. 

Dated: May 21, 2007. 
Stephen J. Claeys, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary for Import 
Administration. 
[FR Doc. E7–10251 Filed 5–25–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–DS–S 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

International Trade Administration 

Organizing ‘‘Green Manufacturing 
Day’’ for U.S. Businesses; Comment 
Request 

ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The International Trade 
Administration proposes to organize a 
‘‘Green Manufacturing Day’’, aimed at 
enhancing public-private interaction in 
the field of sustainable manufacturing. 
This notice seeks public input on areas 
of interest for discussion at the 
proposed ‘‘Green Manufacturing Day’’. 
DATES: Submit comments no later than 
30 days after the date of this notice. 

ADDRESSES: Address all comments 
concerning this notice and requests to 
participate to William McElnea, U.S. 
Department of Commerce, Room 2213, 
1401 Constitution Ave. NW., 
Washington, DC 20230 (or via the 
Internet at 
william.mcelnea@mail.doc.gov). 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
William McElnea, 202–482–2831. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Sustainable manufacturing has garnered 
increasing attention among the 
manufacturing industry as firms have 
recognized its cost-effectiveness and 
profitability. For the purposes of this 
notice, ‘‘sustainable manufacturing’’ is 
defined as the creation of manufactured 
products that use processes that are 
non-polluting, conserve energy and 
natural resources, are economically 
sound, and safe for employees, 
communities, and consumers. At this 
early stage in sustainable 
manufacturing’s development, increased 
public-private interaction can be an 
effective means for government and 
industry to (a) identify the opportunities 
and challenges faced by manufacturers 
in pursuing sustainable production 
practices and (b) promote capacity- 
building among individual firms and 
industry sectors as a whole. 

The purpose of the proposed ‘‘Green 
Manufacturing Day’’, tentatively 
scheduled for September 2007, will be 
to: (1) Disseminate and promote best 
business practices in sustainable 
manufacturing, (2) assist small-and- 
medium-sized enterprises in identifying 
and implementing practical sustainable 
manufacturing solutions, (3) provide 
information on relevant emerging 
technologies, (4) educate participants on 
federal government efforts to promote 
sustainable manufacturing, and (5) 
provide information on international 
sustainable manufacturing initiatives, 
projects, and opportunities. The event 
will include presenters/speakers from a 
variety of stakeholder groups (i.e. 
private sector, government and 
academia) on a variety of topics relating 
to sustainable manufacturing. 

Topic areas covered may include, but 
are not limited to, industrial recycling, 
natural resource conservation, water 
supply and waste-water treatment, 
solid-waste management, hazardous 
waste management, environmental 
assessment, environmental accounting, 
lean and clean manufacturing, 
regulatory compliance, renewable 
energy, remanufacturing, refurbishing/ 
reconditioning, environmental 
technology research and development, 
and air pollution control. 

VerDate Aug<31>2005 20:45 May 25, 2007 Jkt 211001 PO 00000 Frm 00004 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\29MYN1.SGM 29MYN1sr
ob

er
ts

 o
n 

P
R

O
D

1P
C

70
 w

ith
 N

O
T

IC
E

S


		Superintendent of Documents
	2010-07-18T12:42:26-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




