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DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Office of Justice Programs 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comments Requested 

ACTION: 30-Day Notice of Information 
Collection Under Review: Census of 
Juveniles in Residential Placement. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Office of Justice Programs (OJP), Office 
of Juvenile Justice and Delinquency 
Prevention (OJJDP) has submitted the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. The proposed 
information collection is published to 
obtain comments from the public and 
affected agencies. This proposed 
information collection was previously 
published in the Federal Register 
Volume 70, Number 161 page 48982 on 
August 22, 2005, allowing for a 60 day 
comment period. 

The purpose of this notice is to allow 
for an additional 30 days for public 
comment until December 19, 2005. This 
process is conducted in accordance with 
5 CFR 1320.10. 

Written comments and/or suggestions 
regarding the items contained in this 
notice, especially the estimated public 
burden and associated response time, 
should be directed to the Office of 
Management and Budget, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attention Department of Justice Desk 
Officer, Washington, DC 20503. 
Additionally, comments may be 
submitted to OMB via facsimile to (202) 
395–5806. Written comments and 
suggestions from the public and affected 
agencies concerning the proposed 
collection of information are 
encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agencies estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 

use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Extension of previously approved 
collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Census of Juveniles in Residential 
Placement. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
The form number is CJ–14, Office of 
Juvenile Justice and Delinquency 
Prevention, United States Department of 
Justice. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Federal Government. 
Other: State, Local or Tribal 
Government, not-for-profit institutions, 
business or other for-profit. The data 
collection will gather individual level 
information on juveniles (persons under 
18) who are placed in a residential 
facility due to contact with the justice 
system. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond/reply: It is estimated that 3,500 
respondents will complete the 
questionnaire in approximately 3 hours. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are approximately 
11,650 hours associated with this 
collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Brenda E. Dyer, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Patrick Henry Building, 
Suite 1600, 601 D Street, NW., 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: November 10, 2005. 

Brenda E. Dyer, 
Department Clearance Officer, Department of 
Justice. 
[FR Doc. 05–22764 Filed 11–16–05; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Office of Justice Programs 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comments Requested 

ACTION: 30-Day Notice of Information 
Collection Under Review: 2005 Census 
of Publicly Funded Forensic Crime 
Laboratories. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Office of Justice Programs (OJP), Bureau 
of Justice Statistics (BJS), has submitted 
the following information collection 
request to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for review and approval 
in accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. The proposed 
information collection is published to 
obtain comments from the public and 
affected agencies. This proposed 
information collection was previously 
published in the Federal Register 
Volume 70, Number 161, page 48981 on 
August 22, 2005, allowing for a 60 day 
comment period. 

The purpose of this notice is to allow 
for an additional 30 days for public 
comment until December 19, 2005. This 
process is conducted in accordance with 
5 CFR 1320.10. 

Written comments and/or suggestions 
regarding the items contained in this 
notice, especially the estimated public 
burden and associated response time, 
should be directed to the Office of 
Management and Budget, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attention Department of Justice Desk 
Officer, Washington, DC 20503. 
Additionally, comments may be 
submitted to OMB via facsimile to (202) 
395–5806. Written comments and 
suggestions from the public and affected 
agencies concerning the proposed 
collection of information are 
encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agencies estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
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use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Revision of a currently approved 
collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 2005 
Census of Publicly Funded Forensic 
Crime Laboratories. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
Form Number: The form number is 
CFCL–1, Bureau of Justice Statistics, 
Office of Justice Programs, Department 
of Justice. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: State, Local, or Tribal 
Government. Other: Federal 
Government. This information 
collection is a census of public crime 
laboratories that perform forensic 
analyses on criminal evidence. The 
information will provide statistics on 
laboratories’ capacity to analyze forensic 
crime evidence, the number, types, and 
sources of evidence received per year, 
and the number, types, and costs of 
analyses completed. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond/reply: It is estimated that 375 
respondents will complete a three hour 
form. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are an estimated 1,125 
total annual burden hours associated 
with this collection. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Brenda E. Dyer, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Patrick Henry Building, 
Suite 1600, 601 D Street, NW., 
Washington, DC 20530. 

Dated: November 10, 2005. 

Brenda E. Dyer, 
Department Clearance Officer, Department of 
Justice. 
[FR Doc. 05–22765 Filed 11–16–05; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of the Secretary 

Submission for OMB Review: 
Comment Request 

November 9, 2005. 
The Department of Labor (DOL) has 

submitted the following public 
information collection request (ICR) to 
the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (Pub. L. 104–13, 
44 U.S.C. chapter 35). A copy of this 
ICR, with applicable supporting 
documentation, may be obtained by 
contacting Darrin King on 202-693-4129 
(this is not a toll-free number) or e-mail: 
king.darrin@dol.gov. 

Comments should be sent to Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attn: OMB Desk Officer for the Office of 
the Secretary, Office of Management and 
Budget, Room 10235, Washington, DC 
20503, 202–395–7316 (this is not a toll- 
free number), within 30 days from the 
date of this publication in the Federal 
Register. 

The OMB is particularly interested in 
comments which: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Agency: Office of the Secretary. 
Type of Review: Extension of 

currently approved collection. 
Title:Information Collection Plan for 

GovBenefits Online. 
OMB Number: 1290–0003. 
Frequency: On occasion. 
Type of Response: Reporting . 
Affected Public: Individuals or 

households; Business or other for-profit; 
Not-for-profit institutions; Farms; 
Federal Government; and State, Local, 
or Tribal Government. 

Number of Respondents: 6,367,428. 

Number of Annual Responses: 
6,367,428. 

Estimated Time Per Response: 2 
minutes. 

Total Burden Hours: 191,023. 
Total Annualized capital/startup 

costs: $0. 
Total Annual Costs (operating/ 

maintaining systems or purchasing 
services): $0. 

Description: The President’s 
Management Agenda for E-Government 
(February 27, 2002) sets forth a strategy 
for simplifying the delivery of services 
to citizens. The President’s agenda 
outlines a Federal EGovernment 
Enterprise Architecture that will 
transition the management and delivery 
of government services from a 
bureaucracy-centered to a citizen- 
centered paradigm. To this end, the 
Department of Labor serves as the 
managing partner of the 
Administration’s ‘‘GovBenefits’’ strategy 
for assisting citizens in identifying and 
locating information on benefits 
sponsored by the Federal government 
and State governments. This tool greatly 
reduces the burden on citizens 
attempting to locate services available 
from many different government 
agencies by providing one-stop access to 
information on obtaining those services. 

Respondents answer a series of 
questions to the extent necessary for 
locating relevant information on Federal 
benefits. Responses are used by the 
respondent to expedite the 
identification and retrieval of sought 
after information and resources 
pertaining to the benefits sponsored by 
the Federal Government. 

Ira L. Mills, 
Departmental Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. E5–6361 Filed 11–16–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4510–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Employment and Training 
Administration 

Notice of a Change in Status of an 
Extended Benefit (EB) Period for 
Louisiana 

This notice announces a change in 
benefit period eligibility under the EB 
Program for Louisiana. 

Summary 
The following change has occurred 

since the publication of the last notice 
regarding the State’s EB status: 

• October 30, 2005. Louisiana 
triggered ‘‘on’’ EB. Louisiana’s 13-week 
insured unemployment rate for the 
week ending October 15, 2005, rose 
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