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whose interest may be affected by the 
Commission’s action on the application 
may request a hearing and, if not the 
applicant, may petition for leave to 
intervene in a hearing proceeding on the 
Commission’s action. Requests for a 
hearing and petitions for leave to 
intervene should be filed in accordance 
with the Commission’s rules of practice 
set forth in subpart C ‘‘Rules of General 
Applicability: Hearing Requests, 
Petitions to Intervene, Availability of 
Documents, Selection of Specific 
Hearing Procedures, Presiding Officer 
Powers, and General Hearing 
Management for NRC Adjudicatory 
Hearings,’’ of 10 CFR part 2. In 
particular, such requests and petitions 
must comply with the requirements set 
forth in 10 CFR 2.309. Untimely 
requests and petitions may be denied, as 
provided in 10 CFR 2.309(c)(1), unless 
good cause for failure to file on time is 
established. In addition, an untimely 
request or petition should address the 
factors that the Commission will also 
consider, in reviewing untimely 
requests or petitions, set forth in 10 CFR 
2.309(c)(1)(I)–(viii). 

Requests for a hearing and petitions 
for leave to intervene should be served, 
pursuant to 10 CFR 2.302 and 2.305, 
upon Thomas S. O’Neill, Vice President 
and Counsel, Exelon Nuclear, 4300 
Winfield Road, Warrenville, Illinois 
60555, telephone 630–657–3770, fax 
630–657–4335, and e-mail 
thomas.oneill@exeloncorp.com; Jeffrie J. 
Keenan, Esq., PSEG Nuclear LLC, P.O. 
Box 236, –21, Hancocks Bridge, New 
Jersey 08038, telephone 856–339–5429, 
fax 856–339–7–1234, and e-mail 
jeff.keenan@pseg.com; the General 
Counsel, NRC, Washington, DC 20555-
0001 e-mail address for filings regarding 
license transfer cases only: 
OGCLT@NRC.gov; and the Secretary of 
the Commission, NRC, Washington, DC 
20555–0001, Attention: Rulemakings 
and Adjudications Staff. 

The Commission will issue a notice or 
order granting or denying a hearing 
request or intervention petition, 
designating the issues for any hearing 
that will be held, and designating the 
Presiding Officer. A notice granting a 
hearing will be published in the Federal 
Register and served on the parties to the 
hearing. 

As an alternative to requests for 
hearing and petitions to intervene, 
within 30 days after the date of 
publication of this notice, persons may 
submit written comments regarding the 
license transfer application, as provided 
for in 10 CFR 2.1305. The Commission 
will consider and, if appropriate, 
respond to these comments, but such 
comments will not otherwise constitute 

part of the decisional record. Comments 
should be submitted to the Secretary, 
NRC, Washington, DC 20555–0001, 
Attention: Rulemakings and 
Adjudications Staff, and should cite the 
publication date and page number of 
this Federal Register notice. 

For further details with respect to this 
action, see the application dated March 
4, 2005, (ML050750110), available for 
public inspection at the Commission’s 
Public Document Room (PDR), located 
at One White Flint North, Public File 
Area O1 F21, 11555 Rockville Pike (first 
floor), Rockville, Maryland. Publicly 
available records will be accessible 
electronically from the Agencywide 
Documents Access and Management 
System’s (ADAMS) Public Electronic 
Reading Room on the Internet at the 
NRC Web site, http://www.nrc.gov/
reading-rm/adams.html. Persons who 
do not have access to ADAMS or who 
encounter problems in accessing the 
documents located in ADAMS, should 
contact the NRC PDR Reference staff by 
telephone at 1–800–397–4209, 301–
415–4737 or by e-mail to pdr@nrc.gov.

Dated at Rockville, Maryland this 26th day 
of July 2005.

For the Nuclear Regulatory Commission. 
Stewart N. Bailey, 
Senior Project Manager, Section 2, Project 
Directorate I, Division of Licensing Project 
Management, Office of Nuclear Reactor 
Regulation.
[FR Doc. E5–4103 Filed 8–1–05; 8:45 am] 
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Sunshine Federal Register Notice

AGENCY HOLDING THE MEETING: Nuclear 
Regulatory Commission
DATE: Weeks of August 1, 8, 15, 22, 29, 
and September 5, 2005.
PLACE: Commissioners’ Conference 
Room, 11555 Rockville Pike, Rockville, 
Maryland.
STATUS: Public and closed.
MATTERS TO BE CONSIDERED: 

Week of August 1, 2005

Thursday, August 4, 2005

1:30 p.m. Affirmation Session (Public 
Meeting) (Tentative). 

Week of August 8, 2005—Tentative 

There are no meetings scheduled for 
the Week of August 8, 2005. 

a. Dominion Nuclear Connecticut, Inc. 
(Millstone Nuclear Power Station, 
Units 2 and 3), Docket Nos. 50–
336–LR and 50–423–LR (Tentative). 

Week of August 15, 2005—Tentative 

Tuesday, August 16, 2005

10 a.m. Meeting with the Organization 
of Agreement States (OAS) and the 
Conference of Radiation Control 
Program Directors (CRCPD) (Public 
Meeting) (Contact: Shawn Smith, 
301–415–2620).

This meeting will be webcast live at 
the Web address—http://www/nrc.gov.
1 p.m. Discussion of Security Issues 

(Closed-Ex. 3—9). 

Week of August 22, 2005—Tentative 
There are no meetings scheduled for 

the Week of August 22, 2005. 

Week of August 29, 2005—Tentative 
There are no meetings scheduled for 

the Week of August 29, 2005. 

Week of September 5, 2005—Tentative 

Wednesday, September 7, 2005

9:30 a.m. Discussion of Security Issues 
(Closed—Ex. 1). 

1:30 p.m. Discussion of Security Issues 
(Closed—Ex. 3). 

*The schedule for Commission 
meetings is subject to change on short 
notice. To verify the status of meetings 
call (recording)—(301) 415–1292. 
Contact person for more information: 
David Gamberoni, (301) 415–1651.
* * * * *

The NRC Commission Meeting 
Schedule can be found on the Internet 
at: http://www.nrc.gov/what-we-do/
policy-making/schedule.html.
* * * * *

The NRC provides reasonable 
accommodation to individuals with 
disabilities where appropriate. If you 
need a reasonable accommodation to 
participate in these public meetings, or 
need this meeting notice or the 
transcript or other information from the 
public meetings in another format (e.g. 
braille, large print), please notify the 
NRC’s Disability Program Coordinator, 
August Spector, at 301–415–7080, TDD: 
301–415–2100, or by e-mail at 
aks@nrc.gov. Determinations on 
requests for reasonable accommodation 
will be made on a case-by-case basis.
* * * * *

This notice is distributed by mail to 
several hundred subscribers; if you no 
longer wish to receive it, or would like 
to be added to the distribution, please 
contact the Office of the Secretary, 
Washington, DC 20555. (301–415–1969). 
In addition, distribution of this meeting 
notice over the Internet system is 
available. If you are interested in 
receiving this Commission meeting 
schedule electronically, please send an 
electronic message to dkw@nrc.gov.
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Dated: July 28, 2005. 
Sandy Joosten, 
Office of the Secretary.
[FR Doc. 05–15283 Filed 7–29–05; 11:08 am] 
BILLING CODE 7590–01–M

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Biweekly Notice; Applications and 
Amendments to Facility Operating 
Licenses Involving No Significant 
Hazards Considerations 

I. Background 
Pursuant to section 189a.(2) of the 

Atomic Energy Act of 1954, as amended 
(the Act), the U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission (the Commission or NRC 
staff) is publishing this regular biweekly 
notice. The Act requires the 
Commission publish notice of any 
amendments issued, or proposed to be 
issued and grants the Commission the 
authority to issue and make 
immediately effective any amendment 
to an operating license upon a 
determination by the Commission that 
such amendment involves no significant 
hazards consideration, notwithstanding 
the pendency before the Commission of 
a request for a hearing from any person. 

This biweekly notice includes all 
notices of amendments issued, or 
proposed to be issued from July 8, 2005, 
to July 21, 2005. The last biweekly 
notice was published on July 19, 2005 
(70 FR 41442). 

Notice of Consideration of Issuance of 
Amendments to Facility Operating 
Licenses, Proposed No Significant 
Hazards Consideration Determination, 
and Opportunity for a Hearing 

The Commission has made a 
proposed determination that the 
following amendment requests involve 
no significant hazards consideration. 
Under the Commission’s regulations in 
10 CFR 50.92, this means that operation 
of the facility in accordance with the 
proposed amendment would not (1) 
involve a significant increase in the 
probability or consequences of an 
accident previously evaluated; or (2) 
create the possibility of a new or 
different kind of accident from any 
accident previously evaluated; or (3) 
involve a significant reduction in a 
margin of safety. The basis for this 
proposed determination for each 
amendment request is shown below. 

The Commission is seeking public 
comments on this proposed 
determination. Any comments received 
within 30 days after the date of 
publication of this notice will be 
considered in making any final 

determination. Within 60 days after the 
date of publication of this notice, the 
licensee may file a request for a hearing 
with respect to issuance of the 
amendment to the subject facility 
operating license and any person whose 
interest may be affected by this 
proceeding and who wishes to 
participate as a party in the proceeding 
must file a written request for a hearing 
and a petition for leave to intervene. 

Normally, the Commission will not 
issue the amendment until the 
expiration of 60 days after the date of 
publication of this notice. The 
Commission may issue the license 
amendment before expiration of the 60-
day period provided that its final 
determination is that the amendment 
involves no significant hazards 
consideration. In addition, the 
Commission may issue the amendment 
prior to the expiration of the 30-day 
comment period should circumstances 
change during the 30-day comment 
period such that failure to act in a 
timely way would result, for example in 
derating or shutdown of the facility. 
Should the Commission take action 
prior to the expiration of either the 
comment period or the notice period, it 
will publish in the Federal Register a 
notice of issuance. Should the 
Commission make a final No Significant 
Hazards Consideration Determination, 
any hearing will take place after 
issuance. The Commission expects that 
the need to take this action will occur 
very infrequently. 

Written comments may be submitted 
by mail to the Chief, Rules and 
Directives Branch, Division of 
Administrative Services, Office of 
Administration, U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission, Washington, DC 20555–
0001, and should cite the publication 
date and page number of this Federal 
Register notice. Written comments may 
also be delivered to Room 6D22, Two 
White Flint North, 11545 Rockville 
Pike, Rockville, Maryland, from 7:30 
a.m. to 4:15 p.m. Federal workdays. 
Copies of written comments received 
may be examined at the Commission’s 
Public Document Room (PDR), located 
at One White Flint North, Public File 
Area O1F21, 11555 Rockville Pike (first 
floor), Rockville, Maryland. The filing of 
requests for a hearing and petitions for 
leave to intervene is discussed below. 

Within 60 days after the date of 
publication of this notice, the licensee 
may file a request for a hearing with 
respect to issuance of the amendment to 
the subject facility operating license and 
any person whose interest may be 
affected by this proceeding and who 
wishes to participate as a party in the 
proceeding must file a written request 

for a hearing and a petition for leave to 
intervene. Requests for a hearing and a 
petition for leave to intervene shall be 
filed in accordance with the 
Commission’s ‘‘Rules of Practice for 
Domestic Licensing Proceedings’’ in 10 
CFR part 2. Interested persons should 
consult a current copy of 10 CFR 2.309, 
which is available at the Commission’s 
PDR, located at One White Flint North, 
Public File Area 01F21, 11555 Rockville 
Pike (first floor), Rockville, Maryland. 
Publicly available records will be 
accessible from the Agencywide 
Documents Access and Management 
System’s (ADAMS) Public Electronic 
Reading Room on the Internet at the 
NRC Web site, http://www.nrc.gov/
reading-rm/doc-collections/cfr/. If a 
request for a hearing or petition for 
leave to intervene is filed within 60 
days, the Commission or a presiding 
officer designated by the Commission or 
by the Chief Administrative Judge of the 
Atomic Safety and Licensing Board 
Panel, will rule on the request and/or 
petition; and the Secretary or the Chief 
Administrative Judge of the Atomic 
Safety and Licensing Board will issue a 
notice of a hearing or an appropriate 
order. 

As required by 10 CFR 2.309, a 
petition for leave to intervene shall set 
forth with particularity the interest of 
the petitioner in the proceeding, and 
how that interest may be affected by the 
results of the proceeding. The petition 
should specifically explain the reasons 
why intervention should be permitted 
with particular reference to the 
following general requirements: (1) The 
name, address, and telephone number of 
the requestor or petitioner; (2) the 
nature of the requestor’s/petitioner’s 
right under the Act to be made a party 
to the proceeding; (3) the nature and 
extent of the requestor’s/petitioner’s 
property, financial, or other interest in 
the proceeding; and (4) the possible 
effect of any decision or order which 
may be entered in the proceeding on the 
requestor’s/petitioner’s interest. The 
petition must also set forth the specific 
contentions which the petitioner/
requestor seeks to have litigated at the 
proceeding. 

Each contention must consist of a 
specific statement of the issue of law or 
fact to be raised or controverted. In 
addition, the petitioner/requestor shall 
provide a brief explanation of the bases 
for the contention and a concise 
statement of the alleged facts or expert 
opinion which support the contention 
and on which the petitioner/requestor 
intends to rely in proving the contention 
at the hearing. The petitioner/requestor 
must also provide references to those 
specific sources and documents of 
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